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MOTOR SURVEY ASSIGNMENT

Date er02-2018 Qur Ref No. D1B001690MFSH
Accldent Date 10-02-2018 Claim Type. Third Party
Insured Vehicle SHCO388X Third Party Vehicle. SCQ7776Z
Survey Location BLE 3022A UBI ROAD 1 #01-45/458
Contact Parson. LILY LM
Contact No. 67416336/ 0 Fax No. B7417208
Survey Type WITHOUT PREJUDICE: ACCIDENT NOT REFQRTED:
Appointed

i LKK AUTO CONSULTANTS PTE LTD
Surveyor
Contact Person NA Fax No. 68416315
Contact Number. MNA

FOR DIRECT SETTLEMENT

Please submit to us the Tax Invoice together with letter of claim for Rental OR Loss of use (based on
NIMA Benchmark rates) together with your survey report.

THIRD PARTY SURVEY REQUEST

PROGRESSIVE

Cc: Workshop AUTOMOTIVE PTE LTD Attention. MIL
Cc: TP Solicitor NA TP Solicitor Fax No. NA
Officer Incharge LURENE

IMPORTANT NOTE

Kindly subrmit the survey report via CWS within 14 days lor survey assignment and 7 days for re-inspection.
This |5 a computer genarated lelter, no signatura recuired,
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Job Sheet (/ClaimWS/Surveyor/JobSheet/235418) | PRIDocuments @ | close x
PRI Header Details
Claimant
Clalm No D18001690MFSH Policy No D-1B0BBY37MFSH S.No B 1 & PROGRES
Name
PROGRESSIVE Survey
. 30224 1 #01
Workshop | AUTOMOTIVE PTE LTD Location SLE 30424 UBIROAD 1 #01-45/46
Kame (Contact Person : LILY & Contact Mobile: 0, Phone: 67415336 , Fax: 67417208
) ’ H P i i
LIM) its Emailld: BHLIM@PROGAUTO.COM.S5G
Qur LOKCAUTO CONSULTANTS | Instrisctlons | oo pne1unice: ACCIDENT NGT REPORTED:
Surveyor FTELTD To Surveyor
Insured Insured i
Nome CITYCAB PTE LTD Vehicle No SHCO388X ::hlr.‘le SCQ?7762
PEI Surveyor Surveyor
Recieved 27-02-2018 09:51:09 PM Appointed 28-02-2018 04:33:00 PM Accept 01-03-2018 0
Date Date Date
Survey Report Upload
Inspection | s 01-03-2018
Data *: dipe, Report Date I:l&purt
Vehicle Particulars
Make Piease Seiect Make ¥ | | Model Please Select Model * Year  Select Year
Chasis No | | Engine No | | Mileage I
Cubic
Color | ) [
Multiple Documents Upload
Upload Muitiple Documents |
Flle Name Action

Surveyor Job Remarks

Remarks l

hiips.tiiclaims. com 800 1/ClalmWS/Surveyor/Details/2354 18 7




Nivitha (LKK Auto)

From: Mivitha (LKK Auta) <admin-d@lkkauto.com:

Sent: Thursday, 1 March 2018 11:068 AM

To: ‘Claim Workflow System’; ASSIGNMENTS@LKKAUTO.COM
Cc LURENEIAW@MSFIRSTCAPITALCOM.SG; 'SUR'

Subject: RE: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D18001690MESHA
DearSir/Mdm,

Thank you for the assignment.

Please be informed vehicle not inwarkshop, repairer will arrange,

BEST REGARDS,

G.Nivitha | Admin

LEK Auto Consultants Pte Lid

Phione: 6Rg1-1072 | email; gssignments@ikkagtocom | fme ba56-4515
Blk 51, Pava Obi Industrial Park, Uhi Avenue 1, 202-25 | S(408933)

From: Claim Workflow System [mailto:cwsmotarclaims@msfirstcapital.com.sgl

Sent: Wednesday, 28 February 2018 4:33 PM

To: ASSIGNMENTS@LKKAUTO.COM

Ce: CWSMOTORCLAIMS@MSFIRSTCAPITALCOM.SG; LURENEJ'AW@MEFIHSTEAPITAL.CDM.SG
Subject: PRI: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D180016590MFSH/1

Daar Sir/Mdm,

We refer to the above reference.
Please find attached the necessary documents for survey.
Kindly submit your report via CWS within the next 14 days.

Hest Regards,

Admin Team

Claim Workflow System

Motor Claims Department

MS First Capital Insurance Limited
Tel : 6507 3848

Fax : 6507 3849

PS: This is a system generated mail. Please do not reply to this mail.



Nivitha (LKK Auto)

From: Nivitha (LKK Aute) <admin-d@lkkauto.com»

Sent: Wednesday, 31 October 2018 11:15 AM

To: ‘Claim Workflow System’; 'ASSIGNMENTS@LKKAUTO.COM'
Ce: ‘LURENEIAW@MSFIRSTCAPITAL.COM.SG', 'SUR’

Subject: RE: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D1800T690MFSH/1

Dhear Sir/Mdm,

Piease be informed that according to the repairer, TP owner already withdraw claim.

We will close this file at cur end without billing.

BRESRT REGARDS,
G.Nivitha | Admin
LEK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phene: 68411972 | email aslgnments@ kkautocom | e b2s6-4315
Biksy, Pava Ubi Industrinl Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #o2-25 | S{4089313)

From: Nivitha (LKK Auto) [mailto:admin-d@lkkauto.com]

Sent: Thursday, 1 March 2018 11:06 AM

To: 'Claim Workflow System' <cwsmotorclaims@msfirstcapital.com sg>; ASSIGNMENTS@LKKAUTO.COM
Cc: LUREMEJAWEMSFIRSTCAPITAL.COM.SG; 'SUR' <sur@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D18001630MFSH/1

Dhear Sir/Mdm,
Thank you for the assignment.

Please be informed vishicle not in workshap, repairer will arrange.

BEST REGARDS,

G.Nivitha | Adoriln

LEK Auto Consultants Pte Lid

Phone: 6841-1972 | email: assignments@ikkauto.com | fax: b256-4315
Blk s, Pava Ubt Tndustrin Park, Ui Avenue 1, #o2-25 | S{ao8933)

From: Claim Workflow System [mailto:cwsmotarclaims@msfirstcapital.com, sg]

Sent: Wednesday, 28 February 2018 4:33PM

To: ASSIGNMENTSE LKKAUTO.COM

Co: CWSMOTORCLAIMS@EMSFIRSTCAPITAL COM.SG; LURENEJIAW @MSFIRSTCAPITAL COM.SG
Subject: PRI: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D18001690MFSH/1

Dear Sir/Mdm,

We refer to the above reference.
Please find attached the necessary documents for survey,
Kindly submit your report via CWS within the next 14 days.

Best Regards,
Admin Team



Claim Work{flow System

Motor Claims Department

MS First Capital Insurance Limited
Tel : 6507 3848

Fax : 6507 3849

PS: This is o system generated mail. Please do not reply to this mail.



