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Vic (LKKAuto)

From: Joseph Tan <joseph.tan@mbmwheelpower.com.sg>

Sent: Friday, 16 March, 2018 12:43 PM

To: Thin Thin (LKKAuto)

Cc: Vic (LKKAuto); kenneth@mbmwheelpower.com.sg; 

danny.ong@mbmwheelpower.com.sg

Subject: RE: ACCIDENT ON 11/02/2018 INVOLVING VEHICLE SKJ 1888R AND SKK 3433B

Without Prejudice 

 

Dear Vic / Thin Thin, 

 

As both party’s report were of conflicting version, our client would like to propose a mutual settlement to repair the 

vehicle at each own cost. 

 

Our client was not able to exchange particulars or contact number as your insured was not cooperative at the point 

of time. 

 

Kindly relay our client’s proposal to your insured and revert to us soonest possible. 

 

Thank you. 

 

Best regards, 

Joseph Tan | Claims Advisor 

 
T 6262 8888 | F 6250 9015 | M 8686 5188 

Email: joseph.tan@mbmwheelpower.com.sg 

MBM Wheelpower Pte Ltd 

160 Sin Ming Drive • #06-02 

Sin Ming AutoCity • Singapore 575722 

www.mbmwheelpower.com.sg 

 

From: Thin Thin (LKKAuto) <thinthin@lkkauto.com>  

Sent: Friday, 16 March 2018 12:09 PM 

To: joseph.tan@mbmwheelpower.com.sg 

Cc: Vic (LKKAuto) <vicalpeh@lkkauto.com> 

Subject: ACCIDENT ON 11/02/2018 INVOLVING VEHICLE SKJ 1888R AND SKK 3433B 

 

"Without Prejudice" 

 

Dear Sir / Madam, 

 

ACCIDENT ON 11/02/2018 INVOLVING VEHICLE SKJ 1888R AND SKK 3433B 

 

We refer to the below email. 

 

Please be informed that basing on the accident statements submitted by both party, the liability is unclear for the 

above mentioned case. There is no conclusive evidence to substantiate either party’s version. Enclosed herewith is a 

copy of our insured's accident report for your perusal.  
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We are in a course of investigating into the circumstances of the accident. After verifying further with our OI we will 

revert with our opinion on the cause of the accident. Kindly do not refer to any party for legal assistance until you 

heard further from us.  

   

Meanwhile, we would like to request the CCTV footage / accident scene photos / evidence in order to seek further 

instruction from our principal. 

 

 
Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of resolving 

the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be deemed / inferred 

from this negotiation of terms/settlement. 

 

In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the issues 

of liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement. 

 

Best Regards, 

Thin Thin Hlaing | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6841-2360 | email: thinthin@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

 


