Joy Irene (LKK Auto)

—— - ——
From: Joy lrene (LKK Auto)
Sent; Wednesday, 11 Movember, 2015 1:45 PM
Ta: ‘Annabel Tan'
Cc; Janet Tan; Olivia Lau; Admin A; Mei Kwan (LKK Auto)
Subject: RE: Accident involving XB3787Z & SHETG09T on 16 Jan 2014

Dear Ms. Annabel,

We refer to our e-mail correspondence below,

To date, we still have not receive TP's letter of demand with all its supporting claim documents.,
TP also have not responded to our fallow-ups made,

Since there is no development from TP with regards to their TP claim, we will temporarily close this almaost one (1)
yvear outstanding file and submit our report to your good-office,

In future, if there is any development frem TP, we will update and inform you for our further handling.

Thank you,

Best Regards,

Joy Irene | Case Handler

LEK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6749-4274 | email: jovirened@ildiauto.com| fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Pava Uhi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

This email may centain confidential and/or privileged infarmation, If you are not the intended recipient {or have received this email in error) please notify the
sender immediately and destray this email. Any unautharized copying, disclosure or distributian of the material in this email is strictly forbidden.

From: Annabel Tan [mailto:annabel.tan@eqginsurance.com.sg|

Sent: Thursday, 3 September, 2015 5:28 PM

To: Joy Irene (LKK Auto) <loylrene@lkkauto.com>; Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>; Mei Kwan {LKK Auto)
=Meikwan@lkkauto.com=

Cc: Precelia Ang <precelia@lkkauto.com=; Janet Tan <janet.tan@eqinsurance.com.sg=: Olivia Lau
<glivialau@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: Accident involving XB3787Z & SHBYG09T on 16 Jan 2014

Hi oy lrene,

Please proceed to attempt Direct Settlement at 100% in view of QID charged for Inconsiderate Driving,
Update us thereafter for further instructions if TP still does not respond.

Thank you.

Regards,



