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BV Vg LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
;_,"' - 51 Ubl Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408933
- TEL 6256 3561 FAX: B256 4315

Reg No 199607198R GST Reg Mo, 19-8607188-R
Affiliated to Federation Intemnationale Des Experts En Automobile
INDIA INTERNATIONAL INSURANCE PL Rel CC4/I118003953/yb3
#05.02 (0B BUILDING SINGAPORE 046711 D= 'OLOSEN0 |‘ ‘"W“‘IMWII
Code . 12
1i Policy Particulars :- THIRD PARTY CLAIM
Insured Veh. SHC 8383G Veh. Inspected GBEG B178H
Policy No. Coverage ($) D.00
Claim No. Excess (5) D.00
Assign From Assign Date 01/03/2018
2 Vehicle Particulars & Condition
Make & Model c.C ]
Engine No. HIDDEN Year of Reg.
Chassis No. Colour
Odometer Steering
Brakes Modification
General
3. Conditions of Tyres
Size Make Balance
R/H Front Tyre mim
L/H Front Tyre mm
R/H Rear Tyre mm
L/H Rear Tyre mm
4. Description of Damages
5. General Information
Accident Date 27/02/2018 Inspection Date
Survey held at JA AUTOCARE PTELTD
8 KAK] BUKIT AVE 4
#02-37 PREMIER@KAKI BUKIT
SINGAPORE 415875
5a. Remarks
A)THE INSPECTION WAS CONDUCTED ON A"WITHOUT PREJUDICE™ BASIS.
B)IN ACCORDANCE TO YOUR INSTRUCTIONS, WE HAVE NOT AUTHORISED REPAIRS




NMW o

JA AUTOCARE PTELTD

8 Kaki Bukit Ave 4

#02-37 Premier @Kaki Bukit
Singpore 415875

tel 1 94513429

emall - elivacassandra@hotmail com

x%:ﬁj_

EﬁnMATE
India Int'l Insurance Pte Ltd Date 01.03.2018
64 Cecil Strest Vehicle no GBG 8178H
#04 02 108 Building Model: Toyota Dyna
Singapore 049711 DoA 27.02.2018
Parts
01) Tail gate drop panel raa/ W 5 1,680.00 —
02) Tail gate hinges @120.00 x s 480.00 o
03} Tall gate side metal @542000x2 ¢/ %F-70 a/ §ty 5 BADOD ¢
04) Tail lamp rh CAqs 50.80 "
05) Exhaust pipe  7d¥lv OMesS 98050 ——
06) Toyota logo e 5 12000 =
a7) Dyna logo e 5 3500 —
5 4,386.30 /}{ L
Less 25% 5 109650 ¥
$  3,289.50 J |
5/Nett items
0g9) Bpax sticker Aer s 000 /9
10) TOKM/H Al , s 2000 7/ D
11) fw{ Reverse sensor ﬂ”’"{ 5 250,00 -100
12) Rear number plate € mbps¢ A4s  es00 3D
13) Rear step garnish /L s 25000 o
$  605.00
Labour charges
14) To check wiring s 15000 20
15) To dismantle exhaust s 20000 8 P
16) To knock out dents on affected areas S 1,000.00
renew parts J ﬁD
17) To Putty & Respray painitng 5 80000 4 0O
$  2,150,00
e
LKK Autg Congultants hence nolify Yﬁ [
o Taresureey e speay pantg 01! S_Soms0. )

® Third pafty 3

—_—— & NG ﬂw(;]l
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PARF/COE Rebate Enquiry

y

Er’;quire PARF/COE Rebate for Registered Vehicle

Vehicle Owner Particulars

Owner 1D Type: Company
Owner ID: 2221N
Vehicle Details

Wehicle No.: GBGB178H
Wehicle to be Exported No

Intended De-registration 05 Mar 2018
Date:

Wehicle Make: TOYOTA
Vehicle Model. DYNA 150 5MT
Primary Colour: Silver
Manufacturing Year: 2017

Engine No.: 1KD2751820
Chassis No.: JTFATISYXOK20%172
Maximum Power Qutpiut:

Open Market Value: $27.084,00
Original Registration Date: 08 Nav 2017
First Registration Date: 08 Nav 2017
Transter Count o

Actual ARF Paid: $1.355.00
Intended PARF Rebate Details

PARF Eligibility: No

PARF Eligibility Expiry Date:

PARF Rebate Amount: $0.00
Intended COE Rebate Details

COE Expiry Date: 07 Nov 2027
COE Category: C - Goods Vehicle & Bus
COE Period(Years); 10

POP Paid: $32.490.00
COE Rebate Amount: $31.425.00
Total Rebate Amount: $31,425.00

The information contained herain is correct as at 05 Mar 2018

oK

hitps://vrl.lta.gov.sg/lta/vrl/action/enquireRebate By PublicBefore DeregInput ?FUNCTION _1D=F030400...

Page 1 of 2

05-Mar-18



" Nivitha (LK Auto)

From:
Sent:
To:

Ce:
Subject:

Dear Sir / Mdm,

Motor Claim - Il «motorclaim@iil.com.sg>
Thursday, 1 March 2018 9:51 AM

Jen Eliva; ‘sur@lkkauto.com’; Catherine Chong (LKK Auto)
Sundari Nagarajan - ||l

RE: GBG 8178H & SHC 8383G on 27.02.2018

i+ asam(® |1311e

Jthitlt rot In

feron @j(nn\j

Please conduct a survey on TP vehicle GBG8178H and let us have your report urgently.

This claim will be handled by Ms Sundari,

*Kindly upload this survey request email to merimen.

Thank You.

Best Regards,
Gabriel Wee
Motor Claims Dept.

India International Insurance Pte Ltd
64 Cecil Street | #05 I0B Building | Singapore 049711

Tel: 6347 6100, Ext - 248

—~—-Original Message—-

From: Jen Eliva lrnailm:EIivacassandra@hntmail,mm]

Sent: 28 February, 2018 12:38 PM

To: Motor Claim - Il <motorclaim @iii.com.sg>

Cec: admin-a@lkkauto.com

Subject: GBG 8178H & SHC 8383G on 27.02.2018

Hi,

We are the authorise workshop for GBG 8178H to claims against your insured SHC8383G.

We would like to appoint LKK consultant (Marcus Chua } to conduct the PRI at :

JA AutoCare Pte Ltd

B Kaki Bukit Ave 4

#02-16 Premier @Kaki Bukit
Singapore 415875

Thank you
Best Regards

lenny Chew -54513429
For JA AutoCare Pte Ltd



- Kindly-niote that by submitting this claim to us, you are deemed to have agreed to us collecting, using, disclosing and
processing your personal data, sharing your personal data with our service providers (located both inside and
outside Singapore) and/or with other insurers in the general insurance industry, including the General Insurance
Association of Singapore. This enables us to ensure proper processing, handling and/or dealing with your claim,
which includes investigating the said claim, and complying with applicable laws. If you do not agree to the same,
kindly let us know immediately.

DISCLAIMER:

This email is intended solely for the person to whom it has been addressed.

It may contain confidential and/or legally privileged information.

If you are not the person for whom this e-mail was Intended, or if this e-mail has reached you by mistake, please
delete it immediately and inform us of the error and also be hereby notified that any use, distribution, transmission,
printing, copying or dissemination of this information in any way or in any manner is strictly prohibited and may be
unlawful.

Internet communications may not be entirely secure or accurate as information could be intercepted, corrupted,
lost, delayed or contain viruses.

Therefore, we do not accept liability for any errors or omissions in the content of this message or any delay in
delivery which may arise as a result of Internet transmission or any modification.

Print this email only if it is absolutely necessary and help in presarvation of environment.

India International Insurance Pte Ltd.

Registration No. 198703792-K



4NM3r2018 . Marimean e-Claims

Print Received Message

This mail is associated with :

*GBG8178H (MCT18020889)
[SHC8383G]
TP

EKOWATT PTELTD
Feb 27 2018 12;:00PM
[COMFORT TRANSPORTATION PTE LTD]
Ja Autocare Pie Lid

From India International Insurance Pte Ltd (HQ) (Ill_SG), sent on 13/04/2018 14:27 PM.
To LKK_HQ
Subject  Alert - Ad] Mandate Approved ($5§3500.00) - GBGE17EH - Clalm Handler: Sundari Nagarajan

Approved:3500.00.

hitps {fsingapore. mermen. com/claims/index cim#usebox=5VCmalld luseaclion=dsp_PrintACFID=320441 20ACFTOKEN=eb{757514e108b11-5F008330-C325-1



JA AutoCare Pte Ltd
8 Kaki Bukit Ave 4
#02-37 Premier@Kaki Bukit

Singapore 415875
Email @ elivacassandra hotinihlcom

13082018

Toadia Lnt'l Insurance Pre Ll
fid Cecll Street

#0210 Buiilding

Singapore (49711

Attn: Motor Claims Department

Drear SieMidm,

W are the withorized repur workshop Tor the owner of motor vehiele no; GEG 8TTEH owhich wos involved in the
captioned accident with youor insured vehicle: SHO 8383 1he vebiche ommer has requested and authorized os o
assiél him in presenting histher claim against the party responsible for the domoge 1o the vehicle

As the aceident wis ciiad by the negligent uet of vour insored driving. we are submitting these eliims lor
wour considerntion on behall of the pwner claiman

Oy Cast ool Repair £ RN
2 Laoas ol use SO « .ﬁi.'l:.-n % LR
5 LA 00

We enclosed herewith the following documents W supprt the lishins:-

ad Letwer of Avthorisstion £ GEA reportis) 7 Insirunee Certificate, ¢e
hj Final Repaie Hill

Kindly look b e madter and let ds bear Trom vol on the settlement of our customer™ s claims
1% %000 1% possible

Please note that it is a condition of uny sertlement reached that iv shall be without prejudice 1o any
personal injury clamm (iIF any) of the owner/claimant.

Thank you
Yours faithfully

AutolUare Me L1d



Letter of Authorisation

To: JA AutoCare Pre Ltd

Re: ACCIDENTON _22[s2 V1§ invowving Qg £y |Sile FiR3L
ALONGAT _  tamnl Wowlgufieg <np ) Thos aul
iwe  Elowgdl pre e (NRICNO): 20153222 |p)

Of

01) The owner of motor vehicle no: GRZ ¢ ¥Hhereby authorise JA AutoCare Pte Lid to commence
repairs of the said vehicle forthwith. I'We agreed 10 assign the whole procesds my/our third party claim
to JA Autocare Pte Ltd. My our solicitors (To be appointed by

JA AutoCare Pte Ltd on my/our behalf) shall accept this as my/our imevocable authority 1o pay the
amount compensated direct to JA Autocare Pte Ltd after deduction of their cost on a solicitors &
client basis. I/we undertake to Co-operate fully with JA AutoCare Pte Ltd and/or solicitors also
with a true Motor Accident Report /Police Report until the claim to a successful conclusion
incloding court proceedings, failing which, 1/'We undertake to bear the all cosis incurred.

02) I/'We authorise JA AutoCare Pte Ltd to sign all discharge voucher/indemnity forms and all necessary
papers on my/our behalf in connection with the above claim.

03) In the event that third party insurer issued the Agreed Settlement Chegue to me/us, I/ We undertake to
either give the said cheque 1o JA AutoCare Pre Ltd or bank into our account and re-issue the cheque

amount to JA AutoCare Pte Ltd,

LY bavorF oL 0w IF

DATED THIS

SIGNATURE OF WITNESS
NAME: To ¢y
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EXPRESS SETTLEMENT e

DISCHARGE VOUCHER
|ll- Direct Settlement (PODS)

f: ru\L" 15 0Lt "“'nﬂ

India Re

ClaimantRef (<00 7 1xr

Weit M_EP_TE LTD (the workshop") hereby confirm thal weil have reached an agresment
with the appoinizd Sumvayar of N inlematwnal Insudince Pia Lid LKK AUTO GOHSULTMTS PTELTD | e
of Surveyar) with respect {a the @mount GClesmed for S% 3,000 00 (repmir oS 19 500.00 (loss of

saimpmtet) 58 __ " (search lee), wehicle no GBG B178H that was damaged pursuant 1o the ascodent which occiured

vehicle). This is pursuant 10 the inspechian conducied on 03/032018 (datel al ‘the Workshon®

Well confirm that weil arelam authotized by the cwner EKOWATT PTE LTD ("the third paty
clammant”] of vahicle no. GBG B1TBH, . - ie the claim as et aul in the above parageaph and we/l have il authorty 10 seftle
the mistioe on feamer pehall in @ manner that we/| deam hi Weall encloss haredn the et of authority given by "iha thard
party slaimant”

Wi further confiim thet wall will indemnify India imernationsl |nsurance Ple Lid for &l damages. loss andior expanse that
theey will or hove glready Incurred in the event tnat “the thid party claimant” amer ihe above sakl sgresment Iodges &
further clesm sgainst (ha former foi any loss and expensas suffared pertaining 10 cosl of repairs andior rental andiar loss
of use pursusni to the damage Lo GBG B178H | ghcle no | #s 8 resull of I accident

well confirm thit the agreement leached above s in hill gnd final settiemant of ail clams. of “tha third party clamant’
pursuant 1o iha accident and that further this satiement & reached on a withoul prejumce &nd without sdmission of lapiy

DasEs

This agreemunt & subject 10 the apphcation of Singapors law and the Singapore Courts have gaclusive junsdichon Qv any
dispute arsing oul ol the sams

\Well authorize you 1o pay thetotal amountof S§_3.80000 10 _ JA AUTOCARE PTE LTD

Dated this 47 day of M 0 1k
CLAIMANT: WITHNESS:
Signaure Sgnature e
)" (with cho Srgmduympahhdsunw
Name A Name LKK AUTO CONSULTANTS PTELTD.
NRIC = ¢ NRIC 199607 198R _ —
Address L0 Blapy puic] Bed address  STUBIAVENUE 180125
£ = ey © Kol PAYA UBI INDUSTRIAL PARK (5} 408933

0y-gy  fromy wt"* ou 5):

Nationality Mationality -

o foer: Tﬂn,.-q,c\n ; Clccupatinn - B



JA AUTOCARE PTE LTD

8 Kaki Bukit Ave 4

A02-37 Premier@Kaki Bukit
Singpore 415875

tel - 945134329

amail : elivacassandra@hotmail com

TAX INVOICE  03/18/INS/007

india Int’l Insurance Pte Lid Date 14.03.2018
64 Cecil Street Vehicle no GBG B178H
#04 02 108 Building Model: Toyota Dyna
singapore 049711 DOA 27.02.2018
To Proceed on Lump Sum Repair s 3,000.00

Total §  3,000.00




Mernmen e-Claims

Page | of |
-««CLAIM SUBFOLDER...(Pending for Survey Report)
Direct Settlement
|:um SUBFOLDER TRACKING )
Case | Notfied Est Submitted | Ad) Assigned Adj Rot Adj Submitted | Ins Auth'ed Status
e ok 0L 05 Mar 2018 205:900.00 2$3,000.00 ~ Pending for Survey
VA Edit Reg e Idm Extimntes I Wiew Aot I "
_Eoe ey | £t Ay e | = Cancel Case |
Claim Details

'CLAIM SUBFOLDER DETAILS
1 ol -

_ - e | [Created by adjuster]
| COMFORT TRANSPORTATION PTE LTD, Co, Heg. No. -
| EKOWATT PTE LTD. Co. Reg. No.: 201532221N

|GBGH178H

Inl.tzurmu: |Z7/027I018 12:00 - :50

| (|3 Months and 19 Days From LTA Reg Date (Man Yr)]
TP / MCT18020889 PolicyCover

Mote No. - HMCOMO015

| Pokey No.
(Claimant); | DMCHQ17-006444

| _.E;E: 1
| Jm Autocare Pte Ltd () 8 KAK] BUKTT AVE 4, #02-37 PREMIEADICAK] BUKIT, 415875 Kakl Bukit - Tel:

India International Insurance Pte Lid (HQ) - Tel| 63276100 .. [Handled by Sundari Nagarajan - 4347 6071)
EQ Insurance Company Ltd (HQ) - Tel: G223 5433

LKK Auto Consultants Pre Ltd (WQ) - Tel: 6256-3561 . [Handled by MARCUS CHUA] | Final Rpt due 12/03/2018]
'ASSOCIATED MAIL RECEIVED -
|

" View Al | Compose Case Mail il
o TI_SG (13/04/I018): Alert - Ad] Mandate Approved (S$3500.00) - GBGB178H - Claim Handler: Sundarl Nag.... 1
» II_SG (01/03/3018), Alert - Ad) Mandate Approved (S$0.00) - GBGS178H - Claim Handler: Sundari Nagara...

ALL ASSOCIATED TASKS=

Due Date  Priority Type  Task Group Subject
No results.

Handher Assigned By Completed On Craated On Dane?

hitps:/singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRadjuster& fuseaction=dsp c... 8/5/2018



Mernimen e-Claims Page | of 2
Claim Documents
*GBGB178H (MCT18020889)
[SHCR3B3G]
TP
EKOWATT PTE LTD
Feb 27 2018 12:00PM
[COMFORT TRANSPORTATION PTE LTD]
Ja Autocare Pte Ltd

Upload Documents | _upioad Photos | _Compose tew Lemer | View [View in Browser | =]
Photos/Images e
No |Relabel/Reorder | LXX Auto Consultants Pte Ltd (HQ) ' Thumbnall | Print
1 DS/0V1818:37 | Chassis Number © | adws | BA
(2 |05/03/18 18:37  Odometer Reading S O isdrs | &
|13 |0S5/03/18 18:32 General View D | loadirs | B
4 |DS/03/18 18:32 Ganeral View D | lcadrs A |
S 0503181832 General View I | @ | womiwe | 2|
6 | ON03/1818:32 | Genersl View o 0O | s | @
7 |05/0318 1832 | General View a O ww: | A
& 0503181832 | General View - © | e | 2
% 05/03/18 18:32 | General View 0 | oaws |
10 DS/ON1B18:32 | Genersl View - | @ | Losares | B
11 | 05/03/18 18:32 | General View a © | dws | @
(12 [05/03/18 1832 | Genaral View O wurs | &
(13 [05/03/1818:32 | General View @ | osswes | & |
(14 |0S/01/1818:32 | Gemers] View O irvs | & |
15 |0S/03/18 18:32 General View o © | waws | E'
16 05/03/1818:32 | Genersl View - | @ | touws | B
17 |05/03/18 18:32 | General View - o |0 | Leadies | B
18 | 05/D3/1B 18:32 General View D | oadiec | A
19 |D5/03/18 18:32 | General View 0 s || A
20 05/03/18 1832 | General View O | lsdirc | A
21 [0S/03/18 18:32 | General View B O  lodrs | B
22 [0S/03/18 18:32 | General View - o O | wairs | @
73 |DS/03/18 18:327 | GenersiView O | s | @A
24 |BN/G3I8 18:32 | General View 0O eaws | A |
25 |05/03/18 18:32 | General View - O | imaws | @
26 08/03/18 18:32 | General View - o I_l_ Load 76 | 4 |
27 05/03/18 18:32 | General View © | Lsovws | @ |
28 05/03/18 18:12 | General View 0 | loasies | B2
29 05/03/1818:32  General View Q| owrs B |
30 [05/03/18 18:32 | Ganeral View 0 | toaaws | A '
31 [05/03/18 18:32 | Gemersl View @ | leaaws | A
32 [05/03/18 16:32 | Genmersl View © wars B
133 [05/03/18 18:32 | Ganersl View - | @ | Load P
._11 05/03/18 18:32 Ganeral View | @) | Loadiec | BA
15 |05/01/18 18:32 | General View O | edws | R
36 05/03/18 18:32 | Genersl View . © | s | |
37 0S/03/1818:32 | General View B 0 'LEE i?

https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRdoc& fuseaction=dsp_docvi... 8/5/2018



Merimen e-Claims Page 2 of 2

Photos/1mages .
No_|Relabel/Reorder | LKX Auto Consultants Pte Ltd (HQ) Thumbnail
ﬂ@u&ul 1837 [General View o T
30 (05/03/1818:32 | Genersl View
40 DS/OVIB18:32 | General View
41 (0S/03/18 18:32 | General View

g
a
SRR

Documentation
No | Relabel/Reorder | LKK Auto Consultants Pte Lid (HQ)
L 01/03/18 12:37 EMAIL FROM III DD 01032018

Fi 01/03/16 12:41 TP GIA REPORT .

3 OB/03/18 1748 | TP ESTIMATE- MARKED

4 20/03/18 1454 | WORKSHOP INVOICE
IS  |20/03/18 14:54 | LOD
-1

7
No_|
1

i
3
3|

|

H
3

|

© occoococe i oo
:
|

_|OB/05/18 09:40 AUTHORISATION TO ACT FORM
t!.l'l]i}l! ﬂ_ﬂ '.fﬂ DISCHARGE W..

Finalzed On India International Insurance Ple Ltd (HG)
DZ/03/18 O8:41 Singapore Accident Statement

EEE
33|13
i

i:
£

;
3
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LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd icoreg o 1sssor1sen;
51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25, Paya Ubi Industrial Park

Singapore 408833
Tel: 6256-3561 Fax: 6844-8805 Email: sur@lkkauto com:assignments@ikkauto.com

VEHICLE DAMAGE INSPECTION REPORT

Qur File No:  CC4/1118003853/UMB30Q2

Date: 08/05/2018
REFERENCE
Handling Insurer:  India Intermational Insurance Pie Lid Policy MNo: MCOMDO15S
vialmant Vehicle GaGg178H Insured Vehicle No : SHC8383G
Date of Loss: 27/02/2018 Nature of Claim TP Claim No: MCT18020889
DESCRIPTION & IDENTIFICATION OF VEHICLE
Reg No: GBGB1TBH
Make & Model: TOYOTA DYMNA 150, 3.0 D (M) Engine No: 1KD2751820
Reg. Date 0B/1172017 (Man. Year: 2017) Chassis No; JTFATASYX0K209172
Colour: Silver Odometer: 11803 km
Engine Capacily: 2082 cc
Markel Value/New Car Prices N/A
Sum Insured (S3): Market Value/New Car Price
M E I
Geaneral Condition Steenng (Serviceable): Yes Footbrake (Serviceable): Yes
Handbrake (Serviceable); Yes Engine Maodification; No  Pre-accident Condition:
CONDITION OF TYRES
Front Tyre Size: 185/75 R15 Rear Tyre Size: 1585 R12 (D)
Front Left Side: Brndgestone 8 mm Rear Left Side: Bridgestone 6/6 mm
Front Right Side: Bridgestone & mm Rear Right Side: Bridgestona B/8 mm
The abave vialiea represent [he remaming Iyma beacs deh
COST OF CLAIMS - Repairer's Adjuster's Difference  Diff %
Paris 3.894.72 2511.28 1.383.47 35.52
Miscellaneous llems 0.00 0.00 0.00
Labour 2,150.00 1,280.00 870.00 40,47
Paintwork Labour 0.00 0.00 0.00
Towing 0.00 0.00 0.00
Calculated Gross Total (S$) 6,044.72 3,791.25 2,253.47 3r.28
Approved Total (Overridden) (55) 3.000.00
Mett Amount (5§) 6,044.72 3,000.00 3,044.72 50.37
+ Loss of Usa (5.0 x $§100.00/day) (S§) 500.00
Nett Liability (55) 3,500.00
INSPECTION
Date of Assignment: 050372018
Date Inspecied: 05/0372018 Inspected At Ja Autocare Pte Ltd
8 KAK| BUKIT AVE 4, 802-37
PREMIER@KAKI BUKIT
Singapore 415875
Estimated Period of Repair: 4.0 days
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Adjuster: MARCUS CHUA Manager: Lim Chin Siong Bevan

NOTE: This repart represants our findings af ihe tr and pisce of inspaction staled haredn, Such inspection has been coarred oul to the best of our
knowlsdge and ahilily but any other lahility undar sy ottar circumstances is hersby expressly srciuded
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REPAIR DETAILS

Reference

Part Source: (Last Synchronised: 20 Mar 2018)

Parts: W& TOYOTA DYNA 150 3.0 D (M) (Model not available in database)
Labour: Repairar's (Price-denominated Standard List)

Print Code: (Unsubmitted, no print-code for GBGB178H)

Validity: These estimates are valid only if they contain the print code {above) on all estimate pages, running page
numbers with the END OF ESTIMATES marker on the last estimate page

Further Info: lemsvalues not i reference catalogue are prefied with an aserisk |

Recommended Parts

No. Qty PartNo. Particulars Condition Repairer's Amount
1 1 *TAIL GATE DROP PANEL Dented / Bent 168000FL *1.680.00FL
2 2 *TAIL GATE HINGES Repair 480,00 FL =FL
3 1 *TAIL GATE SIDE METAL /S Bent B4D.00FL *148 10FL
4 1 *TAIL LAMP RH Cracked 250,80 FL *250 80 FL
5 1 *EXHAUST PIPE Dented / Deformed 880.50 FL *781.10FL
B 1 *TOYOTA LOGO MNecessary 120,00 FL *120.00 FL
7 1 *‘DUNA LOGOD Necessary 35.00 FL *35.00 FL
B 1 "8PAX STICKER Necessary 2000FS *10.00FS
9 1 ‘TOKM/H Necessary 20.00FS *10.00FS
10 1 *SET REVERSE SENSOR Shorted 250,00 F5 *200.00FS
" 1 ‘REAR NUMBER PLATE EMBOSS Bent B5.00FS *30.00FS
12 1 *REAR STEP GARNISH Repair 250.00 FS *-F8

F=Franchise pan. S=SpcNett L=LsMamDsc

Sub Total [55) 4.991.30 3,265.00

- List Item Discount on L ltems 25.00/25.00% (S$) 1,006.58 75375

Total Parts (S$) 3,894.72 2511.25

| Report was unsubmitted during this print-out. |
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Recommended Miscellaneous Items
Thera are no new miscellansous items selected,
Recommended Labour
No Particulars Lab.Type Repairer's Amount
Labour ltams
1 TO CHECK WIRING New 150.00 20.00
2 TO DISMANTLE EXHAUST New 200.00 60.00
3 TO KNOCK OUT DENTS ON AFFECTED AREAS RENEW New 1,000.00 600.00
PARTS
4  TOPUTTY & RESPRAY PAINTING New B00.00 600.00
Gross Labour Cost (S$) 2,150.00 1,280.00
Reporl was unsubmitted during this print-out ]
< END OF ESTIMATES >
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