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51 UBEAVE L #01-25 PAYA UBLINDUSTRIAL PARK, SINGAPORE 408933 TEL : (063) 62563561 FAX 1 (065) G564 E

Our Ref: CC6/AIG18003952/Uhb3
18 APRIL 2019

TAMPINES OPTICAL & CONTACT LENS CENTRE PTE LTD
BLK 825 TAMPINES STREET 81

#01-72

SINGAPORE 520825

Dear Sir/Madam,
ACCIDENT INVOLVING SKTS8Z AND GBE617X ON 18/02/2018

We refer to the above accident where we are acting for AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte Lid to resolve
the claim against you and/or your authorized driver under the Auto Insurance policy taken up with
them.

We have received a claim from GBE617X against your motor insurance policy.

Both parties involved have given conflict of version, Based on the circumstances of accident and both
parties damage profile, there is no conclusive evidence to substantiate either's parties version,
Pursuant to the above said accident wherein you and/or your authorized driver had amongst other
information given us your version of how the accident had occurred, we as the appointed agent of
vour insurers shall proceed to negotiate for an amicable settlement with third party claimant.

IT you have evidence/information to proof that we should not settle the third party claim, kindly let us
have them in writing within the next 10 days ie by 0L/05/2019, after we shall proceed with
negotiation with Third Party claimant on the without prejudice basis and any settlement should not
bind any claims whatsoever by you'your driver against the other party's insurer arising from this
particular accident.

Please note that your No-Claim Discount (NCD) (if any) will be affected and reduced by 30% (20%
for commercial vehicles) upon next renewal due to this Third Party claim. However, if your policy
has a NCD protector feature, it will be deemed utilized for this claim and your NCD will be protected.

Please call us if you have further queries.

Yours faithfully,
(

KHANCHNA
Case Handler
DID: 6841 2360
FAX: 6741 4108

Email: vicalpeh@Ilkkauto.com

ce  AlG Asia Pacific Insurance Pre Lid
{Motar Claims Dept)




Jia Le (LKK Auto)

e ———————— e ————————

From: AbwinMO - Linda Liao <lindaliao@AbwinM3.com>

Sent: Thursday, 20 June 2019 2:57 PM

To: Admin A <admin-a@Ikkauto.com>

Subject: Re: GBE617X And SKTS8Z Accident on 28/02/2018 Loyang Ave Towards TPE

Dear Officer
Regarding above mentioned vehicle with draw the case.
Thank you

** Notice

Our emall address has changed, please update your records.

With effect from 19" March 2019, my primary email address will change to lindaliao@AbwinM8.com

Please update my contact information In your address book and direct your messages to my new email address.

¥ou messages are important to me, thanks for keeping my information up to date.

Warmest regards,

wABWINS

Servier [emire

Linda Liao

Claims Execulive
DID +85 6713 9417
HP +65 9751 9596

Abwin Service Pte Ltd

T+B856713 8400 | F 4858713 8415

No. 8 Kaki Bukit Avenue 4

#07-48 Premier @ Kaki Bukit Gate 2 Singapore 415875

. ® @& ) O &3
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Jia Le !LI(I( Auto)

From: Jia Le (LKK Auta]

Sent: Wednesday, 10 July 2019 2:41 PM

To: Chan, Kian-Meng

Subject: Your ref: 734336577456 * GBEG17X And SKT58Z Accident on 28/02/2018 Loyang

Ave Towards TPE ***LKK REF:CC6/AIG18003952/Udb3

Dear Kian Meng,
Third party had withdraw the claim and we will proceed to submit WP report.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Carlor Chan | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6749 5792 | email: Jiales |kkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51. Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: AbwinM2 - Linda Liao <lindaliao @AbwinMS. com>

Sent: Thursday, 20 June 2019 2:57 PM

To: Admin A <admin-a@lkkautp.com>

Subject: Re: GBE617X And SKTS8Z Accident on 28/02/2018 Loyang Ave Towards TPE

Dear Officer

Regarding above mentioned vehicle with draw the case.

Thank you

** Motice

Our email address has changed, please update your records.

With effect from 19™ March 2019, my primary email address will change to |indaliaof@AbwinM8.com

Please update my contact information in your address book and direct your messages to my new emall address.
You messages are important to me, thanks for keeping my information up to date.

Warmest regards,

wABWIN

Service | onere

Linda Liao

Claims Executive
DID +85 6713 9417
HP +85 9751 9596

Abwin Service Pte Ltd

T+B5671358400 | F+856713 9415

MNo. B Kaki Bukit Avenue 4

#07-48 Premier @ Kaki Bukit Gale 2 Singapare 415875






L0 G
el BA Yo i
SEUHEAVE 1, 90025 1A% A UBLISDUSTRIAL PARK, SINGAPORE JU8908 TEL 06351 62305501 AN © (651 62304315

Our Ref: CCH/AIG| BOU3952/URb3
05 MAR 2018

TAMPINES OPTICAL & CONTACT LENS CENTRE PTE LTD
BLK B25

#01-72

TAMPINES STREET 81

Singapore 520825

Diear Sirs.

ACCIDENT INVOLVING SKT 5872 AND GBE 617X ON 28.02.2018 ALONG AT
NG TOW

We, LKK Auto Consultants Pre Lid has been appointed 1o act on the behalf of your insurer, AlG
Asia Pacific Insurance Pte Lid (AIG) to settle a THIRD PARTY claim against you for an accident
which happened on the above-mentioned date and location.

Kindly proceed to lodge your GIA report within five (05) working days of receipt of this lener,
giving the version of the accident amongst other things related to the accident. The GIA repon
can be lodged at any of AIG reporting centres. You may refer to your Certificate of Insurance for
the list of the reporting centres.

If you have any information to add or any amendments 1o make, please contact the undersigned
within five days from the date of this letter,

Flease note that the standing of your insurance policy such as NCD. premium & etc would be
nffecied.

Yours faithfully,

R\

Vic Alpeh Sanghilan

Claims

Tel : 6841 2006

Fax: 6741 4108

Emuail : vicalpeh @ lkkauto com

(s Claims Manager
Al Asia Pavific Insuwrance Pre Led
{Motor Claims Dept)
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Our Ref: CC6/AIG18003952/Uhb3
21 NOVEMBER 2018

TAMPINES OPTICAL & CONTACT LENS CENTRE PTE LTD By Registered Mail
BLOCK 285 TAMPINES STREET 81

#01-72

SINGAPORE 520825

ATIN: THE MANAGEMENT

Deaor Sir/Madam,

ACCIDENT INVOLVING SKT 587 AND GBE 617X ON 28/02/2018 ALONG LOYANG AVENUE
TOWARDS TPE AT AROUND 0845HOURS

We, LKK Auto Consultants Pte Lid has been appointed to act on the behalt of your insurer, AIG
Asia Pacific Insurance Pte Lid to settle a THIRD PARTY claim against you tor an accident which
happened on the above-mentionad date and location.

Our record shows tha!l fo date, you/your driver have nol reported the accident fo us. We
would appreciate il if you could urgently file a report at any of AIG reporting centre. You may
refer to your Cerfificate of iInsurance for the list of the reporting centre.

Please note you had been nofified via post from our office dated 05/03/2018.

To enable us 1o look Into the matter immediately, please let us hear from you within fourteen
| 14) days from date of this letter [by 07/12/2018).

Please be reminded that in accordance with the terms and conditions under your pclicy.
failure of compliance, our principal M/s AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte Lid reserves the right 1o
repudiate liability.

If you need further assistance or clarifications, please contact the undersigned.

Yours faithfully,

Vig/Alpeh /

e ell'H dler
DID: 1 2094

Foo: 6741 4108
Ermail: vicalpeh@lkkauto.com

c.c. Claims Manager
AlG Asia Pacific Insurance Ple Lid
(Motor Claims Dept)



To : Traffic Police — Deputy Head, Investigations Department
Fax : 65474885

ONLY FOR ACCIDENTS IN SINGAPORE

NON-INJURY MOTOR ACCIDENT REPORT SCHEME
FORM ON NON-REPORTING BY INSUREDS

Please be informed that we have yet to receive a motor accident report from our
insured with regard to a non-injury motor accident as follows:-

Date of accident . 28/02/2018

Time of accident - 0B45HRS

Place of accident . LOYANG AVENUE TOWARDS TPE

Third Party's name : MR LOH

Third Party's vehicle number : GBEB17TX

Our insured's name : M/s TAMPINES OPTICAL & CONTACT
LENS CENTRE PTE LTD

Our insured's vehicle number . SKT 582

Our insured's NRIC number . 200200092C

Our insured's address - BLOCK 825 TAMPINES STREET 81 #01-72

SINGAPORE 520825
Our Insured's telephone number : nil

A letter dated (05/03/2018) was sent to remind our insured to report the non-injury
Smotor accident to us. No report has yet been made.

Please do not hesitate to contact the following for any clarification on the matter.
(Please cite our reference number:( CC6/AIG18003952/Uhb3)

Name and address of insurance company : AlG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte Ltd
Chartis Building
78 Shenton Way, #08-16
Singapore 079120

Name of contact person : Vic Sanghilan

Contact Number : 6256 3561 / Fax: 6741 4108

Date 1211172018
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View Sent Message

This mail is associated with :

*GBES17X (734336577456G)
[SKTSBZ]
™
ALOY & JEM SERVICES
Feb 28 2018 8:45AM
[TAMPINES OPTICAL B CONTALCT LENS CENTRE PTE LTD]
Abwin Service Pre Ltd

From LEK Auto Consultants Pte Lid (LKK_HQ), sent on 13/03/2019 13:39 PM.

To NoorMariesa. AbuKassim@aig.com; ShengYang, Lim@aig.com; Imran Ishak@alg.com; yokeshi.chan@aig.com; Aashweenjeetiaur.Mithoosi
nghialg.com; Syazalrdina Azlan@alg.com; Yinrul Horaig.com

cC AIG_SG; admin-a@lkkauto.com; vicalpeh@lkkauto.com

Subject  Re: No O1 GIA Report

Dear Sir / Madam,
We refer tn the above matter.

Kindly advise whether insured has reparted. If so, kindly let us have a copy of insured's accident report fof our necessary action,
Thank you.

Best Regards,
Suwanna te-uttaruang
LKK Auto Consultants Pie Ltd

<== Original Message -->

From: AIG_SG

To: LKE_HQ; Admin-a@lkkauto.com; vicalpeh@lkkauto.com
Sent On: 21/11/2018 09:01 AM

Subject: Ae: Fw: Re: No O GIA Report

Hi,

Insured has not report accident till date.
Kindly refer to insured contact details below for your necessary action.

(Thanks & Regards,
¥in Rul, Hor (Viviane)

<-- Original Message —>

From: LKK_HQ

ITo: AlG_SG; Sheng¥Yang.Lim@alg.com; Imran.Ishaki#alg.com; NoorMariesa. AbuKassim@alg.com; yokeshi.chan@aig.com
CC: Admin-aifhlkkauto.com; vicalpehiikkauto.com

Sent On: 20/11/2018 07:37 PM

Subject: Fw: Re: Mo 01 GIA Report

Dear Sir/Madam,

We refer to the subject matter

Kindly assist to upload OI GIA report In merimen if avallabie.
Thank you.

Vic Alpeh
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
Tel: 6841 2096

<-- Original Massage —>

From: LKK_HQ

To: AIG_SG: ShengYang.Lim@alg.com; Imran.Ishak@alg.com; NoorMariesa, AbuKassim@alg com; yokeshi chaniaig.com
CC! Admin-a@ikkauto.com; vicalpeh@lkkauto.com

Sent On: 23/04/2018 01:11 PM

Subject: Re: No 01 GIA Report

Dear Sir/Madam,
hitps://singapore.merimen com/claims/index cfm7fusebox=SYCmailAluseaction=dsp_viewSmode=048imsgid=17574414iSendarAllasid=12&I0omainid... 112



3132018 Merimen e-Claims

[Kindly assist to upioad OI GIA report in merimen If available.
Thank you.

Vic Alpeh
LKK Auto Congultants Pte Ltd
Tal: 6841 2096

<= Original Message —>

From: AlG_SG

To: LKK_HQ

Sent On: 02/03/2018 01:49 PM
Subject: No Ol GIA Report

Hi

Fis be advice that no O1 GIA report recaived
Pls find Ol detalls below for your further actions

QI name - TAMPINES OPTICAL & CONTACT LENS CENTRE PTE LTD
Afdrass |

laLx 825

#01-72

TAMPINES STHEET B1

Singapore 520825

Mobile No: -

[ Thank you

Regards
Darshene

|DOCUMENTS SUMMARY

| There are no documents,

I

hitps:/isingapore. merimen.camiclaims/index. cim Husebox=SVCmail&fuseacton=dsp_view&mode=0&imsgid=1757441&iSenderAliasid=12&iDomainld.
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51 LIBEAVE 1, #01.25 PAYA UBIINDUSTRIAL PARK, SINGAPORE 408913 TEL : 1065) 62563561 FAX ; (065) 62564515
Our Ref: CC6/AIG 18003952/Uhb3

21 MARCH 2019 By Registered Mail
(FINAL REMINDER)

TAMPINES OPTICAL & CONTACT LENS CENTER PTE LTD

BLOCK 285 TAMPINES ST B

SINAGPORE 520285

ATTN : THE MANAGEMENT
Dear Sir,

ACCIDENT INVOLVING SKT S8Z AND GBE 617X ON 28/02/2018 ALONG/AT
LOYANG AVENUE TOWARDS TPE AT AROUND 0845 H

We refer to the above subject matter, Your insurer AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte Lid (AlG)
has received a third party claim(s) against your motor insurance policy, and has appointed LKK
Auto Consuliams Pre Lid to act on their behalf 10 handle this marter.

We highlight that this accident has not been reported 10 AIG.

Please note that you had been notified by our via mail by post from our office on 05/03/018 &
21/11/2018.

Kindly proceed to lodge your accident report immediately, giving the version of the accident
amongst other things related to the accident. The accident report can be lodged at any of AIG
reporting centres. For the listing of AIG reporting centres, you may refer to your Centificate of
Insurance or visit AlG Singapore's website.

To enable us to look into the matter immediately, please let us hear from you within fourteen
{14) days from date of this letter (by 04 APRIL 2019).

Please be reminded that in accordance with the terms and conditions under your policy, failure
of compliance, our principal M/s AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte Ltd reserves the right 10
repudiate liability.

If you need further assistance or clarifications, please contact the undersigned.

Yoturs ﬁ:gfithﬂ.l]ly,

Vic Alpeh Sanghilan
Claims

Tel : 6841 2096
Fax: 6741 4108

Email : vicalpeh@lkkauto.com

cc Claims Manager
AIG Asia Pacific insurance Fre. Lid

fMotar Claims Dept)



To : Traffic Police - Deputy Head, Investigations Department
Fax : 65474885

ONLY FOR ACCIDENTS IN SINGAPORE

NON-INJURY MOTOR ACCIDENT REPORT SCHEME
FORM ON NON-REPORTING BY INSUREDS

Please be informed that we have yet to receive a motor accident report from our
insured with regard to a non-injury motor accident as follows:-

Date of accident . 2B/028/2018

Time of accident : 0B45HRS

Place of accident © LOYANG AVENUE TOWARDS TPE

Third Party's name : MR LOH

Third Party's vehicle number - GBEB17X

Our insured's name © M/s TANPINES OPTICAL & CONTACT
LENS CENTRE PTE LTD

Our insured's vehicle number . SKT 582

Our insured's NRIC number 200200092C

Our insured's address : BLOCK 285 TAMPINES STREET 81

SINGAPORE 520825

Our Insured's telephone number : NIL

A letter dated ( 21/11/2018) was sent to remind our insured to report the non-injury
motor accident to us. No report has yet been made.

Please do not hesitate to contact the following for any clarification on the matter.
(Please cite our reference number: (CC6/AIG18003952/Uhb3)

Name and address of insurance company : AlG ASIA PACIFIC INSURANCE PTE LTD

78 SHENTON WAY

#08-16

Singapore 079120
Name of contact person Vic Alpeh Sanghilan
Contact Number : 6841 2096 / Fax: 6741 4108

Date 14/03/2019
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Merimen e-Claims Page 1 of 1

.«.CLAIM SUBFOLDER...{Pending for Survey Report)

Beyghed [ No aetllement

;CLAIM SUBFOLDER TRACKING

| Case | Notifing | Est Submitted | Ad) Assigned Adj Rt Ad] Submitted | Ins Autied SLatus

' o i[m Mar 2018 | gé:':: 2018 £$330.00 5$330.00 m Sow Suyvery
| Llum | l Edit Ad) Rpt I fdft Extirnates [ Wiew Rpt | | Cln:!rml

Main

CLAIM SUBFOLDER DETAILS
Insured: TAMPIMES OPTICAL &k CONTACT LENS CENTRE PTE LTD, Co. Keg. Mo Z00Z00092C

:::I.:n an.  ALOY & JEM SERVICES, Co. Reg. No.: 530831738

[venicie Reg . | IBSOR/ID1E 0B:00 - 159
INo.; GRER1IX Date of LOSS: | {39 Months and 1 Days From LTA fleg Date (Man ¥r)]

TP/ 734336577456 Policy/Cover | onannnian (Comprehenaive)

Note No.:

Policy No. |
SKTSBZ (Claimant); | 9973472433-02

L I Excess: |

Abwin Service Pte Ltd (HQ) No. B Kaki Bult Avenue &, #0745 Premier@ikaki Bukit Gate 2. 415875 Kaki Bukit - Tel 6713 9400
Hangdling AlG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte. Ltd. (Express) - Tel: £5-6418-3000 ., [Handied by Chan, Klan-Meng]

| Insurer: Kianmeng.Chanl @sig com

'l_:mmanl.‘l Ins

Insurer: = EETPERtY It - ]
Adjustzr | LNK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd (HQ) - Tel 6256-3561 .. [Handled by MARCUS CHUA] ... [Final Rpt due 12/03/2018]

ASSOCIATED MAIL RECEIVED view Al |  Compose Case Mad ||

's AlG_SG(11/11/2018): Re: Fw: Rez Mo OI GIA Report |
* AIG_SG (02/03/2018): No OT GIA Report
< AlG_SG (02/03/2018): Request Te Upload TP GIA Report |

ALL ASSOCIATED TASKS= view Al | Search Tasis | Create new Task | compinte ||
|

Due Date Priority Type Task Group Subject Handler Asgigned Dy Completed On Created On DonaT
| Mo results.

https://singapore. merimen.com/claims/index.¢fm?fusebox=MTRadjuster&fuseaction=dsp_... 18/7/2019
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Claim Documents

*GBEG17X (73433657745G)
[SKT58Z]
T

ALOY & JEM SERVICES
Feb 28 2018 8:45AM
[TAMPINES OPTICAL B CONTACT LENS CENTRE PTE LTD]
Abwin Service Pte Ltd

uﬂuw| up-lm| Compise hew Letter | umw—_’_u!_mm] View [View n Browser v
Assessmant Reports 1 per page v _E
[No_[Finalizes Cn AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte. Ltd, (5G) Thumbnail | Print
1 |SMEVID 35:04 From: 5T - Reg, Ne: SKTHAZ, Clalinast: TAMPINES OFTICAL & CONTACT LENS CENTRE PTE LTD 1 o | LasgHin |
Photos/Images } Sperpoge | v]
Ho  Melabel/Reorder | LKK Auto Consultants Pte Lid {HG) Thumbnail | Print
1 UNTA/I8 17:37 | Chassis Number O | eawrs | 4
2 040V 17:37 | Odemeter Reading 0 | lcedws |
|3 owOW1B 1737 | Genersl View @ | Leadirc |
'a |OWDVIB 1737 | Genarsl View ©O | ladaws &
's on/0Y1817:37 | General View © | cac | A |
& |01/03/18 17:37 General View 0 | loadaes | (4 |
7 |0MDVIB 1737 | General View 0 | oedirs | A |
& DY0318 1737 General View 0 | oosws
8 DYOINBIT3T | General View ) | Loadrc
10 0UO0VIA17:37 | General View 0D | lceairs | 4|
1l DIONIB17:37  General View 0O | wodwc | A
12 DNOIIB17:37 General View | @ | woeadrs | @A
13 |D1/03/18 17:37 General View | Y | toadieG | 4
14 DUOIIB 1737 | General View | ) | weadres | A
|'I'.l-mumnuﬂnn 1 per page e E_
[No |Relabel/Reorder | LKK Auto Consultants Pie Lid (HQ) [ Thumbnail | Print
|t [D2/03/1815:35 | TP ESTIMATE- MARKED ) | Load poF
|2 |02/03/18 15:35 TP GIA REPORT 3 Load POF
|2 |05/03/18 11:24 | Won reporting letter Laad PDF
4 | 21/11/18 15:41 15T AR LETTER AND TRAFFICE POLICE LETTER ) | Losd FOF
|5 | 18/04/19 09:36 LETTER TO O1 0 | LoadroF
& l1mor/1e 09:24 Reglstered Mall Fee = [« BT

Documents Checklist
DOCUMENTS CHECKLIST feset | save | prine |
There are na decument checklists configured,
Checklist Remarks - LKK Auto Consultants Pre Lid (HQ]

Fo
T

Show Remarks To: L] Handling Insurer

Tt B W e U pol iR 8 S Siher Db

https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRdoc&fuseaction=dsp_doc... 18/7/2019
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Adjuster Report Page | of 4
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd (co reg ne 1sssorissry
51 Ubi Ave 1#01-25, Paya Ubi Industrial Park
Singapore 408933
Tel: 6256-3561 Fax: 6844-8805 Email: sur@lkkauto.com;assignments@Ikkauto.com
VEHICLE DAMAGE INSPECTION REPORT
Our Flle No: CC8/AIG18003852/UDB302
Date: 18/07/2019
REFERENCE
Handling Insurer: AlG Asia Pacific Insurance Ple. Lid Palicy No: 1800000120
ﬁ:":““'“' Vehicle oeg17x Insured Vehicle No : SKT58Z
Date of Loss: 28022018 Mature of Claim! TP Claim No: 734338577456
SCRIPTION ENTI
Reg No: GBEB1TX
Make & Model: TOYOTA HIACE, 3.0 D (M) Engine No: 1KD2541345
Reg. Dale: 2710872015 (Man. Year: 2015) Chassis No KDOHZ01501B478
Colour: Silver Odometer. 1202588 km
Engine Capacity: 2882 cc
Marke! Value/™New Car Price:  N/A
Sum Insured (S53) Market Value/New Car Price

CONDITION OF VEHICLE AT THE TIME OF SURVEY

General Conditlon; Steering (Serviceabla): Yes Footbrake (Serviceable): Yes
Handbrake (Serviceabla) Yes Engine Modification Ne  Pre-accident Condition:
CONDITION OF TYRES
Front Tyre Size: 185 R15 Rear Tyre Size: 195 R15
Front Left Side Michelin B mm Rear Left Side: Michelin 8 mm
Front Right Side Michelin 6 mm Rear Right Side: Michelin 6 mm
The above values represen! the remaining fre reads depth
COST OF CLAIMS E— Repairer's  Adjuster's Difference  Diff %)
Parts 1,188.87 30.00 1,1658.87 07 .48
Miscellansous llems 0.00 0.00 0.00
Labour 1,000.00 300.00 700.00 70.00
Paintwork Labour 0.00 0.00 0.00
Towing 0.00 0.00 0.00
Gross Total (S§) 2,188.87 330.00 1.858.87 84.92
+ GST 7.00/7.00% (S%) 153.22 23.10 130.12 B4.02
Nett Amount (S§) 2,342.09 353.10 1,988.99 84.92
Global Sum Settlement (S3) 0.00
INSP |
Date of Assignment: 01/03/2018
Date Inspecied 01/0372018 Inspected At Abwin Service Pie Lid (HQ)
No. 8 Kaki Bukit Avenue 4, #07-48
Premier@Kaki Bukil Gate 2
Singapore 415875
Estimated Period of Repair: 1.0 days
https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRadjuster&fuseaction=gen_... 18/7/2019



Adjuster Report Page 2 of 4

Adjuster: MARCUS CHUA Manager: CHAN JIA LE

NOTE. Thie repart represents our Rndings af the lime and plece of inspection stated horein. Such inspection has been camed out o the best of au
krowiecpe and ability bul any other kablily under any other circemstances fs hereby sxpresaly ercluded

https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRadjuster&fuseaction=gen_... 18/7/2019



Adjuster Report

REPAIR DETAILS

Recommended Parts

Page 3 of 4

No. Qty PartMo.  Particulars Condition Repairer's Amount
11 *RH FRONT DOOR Repair 1.498.50 FL “FL
2 1 *RH FRONT DOOR STICKER Necessary B5.00FS *3D.00FS
FeFrancrese pan. S=Spehen L=ListhemDisc
Sub Total (S5) 1,563.50 30.00
= List Item Discount on L ltems 25.00/25.00% (S§) 37463 0.00
Total Parts (SS) 1,188.87 30.00
Report was unsubmitted during this print-out.
https:/singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRadjuster& fuscaction=gen_... 18/7/2019



Adjuster Report Page 4 of 4

Recommended Miscellaneous Iltems

There are no new miscellaneous Hems selected.

Recommended Labour

No  Particulars Lab.Type Repairer's Amount

Labour ltems

1 TO STRAIGHTEN AND PANEL BEAT ACCIDENT AREAS MNew 300.00 100.00

2 TO TRANSFER AND REFIX FRONT DOOR FIXTURE New 250,00 0.00

3 TO SPRAY PAINT ON AFFECTED AREAS New 300,00 200,00

4 TO SPRAY PAINT ON RH CORNER PAMNEL New 150.00 0.00
Gross Labour Cost (55) 1,000.00 300.00

Report was unsubmitied during this print-out.

< END OF ESTIMATES >

https://singapore.menimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRadjuster&fuseaction=gen_... 18/7/2019



