Vic (LKKAuto)

B e

From: Vic (LKKAuto)

Sent: Monday, 24 September, 2018 10:42 AM

To: Irene Tay

Cc: Alfred Toh; Admin A; Vic (LKKAUtO)

Subject: RE: <SEEK MANDATE=> RE: Direct Settlement - Accident Involving GW2487L (Ol

CAI - SNM18D00274C02) AND SCR2108E (TP : LKK REF - CC6/CTI18003950/Ahb3 )
on 13.01.2018

Dear Irene,
We refer to your below email.
Please be informed that we had settled the matter with TP at a global sum of 58,180.00 (all in).

Thank you,

Best Regards,

Vie Alpeh | Case Handler

LEK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841-2006 | email: vicalpeh@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

¥ LY =2

SLERER SN Suve the Earthe Print only when necessary:

This e-mail contain confidential and privileged material, and are for the sole use of the intended recipient. Use or distribution by an
unintended recipient is prohibited, and may be a violation of law. If you believe that you received this e-mail in error, please do not
read this e-mail or any attached items. Please delete the e-mail and all attachments, including any copies thereof, and inform the
sender that you have deleted the e-mail, all attachments and any copies thereof. Thank you.

From: Irene Tay [mailto:irene.tay@sg.cntaiping.com)

Sent: Friday, 10 August, 2018 12:59 PM

To: Vic (LKKAuto)

Cc: Alfred Toh; Admin A

Subject: RE: <SEEK MANDATE> RE: Direct Settlement - Accident Involving GW2487L (Ol : CAl - SNM18D00274C02)
AND SCR2108E (TP : LKK REF - CC6/CTI18003950/Ahb3 ) on 13.01.2018

Dear Vic,

We refer to the above matter and your email below,

You may proceed fo offer $ 8,487.45 (For TL, LOU, LTA & Towing).
Thank you.

Regards,

Irene Tay
Executive
Claims Department (Motor Division)



Vic (LKKAuto)

From: Irene Tay <irene tay@sg.cntaiping.com:

Sent: Friday, 10 August, 2018 12:59 PM

To: Vic (LKKAuUto)

Cc: Alfred Toh; Admin A

Subject: RE: <SEEK MAMNDATE=> RE: Direct Settlement - Accident Involving GW2487L (O1 .

CAI - SNM1B8D00274C02) AND SCR2108E (TP . LKK REF - CCH/CTILB003950/ANhb3 )
on 13.01.2018

Dear Vic,
We refer to the above matter and your email below,

You may proceed to offer § 8,487.45 (For TL, LOU, LTA & Towing).
Thank you.
Regards,

Irene Tay
Executive
Claims Department (Motor Division)

China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pte. Ltd.

3 Anson Road #14-00 Springleaf Tower Singapore 079709
Direct (45) 4389 6192

Fox [&5) 82247478/62247175

Email; claimsdept@sg.cntaiping.com

wiww sg.cntaiping.com

ANNIYFHSARY
I Simgpapare sinee [958

Disclaimer !

This message is confidential; its contents do not constitute a commitment by China Taiping Insurance (Singapore} Pte. Ltd. excepi
where provided for in a written agreement between you and China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pre. Ltd Any unauthorized
disclosure, use or dissemination, either in whole or partial, is prohibited. If you are not the intended recipient of the message,
please notifi the sender immediately.

From: Vic (LKKAuto) [mailto:vicalpeh@lkkauto.com]

Sent: Wednesday, 8 August, 2018 10:51 AM

To: Claims Dept of CTl <claimsdept@sg.cntaiping.com=>

Cc: Irene Tay <irene. tay@sg.cntaiping.com>; Alfred Toh <alfred.toh@sg.cntaiping.com>; Admin A <admin-
a@lkkauto.com>; Vic (LKKAuto) <vicalpeh@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: <SEEK MANDATE> RE: Direct Settlement - Accident Involving GW2487L (Ol : CAl - SNM18D00274C02)
AND SCR2Z108E (TP : LKK REF - CC6/CTI18003950/Ahb3 ) on 13.01.2018

Importance: High



Datc

MG SOLUTION PTE LTD

23 Kaki Bukit Ave 4, AAS Kaki Bukit Centre #02-03 Singapore 415933
Tel: 6243 1373 Fax: 6243 1376
(GST Reg. No. 201427944N)

: 04/06/2018

Your Ref s GWI487L

To

Attn

: CHINA TAIPING INSURANCE (SINGAPORE) PTE LTD

: Motor Claims Department

Dear Sir/Mdm,

RE: ACCIDENT INVOLVING VEHICLE SCR2108E & GW2487L ON 13/01/2018 AT
JUNCTION OF COMPASSVALE DRIVE AND PUNGGOL ROAD.

We refer to the above matter.

Attached copies of the following for vour kind perusal:

1)

6)

Proforma Bill No. 188170 (@ 5%6,500.00 (Inclusive Of 7% GST)
Loss of Use (@ S85,460.00 (91 Days x S$60)

LTA Search (@ S$7.45

Towing Fee (@ S$180.00

Authorisation to Act

GIA Report

Hope the above is in order and kindly let us have your confirmation soon.

Tax invoice will be issue upon amount finalized.

Thank You.

Yours faithfully,

sholb

Sharon Chm

HP: 9188 6931
E-mail: mg3solution(@gmail.com
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21 UBLAVE 1, #01-25 PAYA UBI INDUSTRIAL PARK, SINGAPORE 408933 TEL : (063) 62563361 FAX: (063} 67414108

Our Ref: CC6/CTI18003950/AhbJ
10" May 2018

FUTURE HOME INTERIOR DESIGNS
156 Lorong Sarina,

Sarina Park,

Singapore 416714,

Dear Sir/Madam,

ROAD TRAFFIC ACCIDENT INVOLVING GW 2487L AND SCR 2108E AT
JUNCTION OF PUNGGOL ROAD AND COMPASSVALE DRIVE ON 13.01.2018

We refer to the above accident where we are acting for China Taiping Insurance
(Singapore) Pte Ltd to resolve the claim against you and/or your authorized driver under
the Auto Insurance policy taken up with them.

Pursuant to the above said accident wherein you and/or your authorized driver had
amongst other information given us your version of how the accident had occurred, we as
the appointed agent of your insurers shall proceed to negotiate for an amicable settlement
with third party claimant

If you have evidence/information to prove that we should not settle the third party claim,
kindly let us have them in writing within the next 10 days i.e. by 24/05/2018, after we
shall proceed with negotiation with Third Party claimant on the without prejudice basis
and any settlement should not bind any claims whatsoever by youw/your driver against the
other party’s insurer arising from this particular accident.

Please call us if you have further queries.

Yours faithfully,

Pohkin, Chong

Case Handler

DID: 6841 2132

FAX: 6741 4108

Email: vicalpehi@lkkauto.com

c.C China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pre Lid
(Motor Claims Dept)



LETTER OF AUTHORITY

Name . PHUA pufi KANG
Address - PLK X9IB (OMPASSUALE STREET
A0S AL aNEAPIRE (42293
Contact No
L CHING FRPING  INCUBAINCE ( SINGAPIET) PTE LTV
Dear Sirs,

accoenTivoving_ SCR MSRE 0 GWOYEIL oy (3for [uid
AT/ ALoNG__ JUNCTIOIN oF  COWPASS\LE DR & PuNLGLL gofp

/We, PHUWA PUAY  kan G
motorzarne, 8 Gk HME

, am/are the registered owner of

Please note that | have assigned all compensations monies due to me/us in the above said accident
to M/S MG SOLUTION PTE LTD.

I/We, hereby authorize you to release all compensation monies pertaining to the above-mentioned
accidentto M/S MG SOLUTION PTELTD and forward your settlement cheque to M/5 MG SOLUTION
PTE LTD whom | had authorized to collect the said compensation monies.

Thank you

Signature of Claimant Witness By



Provides
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Policy Ho DMCVENI0EG301702 Claim HNo @ SKNMIBDDODZTACOZ

Claimant : PHUA BPUAY XIANG

Amount : 558, 180.04

ETHGAFORE DOLLARS EIGHT THOUSAND ONE HUNDRED EIGHTY ONLY

I/We agree to acgept the above mentioned amouns te ke paid to mefus in full &
final settlement of ail ¢leims, costs & disburserents for ‘injuziss / damages
sustained by me/us through an aceident inweliing

Claimant Vehiele No. @ SCH ZI0EE

Insured Vehicle No. : GW Z487L
Date of Lose £ 13.01,2018
Place of atcldent * ALCOHE JUNCTION OF 2UNGGOL ROAD AND COMPASSVALE TRIVE

IN CONSIDERATION of che payment made Lo me/us of the afvrementicned sum by
CEINA TAIPING INSURANCE (SINGAPORE) PTE. LTD., I/We agree ghsclutely to
discharge CHINA TATPING INSURANCE (SINGAPORE)] PTE. LTD:. and/or

Insured Name ! Mfs FUTURE HOME INTERICR DESIGNS
Driver Nama i SALLEHUDDIN BIN S5AID

from all claims, preésent or future in respect of all Ioss, imjury or 'damage
sustained: by mefus arising out of the said accident.

I acknowledge that this payment is made without admission of liability op the
part of CHINA TAIPING INSURANCE (SINGAFORE) PTE. LTD.

(1) Glebal Sum (4ll in) 55 B,.180,00

SREODERSE ST T TS DI

PO e e 2 5 F 8 & 8 8 & 8 0 SEEiog 8;180.00

e o T T i

PHuA PM\{ KHN G NRIC No S¥ve 17118

Claimant Hame:

L as|eapork

Signature : Bate




Lahd Transport Aulharity

12 S0 Ming Dirive

Singapore S7TETM

GET Reagistration Mo, ; MA-D00E520-2
Print Date/Time 28 Feb 2018/ 10:42:36
Feceipt Dale/Time; 28 Feb 20187 10:42:36

Tax [H\FG|CE|‘REI:E|pt
Roceipt Mo, | ITNET-00000-180226-000520

Previous Receipt No

/N Item Description/ Amount GST  Amount
Business Transactlon Reference Before Amount After GST
Mo, GST (55) (5%) (5%)

Result of Insurance Enguiry - GW2487L

Ax ot 13 Jan 201820:45:00

Insurance Co: CHINA TAIPING INSURANCE (SINGAPORE) PTE LTD

1 Insurance Enquiry - GW2487L
Enquiry Fee T.00 049 748
201802281 041387T0893

Sub-Total T.00 0.49 7.48
Total Before Rounding T00 0.4 7.49
Rounding Difference 004
Total Amount Payable T45
Paud By

Durect Debit: eNETS Debit

20180228104145585 (inlemet Banking) 745
Total T45
Cash Change 0.o0
Tandered Amount T 45
Excess Refundable Amount 0.00

THANK Y0 AND HAVE A NICE DAY

Please ensure that all payments to the Authority are good and promptly settled by the payment saervice
provider / financial institution. Otherwise, the transaction and receipt is considered void and late foo
may apply.



Vehicle Insurance Particulars Result

Vehicle No. Incident Dates/Time Insurance Company Mame
GW2487L 13 Jan 2018/ 20:45:00 CHINA TAIPING INSURANCE [SINGAPORE) PTELTD

Print OK Save as PDF



¢ Cash Sale / Work Order No: 11625 .
I.EE SHENG TOWING SERVICE

1 Kaki Bukit Ave 6 #01 -50
Singapore 417883

H/P: 9777 7373

------------------------------------
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. 2aTiing ’ PARF/GCOE Rabate Enquiry

L

-Eﬁquire PARF/COE Rebate for Registered Vehicle

Vehicle Owner Particulars

Owner ID Type:

Owner 1D; 17798

Vehicle Details

Vehicle No.: SCR2108E
Vehicle to be Exported: Mo

Intended De-registration Date: 27 Feb 2018
Vehicle Make: HONDA

Vehicle Model: CITY 4A (1A Cc
Primary Colour: Blue
Manufacturing Year: 1997

Engine No.: B1SB9WPOO129
Chassis No.: MRH3A34640WP0100469
Maximum Power Qutput: -

Open Market Value: 314,266.00
Originzl Registration Date: 25Feb 1998
First Registration Date: 25Feb 1998
Transfer Count: -

Actual ARF Paid: $21,399.00
Intended PARF Rebate Details

PARF Eligibility: Forfeited

PARF Eligibility Expiry Date: -

PARF Rebate Amount: $0.00

Intended COE Rebate Details

COE Expiry Date:

COE Category:

Singapore NRIC

30 Nov 2022

A - Car {1600cc & below)

hitps:ivwl lla.govsa/itatllaction'éng uireR ebateByPublicBeforeDerag InpulFUNC TION _ID=FO304008TT



oTaos PARFICOE Rebate Enquiry

'COE Period(Years): 5
PQP Paid: $20,997.00
COE Rebate Amount: $19,782,00
Total Rebate Amount: $19,982.00
Message

Please note that the 5-year COE for this vehicle cannot be further renewed. The vehicle must be de-
registered upon COE expiry or when the vehicle reaches its statutary lifespan (if applicable), whichever is
earlier.

The information contained herein iscorrect as at 27 Feb 2018

OK

hitpe:ihel e gevegMla‘wiiacionengulreR ebateByPublicBaloreDereg Input TEUNC TION _ID=FO304005TT



