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LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

.'_P g ;; = 51 Uki Ave 1#01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408933
- TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315
Reg. Mo: 199607198R GST Reg. Mo, 19-8607198-R
Affiliated to Federation Internationale Des Experts En Automobile
CHINA TAIPING INSURANCE (S) PTELTD Ref :  CCB/CTI18003950/Ahb3
3 ANSON ROAD #16-00 ,
SPRINGLEAF TOWERSINGAPORE 079909 P frGadne Immm"mumm
Code: CTI
1. Policy Particulars :- THIRD PARTY CLAIM
Insured Veh. GW 2487L Veh. Inspected SCR 2108E
Policy No. Coverage ($) 0.00
Claim No. Excess ($) 0.00
Assign From Assign Date 01/03/2018

2. Vehicle Particulars & Condition
Make & Model c.c 0
Engine No. HIDDEN Year of Reg.
Chassis No. Colour
Odometer Steering
Brakes Modification
General
3. Conditions of Tyres
Size Make Balance
R/H Front Tyre mm
L/H Front Tyre mm
R/H Rear Tyre mm
L/H Rear Tyre mm
4, Description of Damages
5, General Information
Accident Date  13/01/2018 llnspuctlan Date 28/02/2018
Survey held at MG SOLUTION PTELTD
23 KAKI BUKIT AVE 4
(SOUTH WING) #02-038
VICOM INSPECTION CENTRE,
SINGAPORE 415933
5a. Remarks

AJTHE INSPECTION WAS CONDUCTED ON A"WITHOUT PREJUDICE" BASIS.
BjIN ACCORDAMNCE TO YOUR INSTRUCTIONS, WE HAVE NOT AUTHORISED REPAIRS.




MG SOLUTION PTE LTD
23 Kaki Bukit Ave 4 (South Wing) #02-03B
Vicom Inspection Centre, Singapore 415933

Tel: 6243 1373 Fax: 6243 1376
GST Reg. No. : 201427244N

MOTOR CLAIM DISCHARGE

PHWA Pk NG

ACCIZENT CLAI MO cucsnasnnanainasigs

| / We confirm that | / we have taken delivery of Car / Lorry / Motor Cycle

Registered No. E{FL)/HJEE

W CoLeTioN PTe LT

P T E o it Searins SR o Gk P o8 e Lo e L B S B e B e e

S S S oy thie Tepainers;
And that all repairs necessary as a result of an accident in which the said vehicle was Involved on or

about the ......... AR danpef sl 2{}“5 have been completed to my [ our satisfaction, and that

| / we have no further claim on the above company in Respect thereof,

Pate! wonasansisnne s arsigaature: /t}l"‘*

GO AP s NRIC NS s s s



Shu Pei (LKKAuto)

——————— e —

From: Lucas Lee <lucaslee@sg.cntaiping.com>

Sent: Friday, 27 April 2018 5:31 PM

To: Shu Pei (LKKALUtD)

Subject: RE: Direct Settlement - Accident Invalving GW2487L (O] : CAl - SNM1BD0O0274C02)
AND SCR2108E (TP : LKK REF - CCe/CTIN8003950/Ahb3 ) on 13,01.2018

Attachments: lee57_SNM18D00274C02-GW2487L-LKKDirectSettlementAccidentLtr_CLCR95.523 pdf;

MCCA1B007669-GW2487L pdf

Dear Sirs,
Kindly refer to the above attachment,

Case Handler: Irene Tay

Lucas Lee

Claims Department (Motor)

China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pte. Ltd.

3 Anson Road #16-00 Springleal Tower Singapore 072209
Direct (65) 6389 6181

Fax (65) 6222 7175

Email; lucas.lee@sg.cnlaiping.com

Website: www.sg.cniaiping.com

o Bimgapare s e J"?H.I'

Thsclivinmer !

Thiv message ix confidentiol; fis contents do net coustitnte o cemmizment by Ching Taiping Tnsarance {Siagapore) Pre, Lid, evcem
where provided for in @ written agreement between vou and China Taiptng Ieswrance (Singapeore ) Pre, Lad, Ay enaathorized diselesir
s o dissenination, either in whole or partial, s ;Jrrﬂ'u'hr'.'q".'ﬂl. .Il,fl_'.-'rn’ are eyt the imtended recipient of the message, I'-:'.n:'n'.'\-!' nofify the
serder intmedintely,

From: Shu Pei (LKKAuto) [mailto:shupei@lkkauto.com]

Sent: Thursday, 1 March, 2018 5:23 PM

To: Claims Dept of CTI

Cc: Irene Tay; Vic (LKKAuto); Asher Sng (LKKAuto); Admin A

Subject: Direct Settlement - Accident Invelving GW2487L (Ol : CAl - TBA) AND 5CR2108E (TP : LKK REF -
CCe/CTILBD03950/Ahb3 | on 13.01.2018

WITHOUT PREJUDICE



Dear Sir / Madam,

We refer to the above matter.

This is a TP direct settlement case.

We had inspected TP vehicle SCR 2108E at M /s MG Solution Pte Ltd - Kaki Bukit.

Enclosed herewith a copy of TP's GIA report for your perusal.

Please be informed that the estimated cost of repair and preliminary advice is not ready yet.
Meanwhile, kindly let us have a copy of your insured’s GIA report for our necessary action.

Kindly take note that the case handler in-charge is Vic and he can be contacted at DID: 6841 2096.

Thank you

Best Regards,
Shu Pei| Admin
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Blk 51, Paya Ubl Industrial Park, Ubl Averue 1, #02-25 | 5{a08933)

This email has been scanned by the Symantec Email Security.cloud service.
For more information please visit hup:/www.symanteccloud.com
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CHIMNA TAIFING —

Our Reference: SNM18D00274/C02/8
Date : 27 APRIL 2018
FUTURE HOME INTERIOR DESIGNS
156 LORONG SARINA

SARINA PARK
SINGAPORE 416714

Dear Sir / Madam

chE A TR (HE ) FERAT]

CHIMA TAIPING INSURANCE (SINGAPORE) PTE, LTD
3 Anson Road B16-00 Spregieal Tower Sngagese 076506
Tol GIBG 11T Fus 6222 1003

We | g ELEn
Lo Fiag. Mo HJICEIE4E

via Ordinary & Registered Mail

ACCIDENT INVOLVING GW2487L AND SCR2108E ON 13 JANUARY 2018
ALONG JUNCTION OF PUNGGOL ROAD & COMPASSVALE DRIVE

We refer to the abovementioned accident.

Please be advised that the third party vehicle, SCR2108E , is filing a third party property

claim against your vehicle.

We have appointed LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd, to administer the said claim on our behalf
and they will contact you for more information about the accident.

Kindly render your assistance and co-operation accordingly.

Yours truly,
Claims Department

(This is a computer generated letter and no signature is required.)

CC - LKK Auto Consultaniz Pte Ltd

Attn : WIS

Ret ! CCE/ICTI18003950/AHBS
Contact No : 68412096

via Email :  VIC@LKKAUTO.COM

CC - Agent - (AND472A) - CCL INSURANCE AGENCY PTE LTD

FO1/LKKDS-2013



Tel: 6243 1373 Fax: 6243 1376
{GST Reg. No. 20-1427944-N)

MG SOLUTION PTE LTD

23 Kaki Bukit Ave 4, AAS Kaki Bukit Centre #02-03 Singapore 415933

TAX INVOICE

Bill To:

CHINA TAIPING INSURANCE (SINGAPORE) PTE LTD
NO. 3 ANSON ROAD

#16-00 SPRINGLEAF TOWER

SINGAPORE 079909

ATTN : MOTOR CLAIMS DEPARTMENT

INVOICE No : TI 189232

PB No: 188170

Date : 17-September-2018

Vehicle Number: SCR 2108E

Cheque should

'made payable to MG Solution Pte Ltd

Co's stamp & Authorised Signature

QTy DESCRIPTION AMOUNT
1 |To carried out accident repair as per surveyor's recommendation $ 6,500.00
(Lump Sum)
BEFORE GST 6,500.00
7% GST 455.00
TOTAL | & 6,955.00




Vic (LKKAuto)

e e e e e s .

From: MG Solution <mg3solution@gmail.com=>

Sent: Monday, 17 September, 2018 10:43 AM

To: Vic (LKKAuUto)

Cc: Admin A

Subject: Re: 3rd Party Claim for Accident involving Vehicle SCR2108E & GW2487L on
13/01/2018 LKK REF CCe/CTI18003950/Ahb3

Attachments: image001.jpg; T1189232 for SCR2108E (SMG188170).pdf; DV for SCR2108E.pdf

Your Ref: CC6/ CTI18003950/Ahb3 (GW2487L)
Our Ref: SCR2108E

Dear Vic,

Please find attached TAX INVOICE and our duty signed DV by our client for your kind onward action.
Original copy will sent to you by post.

Best Regards,

Su Wong

MG SOLUTION PTE LTD

Mo 23 Kaki Bukit Avenue 4

AAS Kaki Bukit Centre

#02-03B Singapore 415933

Tel: 6243 1373 | Fax: 6243 1376

On Fri, Aug 24, 2018 at 9:57 AM Vic (LKKAuto) <vicalpeh(@lkkauto.com> wrote:

Without Prejudice

Dear Sharan,

we refer to the below email.

We refer further to our below email.

Purely for an amicable settlement on a without prejudice basis and without admission of liability to our Insured’s
part, we have our principal’'s mandate and we our willing to improve our offer to a global sum of $8,180.00 (all in)
to settle your client’s claim,



Kindly confirm let the owner chop and sign the attached DV and forward to us the original signed copy together
with the LOD and all supporting documents for payment processing.

The above amount is to be made payable to MG SOLUTION PTE LTD.

Thank you.

"Please note that our above offer and any settlement arising from the above offer are made on o without prejudice basis, and
should not be construed as an admission of liability on our part or on the part of our Insured Driver. Terms of such settlement
should also not be disclosed in any other related matter(s) in respect of the accident. Our affer made in respect af this present
matter is made solely to resolve this matter only. No reference shall be made to this offer or any settlement arising from this offer
in any other related maotters.

Best Regards,

Vie Alpeh | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841-2096 | email: vicalpeh@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

X Sove the Earth: Print only when necessary:

This e-mail contain confidential and privileged material, and are for the sole use of the intended recipient. Use or distribution by an
unintended recipient is prohibited, and may be a violation of law. If you believe that you received this e-mail in error, please do not
read this e-mail or any attached items. Please delete the e-mail and all attachments, including any copies thereof, and inform the
sender that you have deleted the e-mail, all attachments and any copies thereof. Thank you.

From: MG Solution [mailto:mg3solution@gmail.com]
Sent: Monday, 13 August, 2018 2:48 PM

To: Vic (LKKAuto)

Cc: Admin A

Subject: Re: 3rd Party Claim for Accident involving Vehicle SCR2108E & GW2487L on 13/01/2018 LKK REF
CC6/CTI18003950/Ahb3



