Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

From: Kenneth Yee <kennethyee@insightadjusters.com>

Sent: Monday, 23 April 2018 1:17 PM

To: Bryan Ang (LKKAuto)

Cc: assignments; Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

Subject: RE: [IA2018-36971] / YCK; Insured: TTK Services Pte Ltd; RE: Damage to Third Party's

BMW motorcycle due to fallen tree on 17 December 2017 (New assignment)

Dear Bryan,
With reference to our email dated 17 April 2018.
We have yet to receive your assessment report.

Can we seek your kind assistance to expedite on the issuance of your report. The Insured and Third Party
are sending us chasers on alternate days.

Kindly expedite.

Best regards,
Kenneth Yee
E-Mail : kennethyee@insightadjusters.com

From: Kenneth Yee

Sent: Tuesday, 17 April 2018 8:44 AM

To: 'Bryan Ang (LKKAuto)' <bryanang@Ikkauto.com>

Cc: assignments <assignments@Ilkkauto.com>; Veron Chen (LKKAuto) <veronchen@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: [IA2018-36971] / YCK; Insured: TTK Services Pte Ltd; RE: Damage to Third Party's BMW motorcycle due
to fallen tree on 17 December 2017 (New assignment)

Dear Bryan,
We refer to your email of 3 April 2018.
We have yet to receive your report.

Please expedite and forward your report to us on urgent basis.

Best regards,
Kenneth Yee
E-Mail : kennethyee@insightadjusters.com

From: Bryan Ang (LKKAuto) <bryanang@I|kkauto.com>

Sent: Tuesday, 3 April 2018 6:22 PM

To: Kenneth Yee <kennethyee@insightadjusters.com>

Cc: assignments <assignments@I|kkauto.com>; Veron Chen (LKKAuto) <veronchen@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: [IA2018-36971] / YCK; Insured: TTK Services Pte Ltd; RE: Damage to Third Party's BMW motorcycle due
to fallen tree on 17 December 2017 (New assignment)

Dear Kenneth

Case is pending finalization on the cost of repair.



Dear Veron
Please help to get our surveyor to expedite.
Our ref CS/IAS18003876/Gvb

Best Regards,

Bryan Ang

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

phone: 6256-3561 | email: bryanang@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Kenneth Yee [mailto:kennethyee@insightadjusters.com]

Sent: Tuesday, 3 April 2018 5:36 PM

To: Bryan Ang (LKKAuto) <bryanang@Ikkauto.com>

Cc: assignments <assignments@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: [IA2018-36971] / YCK; Insured: TTK Services Pte Ltd; RE: Damage to Third Party's BMW motorcycle due
to fallen tree on 17 December 2017 (New assignment)

Dear Bryan,
We refer to your email of 28 February 2018.
Kindly let us have your report and fee note on urgent basis.

Your response on the above is greatly appreciated.

Best regards,
Kenneth Yee
E-Mail : kennethyee@insightadjusters.com

From: Bryan Ang (LKKAuto) <bryanang@lkkauto.com>

Sent: Wednesday, 28 February 2018 10:02 AM

To: Kenneth Yee <kennethyee@insightadjusters.com>

Cc: assignments <assignments@I|kkauto.com>

Subject: RE: [IA2018-36971] / YCK; Insured: TTK Services Pte Ltd; RE: Damage to Third Party's BMW motorcycle due
to fallen tree on 17 December 2017 (New assignment)

Dear Assignment Team

Please assign surveyor to inspect the motorcycle asap.
Dear Kenneth

Will carry out the necessary.

Best Regards,

Bryan Ang

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

phone: 6256-3561 | email: bryanang@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Kenneth Yee [mailto:kennethyee@insightadjusters.com]
Sent: Wednesday, 28 February 2018 8:49 AM
To: Bryan Ang (LKKAuto) <bryanang@lkkauto.com>




Cc: assignments <assignments@lkkauto.com>
Subject: [IA2018-36971] / YCK; Insured: TTK Services Pte Ltd; RE: Damage to Third Party's BMW motorcycle due to
fallen tree on 17 December 2017 (New assignment)

Dear Mr Bryan,
The above matter refers.

We have our Principal’s Insurers’ instruction to appoint you in carrying out an assessment on the damage
sustained to the Third Party’s BMW motorcycle bearing registration No. FBH 4319 P.

Please conduct the damage assessment on a “Without Prejudice” basis and appreciate that you could
contact Mr Patrick Yee of De Xing Motors at +65 9489 5112 for the inspection.

At this stage, we do not have any photographs or repair estimate of the affected Third Party’s motorcycle.

We shall now await your further advice and assessment report on the repair cost of the affected Third
Party’s motorcycle.

Please do not hesitate to contact us should you have any further enquires. Thank you.

Best regards,
Kenneth Yee
E-Mail : kennethyee@insightadjusters.com

Insight Adjusters and Surveyors Pte Ltd
133 Cecil Street, #14-02

Keck Seng Tower

Singapore 069535

(65) 6223 2008 * Fax : (65) 6226 2356

http://www.insightadjusters.com

» ASIA Regional Office for vrs adjusters

* Loss Adjuster of the Year, Asia Insurance Industry Award
* A Singapore Top 500 SME

» CESAM Average Agents, AIMU Correspondents

*CONFIDENTIAL NOTE: The information contained in this email is intended only for the use of the individual
or entity named above and may contain information that is privileged, confidential and exempt from disclosure
under applicable law.

If the reader of this message is not the intended recipient, you are hereby notified that any dissemination,
distribution or copying of this communication is strictly prohibited.

If you have received this message in error, please immediately notify the sender and delete the mail.

Thank you.



