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Joy Irene (LKKAuto)

From: Thin Thin (LKKAuto)

Sent: Monday, 3 December 2018 2:49 PM

To: Joy Irene (LKKAuto)

Subject: FW: GW6692J REPAIR LIMIT

Attachments: SHD0113S DOA 15.02.18 (1).wmv

 

 

From: Thin Thin (LKKAuto)  

Sent: Thursday, 21 June 2018 2:33 PM 

To: 'sinsheng engineeringservices' <sinsheng1981@gmail.com> 

Cc: Taufikh (LKKAuto) <Taufikh@lkkauto.com> 

Subject: RE: GW6692J REPAIR LIMIT 

 

Your ref: GW 6692J                                                                                                                        "Without Prejudice" 

 

Dear Sir / Madam, 

 

ACCIDENT INVOLVING GW 6692J & SHD 113S ON 15/02/2018 

 

We refer to above matter. 

 

Our insured has reiterated that the accident was caused due to the negligence of your client. 

 

Your client beat the traffic light and collided with our insured vehicle. Please see the enclosed video footage. 

 

Under such a circumstances, we are denying liability and unable to look into your client’s claim. 

 

Yours faithfully, 

 
Best Regards, 
 
Thin Thin Hlaing | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6841-2360 | email: thinthin@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

 

 

 

From: sinsheng engineeringservices [mailto:sinsheng1981@gmail.com]  

Sent: Thursday, 21 June 2018 11:03 AM 

To: Thin Thin (LKKAuto) <thinthin@lkkauto.com> 

Cc: Taufikh (LKKAuto) <Taufikh@lkkauto.com> 

Subject: Re: GW6692J REPAIR LIMIT 

 

Hi Ms Thin Thin, 

 
We refer to the above. Despite several reminder, we had yet to received any response. 

We could appreciate if can get your response end of 05/07/2018, failing which we have no choice and to close the file on our end.

 
And will pass back the case to our client, any action taken by our client are not related to us. 
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Thank You 

Regards 

 

Susan 

Sin Sheng Engineering Services 

3 Tech Park Crescent 

Tuas Tech Park 

Singapore 638129 

Tel: 6863 9595 

Fax: 6863 6477 

  

 

 

On 7 June 2018 at 16:18, sinsheng engineeringservices <sinsheng1981@gmail.com> wrote: 

Hi Ms Thin Thin, 

 
2nd reminder. 

 

Please assist to revert us with the offer if direct settlement is in order. 

 

 

 

 

Thank You 

Regards 

 

Susan 

Sin Sheng Engineering Services 

3 Tech Park Crescent 

Tuas Tech Park 

Singapore 638129 

Tel: 6863 9595 

Fax: 6863 6477 

  

 

 

On 22 May 2018 at 10:12, Thin Thin (LKKAuto) <thinthin@lkkauto.com> wrote: 

Dear Susan, 

  

We refer to the below matter. 

  

Please be inform that we are still pending for further instruction from our Principal. 
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“Please note that our proposal and correspondence with you is strictly on a without prejudice basis and should not be construed as an 

admission of liability on our part and/or that of our policyholder and/or the authorised driver. The terms of our without prejudice 

engagement should not be disclosed in any other related matter(s) in respect of this accident nor should it be binding in any other 

related claims.” 

  

Best Regards, 

  

Thin Thin Hlaing | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6841-2360 | email: thinthin@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933 

  

  

  

From: sinsheng engineeringservices [mailto:sinsheng1981@gmail.com]  

Sent: Saturday, 19 May 2018 11:28 AM 

To: Taufikh (LKKAuto) <Taufikh@lkkauto.com> 

Cc: Thin Thin (LKKAuto) <thinthin@lkkauto.com> 

 

Subject: Re: GW6692J REPAIR LIMIT 

  

Hi Ms Thin Thin, 

  

Please assist to revert us with the liability issue/offer if direct settlement is in order.  

 

 

Thank You 

Regards 

 

Susan 

Sin Sheng Engineering Services 

3 Tech Park Crescent 

Tuas Tech Park 

Singapore 638129 

Tel: 6863 9595 

Fax: 6863 6477 
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On 19 April 2018 at 13:13, sinsheng engineeringservices <sinsheng1981@gmail.com> wrote: 

Hi Ms Thin Thin, 

  

Attached LOC document and ATA for your attention please. 

  

Kindly assist to revert us with the liability issue/offer if direct settlement is in order. 

  

 

 

Thank You 

Regards 

 

Susan 

Sin Sheng Engineering Services 

3 Tech Park Crescent 

Tuas Tech Park 

Singapore 638129 

Tel: 6863 9595 

Fax: 6863 6477 

  

  

  

On 19 April 2018 at 12:12, sinsheng engineeringservices <sinsheng1981@gmail.com> wrote: 

Hi Mr Taufikh, 

  

We are agreed. 

  

 

 

Thank You 

Regards 

 

Susan 
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Sin Sheng Engineering Services 

3 Tech Park Crescent 

Tuas Tech Park 

Singapore 638129 

Tel: 6863 9595 

Fax: 6863 6477 

  

  

  

On 19 April 2018 at 11:27, Taufikh (LKK Auto) <taufikh@lkkauto.com> wrote: 

Hi Susan, 

  

COR l/s$3000 , 6 days. 

  

Regards 

Taufikh 

Lkk Auto 

  

From: sinsheng engineeringservices [mailto:sinsheng1981@gmail.com]  

Sent: Wednesday, 7 March 2018 3:39 PM 
To: Taufikh (LKK Auto) 

Subject: Re: GW6692J REPAIR LIMIT 

  

Hi Mr Taufikh, 

  

Please find attached. 

 

 

Thank You 

Regards 

 

Susan 

Sin Sheng Engineering Services 

3 Tech Park Crescent 

Tuas Tech Park 

Singapore 638129 
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Tel: 6863 9595 

Fax: 6863 6477 

  

  

  

On 2 March 2018 at 11:45, sinsheng engineeringservices <sinsheng1981@gmail.com> wrote: 

Hi Mr Taufikh, 

  

Please refer attached photo and please increase to 3K 

  

 

 

Thank You 

Regards 

 

Susan 

Sin Sheng Engineering Services 

3 Tech Park Crescent 

Tuas Tech Park 

Singapore 638129 

Tel: 6863 9595 

Fax: 6863 6477 

  

  

  

On 1 March 2018 at 09:04, Taufikh (LKK Auto) <taufikh@lkkauto.com> wrote: 

Hi Susan, 

  

Please take note repair limit for this van is $2500. 

  

Regards 

Taufikh 

Lkk Auto 
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