Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

From: Sg motor enterprise Giam <sg_motor_enterprise@yahoo.com.sg>

Sent: Tuesday, 24 September 2019 3:55 PM

To: Sg Motor; Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

Cc: Admin A

Subject: Re: Your Ref: CC4/AXA18003868/R1pb3 Our Ref FBM 748) Accident dated
22/2/2018

Hi Hsiao tong,

According to the lawyer they only settled injury claim exclude the repair cost.
kindly offer the repair cost to us soonest.

Your attention on this matter is much appreciated.

Best Rgds
Rose

On Saturday, 21 September 2019, 12:38:40 pm GMT+8, Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com> wrote:

Without Prejudice

Dear Sirs/Mdm,

We refer to the above matter.

According to AXA, they have settled the repair cost together with your client injury claim.

Kindly check at your end.

Thanks.

“Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole
intention of resolving the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability,
whatsoever, should be deemed / inferred from this negotiation of terms/settlement.

In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially
affect/influence on the issues of liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation
terms/settlement.”



Best Regards,

Hsiao Tong, Chew | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6742-3197 | email: chewht@Ikkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

Sent: Wednesday, 4 September 2019 3:23 PM

To: Sg Motor <sgmotor2000@yahoo.com.sg>

Cc: Sg Motor <sg_motor_enterprise@yahoo.com.sg>; Admin A <admin-a@Ikkauto.com>
Subject: RE: Your Ref: CC4/AXA18003868/R1pb3 Our Ref FBM 748J Accident dated 22/2/2018

Without Prejudice

Dear Sirs/Mdm,

We are preparing report to seek mandate from AXA.

We will expedite and get back to you asap.

“Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole
intention of resolving the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability,
whatsoever, should be deemed / inferred from this negotiation of terms/settlement.

In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially
affect/influence on the issues of liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation
terms/settlement.”



Best Regards,

Hsiao Tong, Chew | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6742-3197 | email: chewht@Ikkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Sg Motor <sgmotor2000@yahoo.com.sg>

Sent: Tuesday, 3 September 2019 1:03 PM

To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com>

Cc: Sg Motor <sg_motor_enterprise@yahoo.com.sg>; Admin A <admin-a@Ikkauto.com>
Subject: Re: Your Ref: CC4/AXA18003868/R1pb3 Our Ref FBM 748J Accident dated 22/2/2018

Dear Hsiao Tong

May | know the status for this case.

Thank You

Regards

Linda

SG 98 Motor Pte Ltd
Blk 4001 #01-21

Ang Mo Kio Industrial Park 1
Singapore 569622

Tel: 64524898 Fax: 64526898

On Monday, 19 August 2019, 02:40:15 pm GMT+8, Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com> wrote:
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Without Prejudice

Dear Sirs/Mdm,

We refer to the above matter.

Attached is a copy of our insured accident report for your easy reference.

We would like to request for evidences (ie: video footage/ scene photos / PIR) for our necessary action.

Appreciate an early reply.

“Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole
intention of resolving the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability,
whatsoever, should be deemed / inferred from this negotiation of terms/settlement.

In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially
affect/influence on the issues of liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation
terms/settlement.”

Best Regards,
Hsiao Tong, Chew | Case Handler
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6742-3197 | email: chewht@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)



From: Sg Motor <sgmotor2000@yahoo.com.sg>

Sent: Friday, 16 August 2019 1:59 PM

To: Khanchna (LKK Auto) <khanchna@lkkauto.com>; CS A Team <cs-a@lkkauto.com>; Mei Kwan (LKKAuto)
<Meikwan@lkkauto.com>; Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com>

Cc: Sg Motor <sg_motor_enterprise@yahoo.com.sg>

Subject: Your Ref: CC4/AXA18003868/R1mb3 Our Ref FBM 748J Accident dated 22/2/2018

Dear Bevan

Attached is the repair invoice for your kind action.

Thank You

Regards

Linda

SG 98 Motor Pte Ltd
Blk 4001 #01-21

Ang Mo Kio Industrial Park 1
Singapore 569622

Tel: 64524898 Fax: 64526898



