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Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

From: Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

Sent: Tuesday, 27 February 2018 8:17 AM

To: ANG Yvonne

Cc: 'winnie.ho'; Kitty Teo Poh Guek; birdie; jas.tan@axa.com.sg; SUR

Subject: RE: [MV] Check Market Value (MV) - S8M0093N /SJX 5968E /DOA:
16/02/2018

Dear Yvonne,

The market value for SJX 5968E is $20K-23K (EST) as at Feb 2018

Best Regards,

Veron Chen | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email :sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

From: Sheau Wei [mailto:surveyadmin4 @fta.com.sg]

Sent: Monday, 26 February 2018 3:19 PM

To: claims@ajaxinspection.com; admin@autoprobe.com.sg; Chow CP <chowauto@singnet.com.sg>;
bokhari@jpknights.com; 'admin’ (admin@Ibs-auto.com) <admin@Ibs-auto.com>; LKK Valuation
<valuation@Ilkkauto.com>; Cynthia Ong <cynthia.ong@priorityservices.sg>; collin.wong@a-pac.sg

Cc: ANG Yvonne <yvonne.ang@axa.com.sg>; 'winnie.ho' <winnie.ho@axa.com.sg>; Kitty Teo Poh Guek

<Kitty.Teo @axa.com.sg>; Lynn Teo <lynn@falconair.com.sg>; birdie <birdie.ong@axa.com.sg>; jas.tan@axa.com.sg;
Wendy Tan <motorsurvey@fta.com.sg>; Betty Chew <surveyadminl@fta.com.sg>

Subject: [MV] Check Market Value (MV) - S8MOO093N / SJX 5968E / DOA : 16/02/2018

Dear Sir/Mdm,

Please check Market Value and email back to Yvonne.ang@axa.com.sg and cc to all OD case handler
within 48 hours.

Thank you & warm regards

Sheau Wei

FormTeam Consultancy Pte Ltd

No. 33 Ubi Ave 3, #02-15 Vertex, Singapore 408868
Tel : (65) 6509 1788 « Fax: (65) 6509 6221

Email: motorsurvey@fta.com.sqg

Website: www.fta.com.sg

EQAIMS hirSHFE

OHSAS 18001.2007 ST {k’ﬂ

Please consider the environment before printing this email
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2/26/2018

PARF/COE Rebate Enquiry

Enquire PARF/COE Rebate for Registered Vehicle

Vehicle Owner Particulars

Owner ID Type:
Owner [D:

Vehicle Details
Vehicle No.:

Vehicle to be Exported:

Intended De-registration Date:

Vehicle Make:

Vehicle Model:

Primary Colour:
Manufacturing Year:
Engine No.:

Chassis No.:

Maximum Power Output:
Open Market Value:
Original Registration Date:
First Registration Date:
Transfer Count:

Actual ARF Paid:

Intended PARF Rebate Details

PARF Eligibility:
PARF Eligibility Expiry Date:

PARF Rebate Amount:

Intended COE Rebate Details

COE Expiry Date:

COE Category:

pop s 16(3|\1&
(XA
Singapore NRIC

1346F

SIX5968E

No

26 Feb 2018

PROTON

SAGA 1.3L MT M-LINE AIRBAG 2WD 4DR
Black

2009

S4PEPU2072
PL1BT3SNR9B099345

70.0kKW (93 bhp) T~ 2/}
$8,567.00

28 Jun 2010

28 Jun 2010

2

$8,567.00 Y b@

Yes

27 Jun 2020

- $5,140.00

27 Jun 2020

A -Car (1600cc & below)

-hitps:/ivrl.lta.gov.sg/ltasvrl/action/enquireRebateByPublicBeforeDereglnput? FUNCTION_ID=F0304009TT
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2/26/2018 PARF/COE Rebate Enquiry

CQE Period(Years): 10

QP Paid: $30,051.00
COE Rebate Amount: $7,020.00
Total Rebate Amount: $12,160.00

The information contained herein is correct as at 26 Feb 2018

OK

. https://vrl.Ita.gov.sglitafvriiaction/enquireRebateByPublicBeforeDereglnput?FUNCTION _|D=F0304009TT 2/2
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