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Denise Tay (LKKAuto)

From: Steven Tan <rvsallied@gmail.com>

Sent: Wednesday, 7 November 2018 5:52 PM

To: Denise Tay (LKKAuto)

Subject: Re: PA 9850J / TP / MSIG

HI Denise, 

 

 

 

Ok with the amount. 

 

 

Regards 

Steven 

 

On Thu, Oct 4, 2018 at 3:20 PM Denise Tay (LKKAuto) <denisetay@lkkauto.com> wrote: 

Dear Steven, 

  

Please see attachment.  

  

Please check if can refinalize at $3700 lump sum 

  

  

Best Regards, 

Denise Tay | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: denisetay@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

  

From: Denise Tay (LKKAuto)  

Sent: Friday, 22 June 2018 11:44 AM 

To: 'rvsallied@gmail.com' <rvsallied@gmail.com> 

Subject: PA 9850J / TP / MSIG 
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Dear Steven, 

  

Finalized $4050/-, 6days. 

  

Please confirm 

  

  

  

Best Regards, 

Denise Tay | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: denisetay@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

  


