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' 7d V4 LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
Al 51 Ubi Ave 1#01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408933

= TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: 5256 4315

Reg. No: 199607196R GST Reg. Mo, 19-9607198-R

Affiliated to Federation Internationale Des Experts En Automobile

ERGO INSURANCE PTELTD Ref ;. CS/EGI18003755/Kqd3
LT
#04-01 SUNTEC TOWER FIVE Date: 27-02-2018
SINGAPORE 038885
Code: EGI
1 Policy Particulars :- THIRD PARTY CLAIM
Insured Veh. GX 354U Veh. Inspected SHD 8521
Policy No. Coverage (§) 0.00
Claim No. DSMCV1800368/SLisa Excess ($) 0.00
Assign From SITI ATHIKAH Assign Date 27/02/2018
2! Vehicle Particulars & Condition
Make & Model c.c 0
Engine No. HIDDEN Year of Reg.
Chassis No. Colour
Odometer = Steering
Brakes Modification
General
3 Conditions of Tyres
Size Make Balance
R/H Front Tyre mm
L/H Front Tyre mm
R/H Rear Tyre mim
L/H Rear Tyre mm
4, Description of Damages
5. General Information
Accident Date  22/02/2018 Inspection Date 27022018

Survey held at TRANS-CAB AUTO SERVICES FTELTD

NO.2 ANG MO KIO ST 63
SINGAPORE 569111

Ba. Remarks

AJTHE INSPECTION WAS CONDUCTED ON A"WITHOUT PREJUDICE" BASIS.
B}IN ACCORDANCE TO YOUR INSTRUCTIONS, WE HAVE NOT AUTHORISED REPAIRS.




Date:
Cur Refarence:

Your Reference:

To:

23.02.2018

G¥354U/5E/sa

5HD352L

TRANS-CAB SERVICES PTE LTD

Pre-Repair Survey [PRS) Acknowledgement

Vehicle For Inspection: SHD 952L

Insured's Vehicle:

Date Of Accident:

GX 354U

22.02.2018

We acknowledge receipt of your request for PRS on:

23.02.2018

ERGO

Sent via Fax
or
Email
candy. kong@transcab.com.sg

In campliance with "State Courts Practice Directions Amendment No.1 of 2016", do select an assessor from

the list below and indicate your selection in the box marked *.

AlS sutomobile Inspection Services Pre Lid LB% L.B.5 Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
1AS Infiniti Appraisal Service LKK LKE Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
IPK JP Knights Pte Ltd Ps Priority Services

VAC Wicom Ltd

v Qur Insured's driver has not reported the accident to us todate.

Your request for inspection does not have your client's cost of repair estimate, kindly forward a copy.
Your request for inspection does not have your client's GIA repart, kindly forward a copy.

We acknowledge your interest for direct settlement, we will assess & revert soon wpon receipt of estimate,

V |otherss  We are therefore not in a position to discuss on liability at this juncture.
Prepared by : /&‘{1} U}A,« Siti 6829 9170 claims@ergo.com.sg
Signature: Ry FAX : 6829 9247
Assessor use only: Werkshop use only:

Assignment Date:
Assignment Time:

Remarks:

Assessor attended workshop on:

Date;
Time
Inspector:

] vehicle not available at the appointed date and time.

Kindly acknowledge our Assessor presence for the above job .

Waorkshop Acknowledgement & Stamp.
Note: Qur Inspection s on a withowt admission to Fability basis.




Nivitha (LKK Auto)

From: 5iti A Thikah AB Rahman <siti.rahman@ergo.com.sg>

Sent: Monday, 26 February 2018 5:06 PM

To: Catherine Chong (LKK Auto) (admin-d@lkkauto.com)

Subject: Ol: GX 354U | TP: SHD 952L | LKK | DOA: 22.02.2018 - PRS | OUR REF:
DSMCV1800369/5L/sa

Attachments: ARRANGE FOR SURVEY SHD952L (402 KB); PRS FORM . pdf

Dear Catherine,

In compliance with “State Courts Practice Directions Amendment No.1 of 2016” in regards to the Pre Repair Survey,
both TP repairer and Ergo Insurance Pte Ltd have agreed on your company LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd to be the
"Single Joint Expert”.

Please conduct this survey request on without prejudice basis and to try finalise with the repairer on the repairs.
(Note: Our insured has yet to lodge the accident report to us).

Please fill up the necessary on ERGO PRS Form and return to us together on your update of the survey status.
Attached are the necessary documents for your further actions,
Kindly acknowledge receipt of this email.

NOTE: Please assist to quote our ref as the subject matter, when forwarding the Preliminary Reports / Survey
Reports.

| ank you
Warmesl re Qands
Siti A'thikah

lepar

v BLISIE. WA ErO0. COm.S50G

ERGD s one of the major insurance groups in Germany and Europe. Worldwide, ERGO is represented in mare than 30 counires

and concentrates on Europe and Asia. ERGO is pari of Munich Re (Group), one of the world's leading risk carriers

From: Siti A Thikah AB Rahman

Sent: Monday, 26 February, 2018 5:03 PM

To: 'Candy Kong'

Cc: ERGO Insurance Pte. Ltd. (Claims Department)

Subject: RE: GX 354U | TP: SHD 952L | DOA: 22.02.2018 - OUR REF:GX354U/SL/sa

WITHOUT PREJUDICE
Cear Candy,
We shall arrange our surveyor from LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd to survey your client's vehicle.

Thank you,

Warmest regards



Siti A'thikah

Claims Department

ERGO Insurance Pte. Ltd,
5 Temasek Boulevard
#04-01 Suntec Tower Five
Singapore 038985

Tel.; 65 68299170

Website: www.ergo.com.sg

ERGO is one of the major insurance groups in Germany and Europe. Worldwide, ERGO Is represented in more than 30 countries
and concentrates on Europe and Asia. ERGO is part of Munich Re (Group), one of the world's leading risk carriers,

--—-Original Message-—-

From: Candy Kong [mailto:candy.kong@transcab.com.sg]

Sent: Monday, 26 Febiruary, 2018 4:58 PM

Ta: Siti A Thikah AB Rahman

Cc: ERGO Insurance Pte, Ltd. (Claims Department)

Subject: GX 354U | TP:SHD 952L | DOA: 22.02.2018 - OUR REF.GX354U/5L/sa

Hi 31T,

PLS ARRANGE LKK AUTO CONSULTANTS PTE LTD TO SURVEY.

Thks & Regs
Candy Kong
Claims Service Assistant

This message is confidential. It may also be privileged or otherwise
protected by work product immunity or other legal rules. If you have
received it by mistake, please let us know by e-mail reply and delete it

from your system; you may not copy this message or disclose its contents to
anyone. Please send us by fax any message containing deadlines as incoming
e-mails are not screened for response deadlines. The integrity and security
of this message cannot be guaranteed on the Internet

—---Original Message-----

From: 5iti A Thikah AB Rahman [mailto:siti.rahman@ergo.com.sg]

Sent: Monday, 26 February, 2018 4:48 PM

To: Candy kong <candy kong@transcab.com.sg>

Cc: ERGO Insurance Pte. Ltd. (Claims Department) <claims@ergo.com.sg>
Subject: RE: GX 354U | TP: SHD 952L | DOA: 22.02.2018 - OUR REF:GX354U/5L/sa

WITHOUT PREJUDICE

Dear Candy,

Please refer to both of our emails for your reply.
Thank you.

Warmest regards

Siti A'thikah
Claims Department



ERGO Insurance Pte. Ltd.

5 Temasek Boulevard
#04-01 Suntec Tower Five
Singapore 038985

Tel.: 656829 9170
Website: www.ergo.com.sg

ERGO is one of the major insurance groups in Germany and Europe. Worldwide,
ERGO is represented in more than 30 countries and concentrates on Europe and
Asia, ERGO is part of Munich Re (Group), one of the world's leading risk
carriers.

EMAIL DISCLAIMER

The information contained in this email communication is confidential. You
should only read, disclose, re-transmit, copy, distribute, act in reliance

on or commercialize the infarmation if you are authorized to do so. If you
are not the intended recipient of this email communication, please notify
the sender by replying to the email and destroy any electronic or paper copy
of this message.

Any views expressed in this email communication are those of the individual
sender, ERGD Insurance Pte. Ltd. does not represent, warrant or guarantee
that the integrity of this communication has been maintained or that the
communication is free of errors, virus or interference.

ERGO Insurance Pte. Ltd. asserts copyright in respect to this email

including any attachment-—---Original Message-----

From: Candy Kong [mailto:candy.kong@transcab.com.sg)

Sent: Monday, 26 February, 2018 4:44 PM

To: ERGO Insurance Pte. Ltd. (Claims Department)

Subject: ARRANGE FOR SURVEY SHD952L

Dear all,

Resend.
Pls arrange to survey urgently

Thks & Rdgs
Candy Kong
Claims Service Assistant

This message is confidential. It may also be privileged or otherwise
pratected by work product immunity or other legal rules. If you have
received it by mistake, please let us know by e-mail reply and delete it

from your system; you may not copy this message or disclose its contents to
anyone. Please send us by fax any message containing deadlines as incoming
e-malls are not screened for response deadlines. The integrity and security
of this message cannot be guaranteed on the Internet

-----Original Message---——
From: Candy Kong [mailto:candy.kong@transcab.com.sg]



Sent: Friday, 23 February, 2018 10:45 AM
To: ‘claims@ergo.com.sg’ <claims@ergo.com.sg>
Subject: ARRANGE FOR SURVEY SHD952L

Dear all,
Please arrange for survey as below :

GX354U - 22.02.2018 at 0655Hrs - SHD952L Lunch time : 12pm - 1pm,
Kindly pls dun arrange survey during lunch time.

“We Agree to let your In-house surveyor assess/ survey our vehicle with
estimate.”

Thks & Rdgs
Candy Kong
Claims Service Assistant

This message is confidential. It may also be privileged or otherwise
protected by work product immunity or other legal rules. If you have
received it by mistake, please let us know by e-mail reply and delete it

from your system; you may not copy this message or disclose its contents to
anyone. Please send us by fax any message containing deadlines as incoming
e-mails are not screened for response deadlines. The integrity and security
of this message cannot be guaranteed on the Internet



Shiau Chan (LKKAuto)

From: Shiau Chan (LKKAuto)

Sent: Thursday, 1 March 2018 9:48 AM

To: 'Siti A Thikah AB Rahman'

Cc: assignments; SUR

Subject: RE: GX 354U | TP: SHD 952L | LKK | DOA: 22.02.2018 - PRS | OUR REF:
DSMCV1800369/5L/5a

Attachments: CSEGI18003755Kqd3.pdf

Dear 5iti,

Enclosed herewith preliminary advice of SHD 952L.

Best Regards,

Shiau Chan (Ms) | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: siewsc@lkkauto,com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 5.1, Pava Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

From: Admin-D (LKKAuto)

Sent: Tuesday, 27 February 2018 1:20 PM

To: 'Siti A Thikah AB Rahman' <siti.rahman@ergo.com.sg>

Cc: assignments <assignments@lkkauto.com>; SUR <sur@lkkauto.com=

Subject: RE: GX 354U | TP: SHD 952L | LKK | DOA: 22.02.2018 - PRS | OUR REF: DSMCV1800369/SL/sa

Dear Siti,
Thank you for the assignment.

Best Regards,

Catherine Chong | Admin

LEK Auto Consultants Pte Lid

Phone: 6741-8434 | email: assignments@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S{408933)

From: Siti A Thikah AB Rahman [mailto:siti.rahman@ergo.com.sg]

Sent: Monday, 26 February, 2018 5:06 PM

To: Catherine Chong (LKK Auto) (admin-d@lkkauto.com) <admin-d@lkkauto.com>

Subject: Ol: GX 354U | TP: SHD 952L | LKK | DOA: 22.02.2018 - PRS | OUR REF. DSMCV1800369/5L/sa

Dear Catherine,

In compliance with “State Courts Practice Directions Amendment No.1 of 2016” in regards to the Pre Repair Survey,
both TP repairer and Ergo Insurance Pte Ltd have agreed on your company LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd to be the
“Single Joint Expert”.

Please conduct this survey request on without prejudice basis and to try finalise with the repairer on the repairs.
(Note: Our insured has yet to lodge the accident report to us).

Please fill up the necessary on ERGO PRS Form and return to us together on your update of the survey status.



1 UBLAVE 1, #01-25 PAYA UBLINDUSTRIAL PARK, SINGAPORE 408933 TEL ; (065) 62363561 FAX : (063) 62564315

Your Ref: DSMCV1800369/SL/sa Date: 015 March 2018
Our Ref: CS/EGI18003755/Kqd3 Without Prejudice

The Motor Claims Department
ERGO Insurance Pte Lid

Attn; Pei Li
Dear Sirs/Mdm

PRELIMINARY ADVICE OF VEHICLE NO.__SHD 952L

We thank you for the instruction on _26/02/2018.

Please be informed that we had conducted the inspection of the abovementioned vehicle

on 27/02/2018 at the premises of M/s TRANS-CAB and have the following
to report:-

Workshop Estimate Amount : 5% 42.416.07

Revised Estimate Amount b 5.137.67

“Check” Items Amount : S8 699.77

Market Value . S§ -

Salvage Value :S% -

Nett Value : 8% -

Description of Damage:
The vehicle sustained damages at the
rear portion.

Comments/ Present Status:

Damages consistent.
Days of repair: 2.5 days.
We have NOT authorise repair.

Yours faithfully

KENNETH KONG
Licensed Appraiser



PARF/COE Rebate Enquiry

Enquire PARF/COE Rebate for Registered Vehicle

Vehicle Owner Particulars

Owner ID Type:
Owner [D:

Vehicle Details

Vehicle No.:

Vehicle to be Exported:

Intended De-registration Date:

Vehicle Make:

Vehicle Model:

Primary Colour:
Manufacturing Year:
Engine No.:

Chassis No.:

Maximum Power Output:
Open Market Value:
Original Registration Date:
First Registration Date:
Transfer Count:

Actual ARF Paid:

Intended PARF Rebate Details

PARF Eligibility:
PARF Eligibility Expiry Date:

PARF Rebate Amount:

Intended COE Rebate Details

Company

3878K

SHD952L

Yes

22 Febh 2018

RENAULT

LATITUDE 2.0L DCI AUTO D/AB 4DR
Red

2016
M9R8839C003254
VF1ABL15AUC283507
127.0 kW (170 bhp)
$19,998.00

03 Jul 2017

03 Jul 2017

0

$19,998.00

Yes

02 Jul 2025

$14,998.00

https://vrl.Ita.gov.sg/lta/vrl/action/enquireRebate By PublicBeforeDeregInput?FUNCTI...

Page 1 of 2

22/2/2018



PARF/COE Rebate Enquiry Page 2 of 2

COE Expiw Date: 02 Jul 2025

COE Category: A - Car up to 1600cc & 97kW (130bhp}
COE Period(Years): 8

PQP Paid: $£38,560.00

COE Rebate Amount: $30.848.00

Total Rebate Amount: $45 846.00

Message

Please note that the 8-year COE for this vehicle cannot be further renewed. The vehicle must be
de-registered upon COE expiry or when the vehicle reaches its statutory lifespan (if applicable),
whichever is earlier.

The infarmation contained herein is correct as at 22 Feb 2018

OK

https://vrl.Ita.gov.sg/lta/vrl/action/enquireRebateBy Public BeforeDereglnput?FUNCTL..  22/2/2018



Trans-cab Auto Services Pte Ltd
No. 2 Ang Mo Kio Street 63 Singapore 569111

Tel No. : 6287 b6b6

Fax No. : 6257 1330

CO./GST Reg. No. 20101962606
SHD 952L

Lo e B o L T B N

L R L T o T O T T o T N T e ey
gmmﬂmmhmm—lmmmﬂmmhwm—lmm

Vehicle No..
Chassis No.:
Vehicle Make:
Vehicle Model:
Date of Accident :
Third Party Insurer :

PART

BUMPER COVER REAR

BUMPER LOWER REAR

BUMPER BRACKET CTR REAR
BUMEPR BRACKET SIDE RH REAR
BUMEPR RETAIMER RH REAR
BUMPER REFLECTOR RH

BUMEPR BRACKET SIDE LH REAR
BUMEPR RETAINER LH REAR
BUMPER REFLECTOR LH

BUMPER BEAM REAR

BUMPER BEAM BRACKET LH REAR
BUMPER BEAM BRACKET RH REAR
BOOT REAR

BOOT FINISHER

BOOT WHEATERSTRIP

BOOT REFLECTOR LAMP LH

BOOT REFLECTOR LAMP RH

BOOT BADGE 'RENAULT'

BOOT BADGE

BOOT INMNER TRIM

BOOT SWITCH

BOOT LOCK

BOOT LOCK CATCH

2 LICENCE PLATE LAMP

2 BOOT RUBBER PLUG

1 TAILLAMP RH

1 TAILLAMP PANEL RH

1 TAILLAMP LH
1
”

..-l—l-.—l—l_l.—l—l-rlq—ﬂ-—l—l—l—l—l_I—'l—l—l—ha.-l—l—l-.—l

TAILLAMP PANEL LH
QUTER PANEL REAR (End Panel)

S Va7 ’/L/':,?.-A
ﬁ"fuﬂ

Sl
ﬁ7 /51;" I//J'(;.;.;?/

SHD 952L

AAD1802-218

VF1ABL15AUC283507

RENAULT
LATITUDE
22.2.2018
ERGO

1-\

Je.

J 1..
T
T
A

[in
Vi

.

“H‘P%%Hbﬂﬁ%%%%ﬂ%%%%%“ﬂhﬂ%mmmm%%bﬂ%m

768.84 X'
113.47 X
135.97 X
44.99
4361 %
135.97
4499 4
4361 A

fL 77752 Z;
225.95

22595 £

7 287268 _—

470.06 X
323.05 <
49335 £
49335 A
22536 —
22536 «—
586.45
168.13
202.67

74.40

5052 2 X
221.81
552.55
986.70
552.55
986.70

/T 147197 _



Trans-cab Auto Services Pte Ltd AAD1802-218
MNo. 2 Ang Mo Kio Street 63 Singapore 569111
Tel No.: 6287 6666  Fax No.: 6257 1330
CO./GST Reg. No. 201019626G
SHD 952L
31 1 OUTER PANEL REAR (End Panel)TRIM 3 Jn“\ 404 56 w{
32 1 EXHAUST REAR $ T 748905 4
33 1 EXHAUST CAP REAR 3 A 23049 /{
TOTAL $ 22,750.91
10% % 3,586.89
$ 32,282.05
Specical Nett
1o, .
1 1SET PARKING AID $ e 700.00 ¥
2 1SET REAR BUMPER CLIP $ 5 66.00 —
3 1SET BUMPER BRACKET CTR CLIP $ “Aa 3300 —
4 1SET BUMPER BRACKET SIDE CLIP RH RR $ T 1000
5 1SET BUMPER RETAINER RH CLIP RR $ A 2000
6 1SET BUMPER BRACKET SIDE CLIP LH RR $ L 10.00
7 1SET BUMPER RETAINER CLIP LH RR 3 v 20,00
8 1SET BUMPER LOWER REAR RIVET $ A~ 2200 /A
9 1SET BUMPER LOWER REAR CLIP ;S V1 66.00
10 1 EXHAUST MOUNTING REAR $ Y 1782
11 1SET BOOT FINISHER CLIP $ A 2420
12 1 BOOT STICKER "Trans-cab” $ 3000 —
13 1 BOOT STICKER "6555-3333" $ T 3000 —
14 1 BOOT INNER TRIM CLIP g T 4500 X
TOTAL $ 1,094.02
TOTAL PARTS % 33,376.07
LABOUR
¢ .ﬁ"rl;/
Putty And Spray Painting Of The Affected Portion. $ 3,500.00
Panel Beating, Knocking And Straightening The
Necessary Portion, Remove And Renewal Of Parts, 5.2‘ cef
Adjust And Realign The Same $ 3,200.00
To Rust-Proofing Of The Affected Areas. $ 170.00 F¢/ j



Trans-cab Auto Services Pte Ltd AAD1802-218
Mo. 2 Ang Mo Kio Street 63 Singapore 569111

Tel No.: 6287 6666  Fax No. : 6257 1330

CO./GST Reg. No. 2010196266

SHD 952L

To reinstall rear bumper parking sensor. $ 17000 O/

To transfer of bootlid fittings, attachments and
perform water seepage test. $ 170.00 J,}:rf

To repair and realign rear exhaust pipe. $ A 17000 X

To drop rear exhaust box, renew the same, to repair

and realign centre exhaust pipe. $ 17000 X
To transfer of rear end panel fittings, attachment and
perform water seepage test. 3 A 17000
To transfer of rear luggage floor panel fittings,
attachment and perform water seepage test. $ AN 17000 X
To supply and re-do rear luggage floor panel
insulation padding. $ A 380.00 i
To transfer of rear fender fittings, attachment and
perform water seepage test, $ “¥“L 380.00 X
To transfer of rear windscreen fittings and conduct
water seepage test. $ A= 19500 K
To check steering geometry and computer wheel
alignment $ A4 22000 X
TOTAL $ 9,040.00
Over All Total $ 42,416.07
Lahod B+
PART BY PART
Repair Days _10-DAYS

2 ictey;



' 74 74 LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

:"‘—5_‘_& 51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408933
TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315
Reg. No: 199807198R G5T Reg. No. 18-9607156-R
Affiliated to Federation Internationale Des Experts En Automobile
ERGO INSURAMCE PTELTD Ref : CS/EGI18003755/Kgd3n2
5 TEMASEK BOULEVARD N"M"N”‘Imm
#04-01 SUNTEC TOWER FIVE Date -  21-06-2018
SINGAPORE 038985
Code: EGI
1. Policy Particulars :- THIRD PARTY CLAIM
Insured Veh. GX 354U Veh. Inspected SHD 9521
Policy No. Coverage ($) 0.00
Claim No. DSMCV180036%/SLYsa Excess ($) 0.00
Assign From SITI ATHIKAH Assign Date 26/02/2018
Pk Vehicle Particulars & Condition
Make & Model RENAULT LATITUDE (A} c.C 1995
Engine No. HIDDEN Year of Reg. 2017
Chassis No. VF1ABL1SAUC283507 Colour METALLIC WHITE / RED
Odometer 74190 Steering IN ORDER
Brakes IN ORDER Modification MIL
General GOOD
< Conditions of Tyres
Size Make Balance
R/H Front Tyre |215/60 R16 GOODYEAR 8 mm
L/H Front Tyre |215/60R16 GOODYEAR & mm
R/H Rear Tyre |215/60R16 GOODYEAR B mm
L/H Rear Tyre |215/60 R16 GOODYEAR 8 mm
4, Description of Damages
THE VEHICLE SUSTAINED DAMAGES AT THE REAR PORTION.
DAMAGES SEE DETAILS.
5. General Information
Accident Date  22/02/2018 |Inspection Date 27/02/2018
Survey held at TRAMNS-CAB AUTO SERVICES PTE LTD
NO.2 ANG MO KIO ST 83
SINGAPORE 569111
5a. Remarks
AJTHE INSPECTION WAS CONDUCTED OM A"WITHOUT PREJUDICE" BASIS,
BjIN ACCORDANCE TO YOUR INSTRUCTIONS, WE HAVE NOT AUTHORISED REPAIRS.

5b. Estimate Days of Repair

ESTIMATED NORMAL PERIOD FOR REPAIR: 2.500 Working Days




LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408933

TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: B256 4315

Reqg. No: 199607198R GST Reg. No. 19-8607196-R
ADJUSTMENT ON REPAIR COST FOR VEHICLE NO. SHD 952L

Page No.:1 of 3

Estimate By | Our Adjusted
Qty Description of Eartu Condition Workshop (5)) )
REPLACEMENT OF PARTS
1|BUMPER COVER REAR BENT 1,108 46 1,108.46
1|BUMPER LOWER REAR SERVICEABLE 768.84 .
1|BUMPER BRACKET CTR REAR SERVICEABLE 113.47 -
1|BUMPER BRACKET SIDE RH REAR SERVICEABLE 135.87 -
1|BUMPER RETAINER RH REAR SERVICEABLE 44.99 .
1|BUMPER REFLECTOR RH SERVICEABLE 43,61 -
1|BUMPER BRACKET SIDE LH REAR SERVICEABLE 135.97 -
1|BUMPER RETAINER LH REAR SERVICEABLE 4499 -
1|BUMPER REFLECTOR LH SERVICEABLE 43,61 8
1|BUMPER BEAM REAR TO REPAIR SEE 777.52 -
LABOUR
1|BUMPER BEAM BRACKET LH REAR TO REPAIR SEE 22585 -
LABOUR
1|BUMPER BEAM BRACKET RH REAR TO REPAIR SEE 225.95 .
LABOUR
1|BOOT REAR BENT 2 872,68 287268
1|BOOT FINISHER SERVICEABLE 470.06 -
1|BOOT WEATHERSTRIP SERVICEABLE 323.05 -
1|BOOT REFLECTOR LAMP LH SERVICEABLE 493.35 i
1|BOOT REFLECTOR LAMP RH SERVICEABLE 493.35 -
1|BOOT BADGE "RENAULT" NECESSARY 225.36 22536
1|BOOT BADGE NECESSARY 225,36 225.36
1|BOOT INMER TRIM SERVICEABLE 586.45 -
1|BOOT SWITCH SERVICEABLE 168.13 -
1|BOOT LOCK TO REPAIR SEE 20267 -
LABOUR
1|BOOT LOCK CATCH TO REPAIR SEE 74.40 .
LABOUR
2|LICENCE PLATE LAMP SERVICEABLE 50.52 -
2|BOOT RUBBER PLUG SERVICEABLE 22181 -
1| TAILLAMP RH SERVICEABLE 552,55 -
1| TAILLAMP PANEL RH TO REPAIR SEE 9B6.70 :
LABOUR

Report Ref No. CS/EGI18003755/Kagd3n2




LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

51 Ubi Ave 1#01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408933
TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315
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1| TAILLAMP LH SERVICEABLE 652 B5 -
1| TAILLAMP PANEL LH TO REPAIR SEE SBE. 70 -
LABOUR
1|OUTER PANEL REAR (END PANEL) TO REPAIR SEE 1471.77 -
LABOUR
1|OUTER PANEL REAR (END PANEL) TRIM SERVICEAEBLE 404 56 -
1|EXHAUST REAR TO REPAIR SEE T.489.05 -
LABOUR
1|EXHAUST CAP REAR TO REPAIR SEE 230.49 :
LABOUR
LESS 10% DISCOUNT -2, 275.08 443 18
20,475.80 3,088.67
SPECIAL NETT ITEMS
1|SET PARKING AID (SN) SERVICEABLE T00.00 -
1|SET REAR BUMPER CLIP (SN) NECESSARY B66.00 66.00
1|SET BUMPER BRACKET CTR CLIF (SN) NECESSARY 33.00 33.00
1|SET BUMPER BRACKET SIDE CLIF RH RR (SN} NOT NECESSARY 10.00 -
1|SET BUMPER RETAINER RH CLIP RR (SN} NOT NECESSARY 20.00 -
1|SET BUMPER BRACKET SIDE CLIP LH RR (SN) NOT NECESSARY 10.00 -
1|SET BUMPER RETAIMER CLIP LH RR (SN) NOT NECESSARY 20.00 -
1|SET BUMPER LOWER REAR RIVET (SM) NOT NECESSARY 22.00 -
1|SET BUMPER LOWER REAR CLIP (SN) NOT NECESSARY 66.00 -
1|EXHAUST MOUNTING REAR (SN) SERVICEABLE 17.82 -
1|{SET BOOT FINISHER CLIP (SN} NOT NECESSARY 24,20 -
1|BOOT STICKER "TRANS-CAB" (SN) NECESSARY 30.00 30.00
1|BOOT STICKER "6555-3333" (SN) MECESSARY 30.00 30.00
1|BOOT INNER TRIM CLIP (SHN) MOT NECESSARY 45.00 -
1,094 02 159.00
LABOUR
PUTTY AND SPRAY PAINTING OF THE AFFECTED 3,500.00 440.00

FORTION.
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Description of Parts Condition _Estimate By | Our Adjuste
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PANEL BEATING KNOCKING AND STRAIGHTENING THE 3,200.00 400 00
NECESSARY BORTION REMOVE AND RENEWAL OF
PARTS ADJUST AND REALIGN THE SAME_INCLUSIVE OF
THE REPAIR OF BUMPER BEAM REAR BUMPER BEAM
BRACKET LH REAR, BUMPER BEAM BRACKET RH
REAR BOOT LOCHK BOOT LOCK CATCH TAILLAMP PANEL
RH, TAILLAMP PANEL LH,OUTER PANEL REAR (END
PANEL),EXHAUST REAR AND EXHALST CAP REAR.
TO RUST-PROOFING OF THE AFFECTED AREAS. 170.00 30.00
TO REINSTALL REAR BUMPER PARKING SENSOR, 170.00 60.00
TO TRANSFER OF BOOTLID FITTINGS ATTACHMENTS 170.00 60.00
AND PERFORM WATER SEEPAGE TEST.
TO REPAIR AND REALIGHN REAR EXHAUST PIPE NOT NECESSARY 170.00
TO DROP REAR EXHALUST BOX RENEW THE SAME TO NOT MECESSARY 170.00 -
REPAIR AND REALIGN CENTRE EXHAUST PIPE.
TO TRANSFER OF REAR END PANEL WOT NECESSARY 170.00 -
FITTINGS ATTACHMENT AND PERFORM WATER
SEEPAGE TEST.
TO TRANSFER OF REAR LUGGAGE FLOOR PANEL NOT NECESSARY 170.00 -
FITTINGS ATTACHMENT AND PERFORM WATER
SEEPAGE TEST
TO SUPPLY AND RE-DO REAR LUGGAGE FLOOR PANEL |NOT NECESSARY 380.00 -
INSULATION PADDING.
TO TRANSFER OF REAR FENDER NOT NECESSARY 380.00 -
FITTINGS ATTACHMENT AND PERFORM WATER
SEEPAGE TEST.
TO TRANSFER OF REAR WINDSCREEMN FITTINGS AND NOT NECESSARY 170.00 -
COMNDUCT WATER SEEPAGE TEST.
TO CHECK STEERING GEOMETRY AND COMPUTER NOT NECESSARY 220.00 -
WHEEL ALIGNMENT,

9 .040.00 990.00
GRAND TOTAL 30,609.82 5137.67
RECOMMENDED COST OF REPAIRS | | | 5,137.67|
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ISCLAIMER OF LIABILITY TO THIRD PARTIES:- This Repornt ks made solely for the use and benefit of the Client named an the front page of this Report.




