Vic (LKKAuto)

h

From: GERALD POH WEE BIN <geraldpoh@lonpac.com>

Sent: Monday, 7 May, 2018 5:36 PM

Teo: Vic (LKKAuto)

Cc: MT_Claim_5G

Subject: RE: <SEEK MANDATE> PART 2/2 RE: Direct Settlement - Accident Involving

5J55477G (Ol : LPC - 17/18/18/VP05/020435) AND SKAG825L (TP : LKK REF -
CCe/LPC18003742/Uhb3 ) on 27.02.2018

Dear Vic,

Kindly proceed as proposed.

Best Regards

Gerald Poh

Senior Claims Executive | Lonpac Insurance Bhd

300 Beach Road, #17-04/07 The Concourse, Singapore 199555
Tel: (65) 6250 7388 Ext.255 | Fax: (65) 6296 2706

From: Vic (LKKAuto) [mailto:vicalpeh@lkkauto.com)

Sent: Monday, 7 May, 2018 3:01 PM

To: GERALD POH WEE BIN

Cc: MT_Claim_SG; Admin A; Bevan Lim (LKK Auto); Vic (LKKAuto)

Subject: RE: <SEEK MANDATE> PART 2/2 RE: Direct Settlement - Accident Involving SJS5477G (OI : LPC -
17/18/18/VP05/020435) AND SKA6825L (TP : LKK REF -CC6/LPC18003742/Uhb3 )on 27.02.2018

PART 2/2

Your Ref: 17/18/18/VP05/020435
Our Ref: CC6/LPC18003742/Uhb3

Dear Gerald,

ACCIDENT INVOLVING VEHICLES SJS 5477G (Ol) / SKA 6825L (TP) / OTHERS ON 27/02/2018 ALONG SENGKANG EXIT
TOWARDS TAMPINES

We refer to the above matter.

It was reported that Insured vehicle was involved in a 5 vehicle chain collision and was the 4" vehicle and was rear-
ended by the Malaysian Motorcycle (last vehicle).

TP reported only 4 vehicle chain collision and Insured was the last car and rear-ended his vehicle.

We propose to offer to TP repairer “FASTECH AUTO PTE LTD" as below:
TP CLAIMED REVISED - TO OFFER
Cost of Repair (w/gst) $ 27,438.10 S 9,630.00
Loss of Use (5100 x 10 days) 5 1,000.00 S 600.00 (560 x 10 days)
GIA Search Fee 5 2.00 5 2.00
TOTAL | $ 28,440.10 $ 10,232.00




MARKET VALUE : $36,000.00 (est)
LTA REBATE : $24,497.00 (est)
NETT VALUE  :$11,503.00 (est)

Breakdown of days is as follows:

Our surveyor's recommended days to repair 9 days
Downtime / Weekends 1day
TOTAL 10 days

The above is for your approval and/or further instructions please.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Vic Alpeh | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841-2096 | email: vicalpeh@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)
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SSRER i Saye the Earth: Print only when necessary

This e-mail contain confidential and privileged material, and are for the sole use of the intended recipient, Use or distribution by an
unintended recipient is prohibited, and may be a violation of law. If you believe that you received this e-mail in error, please do not
read this e-mail or any attached items. Please delete the e-mail and all attachments, including any copies thereof, and inform the
sender that you have deleted the e-mail, all attachments and any copies thereof. Thank you.

From: Zaini (LKK Auto)

Sent: Wednesday, 4 April, 2018 5:21 AM

To: 'GERALD POH WEE BIN'; ONG LI LI; "ERIC WOO JUN KIAT
Cc: 'MT_Claim_SG'; Admin A; Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

Subject: RE: Direct Settlement - Accident Involving 5/55477G (01 : LPC - TBA) AND 5KAB825L (TP : LEK REF -

CCB/LPC18003742/Ukb3 ) on 27.02.2018
WITHOUT PREJUDICE

Dear Sir / Madam,

We refer to the above matter.

This is a TP direct settlement case.

We had inspected TP vehicle SKA 6825L at M/s FASTECH AUTO PTE LTD.

Enclosed for your perusal is:
- TP estimated cost of repair

- Preliminary advice

Kindly take note that the case handler in-charge is as stated on the undersigned.
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Thank you.

Besl Regards,

Iaini Kusaini | Case Hondler

LKK Auto Consultants Fle Lid

DIC: 6841-2132 | email; {Qini@kkauto com | fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Payallbi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5[408933)

From: 5hu Pei (LKKAuto)

Sent: Wednesday, 28 February 2018 6:19 PM

To: 'GERALD POH WEE BIN' <geraldpoh@lonpac.com>; ONG LI Ll <llong@!| = 'ERIC WOO JUN KIAT'
<ericwoo @lonpac.com>

Cc: 'MT_Claim_SG' <mt _claim@lonpac.com>; Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com=; Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)
<chewht@Ikkauto.com>; Zaini (LKK Auto) <Zaini@lkkauto.com>

Subject: Direct Settlement - Accident Involving SJ55477G (Ol : LPC - TBA) AND SKAG825L (TP : LKK REF -
CC//LPC18003742/Ukb32 ) on 27.02.2018

WITHOUT PREJUDICE

Dear Sir / Madam,

We refer to the above matter.

This is a TP direct settlement case. We had inspected TP vehicle SKA 6825L at M /s Fastech Auto Pte Ltd.
Meanwhile, kindly let us have a copy of your insured’s GIA report for our necessary action.

Enclosed for your perusal is:
TP GIA report

Please be informed that estimated cost of repair and preliminary advice is not ready yet
Our case handler in-charge is Zaini and he can be contacted at DID: 6841-2132.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Shu Pei| Admin
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
Phone: 6366-0055 | email: shupei@|kkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108

Bk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)



FASTECH AUTO PTE LTD
1 Kaki Bukit Ave 6 #01-48 Autobay

Singapore 417883

Tel No: 67452063 / 67467158 Fax No: 67458520
Tax Reg No: 200006262D

Date : 28.03.2018

Lonpac Insurance BHD

300 Beach Road
#17-04/07 The Concourse

Singapore 199555

Attn: Motor Claims Department

ACCIDENT INVOLVING VEHICLE: SKA 6825L / SIS 5477G ON  27.02.2018
We are the authorized repair workshop for the owner of motor vehicle no:  SKA 6825L |, which was involved
in the captioned accident with your insured vehicle no: SIS 54776 . The vehicle owner has requested and

authorized us to assist him in presenting his‘her claim against the party responsible for the damage to the vehicle,

As the accident was caused by the negligent act of your insured driving, we are submitting these claims for
vour consideration on behalf of the owner/claimant.

I} Cost of Repair (inclusive of GST) s 9.630.00
2)  Loss Of Use (9 days + 1 Sun X § 100} 8 1,000.00
3}y GILA Search Result s 2.00
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We enclosed herewith the following documents to support the claims:

a) Final Repair Invoice e) Vehicle Registration Log Card
b) I/C & Driving License f) Letter of Authorisation, efc...
c) GIA Report/ GIA Search Result

d) Insurance Certificate

Kindly look into the matter and let us hear from vou on the settlement of our customer’s claims
as soon as possible,

Please note that it is a condition of any settlement reached that it shall be without prejudice to
any personal injury claim (if any) of the owner/claimant,

Thank vou.
Yours faithfully,

Jason Tang ( j&snn@f&al&ﬂhﬁﬁﬂbﬂm.sg}

FASTECH AUTO PTE LTD

Fvpiriad iy 1a s o sk Lo



DATE

27022018

TO : Lonpac Insurance BHD

RE : ACCIDENT INVOLVING VEHICLE NO. e -
SIS 54776 ONLY
ALONG TPE TWDS PIE AFTER PUNGGOL EXIT
ON 27.02.2018
I/'We,  CHYE YAN JIN DANIEL
of (NRIC No./ROC No.) 584254130
Uf 789 ANCHIRVALE CRES #01-17 5-544624
owner of vehicle no. SKA 6825L in consideration of M/s FASTECH AUTO
PTE LTD repairing my/our vehicle SKAs82sL at my/our instruction and hereby

authorise M/s FASTECH AUTO PTE LTD to demand claim settle receive whatever

amount settled/payable by the Insurance Company and/or third party or to commence legal
proceedings, if necessary, under my name, for the cost of Tepairs, car rental and/or loss of use,
etc. and fo their appointing solicitor to act for me/us in respect of the said accident/claim and
all claimed and/or settled shall belong to them absolutely.

I/We further agree and undertake to indemnify them against the abovementioned claim cost
which may arisen therewith.

Signature of Owner : /‘g’"ﬂﬂb{’

Name of Owner CHYE YAN JIN DANIEL




LONPAC INSURANCE BHD

CLAIM NO : 17/18/18/VP05/020435
DATE : 08 MAY 2018

DISCHARGE VOUCHER

I/We, CHYE YAN JIN DANIEL confirmed acceptance from M/s LONPAC
INSURANCE BHD and/or the owner of SIS 5477G the sum of Singapore Dollars
Ten Thousand Two Hundred Thirty Two Only (510,232.00) in full and final
satisfaction, liquidation and discharge of property claim competent to me/us upon the
said M/s LONPAC INSURANCE BHD in respect of property claim sustained by
me/us whether now or hereafter o become manifest, arising either directly or
indirectly from an accident 0 my vehicle, SKA 6825L on 27 FEBRUARY 2018
along SENGKANG EXIT TOWARDS TAMPINES.

I /We hereby agree to indemnify and keep indemnify (TAN CHENG CHWEE /
LONPAC INSURANCE BHD) against all claims and any claims whatsoever made
by any person/persons on our behalf in respect of the said accident.

I/'We further authorize you to pay the above settlement sum directly to M/S
FASTECH AUTO PTE LTD.

I/We hereby acknowledge that this payment is made on a without admission of
liability basis and without prejudice to all related claims and in respect of our
insured’s recovery action.
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Name of vehicle owner/Date

affect b nal
claim o a Leter date
rart the setflement terma herein should not be used as an
Evidence to peejisdice 1o the clamant's personal inpures claim
andfor other wminsured lotses clamm anisizg of the
subject matter in this actioa.




TAX INVOICE

FASTECH AUTO PTE LTD

1 Kaki Bukit Ave 6 #01-48 Autobay

Singapore 417883

Tel No: 67452063 / 67467158 Fax No: 67458520
Tax Reg No: 200006262D

Tax Invaice :20165
Lonpac Insurance BHD
300 Beach Road Date 28.03.2018
#17-04/07 The Concourse Vehicle No  :SKA 68251
Singapore 199335 Make/Model :HONDA CITY
Chassis/Eng#
Accident Date :27.02.2018
Claim No :0218- 20165
Reference
Policy No
Amount
To proceed on lump sum repair 5% 9.000.00
E. & Q. E. Total : 5% Q.000.00
GST @ 7% : 5% 630.00
Amownt Due  : S% 9.630.00

b

FASTECH AUTO PTELTD |} -
All Invoices are subjected to GST
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271022018

GENERAL

Cur Ref No: GR-18-029972
Date of Request 2710212018

Kim Chwee Auto Ple Lid
1 Kaki Bukit Avenue & #01-48
AutoBay@Kaki Bukit

INSURANCE

RECORDS MANAGEMENT CENTRE

Invaice

GENERAL INSURANCE ASSOCIATION OF SINGAPORE

RECORDS MANAGEMENT CENTRE

6 Raffles Quay #18-00, Singapore 048580
Phone: +65 6224 0010 Fax: +65 6224 0030

Operating Hours: Monday to Friday Sam lo Spm

GST Registration Mo: M400017735

Third Party Insurer Enquiry

Your Ref No; Online Purchase

Singapore 417883

Deaar SirfMadam,

“aquiry Date 270212018

o nauiry By Tang Kok Wee, Allan
TP Vehicle Na. SJS5477G

Accident Date 27102/2018

Enguiry Result

TP Vehicle No. Insurer Period of Insurance Insurer Tel. No.,
SJS85ATTG Lonpac Insurance Bhd 271094201 7-26/09/2018 +55 62507388
Thank You.

The images provided Lo you are laken from he original reports forwarded o the cantre by the members of lhe General Insurance Association of

Singapore and we take no responsibility for their accuracy or contents and shall be under no Hability whatsoever for any loss or damage arising oul of
or in connection with the reports or their imagas,

This is a computer generated document and requires no signature.,

https:fisingepore. merimen.comiclaims/index.cfm7fusebox=MTRsas&fuseaction=dsp_geninvip&relid=17 3263 TACFID=283004T4ECFTOKEN=33a...
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2710272018

GENERAL
INSURANCE

RECORDS MANAGEMENT CENTRE

Our Ref No: GR-18-020972
Date of Request: 27/02/2018

Kim Chwee Auto Pia Ltd
1 Kaki Bukit Avenua B #01-48
AutoBay@Kaki Bukit

Inwoice

GENERAL INSURANCE ASSOCIATION OF SINGAPORE
RECORDS MANAGEMENT CENTRE

& Raffles Quay #18-00, Singapore 048580
Phone: +65 6224 0010 Fax: +65 6224 0030
Operating Hours: Monday to Friday 9am to 5pm
GST Registration Mo: M400017735

TAX INVOICE

Your Ref Mo: Online Purchase

Singapore 417883

Dear SirfMadam,

~aguiry Date 2710212018

wcnguiry By Tang Kok Wee, Allan

TF Vehicle Mo, SJS54776G

Accident Date 2710272018

DESCRIPTION AMOUNT (S$)

TP Insurer Enguiry 1.87
GST Amount 0.13
Total Amount Dua (GST Inclusive) 2.00

Thank You.

This is a computer generated document and requires no signature.

For GIARMC Official usa:
Date:
[%] GIRO [ ] Cash [ ] Cheque

hilps:fisingapore.merimen.comfclaimsafindex.cimfusebox=MTRsas&luseaclion=dsp_gsninvip&ralid=1T3263T&CFID=293004744CFTOKEN=33a... 12



