Vic (LKKAuto)

From: Claims Dept of CT1 <claimsdept@sg.cntaiping.com>

Sent: Monday, 25 March, 2019 10:17 AM

To: Vic (LKKAuto): admin@|bs-auto.com

Ce: Irene Tay: Alfred Toh; Chee So Chow, mgt@autoshield.com.sg,
Billyteocs@gmail.com

Subject: Direct Settlement - Accident Invalving SICT797D (O SNM1BD00836C02/7) and
SHBBY16A (TP : LKK REF - CC3/CTI18003729/K1hb3 ) on 09.02 2018

Attachments: SHBBY916A - Scene video.avi; Email to Ol dd 190319 pdf; LETTER TO OLpdf

LKK REF - CC3/CT118003729/K1hb3
CTI REF- SNM18D00E36C02/7 (SICTT97D)
Section Il Excess applicable: $1,500.00

Dear Vic

We refer to your email of 19 March 2019 pertaining to the above matter.
Please proceed to negotiate claim at best possible terms.

Aside to Irene, please assist to keep track/follow up on the matter.

Best Regards

Alfred Toh

Senior Executive

Claims Department

China Talping Insurance (Singapore] Pte. Ltd.

3 Anson Road #16-00 Springleaf Tower Singapare 079909
Tel {65) 6389 6183

Fax (65) 6224 7478

Email: claimsdept@sg.cntaiping.com

alfred.toh@ sg.cntaiping.com
Website: www.sg.cntaiping.com
Bisclatmer,
s message v confidlenital; ws contents do nod constteie a commuiment by Chenn Taggng favnronce (Singapore) Pre. Lid, except
wiere prowviched for b a weitten agreciment between voir and Ching Taiping livwrance (Singapore) Phe. Ll Ay unaatlhorizied
disclovire, wse or dixsewitnation, elther i whaele or partial, is probibited If voi are jed the intended recipient of the mewaye,

feive minrife the senler mmedfiorei

From: Vic (LKKAuto) [mailtowvicalpeh@|kkauto.com]

Sent: Tuesday, 19 March, 2019 5:56 PM

To: lrene Tay <irene.tay@sg.cntaiping.com:=

Cc: Claims Dept of CT1 <claimsdept@sg.cntaiping.com>; Alfred Toh <alfred.toh@sg.cntaiping.com>; Admin A
<admin-a@lkkauto.com=; Vic (LEKAuto) <vicalpeh@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: Direct Settlement - Accident Involving SIC7737D (Ol : CTI - TBA) and SHBBS16A (TP : LKK REF -
CC3/CTI18003729/K1hb3 ) on 09.02.2018

Dear Irene,
We refer further to the below emall.

Please find attached TP video footage which shows Insured vehicle swerved lane to avoid road works when the
accident happened



Ac such, liabllity is not to our Insured’s favour,

Thank you,

Best Regards,

Vie Alpeh | Case Hondler

LEKK Auto Consultants Pre Lid

Phione: 6841-2096 | email: vicalpeh@lkkauto.com | fax: 67q1-4108

Bk 51, Pavi Ubi Industrial Park, U Avenue 1. #02-25 | SI408931]

F RIS =
S=RER =5 Snw dhe Sacth Print anly when necesvary

T g-minl coptan conhdental and prvileged matenal, end are for he sola use of the intended recipient. Lise or amtnbution by an
uriniended reciplent = probibiled, ang may be a8 violation of law, I you believe thal you received Ihis 2-mail in error, pleass oo nal
rexindd [Meg @-miall b any otthched ilema. Pleasa delete the e-mall and oll atiachmanty, including any coples [hersol. and inform the
sender that you have deleted the e-mall, all attachments and any copes thereof, Thank yau

From: Evon Char <gvon.char@sg cntaiping.com>
Sent: Tuesday, 6 March 2018 12:40 PM

To: Shu Pei (LKKAuto) <shupei@|kkauto.com>
Cc: Irene Tay <irene.tay @sg cotaiping. com>; Admin A <admin-a@|kkauto.com>; Vic (LKKAuto|

<vicalpeh@lkkauto.com>; Asher Sng (LKKAuto) <AsherSng@|kkauto.com>
Subject: RE: Direct Settlement - Accident Involving SJC77970 (01 : CTI1 - TBA) and SHBE916A (TP : LKK REF -
CC3/CTI18003729/K1hb3 ) on 09.02.2018

Dear Shu Pel,
We refer to your emall of 27" February 2018.
We attached a copy of our Assignment Letter and SAS Report for your necessary action.

Kindly take note, the claim handler is lrene Tay 6389 6192

Hegards.

Evon Char

Claims Department

China Taiping Insurance [Singapore) Ple. Lid
3 Ansan Road # 15-00

Springleal Tower Singapare 079808

Co. Regn, No. 200208384E

DID: 6389 6116

Fax: 6224 T175
Email' Evon.char@sg.cntaiping.com
laim .cntai .com

Website - hitpJ//www.sg.cntaiping .com

R L L

Discluimer: This message is confidential; its contents do not constitute a commitment by China Taiping
Insurance (Singapore) Ple. Lul, except where provided Tor in a written agreement between vou and China

2



Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pre. Lul. Any unauthonsed disclosure. use or dissemination, either in whole
or partial, is prohibited. 15 vou are not the intended recipient of the message, please notify the sender
immediately.
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From: Shu Pei (LKKAuto) [mallto:shupel@Ikkauto.

Sent: Tuesday, February 27, 2018 6:58 PM

To: Claims Dept of CT

Cc: Irene Tay; Admin A; Vic (LKKAuto); Asher Sng (LEKAuto)

Subject: Direct Settlement - Accident Involving SIC7797D (O : CTI - TBA) and SHB8916A (TP : LKK REF -
CC3/CTI18003729/K1hb3 } on 09.02.2018

WITHOUT PREJUDICE
Dear Irene,
We refer to the above matter.
This Is a TP direct settlement case.
We had Inspected TP vehicle SHB 8916A at M/s Premier Automotive Services Pre Ltd - Changl.
Enclosed for your perusal is:
- TP GIA report
- TP estimated cost of repair
- Preliminary advice
Meanwhile, kindly let us have a copy of your insured's GIA report for our necessary action.

Kindly take note that the case handler in-charge is Vic and he can be contacted at DID: 6841 2096,

Thank you.

Bast Regarads,

Shu Pel| Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Fhoneg: 6366-0055 | email shupm@Eikksuio.com | B 67414108
Bik 51, Paya Ubl Industria) Park, Ubl Avenus 1, 802-25 | S{408933)
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PREMIER AUTOMOTIVE SERVICES PTE LTD
23 CHANGI SOUTH AVE 2 #01-02
SINGAPORE 486443
TEL:65446671 FAX:62141511
CO. REG:200707743D GST REG:200707743D

Our Rel: SHBR916A/GS

9" March 2018

(By Email Only)
Attn: The Motor Claims Department
China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pte Lid
3 Anson Road #16-00
Springleaf Tower

Dear Sir/Madam

ACCIDENT INVOLVING SHB8916A & SIC7797D ALONG CLEMENCEAU
AVE ON 09,0218

We have been authorized by Premier Taxis Ple Ltd, the owner of Taxi vehicle number:
SHBB916A, to claim against the party/parties responsible for the damages arising from
the above-mentioned accident.

Our records show that you are the insurers of vehicle number: SJC7797D at the material
time of the accident with the driver of our client’s vehicle, Mr Sng Yong Wee

As a result of the accident caused by your Insured Driver's negligent driving and/or
management of vour insured's Vehicle Number: SIC7797D, our client’s vehicle was
damaged and we have been put to loss and damage as follows:

(1) Cost of repair $ 674.10 (Incl. GST)
(2) Loss of Rental - 3Days @$89.69per day $ 269.07
(3) Loss of Income — 3Days @$100.00per day $ 300.00
(4) GIA Search fee $ 2.00
§.17

A copy of each of the following supporting documents is enclosed:
(1) Final Repair Bill, GIA report & sketch plan of SHB8916A

(2) Driver's I/C and Driving Licence

(3) Vehicle Registration card, Centificate of Insurance

(4) Check In/Out Voucher, GIA search



PREMIER AUTOMOTIVE SERVICES PTE LTD
23 CHANGI SOUTH AVE 2 #01-02
SINGAPORE 486443
TEL:65446671 FAX:62141511
CO. REG200707743D GST REG:200707743D

Our Ref: SHB8916A/GS

We would appreciate if you could look into the subject matter and let us have your
favorable offer within 14 days. If vou are agreeable to the settlement of the above said
claims, please forward us your discharge voucher as for our client's signature and
payment made to “Premier Automotive Services Pre Lid™.

Please note that if we do not hear from you within the stipulated 14 days, we will have no

alternative but to appoint our solicitor to act on our behalf to commence proceedings
against vou without further notice to you.

Yours faithfully,

it -__,--":'ﬁ:..:-"'

Claims Bepartment — Gary Shi

Email: parv shi@premiertaxi.com

NB: We encourage all parties to liaise with us via email to expedite all matters

P5: Please quote our reference no when replying

¢.c. Client — Premier Taxis Pte Lid
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From: Vic [LKKAuUto)
Sent: Tuesday, 19 March, 2019 5:44 PM
Te: billyteocs@gmail com
Cc: Admin A; Vic (LKKAuto)
Subject: Your Ref: SIC 7797D_ACCIDENT INVOLVING SJC 7797D AND SHB 8916A ON
09/02/2018
L7 A~
Conguttants

S UBLAVE 1, #0125 PAYA UNTINDUSTRIAL PARK, SINGAPORE 408933 TEL : (065) 62563561 FAX : (065) 62564315

Our Ref: CC3/CTI18003729/K1hb3

19 MARCH 2019

SPR REALTY PTELTD By Post and By Email
200 JALAN SULTAN

#03-17 TEXTILE CENTRE

SINGAPORE 199018

ATTN: THE MANAGEMENT

Dear Sir/Madam,
ACCIDENT INVOLVING SJC 7797D AND SHB 8916A ON 09/02/2018

We refer to the above accident where we are acting for China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pte Ltd to resolve the
claim against you and/or your authorized driver under the Auto Insurance policy taken up with them.

Based on the accident report and accident scenario, liability is down against us. We will therefore proceed to negotiate
for an amicable settlement with the Third Party,

Should you however wish to further discuss on the matter prior to our negotiations and settlement, please contact us
within 10 days from the date of this letter.

Please call us if you have further queries.

Best Regards,
Vie Alpeh | Case Handler
LEKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841-2006 | email: vicalpeh@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubl Avenue 1, #02-25 | S{408033)

¥ S
LXK = Save the Earth Print only when necessary



This e-mail contain confidential and privileged material, and are for the sole use of the intended recipient. Use or distribution by an
unintended recipient is prohibited, and may be a violation of law. If you believe that you received this e-mail in error, please do not
read this e-mail or any attached items. Please delete the e-mail and all attachments, including any copies thereof, and inform the
sender thal you have deleted the e-mail, all attachments and any coples thereof. Thank you.



WITHOUT PREJUDICE

China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pre Lid
3 Anson Road #16-00

Springleat Tower

Singapore 079909

Attn: The Motor Claims Department

Dear SirMadam,

ACCIDENT INVOLVING SHBS8916A AND SJC7797D ALONG CLEMENCEAU AVE
ON 09.02.18

We, Premier Taxis Pte Lid. the registered owner of vehicle No: SHB8916A. We, hereby
authorize the said workshop, M/s Premier Automotive Services Pte Lid to execute sign
discharge voucher/Indemnity forms and all necessary documents in connection with and arising
out of the above claim, and collect all compensation monies due to us from vou or any other

party, regarding the said accident.

Thank You

Date

Premier Taxis Pte Ltd
Authorized Signatory
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Claimant 3 PREMIER TAXIS PTE LTD
Brsunt H 1,065,177

DOLLARS ONE THOUSAND SIXTY-FIVE AND SEVENTEEN CENTS ONLY

[fM= mgres to scsspt the above pentioned amount to be pald to ze/jes In full
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PREMIER AUTOMOTIVE SERVICES PTE LTD
QFFICE 23 Changi South Avenue 2 #01-02 S/468447)

TEL 65438576 / 54065805 FAN E2141511

AUTOMOTIVE SERVICES CO REG NO 2007077420 GST REG NO.- 2007077430
TAX INVOICE
PREMIER TAXIS PTE LTD DATE 8-Mar-2018
23 CHANG! SOUTH AVENUE 2 #03-02 PAGE 10F 1
SINGAPORE 488443
ITEM Description QTy U.PRICE AMOUNT
FINAL REPAIR BILL FOR KIA OPTIMA 3 €30.00
REGN NO: SHB 8916 A
TOTAL REPAIR COSTS AS RECOMMENDED BY SURVEYOR 630.00
GST@7%| $ 44.10
GRAND TOTAL] § 674.10

. far Pramisr AuTo-l'nq*l.lw.-‘S:mc-EE Pta Lid

(ALL THE REPAIR COSTS ARE SUBJECTED TO GS5T)




Premier Automotive Services Pte Ltd
23 Changt South Avenus 2

#0a-02

Singapore 436443

GST: 2007077430 ROC: 2007077430

| Tax Invoice |

‘.-'!(p REMIER

AUTOMOTIVE SERVICES

Phone:  (B5) 6214 8380 Bate Fage
Fax; (B5) 6214 2458 Dec 20, 2018 1
Involce Numbar
Sold To: Ship To: V1812018581
China Taiping Insurance (Singapore] Ple Lid China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pie Lid
3 Anson Road 218-00 3 Ansan E.:Ej#1;_m ¢
Springieal Tower Springlest Tower
Singapare 079503 Singapore 078808
Shipment { DO Na. Order Date Vehicle No. Case D PO Number Terms
SM1812025108 SHBED1EA TPMBD20WSHBBI 16A 30D
SiN ftem Number Description Qty. UnitPrice |Total Discount | Total Amount
Shp.
1 | ICGSTY Cost of Repar (subject to GST) 0.00 530.00
2 | ICGST2 Lo=z of Rental {subject 1o GST) 0.00 251 47
1 | ICGIA GlA Search Fee (subject to GST) 0.00 187
4 | ICNGST Misc Charges (not subject to GST) 0.00 120,00
Comments: Subtotal 1,003.34
Accident |n'-rDMI'Hu SJO77E7D o) ¥218 Less discount 0.00
Total amount 1,003.34
Authorised GST % 61.83
\N\ Grand total 1,065.17




@PREMIER

TAXIS

20 February 2018
To Whom It May Concemn

Dear Sir/Madam

CERTIFICA

This letter serves to inform that Sng Yong Wee of NRIC Number $7237276Z is a
registered driver of SHBB9I6A. Sng Yong Wee is paying daily rental rate of $89.69
{Inclusive of GST).

Should you require further information. please contact us at 6214 8880.
Thank you.

Yours sincerely

3

Chin Bee Lian (Ms)
Assistant Vice President

Taxis Administration

Prepared By: SY

PREMIER TAXIS FTELTD

13 Uhangi Seull Avenue 1

#3-

Singnpore 4806443

Telephone: +65 G214 BERD Fax: <48 6214 W30

e peyrtberian e
Co. Heg No. 20030457511



ﬁPREMIER

AXIS
"'-r’rg: CHECK IN / OUT VOUCHER

DAIVER'S NAME /@'ﬂ Keg .-{{um"
e s732 0406 E [ 414443
TRAREGNWO. § w B @11 £ AF|"E/ Moo Q-

DATE IN TIME N DATE OUT TIME OUT
264208 W3I® [2fo021¢ p736
HILOMETRES IN FUEL IN KII..IJIEI‘FEEU.I'I‘ FUEL OUT

(& [im[wasa] ¥ = [nlzlon]

TAX| METER DOWHLOADED
OATE / TIME TOWED N TD WORKEHOP

NU DDMH_rr HHMIBM
m:mmmmmmm
DD MY Y HHMM

| ACKNOWELDGE AND CONFIRM THAT | HAVE EXAMINED THE ABOVE SAID VEHICLE AND
THAT THE SAME 15 IN GDOD COMNDITION AND TO MY SATISFACTION IN EVERY RESFECT
TOGETHER WITH THE ACCESSORIES / ITEME LIST ABOVE. THIS VOUCHER |8 UBED IN
COMJUNCTION WITH THE TERM RENTAL AGREEMENT.

T it Hot | Suy oy e ¥
/ﬁﬁu )J’JDATEmLE mﬁm/gm:m; ME x
y 'w-‘—é/

YES

CHECKEGH BY CHECKED OUT BY

(PREMIER'S AUTHORISED WORKSHOP) (FREMIER'S AUTHORISED WORKSHOR)
SERVICE / REPAIRS DONE DRIVER'S REMARKS
Q SERVICING O OTHERS:

O T/BET

o mm/mq:m;m_um.

Q TURBO Gquysy 22458

QO BRAKESYSTEM @~ -
O CLUTCH SYSTEM

I AN

3 CPF
O BATTERY




2an2208 Invoice

GENERAL INSURANCE ASSOCIATION OF SINGAPORE

RECORDS MANAGEMENT CENTRE
@m RECORDS MANAGEMENT CE

I"SURANCE Phone: +65 5224 0010 Fax: +685 B224 0030
Operating Hours: Monday to Friday S8am to Spm
GST Registration No: M400017735

RECORDS MANAGEMENT CENTRE
Third Party Insurer Enquiry

Dur Ref No: GR-18-0234786

Date of Reguest; 12/02/2018 Your Ref No: Online Purchase
Premiar Automotive Sarvices Fla Lid
23 Changi South Ave 2
#01-02
Singapore 4868443

Dear SirffMadam,

Enquiry Date 12/02/2018

Enquiry By GOH WEE DEX
TP Vehicla Mo, SJCTTETD

Accident Date 09/02/2018
Enquiry Resull

TP Vehicle No, Insurar Period of Insurance Insurer Tel. No.
SJCTTeTD China Talping Insurance (Singapore) Ple. Lid. 2B/0B/2017-2T/0B/2018 6389 8111
Thank You.

The Images provided o you are taken from Lhe original reports forwarded (o the centre by the membaers of the General Inswrance Assodlation of
Singapore and we take no responsibility for thair acturacy of contents and shall be under no iability whatsoever for eny loss or damage anising oul of
or in conneclion with the reports or thelr images.

This s @ compuler generated document and reguires no signature,

hitpsdiwww.giarme.org sg/iclaims/index. cim Husebox=MTReaslfuseaction=dsp_geninvipArelid=17222468CFID=284803288CFTOKEN=0bb2d4d. . 112




21208 Irvoice

GENERAL INSURANCE ASSOCIATION OF SINGAPORE
RECORDS MANAGEMENT CENTRE

& Raffles Quay # . Singapore 048580
ASSDCIATION Oparating Hours: Monday to Friday 8am to S5pm

RECORDS MANAGEMENT CENTRE GST Registration No: M400017735
TAX INVOICE

Our Ref No: GR-18-023478
Cate of Request: 121022018 Your Ref No: Onling Purchase
Premiar Automolive Services Ple Lid
23 Changi South Ave 2
#01-02
Singapore 486443
Dear SinfMadam,
Enquiry Date 12/02/2018
Enquiry By GOH WEE DEK
TP Vehicle No. SJCTTaTD
Accident Date 09/02/2018
DESCRIPTION AMOUNT (S$)
TP Insurer Enquiry 1.87
GST Amount 0.13
Total Amount Due [GST Inclusive) 200
Thank You,

This is a computer generated document and requires no signature.

For GIARMC Official use:
Date;
[*¥] GIRO [ ] Cash [ ] Cheguea

hitps:iiwww.giarmc org sg/claimalindex, cfm Musebox=MTRsasiiuseaction=dsy_geninvipSrafid=1T22246ACFID=284B83264CFTOKEN=0bb204d,.. 22



