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LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

adm B - 51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408933
- TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315
Reg. No: 199607198R GST Reg. No. 19-9607198-R
B Affiliated to Federation Internationale Des Experts En Automobile
LONPAC INSURANCE BHD Ref - CC4/LPC18003724/yb3
B 07 THE CONCOURSESINGAPORE 199555 D¢~ 27022018 n mmmmwmm
Code: LPC2
1. Policy Particulars :- THIRD PARTY CLAIM
Insured Veh.  SLU 9920H Veh. Inspected SFY 3228M
Policy No. Coverage ($) 0.00
Claim No. Excess ($) 0.00
Assign From Assign Date 27/02/2018
2. Vehicle Particulars & Condition
Make & Model c.C 0
Engine No. HIDDEN Year of Reg.
Chassis No. Colour
Odometer Steering
Brakes Modification
General
3. Conditions of Tyres
Size Make Balance
R/H Front Tyre mm
L/H Front Tyre mim
R/H Rear Tyre mim
L/H Rear Tyre mm
4, Description of Damages
5. General Information
Accident Date  18/02/2018 Inspection Date
Survey held at WEARNES AUTOMOTIVE PTELTD
249 ALEXANDRA ROAD
SINGAPORE 158935
5a, Remarks
A)THE INSPECTION WAS CONDUCTED ON A"WITHOUT PREJUDICE" BASIS.
B)IN ACCORDANCE TO YOUR INSTRUCTIONS, WE HAVE NOT AUTHORISED REPAIRS.




oL Company Registration Mo, 199607158 R

CELL AN E b 02-55 TAYA UL INDUSTRIAL Pkt SINCAPORE 408933 TEL 5 (065 GIERISH] FAN @ 63| A

yYourtel:  To Be Advised Date; 06.03.2018
Our rel: CCHLPC] E{]DSTZ-I-}'TI}'I'J}

The Motor Claims Department
Mis LONPAC INSURANCE BHD

Dear Sir/Madam,

PRELIMINARY ADVICE OF VEHICLE NO. SLUY920H

We refer to the above matter.

Please be informed that we had conducted the inspection of the above mentioned vehicle on 05.03.2018
al the premises of M/s Wearnes Automotive Pte Lid_and have the following to report:-

Workshop Estimate Amount - 5% 5,545.50
Revised Estimate Amount 5% 3,434.00
"Check” ltems Amount 1 55 -

Market Value 1 85 -

LTA Reimbursement Value 5% -

Nett Value 1 5% -
Description of Damage: R i
The vehicle sustained damages at the SRRy
Rear N/S Portion et

Comments/Present Status:
Damages Consistent
Estimated normal period for repairs: 4 days

Yours faithfully,

MOHD. TAUFIKH
Licensed Appraiser



Catherine Chuna (LKK Auto)
e e —— T v |

From: GERALD POH WEE BIN <geraldpoh@lonpac.com>

Sent: Monday, 26 February, 2018 12:23 PM

To: assignments@|kkauto.com

Cc: MT_Claim_5G

Subject: FW: Our Ref: 17/18/18/VP05/020414 Direct Settlement - Our Ref: SLUY9920H :
Your Insured SFY3228M DOA 18/02/2018

Attachments: 26022018121839.pdf

Importance: High

Dear Catherine,
We attached a copy of insured’s GIA report for your attention.

Kindly proceed to conduct a survey and revert on liability.

Best Regards

Gerald Poh

Senior Claims Executive | Lonpac Insurance Bhd

300 Beach Road, #17-04/07 The Concourse, Singapore 199555
Tel: (65) 6250 7388 Ext.255 | Fax: (65) 6296 2706

From: Michelle Ong Siew Bee [mailto:michelle.ong@wearnes.com]

Sent: Wednesday, 21 February, 2018 12:33 PM

To: ERIC WOOD JUN KIAT

Ce: MT_Claim_SG

Subject: RE: Qur Ref: 17/18/18/VP05/020414 Direct Settlement - Our Ref: SLU9920H ; Your Insured SFY3228M
DOA 18/02/2018

Impaortance: High

Dear Eric,
Please confirm liability befare arranging for survey.
Kindly revert on urgent basis.

Best regards,

Michelle Ong

Service Consultant
Bodyshop & Paint

Wearnes Automotive Pte. Ltd.

V 249 Alexandra Read Singapore 159103

M (E5) 9120 4556 F (65) 6264 T137
www weameseom  michelle onpinwearnes. com

VWVIEAIINES

This email, ingluding any sttachment, is confidential and may alse be privileged.
if you have received it in error, please notify us immediately by reply emall and then delete this message from your sysfem.
Flease do not copy it or use it for any purpose, or disclose its conlents or any altschment to any other perscn. Thank you.



From: ERIC WOO JUN KIAT [mailto:ericwoo@lonpac.com]

Sent: Wednesday, February 21, 2018 12:04 PM

To: Michelle Ong Siew Bee <michelle.ong@wearnes.coms>

Cc: MT_Claim_5G <mt_claim@lonpac.com:

Subject: RE: Our Ref: 17/18/18/VP05/020414 Direct Settlement - Our Ref: SLUS920H ; Your Insured SFY3228M DOA
18/02/2018

Dear Michelle,

Please note that we will be appointing LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd to survey SLU 9920H.
Dear Catherine/Nivitha,

FYA.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Eric Woo

Claims Executive | Lonpac Insurance Bhd

300 Beach Road, #17-04/07 The Concourse, Singapore 199555
Tel: (65) 6279 9253 | Fax: (65) 6296 3767

From: Michelle Ong Siew Bee [mailto:michelle.ong@wearnes.com]

Sent: Wednesday, 21 February, 2018 10:40 AM

To: GERALD POH WEE BIN

Subject: FW: Direct Settlement - Our Ref; SLUS920H ; Your Insured SFY3228M DOA 18/02/2018
Importance: High

Dear Sirs,

We refer to the above matter.
Attached for Direct Settlement.
Kindly revert asap.

Best regards,

Michelle Ong
Service Consultant
Bodyshop & Paint

Wearnes Automotive Pte. Lid.

_w_ 243 Alexandra Road Singapore 159102

= M (55) 9129 4556 F (65) 6264 7137
WEARNES gywwearnes.com  michelleongifwearnes.com

This email, including any attachment, is confidential and may also be privileged,
If you have received it in error, plaase notify us immediately by raply email and then delete this message from your system.
Pierase do not copy it or use it for any purpose, or disciose its confents or any aftachment to any other person, Thank you.



2018/3/6

Enquire Transfer Fee

Vehicle Details
Wehicle Mo

Wehicle Type -

Vehicle Attachment 1 ;

Wehicle Scheme :
Vehicle Make -
Vehicle Madel ;
Chassis No. :
Propellant ;
Engine Na, :

Engine Capacity

Transfer Fee Enguiry

SGR2189Z

P10 - Passenger Maotor Car

Mo Attachment

Marmal

TOVOTA

TOYOTA COROLLA ALTIS LALCVT
MROS3REH104546701

Petrol

1ZRK556577

1598 cc

Maximum Power Output - 20.0 kW { 120 bhp)

Maximum Laden Weight 1640 kg
Unladen Weight ; 1205 kg
Year Of Manufacture : 2015
Original Registration Date : 25 May 2014

Lifespan Expiry Date: -

COE Category : A - Carupto 1600ce & 97kW [130bhp)
Quota Premium : $47,020,00

COE Expiry Date: 24 May 2026

Road Tax Expiry Date: 24 May 2018

PARF Eligibility Expiry Data ; 24 May 20246

Inspection Due Date 24 May 2019

Intended Transfer Date: 06 Mar 2018

CO2 Emission ; 151.00 (g/km)

CEV/VES Rebate Utilised
Amount

CO Emission: -
HT Emission : -
MOy Emission : -
PM Emission : -

The current road tax expiry is 24 May 2018, You may renew the road tasx from 25 Feb 2018 with all pre-requisite(s) fulfilled. If the road tax is
renewed after 24 May 2018, late renewal feels) will be impased. Please use Enguire Road Tax Payvable to check on the late fee(s) payable,

Road tax. Including Over Payment (if any), of a vehicle will follow the vehicle to the new registered owner when its ownership is being
transferred.

Amount Payable (From 25 May 2018 to 24 Nov 2018)

hitps:iivrl.ita. gov.sgitatwl/actionfenguire TransferFeeDetailsProxy PFUNCTION_ID=F0501015ET



WEARNES

SERVICE ESTIMATE
44471 - CDOODY SL: SERVICE SALES - PC
GAC (Singapore) Pte. Ltd.
Attn: Mr Lars Bergstrom
80 Anson Road

GST Reg.No:M28320628x%
Inv.No. . : B&P 0 Page 1
Inv.date. : 20/02/2018

#06-01 Fuji Xerox Towers WIP No. . : 46066
Singapore 079309 Veh. In/Out:
*Tel.No, : Mobile: 97301855
Reg.No. : SLUS920H
Closed by . : Michelle Ong Siew Be Reg.date .: 19/12/2017
Svc Cohsultant : Mileage ..: o
Remarks ...... : GAC (Singapore) Pte. Chassis No: YV1UZ10ACJ1020892
Op. No Description Mech Qty Price Discx Pkg Amount G
= / o=
802 TO REPLACE REAR BUMPER, 0 1200.00 0 1,@& S
LHR TAIL LAMP & ETC.
800  TO PUTTY & SPRAY PAINT ON 0 2200,00 © 2,200.00 5 /%03
REAR BUMPER, REAR LOWER
BUMPER, LHR FENDER & ETC.
BUMPER COVER REAR XC 1.0 EA 1398.60 1,398.60 s K
PROTECTING PLATE 1.0 EA 221.50 221.50 S XAy
BRACKET BUMPER LH 1.0 EA 40,90 40.90
BRACKET BUMPER RH 1.0 EA 40,90 40.90 S Xwd _ ., ¢
LAMP BODY LHR 1.0 EA  434.00 434,00 sokb—" =
CLIP 2.0 EA 4,80 9.60 S X
LKK Auto Consultants hence notify
the Repairer of the following:
* To resurvey before/afier spray peinting
= To display damaged partis) during resurvey
= Parts prices are subject i confirmation .
* Third party survey Is on a “Withou! Prejudice” basis 650‘1-'-1"0
* No illegal modficationis) |s aligwed
c&pﬁemmqnam[s;l t be ed
ey sater Mawmﬂu?m If;éuwer cﬂm Gross Total. 5,547.50
hm%mTc:ta'l B,400,00 ) [ S — 5,545,580
samr-ts Total £.145.50 GST @ 7.0% 388,19
askage Total 0.00 TotaY. oo 5,833.70
R dees . 0.00
Please Pay.. 5,833.70
GST: S=StdRated; O=0utOfScope: Z=ZeroRated 5
-—;«»ﬁm NS
1 b
s[1]18@ 2cop~
¥ilon L o
:;'::;‘m mﬁmﬂsﬁm T +65 6430 4700 www.wearnasauts.com 31‘/@ {{,LLQ‘_M_L - Dby

Coreg ne. 199501400R / G5T reg no. M28920628X
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WEARNES
gupplementary 1%
SERVICE ESTIMATE
0 - LoooD2 SL: LONPAC INSURANCE BHD
LOMPAC IMSURANCE BHD GST Reg.No:M28920628X
300 BEACH ROAD Inv.Mo. . : B&P 0 Page 1
#17-04/07 THE CONCOURSE Inv.date. : 14/03/2018
SINGAPORE 193555 WIP No. . : 46066
Veh. In/Out: 05/03/2018 09/03/2018
*Tel .No. . : 62507388
Reg.MNo. . : SLUSS2CH
Closed by .... : Michelle Ong Siew Be Reg.date .: 19/12/2017
Sve Consultant : ACC Mileage ..: 32,330
Remarks ...... : GAC (Singapore) Pte. Chassis No: YVIUZ10ACJ1020832
Op.No Descripticn Mech Qty Price Disc¥% Pkg Amount G
280 TO CHECK WIRING INCLUDE RESETT 0 450.00 O 450.00 S
OF ALL ELECTRICAL MODULES
REFLECTCR 1.0 EA 62.20 10 E5.98 &
REFLECTOR 1.0 EA 62.20 10 55,98 8
Gross Total. E61.96
Labour Total 450.00 ) | - P 561.86
Parts Total 111.96 ST @ 7.0% 39,34
Package Total 0.00 TOtE) visses 801 .30
Padd..csiva 0.00
Plaase Pay.. 801.30

GST: S=S5tdRated; 0O=0utOfScope; Z=ZeroRated

Wearnas Automaotive Pta. Ltd,
45 Leng Kee Road, Singapore 159103 T +65 G430 4700  www. Wearnesauto. com

Co reg no. 198501400R / G5T reg no. M2ZES2Z0B28X
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WEARMNES

SERVICE ESTIMATE

0 - LOooo2 SL: LONPAC INSURANCE BHD
LONPAC INSURANCE BHD

300 BEACH ROAD Inv.No.

Inv.date.
SINGAPORE 199555 WIF Mo.

Veh. In/Out:
*Tal,No.
Reg. No.
Reg.date .:
Svc Consultant : ACC Mileage ..:
Chassis Mo: YVIUZ10ACJ1020852

#17-04/07 THE CONCOURSE

Closed by .... : Michelle Ong Siew Be
Femarks ...... : GAC (Singapore) Pte,

Op.No Descripticon

Mech Qty

GST Reg.No:M28920628X%

: BapP 0 Page 1

14/03/2018

: 46066

05/03/2018 08/03/2018

. 62507388
: SLUSS20H

19/12/2017
32,330

Price Disc% Fkg Amount G

802 TO REPLACE REAR BUMPER,
LHR TAIL LAMP & ETC.

800 TO PUTTY & SPRAY PAINT ON
REAR BUMPER, REAR LOWER
BUMPER, LHR FENDER & ETC.

280 TO CHECK WIRING INCLUDE RESETT
OF ALL ELEGTRICAL MODULES —Supf

LAMP BODY

1,600.00 ﬁwf”f

REFLECTOR 4 Gupy

REFLECTOR

Labour Total
Parts Total
FPackage Total

GST: S=StdRated; 0=0utOfScope; Z=ZeroRated

Wearnes Automotive Pre. Lid.

3,450.00
502,56
0.00

45 Leng Kee Foad, Singapore 159103 T +65 6430 4700  www.wearnesaube.com

Ciooreg no. 199501400R £ GET rég no, MIEEI06ZEN

1600.00 ©
1400.00 0  1,400.00 s/
450.00 0 450.00 § ~AL(
434,00 10 390.60 § [+ 7
62.20 10 55.98 S
£2.20 10 55,98 §

Gross Total. 3,352.56

NEt. .o rsens 3,952.56

GST @ 7.0% 276.68

TOLER]G cnwiin s 4,229, 24

Paid........ 0.00

Flease Pay.. 4,229, 24



Poh Kin (LKKAuto)

From: Poh Kin (LKKAUtO)

Sent: Thursday, 27 September 2018 12:20 PM

To: 'Christine Yow'

Cc ‘Suhaimi Saidi’

SI.ijEl:t: RE: SLU9920H / SFY3228M (Lonpac) DOA 18.02.18
Importance: High

WITHOUT PREJUDICE

Qur Ref: cca/ LPC18003724/T1fb3

Your Ref: 5LU9920H/7013179

Dear Christine,

Thank you for signed DV, kindly also furnish a copy of rental agreement for payment process.

Best Regards,
Poh Kin, Chong (Mr) | Case Handler
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841-2132 | email: pohkin@lkkauto.com | fax: A741-4108
Blk 51, Pava Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5{408033)
B 74 P

ELERER WU saye the Earthe FPrint only when necessary

This e-mail contain confidential and privileged material, and are for the sole use of the intended recipient. Use or distribution by an
unintended recipient is prohibited, and may be a violation of law. If you believe that you received this e-mail in error, please do not read
this e-mail or any attached items. Please delete the e-mail and all attachments, including any copies thereof, and inform the sender that
you have deleted the e-mail, all attachments and any copies thereof. Thank you

From: Christine Yow [mailto:christine.yow@wearnes.com]
Sent: Wednesday, 19 September 2018 2:08 PM

To: Poh Kin (LKKAuto) <pohkin@lkkauto.com>

Cc: Suhaimi Saidi <suhaimisaidi8069@gmail.com>

Subject: RE: 5LUS920H / SFY3228M (Lonpac) DOA 18.02.18
Hi

Signed DV attached, original will mail out LKK.

Kindly let us have the payment soon. Thank you.

Best Regards,



Poh Kin (LKKAuto)

From: Poh Kin (LKKAuta)

Sent: Friday, 14 September 2018 4:54 PM

To: 'suhaimi Saidi’; 'Christine Yow'

Subject: RE: SLU9920H / SFY3228M (Lonpac) DOA 18.02.18
Attachments: DV SLU 9920H.pdf

Importance: High

WITHOUT PREJUDICE

Our Ref: CC4/LPC18003724/T1fb3

Your Ref: SLU9920H/7013179

Dear Sir/Madam,
ROAD TRAFFIC ACCIDENT INVOLVING SFY 3228M AND SLU 9920H ON 18.02.2018
We refer to the above matter and your letter of demand dated 5" April 2018.

We hereby confirmed settlement as follow:-

1, Cost of Repair (53,952.56 + 7%GST) 55 4,2259.24
2. Loss of Rental ($120.00 x 4 days)+7%GST SS_ 513.60
s$ 4,742.84

Please duly sign the DV enclosed and return with Rental Agreement for payment processing.

We need original copy DV.

Your prompt reply will be very much appreciated.

“Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole
intention of resolving the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability,
whatsoever, should be deemed / inferred from this negotiation of terms/settlement.

In the event of new evidence being discovered or su bsequently produced by either party that will materially
affect/influence on the issues of liability/damages, gither party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation
terms/settlement.”

Best Regards,
Poh Kin, Chong (Mr) | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841-2132 | email: pohkin@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108
Ik 51, Paya Uhi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)
.74 74

S Ba o

ZERER WET Saue the Farth Print only when necessary

1



Poh Kin (LKKAuto)

From: ONG LI LI <llong@lonpac.com>

Sent: Friday, 14 September 2018 10:11 AM

To: Poh Kin (LKKAuUto)

Cc MT_Claim_SG; Admin A

Subject: RE: SEEK MANDATE: ROAD TRAFFIC ACCIDENT INVOLVING VEHICLE NOS. SFY

3228M(01) AND SLU 9920H(TP) ON 18-02-2018: LKK ref : CC4/LPC18003724/T1fb3;
Lonpac ref: 17/18/18/VP05/020414

Dear Poh Kin
Please proceed.

Regards,

Ong Li Li

Senior Claims Executive | Lonpac Insurance Bhd

300 Beach Road #17-04/07 The Concourse Singapore 199555
Tel : (65) 6250 7388 Ext. 254 Fax: (65) 6296 2706

From: Poh Kin (LKKAuto) [mailto:pohkin@lkkauto.com]

Sent: Thursday, 13 September, 2018 11:43 AM

To: GERALD POH WEE BIN

Cc: MT_Claim_SG; Admin A

Subject: SEEK MANDATE; ROAD TRAFFIC ACCIDENT INVOLVING VEHICLE NOS. SFY 3228M(OI) AND SLU S920H(TP)
ON 18-02-2018; LKK ref : CC4/LPC18003724/T1fb3; Lonpac ref: 17/18/ 18/VP05/020414

Importance: High

Lonpac ref: 17/18/18/VP05/020414
LKK ref : CC4/LPC18003724/T1fb3

Dear Gerald,
ROAD TRAFFIC ACCIDENT INVOLVING VEHICLE NOS. SFY 3228M(0I) AND SLU 9920H(TP) ON 18-02-2018
We refer to the above matter.

We have highlighted to your good office on 21 February 2018 of Third-Party’s request to do Direct Settlement
with our Principal, Lonpac Insurance Bhd.

This collided to parked vehicle case. Ol collided to parked vehicle while reversing out. Liability 100% against
our insured.

Summary to offer to third party repairer, Wearnes Automotive Pte Ltd is as follows: -

Claimed Amount Revised Amount
1. Cost of Repair (w/GST){part by part) 5 6,962.98 (56,507.46 + 7%) S 4,229.24 ($3,952.56 +7%)
2. Loss of Rental (5120.00 x 4 days +7% GST) $ 513.60 S 513.60 (4 days x $120.00 + 7% GST)
Total | § 7,476.58 $ 4,742.84

1



Poh Kin (LKKAuto)

From: Poh Kin (LKKAuto)

Sent: Thursday, 13 September 2018 11:43 AM

To: 'geraldpoh@lonpac.com

Cc: 'mt_claim@lonpac.com’; Admin A

Subject: SEEK MANDATE; ROAD TRAFFIC ACCIDENT INVOLVING VEHICLE NOS. SFY 3228M{01)
AND SLU 9920H(TP) ON 18-02-2018; LKK ref : CC4/LPCT B003724,/T1fb3; Lonpac ref:
17/18/18//P0S/020474

Attachments: LKK ADJUSTMENT REPORT.pdf; LKK INSPECTION REPORT.pdf; LKK RESURVEY

PHOTO pdf; LKK RESURVEY PHOTO-AFTER REPAIR pdf: LKK SURVEY PHOTO.pdf; TP
LOD_SLU 9920M.pdf

Importance: High

Lonpac ref: 17/18/18/VP05/020414
LKK ref : CC4/f LPC18003724/T1fb3

Dear Gerald,
ROAD TRAFFIC ACCIDENT INVOLVING VEHICLE NOS. SFY 3228M(OI) AND SLU 9920H(TP) ON 18-02-2018
We refer to the above matter.

We have highlighted to your good office on 21 February 2018 of Third-Party’s request to do Direct Settlement
with our Principal, Lonpac Insurance Bhd.

This collided to parked vehicle case. Ol collided to parked vehicle while reversing out. Liability 100% against
our insured.

summary to offer to third party repairer, Wearnes Automotive Pte Ltd is as follows: -

Claimed Amount Revised Amount
1. Cost of Repair (w/GST)(part by part) $ 6,962.98 (56,507.46 + 7%) 5 4,229.24 (53,952.56 +7%)
2. Loss of Rental ($120.00 x 4 days +7% GST) $ 513.60 ¢ 513.60 (4 days x $120.00 + 7% GST)
Total | § 7,476.58 4,742

*%04 days recommendation for repair.
Relevant supporting claim documents are attached herewith for your perusal and reference.

The above is for your approval.
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WEARNES
Supplementary L
SERVICE ESTIMATE
0 - LoOooo2 SL: LONPAC INSURANCE BHD
LONPAC INSURANCE BHD G5T Reg.No:M28520628X%
300 BEACH ROAD Inv.MNo. . - B&P 0 Page 1
#17-04,/07 THE CONCOURSE Inv.date. : 14/03/2018
SINGAPORE 199555 WIP No. . : 46066
veh. In/Out: 05/03/2018 09/03/2018
*Tal.Mo. . : 62507388
Reg.No. . : SLU9920H
Closed by .... : Michelle Ong Siew Be Feg.date .: 13/12/2017
Svc Consultant : ACC Mileage ..: 32,330
Remarks ...... : GAC (Bingapore) Pte. Chassis Mo: YVIUZ10ACJ1020892
Op.No Description Mech Qty Price Disc% Pkg Amount G
280 TO CHECK WIRING INCLUDE RESETT 0 450.00 O 450.00 5
OF ALL ELECTRICAL MODULES
REFLECTOR 1.0 EA 62.20 10 £5.98 S
REFLECTOR 1.0 EA 62.20 10 55,98 S
Gross Total. 561.96
Labour Total 450.00 -y R 561.96
Parts Total 111,96 GsT @ 7.0% 39.34
Package Total 0.00 Total oo cowvs 601.30
=17, £ [ 0.00
Please Pay.. 601.30

GST: S=StdRated; O=OutOfScope; Z=ZeroRated

Waarnas Automothve Pte. Lid,
45 Leng Kee Road, Singapors 159103 T +65 6430 4700  www. weamessulo.com

Co reg no, 1995014008 / G5T reg no. MZBI20628X
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PAYMENT BREAKDOWN
Insured Vehicle No. SLU9920H Model: XC6B0
TP Vehicle No. SFY3228M  |-VonpiL-
Date of Accident 18th Feb 2018
Global Sum Settlement YES i NO
Liability 100% (Agreed / Assessed)
Repair Estimate $5,933.70
Final Repair Cost $4,229.24 7
Loss of Use days at per day
Rental (If Any) $513.60 © | 4daysat| 128.40 (Inclusive of GST) per day
Others
Final Settlement Sum $4 742 84

Remarks

Payment Instruction: Payee's Breakdown

1) Wearnes Automotive Pte Ltd

$4,742 84

2)

3)

4)




LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

AP ) =0 = 51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408933
e T TEL 6256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315

Reg. Mo 100607188R GST Reg. Mo, 18-8607198-R

Affiliated to Federation Internationale Des Experts En Automobile

LONPAC INSURANCE BHD Ref : CC4/LPC18003724/T1fb3n2
0y THE CONCOURSESINGAPORE 1gpsss Defe: 09102018 NWM“IW\“"““
Code: LPC2
1. Policy Particulars :- THIRD PARTY CLAIM
Insured Veh. SFY 3228M Veh. Inspected 5LU 8820H
Policy No. Coverage ($) 0.00
Claim No. 17/1818NPOSI020414 Excess ($) 0.00
Assign From  GERALD Assign Date 27/02/2018
2. Vehicle Particulars & Condition
Make & Model VOLVO XCE0 c.c 1969
Engine No. HIDDEN Year of Reg. 2017
Chassis No. YW1UZ10AC) 1020892 Colour SILVER
Odometer 3239 Steering IN ORDER
Brakes IN ORDER Modification SPORTS RIM
General GOooD
3. Conditions of Tyres
Size Make Balance
R/H Front Tyre |235/80 R18 CONTINENTAL & mm
L/H Front Tyre |235/60 R18 CONTINENTAL & mm
R/H Rear Tyre |[235/60 R18 CONTINENTAL & mm
L/H Rear Tyre 235/60 R18 CONTINENTAL 6 mm
4. Description of Damages
THE VEHICLE SUSTAINED DAMAGES AT THE REAR N/S PORTION,
DAMAGES SEE DETAILS.
5. General Information
Accident Date  18/02/2018 Inspection Date 05/03/2018
Survey held at WEARNES AUTOMOTIVE PTE LTD
45 LENG KEE ROAD
SINGAPORE 159103,
5a. Remarks
AYTHE INSPECTION WAS CONDUCTED ON A"WITHOUT PREJUDICE" BASIS.
B)IN ACCORDANCE TO YOUR INSTRUCTIONS, WE HAVE NOT AUTHORISED REPAIRS.
5b. Estimate Days of Repair

4 Working Days

|ESTLMATED NORMAL PERIOD FOR REPAIR:
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LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

."'_‘ o ; "" ; 51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408933
TEL: 8256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315
Reg. Mo 198607188R GST Reg. No. 15-9607 198-R Page Mo.:1 of 1
ADJUSTMENT ON REPAIR COST FOR VEHICLE NO. SLU 9920H
Qty Description of Parts Condition WE::LT:;.?;H Our ‘“‘;JJ““““
REPLACEMENT OF PARTS
1|BUMPER COVER REAR XC (SN) TO REPAIR SEE 1,358.60 -
LABOUR
1|PROTECTING PLATE (SN) NOT NECESSARY 221.50 -
1|BRACKET BUMPER LH (SN) MOT NECESSARY 40.90
1|BRACKET BUMPER RH (SN) NOT NECESSARY 40.90
1|{LAMP BODY LHR (SN) cuT 434.00 390.60
2|CLIP [SN) NOT MECESSARY 9.60 =
1|REFLECTOR (ADDITIONAL}SM) MECESSARY 55.98 55,08
1|REFLECTOR (ADDITIONALYSN) NECESSARY 55.88 55.98
2,257 46 502.56
LABOUR
TO REPLACE REAR BUMPER LHR TAIL LAMP & 1,600.00 1,600.00
ETC.INCLUSIVE OF THE REPAIR OF BUMPER COVER
REAR XC.
TO PUTTY & SPRAY PAINT ON REAR BUMPER REAR 2,200.00 1,400.00
LOWER BUMPER,LHR FENDER & ETC.
TO CHECK WIRING INCLUDE RESETT OF ALL 450,00 45000
ELECTRICAL MODULES (ADDITICOMALY).
4,250.00 3,450.00
GRAND TOTAL 6,507 .46 3,952.56
[ RECOMMENDED COST OF REPAIRS | 3,952.56]
Report Ref No. CC4/LPC18003724/T1fb3n2
f i1
w [ :J
MOHAMAD TAUFIKH HO LEONG CHUAN

M.MATAI, AMSAE-A

Automotive Assessor

Automotive Assessor




