ﬂian Lau_ (LKKALH

f

From: ONG LU U <llong@lonpac.com=>

Sent: Thursday, 7 June, 2018 11:28 AM

To: Vivian Lau (LKKAuto)

Cc: MT_Claim_SG

Subject: RE: Our Ref: 17/18/18/VP05/020422 Accident involving motor vehicle nos.

SDU 8333 D & SKF 3214 T // Propose for Direct Settlement ***LKK
REF:CC4/LPC18003720/wb3 ( part 2)

Dear Vivian
Please proceed.

Regards,

Ong Li Li

Senior Claims Executive | Lonpac Insurance Bhd

300 Beach Road #17-04/07 The Concourse Singapore 199555
Tel : (65) 6250 7388 Ext. 254 Fax: (65) 6296 2706

From: Vivian Lau (LKKAuto) [mailto:vivianlau@Ilkkauto.com]

Sent: Wednesday, 6 June, 2018 9:42 AM

To: ONG LI LI

Cc: MT_Claim_5G

Subject: RE: Our Ref: 17/18/18/VP05/020422 Accident involving motor vehicle nos. SDU 8333 D & SKF 3214 T /
Propose for Direct Settlement ***LKK REF:CC4/LPC18003720/wb3 ( part 2)

Lonpac Ref: 17/18/18/VP05/020422
LKK Ref: CC4/LPC18003720/wb3

Hi Lili,
We refer to the above matter.

We have highlighted to your good office on 26/03/2018 of Third-Party’s request to do Direct Settlement with our
Principal, Lonpac Insurance Bhd.

This is a head-to-rear collision., BOLA 27 Liability is 100%

Summary to offer to third party repairer, Cycle & Carriage Industries Pte Ltd is as follows: -

Claimed Revised Amount
Amount
1. Cost of Repair (w/GST} $6,038.40 $4.730.02
2. Loss of USE ($ 120.00 x 7days) $ 545.70 $ 545.70(3days x $170.00 +GST)
3. LTA/GIA search fee § 2.00 $2.00
Total | $6,586.10 $5.277.72

*#(3 days recommendation for repair
Relevant supporting claim documents are attached herewith for your perusal and reference.

The above is for vour a val.



Thank you

Best Regards,

Vivian Lau| Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841-8625 | email: Vivianlan@lkkauto.com| fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

From: Vivian Lau (LKKAuto)

Sent: Wednesday, 6 June, 2018 9:40 AM

To: 'ONG LI LI' <llong@lonpac.com>

Cc: 'MT_Claim_SG' <mt_claim@lonpac.com>; Thin Thin (LKKAuto) <thinthin@Ilkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: Our Ref: 17/18/18/VP05/020422 Accident involving motor vehicle nos. SDU 8333 D & SKF 3214 T//
Propose for Direct Settlement ***LKK REF:CC4/LPC18003720/wb3 ( part 1}

Lonpac Ref: 17/18/18/VP05/020422
LKK Ref: CC4/LPC18003720/wb3

Hi Lili,
We refer to the above matter.

We have highlighted to your good office on 26/03/2018 of Third-Party’s request to do Direct Settlement with our
Principal, Lonpac Insurance Bhd.

This is a head-to-rear collision.. BOLA 27 Liability 1s 100%

Summary to offer to third party repairer, Cycle & Carriage Industries Pte Ltd is as follows: -

Claimed Revised Amount
Amount
|. Cost of Repair (w/GST) $6.038.40 $4.730.02
2. Loss of USE ($ 120.00 x 7days) $ 545.70 $ 545.70(3days x $170.00 +GST)
3. LTA/GIA search fee $ 2.00 £2.00
Total | $6,586.10 $5.277.72

*#()3 days recommendation for repair

Relevant supporting claim documents are attached herewith for your perusal and reference.

The above is for your approval.



Thank you
Best Regards,

Vivian Lau| Case Handler
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841-8625 | email: Vivianlau@lkkauto.com| fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408033)

————— Original Message-----

From: Shu Pei (LKKAuto)

Sent: Monday, 26 March, 2018 7:57 PM

To: ONG LI LI <llong@lonpac.com=

Ce: MT Claim_SG <mt_claim@lonpac.com>; Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com=>; Vivian Lau (LKKAuto)
<vivianlau@lkkauto.com>; Joy Irene (LKKAuto) <Joylrenef@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: Our Ref: 17/18/18/VP05/020422 Accident involving motor vehicle nos. SDU 8333 D & SKF 3214 T //
Propose for Direct Settlement ***LKK REF:CC4/LPCI 8003720/wh3

WITHOUT PREIJUDICE

Dear Sir / Madam,

We refer to the above matter.

We had inspected TP vehicle SDU 8333D at M/s Cycle & Carriage Industries Pte Ltd.

Enclosed for your perusal is:
- TP estimated cost of repair
- Preliminary advice

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Shu Pei| Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6366-0055 | email: shupei@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108 Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1,
#02-25 | S(408933)

--—-0Original Message-----

From:; ONG LI LI [mailto:llong@lonpac.com]

Sent: Tuesday, 27 February 2018 2:44 PM

To: Shu Pei (LKKAuto) <shupei@lkkauto.com=>

Ce: MT_Claim_SG <mt_claim@lonpac.com>; Admin A <admin-a@Ikkauto.com>; Vivian Lau (LKKAuto)
<vivianlau@lkkauto.com>; Joy Irene (LKKAuto) <Joylrene(@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: Our Ref: 17/18/18/VP05/020422 Accident involving motor vehicle nos. SDU 8333 D & SKF 3214 T //
Propose for Direct Settlement ***LKK REF:CC4/LPCI 8003720/ wh3

Hi Shu Pei

Please see our Insured's GIA report attached.
Regards,

Ong LiLi

Senior Claims Executive | Lonpac Insurance Bhd

100 Beach Road #17-04/07 The Concourse Singapore 199555 Tel : (65) 6250 7388 Ext. 254 Fax: (65) 6296 2706

3



--==-Original Message----—-

From: Shu Pei (LKK Auto) [mailto:shupei@lkkauto.com]

Sent: Tuesday, 27 February, 2018 1:57 PM

To: ERIC WOO JUN KIAT; GERALD POH WEE BIN: ONG LI LI

Ce: MT_Claim_SG: Admin A; Vivian Lau (LKKAuto); Joy Irene (LKK Auto)

Subject: RE: Our Ref: 17/18/18/VP05/020422 Accident involving motor vehicle nos. SDU 8333 D & SKF 3214 T//
Propose for Direct Settlement ***LKK REF:CC4/LPCI &003720/wb3

WITHOUT PREJUDICE

Dear Sir / Madam,

We refer to the above matter.

This is a TP direct settlement case.

Kindly let us have a copy of your insured's GIA report for our necessary action.

Kindly take note that the case handler in-charge is Vivian and she can be contacted at DID: 6841 8625,
Thank you.

Best Regards,

Shu Pei| Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6366-0055 | email: shupei@Ilkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108 Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1,
#02-25 | S(408933)

From: Admin-D (LKKAuto)

Sent: Monday, 26 February 2018 4:11 PM

To: "ERIC WOO JUN KIAT' <ericwoo@lonpac.com=>; Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>; assignments
<assignments@lkkauto.com=

Ce: 'MT Claim_SG' <mt_claim@lonpac.com=

Subject: RE: Our Ref: 17/18/18/VP05/020422 Accident involving motor vehicle nos. SDU 8333 D & SKF 3214 A iff
Propose for Direct Seftlement

Dear Eric,

Thank you for the assignment.

Please be informed that vehicle currently not in the workshop, repairer will arrange.

Best Regards,

Catherine Chong | Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Lid

Phone: 6741-8434 | email: assignments@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315 Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue
1, #02-25 | S(408933)

————— Original Message-----

From: ERIC WOO JUN KIAT [mailto:ericwoo(@lonpac.com|

Sent: Friday, 23 February, 2018 2:20 PM

To: Yik Chan Hoe <chanhoe yik@cyclecarriage.com.sg=; assignments(@lkkauto.com

Ce: MT Claim_SG <mt_claim(@lonpac.com=

Subject: RE: Our Ref: 17/18/18/VP05/020422 Accident involving motor vehicle nos. SDU 8333 D & SKF 3214 T i
Propose for Direct Settlement



Dear Chan Hoe,

We will be appoint LKK Auto Consultants Pte Lid to survey SDU 8333D.
Dear Catherine/™avitha,

FYA.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Eric Woo

Claims Executive | Lonpac Insurance Bhd

300 Beach Road, #17-04/07 The Concourse, Singapore 199555
Tel: (65) 6279 9253 | Fax: (65) 6296 3767

-----Original Message-----

From: Yik Chan Hoe [mailto:chanhoe.yik@cyclecarriage.com.sg]

Sent: Thursday, 22 February, 2018 6:26 PM

To: MT_Claim_5G

Subject: Accident involving motor vehicle nos. SDU 8333 D & SKF 3214 T // Propose for Direct Settlement

To: Lonpac Ins
Atin; Motor Claims Dept

RE: Accident involving motor vehicle nos. SDU 8333 D & SKF 3214 T along Jurong Town Hall road junction,
Accident date: 22/02/2018

Dear Officer In-Charge,

This email is with regards to the above accident which has been reported by our customer. We have since been
instructed by him/her (motor vehicle number SDU 8333 D), to submit a claim on his/her behalf as we are the
authorised repair workshop for his/her car.

We note that you are the insurer (3rd party) of the (motor vehicle number SKF 3214 T) involved. As such we are
proposing for a Direct Settlement with regards to the repair costs and other conseguential losses.

We appreciate your assistance in this matter and look forward to your agreement on this direct settlement.

I can be reached at chanhoe.yiki@cyclecarriage.com.sg

Thanks & Regards,

¥ik Chan Hoe

Mercedes-Benz Body Care & Repair Center

Cycle & Carriage Industries Pte Ltd

Pandan Loop Service Center

Mobile: 9186 5109 | DID: 6771 4353 | Fax: 6872 1272
Website: www.mercedes-benz.com.sg

DISCLAIMER:- This email and any attachment to it is confidential and intended only for the use of the individual or
entity named above and may contain information that is privileged. If you are not the intended recipient, you are
notified that any dissemination, distribution or copying of this email or any attachment is strictly prohibited. If you
have received this email in error, please notify us immediately by return email and destroy the original message. Any



views expressed are those of the individual sender, and not necessarily the views of Cycle Carriage Industries Pte Ltd

and/or any of its related corporations.



Our ref?

Your ref:
Direct Settlement
Date: - APR 2018
| = AL
To: :'»C;“D@C ,1” )
f
Singapore
Atin: Motor Claims Department

Re:  Accident Imitvrnzxs{? <ar E}eiszr?u "J &Ifﬁiﬁgﬁ:’# T

At/Along

I am the owner of yehic m;%; ﬂ':) tha?%s mvulved in an accident with your
insured vehicle no. a4 ef t.he abme accident.
l

As the accident was caused by vour insured negligent/inconsiderate driving, thus I am claiming
from you for the following: -

1. Cost of Repairs ; O % 4;55 'E;-c)“
2. Loss of Use / Rental é days @ $ fr(?f Eéper day) $ %5 2y <
3. LTA/GIA Search Fee b L)
4. GIA Report Fee 5 o
5. Others $ -

Total: S .*__‘5 } "II‘-;J{ "F?QL

I hereby give vou fourteen (14) days to comply with the above, failing which, I shall instruct my
solicitor to commence legal action against you. If you have any queries, please contact the
representative of CYCLE & CARRIAGE INDUSTRIES PTE LTD at Telephone No:
67714353 (Mr Yik Chan Hoe) / 67714304 (Ms Amanda Ang).

I hereby give full authority to CYCLE & CARRIAGE INDUSTRIES PTE LTD and their
representative to negotiate/comprise settlement of the above claim on my behalf.

Your co-operation and immediate attention to the above is greatly appreciated. I hereby look
forward to hearing from you soon.

Yours faithfully

,rff || L—_-E:_l

\M_ B oAl __,f

[

Name & Signature
Address: C/o. 188 Pandan Loop Singapore 128378
Ce: Mr Yik Chan Hoe/ Ms Amanda Ang
E-mail: chanhoe.yiki@cyclecarriage.com.sg / amanda.angacyelecarriage.com.sg
Fax No. 67795383

Updated..22/01/15



LETTER OF AUTHORIZATION

To:  npac \NSuvance Ad

Singapore

Attn.: Motor Claims Department

Dear 5ir/ Mdm,

MOTOR ACCIDENT INVOLVING 6)‘/(855\5_'7 (OWNER'S

VEHICLE NO.) AND %M@m PARTY'S VEHICLE NO.)
ON Qc:} o) ! {DATE} Qﬁg%g . (TIME)

AT/ALONG T&{(& ! (‘) #2794 (ROAD)

[ am the registered owner of é ,jé@é:zé:?z 5 E (Vehicle No.).

I hereby authorise CYCLE & CARRIAGE INDUSTRIES PTE LIMITED and
its agents or any person(s) authorised by Cycle & Carriage Industries Ple
Limited to do all or any of the following:-

s Submit, resolve and make any claims which I may have against the 3
party insurers; and/or

¢ Execute and sign discharge voucher, indemnity forms and all necessary
documents in connection with and arising from the above claim.

All payment towards settlement of my claim should be made in favour of
CYCLE & CARRIAGE INDUSTRIES PTE LIMITED.

Registered Owner’s Signature

(Company stamp & authorized signature if it is a company-registered vehicle)
Name cTeo Tl Hin

NRIC No. : CTLIRCRE

Date :




N

CLAIM NO : 17/18/18/VP05/020422 h

DATE : 07 June 2018

DISCHARGE VOUCHER

I/'We, TEO TAT HIN confirmed acceptance from M/s LONPAC INSURANCE BHD
and/or owner of SKF 3214T the sum of Singapore Dollar Five Thousand Two
Hundred Seventy Seven and cents Seventy Two Only ($ 5,277.72) in full and final
satisfaction, liquidation and discharge of all property losses competent to me/us upon
the said M/s LONPAC INSURANCE BHD in respect of all property losses
sustained by mefus whether now or hereafter o become manifest, arising either
directly or indirectly from an accident involving SDU 8333D on 22/02/2018 along
Jurong Town Hall Rd Juction d

[ /We hereby agree 1o indemnify and keep indemnify (LONPAC INSURANCE
BHD/YANG LEE MING AND/OR TOH SOH LING SANDY) against all claims
and any claims whatsoever made by any person/persons on our behalf in respect of
the said accident.

I/We further authorize you to pay the above settlement sum directly to Cycle &
Carriage Industries Pte Lid

I/We hereby acknowledged that this payment is made on a without admission of

liability basis and without prejudice to all related claims and in respect of our
insured’s recovery action.

F o ™ - o )

Name of vehicle owner /Date

.'r I‘:‘E[:El'lu.lt' !'.I

LONPAC INSURANCE BHD *'

1A
I

sonz



Mercedes-Benz

Cycle & Carriage

Industries Pte Limited
Autharised Dealer
Compary Mo, | §64003067W

TAX lNVUICE GST Reg No. MR-S50D111-X
Invoice Name & Address Owner Mame & Vehicle Info
Cust Mo/Mame WCV33980/Mr Teo Tai Hin (Zhang Taixing)
LONPAC IMSURANCE BHD
Reg No/Reg Date SDUB3330 / 05/02/2018
MOTOR CLAIM DEPARTMENT Date In/Milzage 21/03/2018/ 2918
300 BEACH ROAD .
§17-08,/07 THE CONCOURSE Chassis Mo WDD2130452A376366
SINGAPORE 199555 Engine Mo 27492031303180
Make/Model MB/MB E 250 2.0 SEDAN (W213) "AVANTGARDE

Contact Mo 62507388

]M|m|||||||,||||,|W|lwm||||N|||MNIIWHM Colour/Trim 028 B90 Cavansit B1/ 042 214 Leather - J
CSE

Account Mo Terms Date/Time Printed Operater WIF Mo Invoice/Credit Mota Mo
WLOO1605 Credit 05/04/2018/ 17:41 YK 395 / Yik Chan Hoe 21488 28141117
Description of Goods / Services Qy Unit Price 5% Amount 55
M BFNSUN F.0.C.
POLICY NO/ACC DATE : 180008582 [ o22/02/2018
DRIVE IN/ERCESS ; 22/02/2018 // TP VEH NO SKF3214T LONPAC
DATE IN/DATE SURVEY: 21/03/2018 @ 1220 J/ TAIFIKH LKK
BY /AUTHRIZED ON : DIRECT SETTLEMENT // VIVIAN LKK
A BPILAB 960.00
PANEL BEATING TO REPAIR AFFECTED AREAS, REMOVE AND REPLACE WITH NEW
BODY PAMELS WITH REFINISH.
A BPIRES 600.00
RESPRAY REAR BUMPER
A BPILAB 0.10 3B0.00
USING XENTRY SYSTEM TO CHECK CONTROL UNLTS, RESET MEMORY TO
STAMDARD SETTIMNGS.
i REAR BUMPER LOWER CHROME MOULDING 1.00 i01.99 301.99
¥ FREAR BUMPER LOWER 1.04 260.25 260.25
% REAR BUMPER 1.00 1918.34 1918.34
Parts 2,4B0.58 Nett 4,420.58
Labour 1,940.00 7% GST on 4420.58 309.44
Standard Menu 0.00
Specialist Jaob 0.00 Total Payable 4,730.02
Diagnostics Job (.00 Paid 0.00
Sundry/Others 0.00 Total Due 4,730.02
Total{w/o G5T) 4,420.58

Payment shewld be made strictly by cash, NETS er credit cards. Thank you.
Arry dispuie Lo the invoice must oe made within 3 gays. This is & computer genarated documant, no gignabure is reguired

| Pandan Laop Servce Centar
@@ | WEDRIVE FIRST CLASS 188 Pandan Loop
CYELE & CARRIABE | Singapore 126378
Tek G777 BI84

Fax: 4779 5383
www, mercedes-benz.com.sg

.: LY Mercedes-Banz - are registersd trademarka of Daimiler, Stuttgart, Germany Page 1ol



ggﬁgﬁﬂiiﬂNS ENTERPRISE Chqn‘s

Singapors 758379
Tel 67532536 Fax:67567565 www.chans.com.sg

GST Reg No: 51-936300-M

TAX INVOICE
TEO TAI HIN INVOICE : AR1803-0444
DATE : 20/03/2018
TERMS : cC.0D
STAFF ID : ELAINE
AGREEMENT NO. : HA201803-0220
ATTN : ACCOUNTS PAYABLE
[ DESCRIPTION | AMOUNT (SGD) |
‘ehicle Reg No : SJWBOSR 510.00
Make / Model . TOYOTA CAMRY 2.0 AUTO
Rental Dates . Rental Billing From 20/03/2018 To 23/03/2018
Periad 3 days
Rental Rate . 5% 181.90 Per Day {Including GST)
Reference No . 5DVB333D
AMOUNT : S$ NON-TAXABLE VALUE : 0.00
EIVE HUNDRED FORTY-FIVE DOLLARS AND CENT TAXABLE VALUE : 510.00
SEVENTY ONLY GST 7% : 35.70
i TOTAL S§ - 545.70]

Please make your cheques payable to CHAN'S & SONS ENTERPRISE

For Official USe Only

Payment Date : F ! Amt

AL Y CS / CC /CH
= CS/CC/CH

Member ol g, Tl T = ) ¥
.,HAE: nﬂt:s @ : A H. | A 5 353 Sembawang Road Goodlink Park Singapore 753372 T 67332536 F 67547555 F sales@charnis, com.sg



RENTAL AGREEMENT

Hirer's " iTe 'J"q‘t # ril !‘-J

| Date of Birth

Address | Decupation " Driving Licence No | Date of Expiry
& 3' ,J AVILY O illlih
..... e et e e s
| 6xEGET QR m:;?,‘s
Joinl Hirer's / Guaramor's Name - hﬁﬁﬁﬁﬁ? T “Passport’ Nnc No. : T Nationatity
ok Uan ! [?L S Freme34C
Mﬂ'-fﬂss " Driving Licence No " Date of Expiry
[ PostalCode | ConfactNe | Mobil Js Bhone N, |
i 1 |
CHECK OUT 2 ™) 7 Wisags , e =
b i e T r e | E 17 172 a4 F
CHECK IN s o CE R, ioage i
23.3-18 4-40pm ™| e

IMPORTANT NQTES UNIT RATE($) | TOTAL [$:|
» Caris restricted to SINGAPORE use. See clause 1(f) lor non-comgliance. Pl T Y T i = |
» Mo refund will be given lor vehicls that returng earty. __HATE ) i -?:ﬂ_' . @ 130 + 9‘51* ﬂ 0D
= Own Damage Liabiity - First $1500 for gamage to vehxle plus loss of |

garmings whike damaged vehicle is under repair. i EHSCDUNT = ]
- Third Party Liakiity — First $2000 for any Third Party Accident Claim. GST @ ?% MO
» Agditional Excess ol $3000 for drivers under 21'.'rs oid or above TO0yrs i e 2y 1

ardion less than 2yrs driving expariance. TOTAL ,5] E 5 .
» Hirer is responsibie for &l parking lipes & traffic summons. frr—p= = R e aﬁ
« Extension- One day's advance notice is requited otherwise no exlension | EXTENSION

will be allowed t Za -
v Yehicle should be returned &t the same time as colection excepl cn

Salurday whare ralum time is belora 10am 1 i —f— =
s+ Yohicle rewrned atter office hour will be charged 1o 1he next working day.
» Hourly extansion is charged at 1/5 of the daily rate, N Y =
= Az preventive maintanance, piease check water & engine oil daity, [ A= ) | 1] |
« Pleasa check that you kave not-left any of your personal belengsngs . the [5 F) b 15'3 -5'3 O il

vehicle. Our compary &nd stali will no! be responsible ler any loss of

balpngings after the vahicls is retumed.
« For the comior ol ofver users, please relrain from smoking, eating of . A T i | e

carryirg of pets in the car. A cleaning charge of $200 wiil be imposad for = . ) )

smoky, smelly or dirty vehicle, DE POSIT [reluMabIa: $$ N{Lﬁ
« Carying of PASSENGERS in commercial veficle s striclly peohdited. [ o =

Only WORKERS covered under hirer's workmen compensafion are CHANGED OVER FROM VEH. DATE

allgpwed.

K . — e e S UY S R e ———— CIRETS T

I'We have read and agres fo the lerms and condiions of the rental agreement above and as sel ww.taaf/ y l 4 )
1'We deciare that all infarmalion given on this form 8 irue and accurale. 1 I,\ -

I

CHAN'S & SONS ENTERPRISE

363 Sembawang Road, Goodlink Park,
Singapore 758378,

Tel: 6753 2536 Fax: 6756 7565

Breakdown Recovary; 9742 9446

201803 - 0220
T i SR

Ro0s- (S| CAMEPTEF

Hirer's S-ignature
VEHICLENO. 8% ¢ e

FROM

Jaint Hirer's! Guarantnr 5 Elgnalura

for CHAN'S & SONS ENTERPRISE

MDDEL

*Egtimate Dafe. For schual ralorn gop CHECH Y

HETUHN

OPERATING HOURS: MONDAY TO FRIDAY B.30AM TO 5.30PM SATURDAY 8.30AM TO 12.30PM CLOSED DN SUNDAY & PUBLIC HOLIDAY



Invoice Page 1 of 2

e *,;; GENERAL INSURANCE ASSOCIATION OF SINGAPORE
A RA' RECORDS MANAGEMENT CENTRE
!1;:%% ENE & Raffles Quay #18-00, Singapore 048580
oW INSURANCE rhone: +65 6224 0010 Fax: +65 5224 0030

%0 ASSOCIATION Operating Hours: Monday to Friday 9am to 5pm
RECORDS MANAGEMENT CENTRE GST Registration No: M400017735

Third Party Insurer Enquiry

Dur Ref Nao: GR-18-027799
Date of Reguest: 22i02/2018 Your Ref No: Online Purchase

Cycle & Carriage Industries Pte Lid
188 Pandan Loop
Singapore 128378

Dear SirMadam,

Enguiry Date 22102/2018

Enquiry By Lim Xin Yi

TP Vehicle No. SKF3214T

Accident Date 22/02/2018

Enquiry Result

TP Vehicle No. Insurer Period of Insurance Insurer Tel. No. ]
| SKF3214T Lonpac Insurance Bhd 13/11/2017-12/11/2018 +65 62507388 ]
Thank You

The images provided to you are taken from the ariginal reports forwarded to the centre by the members of the General Insurance
Association of Singapare and we take no responsibility for their accuracy or contents and shall be under no liability whatsoever for any
loss or damage arising out of or in connection with the reparts or their images.

This is a computer generated document and requires no signature.

https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfin?fusebox=MTRsas& fuseaction=dsp_g... 22/2/2018



Invoice

.| GENERAL

‘gggglusunnncs

ASSOCIATION

RECORDS MANAGEMENT CENTRE

Cur Ref No: GR-18-0277959
Date of Request: 2202/2018

Cycle & Carriage Industries Pte Lid
188 Pandan Loop
Singapore 128378

Page 2 of 2

GENERAL INSURANCE ASSOCIATION OF SINGAPORE

RECORDS MANAGEMENT CENTRE
& Raffles Quay #18-00, Singapore 048580
Phone: +65 6224 0010 Fax: +65 6224 0030
Operating Hours: Monday to Friday Sam to 5pm
GST Registration No: M400017735

TAX INVOICE

Your Ref Mo Online Purchase

Dear SirfMadam,

Enguiry Date 22/02/2018

Enqguiry By Lim Xin i

TP VWehicle No SKF3214T

Accident Date 22/02/2018

DESCRIPTION F*.MDL.INT (5%)

| TP Insurer Enquiry 1.87
GST Amount 0.13
| Total Amount Due (GST Inclusive) 2.00

Thank You

This is a computer generated document and requires no signature.

For GIARMC Official use:
Date:
[¥] GIRO [] Cash [] Cheque

hltps:Hsingapme_mcrimen.cum.-"cIainw‘i11(]433{.cfm‘?f’u5ebox=MTRsas&t’useaciiun=dsp g.. 22/2/2018



