Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

Sent: Saturday, 15 September 2018 12:11 PM

To: '‘Ng, Hai-Chuan'

Subject: RE: AIG REF: 9874511179SG *LKK REF: CC3/LCR18003706/Kpb3
Hi Mr Ng,

We refer to the above matter.

Third party reported that he was driving along the 2nd lane of Hill Street towards Victoria Street. Our insured
vehicle was on the 3@ lane. Both vehicles stopped at the traffic junction. When the traffic light turned
green, both vehicles moved off. Our insured who was on the 3@ lane did not keep to her lane and
encroached into third party lane. Third party driver immediately started to horn but our driver did not realise
and grazed across third party taxi and continued to move. Third party driver then high beam and horned at
our driver. Then our driver came to stop.

Our insured driver reported that she was driving on the 3@ lane of Hill Street towards Victoria Street. As the
fraffic light furned red, she stopped at the junction. After the traffic light turned green and she proceeded
to drive. Third party driver who was driving behind her on 2nd lane suddenly high beam her. She proceeded
fo stop at the road side and third party driver told her that her car and hit onto third party taxi. Our insured
driver refused to private settle as she was not at fault.

Both parties has no video footage/ concrete evidences to support either version.

In view of conflicting version, we propose to settle the matter at 50/50. The summary of claim is as follows: -

Claimed Amount: | Adjusted Amount:

1. Cost of Repair (w/GST) $ 3.424.00 $ 3.424.00
2. Loss of Rental (4days x $101.46) $ 405.84 $ 304.38 (3days x $101.46)

3. Loss of Income (4days x $50.00) $ 200.00 $ 150.00 (3days x $50.00)

$4,029.84 $3,878.38

@50% | $1,939.19

4. LTA/ GlA search fee $ 7.49 $ 7.49

Total | $ 4,037.33 $1,946.68

Kindly let us have your instruction/comments.

Best Regards,

Hsiao Tong, Chew | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6742-3197 | email: chewht@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Ng, Hai-Chuan <Hai-Chuan.Ng@aig.com>
Sent: Friday, 2 March 2018 5:37 PM



To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@Ikkauto.com>; Vivian Lau (LKKAuto) <vivianlau@lkkauto.com>
Subject: AIG REF: 9874511179SG

Dear all,

We refer to the above.

Please advise liability before settlement.
Thank you.

Regards,

Ng Hai Chuan

AIG

Senior Complex Claims Examiner

Claims | AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte. Ltd.
78 Shenton Way AIG Building #08-16 Singapore 079120
Tel +(65)6419 1994| Fax +68357416

Hai-Chuan.Ng@aig.com | www.aig.com.sg

IMPORTANT NOTICE:

The information in this email (and any attachments) is confidential. If you are not the intended
recipient, you must not use or disseminate the information. If you have received this email in error,
please immediately notify me by "Reply" command and permanently delete the original and any copies
or printouts thereof. Although this email and any attachments are believed to be free of any virus or
other defect that might affect any computer system into which it is received and opened, it is the
responsibility of the recipient to ensure that it is virus free and no responsibility is accepted by AIG for
any loss or damage arising in any way from its use.
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