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' V ” LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

adE Ba m 51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408933

TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315
Reg. No: 199607198R GST Reg. Na. 19-9607198-R

= Afiillated to Federation Internationale Des Experts En Automobite

ERGO INSURANCE PTE LTD Ref . CS5/EGI18003645/Ugb

LRI
#04-01 SUNTEC TOWER FIVE Date: 26-02-2018
SINGAPORE 038985
Code: EGI
1. ... . PolicyParticulars :- THIRD PARTY CLAIM -
Insured Veh.  SKA6803A Veh. Inspected FBL 63925
Policy No. Coverage ($) 0.00
Claim No. DSMPCP1800323/SL/s Excess ($) 0.00
Assign From  SITIATHKAH Assign Date 26/02/2018
2. Vehicle Particulars & Condition
Make & Model c.c 0
Engine No. HIDDEN Year of Reg.
Chassis No. Colour
Odometer - Steering
Brakes Modification
General
3 e _ onditions of Tyres ... ‘_
Size Make Balance
R/H Front Tyre mm
L/H Front Tyre mm
R/H Rear Tyre mm
L/H Rear Tyre mm
4, e ' Description of Damages '
5. L General Information
Accident Date  12/02/2018 Inspection Date 26/02/2018
Survey held at BAN HOCKHIN CO.PTE LTD
NO 6 DEFU LANE 4
SINGAPORE 539410
A)THE INSP=é61;ION WAS EZONDUCTEE.)M(I)N A"WITHCLJ'i; PREJUDICE" BASISZ
B)IN ACCORDANCE TO YOUR INSTRUCTIONS, WE HAVE NOT AUTHORISED REPAIRS.




"~ Nivitha (LKK Auto)

From: Siti A Thikah AB Rahman <sitirahman@ergo.com.sg>

Sent: Monday, 26 February 2018 8:30 AM

To: Catherine Chong (LKK Auto) (admin-d@lkkauto.com)

Cc: Survey Report (ERGO Insurance Pte. Ltd.)

Subject: SKA 6803A | TP: FBL 63925 | LKK | DOA: 12.02.2018 - PRS | OUR
REF:DSMPC1800323/5L/sa

Attachments: FBL6E392S.pdf; Accident involving FBL6392S & SKAG803A on 12/02/2018 (2.43 MB);

SKAGB03A - Ol SAS.PDF

Dear Catherine,

In compliance with “State Courts Practice Directions Amendment No.1 of 2016” in regards to the Pre Repair Survey,
both TP repairer and Ergo Insurance Pte Ltd have agreed on your company LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd to be the
“Single Joint Expert”,

Please conduct this survey request and confirm direct settlement with the repairer.

Please fill up the necessary on ERGO PRS Form and return to us together on your update of the survey status.
Attached are the necessary documents for your further actions.

Kindly acknowledge receipt of this email.

NOTE: Please assist to quote our ref as the subject matter, when forwarding the Preliminary Reports / Survey
Reports.

Thank you.

Warmast regards

Siti A'thikah

Claims Departrment

ERGE Insurance Pte. Lid
5 Temasek Boutevard
#04-01 Suntec Tower Five
Singapore 038985

Tel.: 65 6829 9170
Website: www ergo.com.sg

ERGO is cne of the major insurance groups in Germany and Europe. Worldwide, ERGO is represented in more than 30 countries
and concentrates on Eurcpe and Asia. ERGO is part of Munich Re {Group). cne of the world’s leading risk carriers

From: Raymond [mailto:raymond@bhh.com.sg]

Sent: Friday, 23 February, 2018 5:11 PM

To: Siti A Thikah AB Rahman

Cc: ERGO Insurance Pte. Ltd. (Claims Department)

Subject: RE: SKA 6803A | TP: FBL 63925 | DOA: 12.02.2018 - OUR REF:DSMPC1800323/5L/sa

Dear Siti,
Please refer to the attachment for the selected surveyor.

Thanks

Best Regards,
Raymond



Ban Hock Hin Co., Pte Ltd

< Tel: (65) 6281 6520 x 220 | Fax: (65) 6284 2969

Visit us at hitp://www.bhh.com.sq
Facebook: http:/fwww.facebook.com/bhhsg

BAN HOCK HIN
w Co.. Pie Lid

No. & Defu Lane 4, Singapore 533410

www. blth.com.:

MOTORCYCLE ACCESSORIES | SERVICE CENTRE | MODIFICATIONS | SPRAY PAINTING AND BODY WORK | METAL WORKS |

...............................................................................................................

OIS Yomnese  QEAM  EE Seakhs  EEEI

From: Siti A Thikah AB Rahman [mailto:siti.rahman®@ergo.com.sg]

Sent: Friday, 23 February, 2018 4:59 PM

To: Raymond <raymond@bhh.com.sg>

Cc: ERGO Insurance Pte. Ltd. (Claims Department) <claims@ergo.com.sg>

Subject: Oi: SKA 6803A | TP: FBL 63925 | DOA: 12.02.2018 - QUR REF:DSMPC1800323/5L/sa

WITHOUT PREJUDICE

Dear Sir,

Woe refer to your email below.
Attached our template for your input.

Kindly let us have your reply.

Thank you.

Warmest regards

Siti A'thikah

Claims Department

ERGO insurance Pte. Lid.
5 Temasek Boulevard
#04-01 Suniec Tower Five
Singapore 038985

Tel.: 65 68299170
Website: www.ergo.com.sg

ERGO is one of the major insurance groups in Germany and Europe. Worldwide, ERGQ is represented in more than 30 countries
and concentrates on Europe and Asia. ERGO is part of Munich Re {Group), one of the world's leading risk carriers.

|[EMAIL DISCLAIMER




The informaticn contained in.this email communication is confidential. You shouid only read, disclose, re-transmit, copy, distribute, act in reliance on or
commercialize the information if you are autherized to do so. If you are not the intended recipient of this email communication, please notify the sender by

replying to the email and destroy any electronic or paper copy of this message.

that the integrity of this communication has been maintained or that the communication is free of errors, virus or interference.

ERGQ Insurance Pte. Ltd. asserts copyright in respect to this email including any attachment. No part may be reproduced by any process or for any

Any views expressed in this email communication are those of the individual sender. ERGO Insurance Pte. Ltd. does not represent, warrant or guarantee ‘
I
i

purpose without prior written permission.

From: Raymond [mailto:raymond@bhh.com.sqg]

Sent: Friday, 23 February, 2018 3:03 FM

To: ERGO Insurance Pte, Ltd, (Claims Department)

Subject: Accident Involving FBL6392S & SKAG803A on 12/02/2018

Dear Sir / Madam,

We attached the third party claim documents for your perusal.

Appreciate for you to arrange for the Pre-repair survey.

Thanks

Best Regards,

Raymond

Ban Hock Hin Co., Pte Ltd

Tel: (65) 6281 6520 x 220 | Fax: (65) 6284 2969

Visit us at hitp://www.bhh.com.sq
Facebook: http:/fwww.facebook.com/bhhsg

BAN HOCK HIN

No. & Defu Lane 4, Singapore 539410

www. bhh.com.:

MOTORCYCLE ACCESSORIES | SERVICE CENTRE | MODIFICATIONS | SPRAY PAINTING AND BODY WORK | METAL WORKS |

© RISURINCE Y ominese

Sicsricha
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Date: 23.02.2018 Sent via Fax -
Our Reference: DSMPC1800323/SL/sa o
Your Reference: FBLE392S

Email

raymond@bhh.com.sg

To: BAN HOCK HIN CO PTELTD

Pre-Repair SuNey (PRS} Acknowledgement

Vehicle For Ingpection: FBL 63925

Insured's Vehicle: SKA 6803A

Date Of Accident: 12.02.2018

We acknowledge receipt of your request for PRS on: 23.02.2018

In compliance with "State Courts Practice Directions Amendment No.1of 2016", do select an assessor from

the list below and indicate your selection in the hox marked *. * LK[[-A’U-’(D C@MMW

Pttt B PGt rr TSP o S
1AS infiniti Appraisal Service LKK LK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
JPK JP Knights Pte Ltd PS Prigrity Services

VAC Vicom Ltd

Your request for inspection does not have your client's cost of repair estimate, kindly forward a copy.

Your request far inspection does not have your client’s GIA report, kindly forward a copy.

We acknowledge your interest for direct settlement, we will assess & revert soon upan receipt of estimate.

-~ lOurtnsured's driver has not reported the accidenttoustodate:

Others:

Prepared by: Siti 68299170 claims@ergo.com.sg
Signature: FAX : 6829 9247
Assessor use only: Workshop use only:
— = e e e B L';‘ e P . . - - '_',A’s_-__._ éss_qta_ttepde@.waﬂ(sho _on:"'_"_""';'_' "—_"ﬁv e "7777;77’::"7 —
Assignment Date: Date: q‘)—%& 1§
Assignment Time: Time TETLT
Inspectar:
Remarks: D Vehicle not available at the appointed date and time.

nce for the above job. -

W )

Kindly acknowledge our Assessg,

FPREr—— S Gtmr
Note: Our Inspection is on a without admission to liability basis.




Shiau Chan (LKKAuto)

From: Shiau Chan (LKKAuto)

Sent: Tuesday, 27 February 2018 5:19 PM

To: 'ERGO Insurance Pte. Ltd. (Claims Department)’; Admin-D (LKKAuto)

Cc: ‘Steve Lim'; SUR

Subject: RE: SKA 6803A | TP: FBL 6392S | DOA: 12.02.2018 - OUR REF:DSMPC1800323/SL/sa
Attachments: CSEGI18003645Uqd3.pdf

Dear Steve,

Enclosed herewith preliminary advice of FBL 63925.

Best Regards,

Shiau Chan (Ms) | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: siewsc@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Raymond [mailto:raymond @bhh.com.sg]

Sent: Tuesday, 27 February 2018 2:21 PM

To: 'ERGO Insurance Pte. Ltd. {Claims Department)’ <claims@ergo.com.sg>; Admin-D (LKKAuto} <admin-
d@lkkauto.com>

Cc: 'Steve Lim' <steve.lim@ergo.com.sg>

Subject: RE: SKA 6803A | TP: FBL 6392S | DOA: 12.02.2018 - OUR REF:DSM PC1800323/5L/sa

Dear Pei Li,

Noted with thanks.

Best Regards,

Raymond

Ban Hock Hin Co., Pte Ltd

Tel: (65) 6281 6520 x 220 | Fax: (65) 6284 2969

Visit us at http://www.bhh.com.sg
Facebook: http://www.facebook.com/bhhsg

www. bith.com.:

ansmms Wounese  PRAM 205, Skyricha QISR

E AR L



' VV Auto

Consultanis
edil BA = Ple Lid

51 UBI AVE 1, #01-25 PAYA UBI INDUSTRIAL PARK, SINGAPORE 408933 TEL : (065) 62563561 FAX : (065) 62564315

Your Ref: DSMPC1800323/SL/sa

Our Ref: CS/EGI8003645/Ugb

The Motor Claims Department
ERGO Insurance

Attn: Siti

Dear Sirs/Mdm

PRELIMINARY ADVICE OF VEHICLE NO.

We thank you for the instruction on _26/02/2018.

Date: 271 February 2018

FBL 63928

Please be informed that we had conducted the inspection of the abovementioned vehicle

on 26/02/2018 at the premises of M/s

following to repott:-

Workshop Estimate Amount
Revised Estimate Amount

“Check” Items Amount

Lump Sum Repair Estimate Amount
Market Value

LTA Reimbursement Value

Nett Value

Description of Damage:

The vehicle sustained damages at the
n/s body.

Comments/ Present Status:
Damages consistent.

Days of repair: 3 days.

We have NOT authorize repair.

Yours faithfully

CHUA KANG SENG
Licensed Appraiser

BAN HOCK HIN and have the

: S$ 2.160.00

: 8% 1,882.00

1 S8 -

: 5% -

: S$ -

: 8% -

:S$ -
nearside

()R B

offside



PARF/COE Rebate Enquiry

Enquire PARF/COE Rebate for Registered Vehicle

Vehicle Owner Particulars
Owner ID Type:

Owner ID:

Vehicle Details

Vehicle No.:

Vehicle to be Exported:

Intended De-registration
Date:

Vehicle Make:

Vehicle Model:

Primary Colour:
Manufacturing Year:
Engine No.:

Chassis No.:

Maximum Power Output:
Open Market Value:
Criginal Registration Date:
First Registration Date:
Transfer Count:

Actual ARF Paid:

Intended PARF Rebate Details

PARF Eligibility:
PARF Eligibility Expiry Date:
PARF Rebate Amount:

Intended COE Rebate Details
COE Expiry Date:

COE Category:

COE Period(Years):
QP Paid:

COE Rebate Amount:

Total Rebate Amount:

Singapore NRIC

7679G

FBL&3925
No

26 Feb 2018

HONDA

CB400SF MANUAL
Red

2016
NC42E1205825
NC421801870
$7,.911.00

16 Jan 2017

16 Jan 2017

1

$1,187.00

No

$0.00

15 Jan 2027
D - Motorcycle
10

$6,101.00
$5.422.00

$5,422.00

The information contained herein is correct as at 26 Feb 2018

https://vrl.lta.gov.sg/lta/vrl/action/enquireRebateByPublicBeforeDeregInput?FUNCTION_ID=F030400...

OK

Page 1 of 2

26-Feb-18



Transfer Fee Enquiry Page 1 of 2

Enquire Transfer Fee

Vehicle Details

Vehicle No.: FBLA3925

Vehicle Type: POO - Passenger Motorcycle/Autocycle/Moped
Vehicle Attachment No Attachment

1:

Vehicle Scheme : Normal

Vehicle Make : HONDA

Vehicle Model : CB400SF MANUAL
Chassis No. : NC421801870
Propellant : Petrol

Engine No. : NC42E1205825
Engine Capacity : 39%9cc

Maximum Power -

Qutput:

Maximum Laden 300 kg

Weight :

Unladen Weight : 190 kg

Year Of 2016

Manufacture:

Original 16 Jan 2017
Registration Date:

Lifespan Expiry
Date:

COE Category : D - Motorcycle
Quota Premium: $6,101.00
COE Expiry Date : 15 Jan 2027

https://vrl.lta.gov.sg/lta/vrl/action/enquire TransferFeeDetailsProxy?FUNCTION_ID=...

21/02/2018



Invoice Page 1 of 2

GENERAL INSURANCE ASSOCIATION OF SINGAPORE
GENERAL  RECORDS MANAGEMENT CENTRE

6 Raffles Quay #18-00, Singapore 048580
INSURANCE Phone: +65 6224 0010 Fax: +65 6224 0030
ASSOCIATION Operating Hours: Monday to Friday 9am to 5pm
- oy : i e OST Registration No: M400017735
RECORDS MANAGEMENT CENTRE 9

Third Party Insurer Enquiry

Qur Ref No: GR-18-024814
Date of Request: 14/02/2018 Your Ref No: Online Purchase

Ban Hock Hin Co. Pte Ltd
No. 6 Defu Lane 4

Singapore 539410

Dear Sir/fMadam,

Enquiry Date 14/302/2018

Enquiry By Tan Chok Lok

TP Vehicle No. SKAB803A

Accident Date 12/02/2018

Enquiry Result

TP Vehicle No. Insurer Period of Insurance Insurer Tel. No.
SKAB803A ERGO Insurance Pte. Ltd. 23/03/2017-22/03/2018 68299199
Thank You.

The images provided to you are taken from the original reports forwarded to the centre by the members of the General Insurance
Association of Singapore and we take no responsibility for their accuracy or contents and shall be under ne liability whatsoever for any
loss or damage arising out of or in connection with the reports or their images.

This is a computer generated document and requires no signature.

https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfim?fusebox=MTRsas&fuseaction=dsp_... 21/02/2018



MBHH15022989-D; { AJAX MARS PTE LTD - Bukit Merah 3 H
B D B TN Dt 16,34 Your NCD will be affected due to late reporting

SUBMITTED BY: MAYMI Actual e-Filling Submission Date & Time: 19/02/2018 20:49

SINGAPORE ACCIDENT STATEMENT
IMPORTANT NOTICE

1. Please report correctly the details of the accident to speed up the claims process.

2. This Form must be completed by the Palicyholder and/cr the Authorised Driver.

3. Infarmation provided must be as truthful and accurate as possible. Any wilful misrepresentation or witholding of material facts may allow insurance companies to
repudiate policy ability.

4. The issue and acceptance of this Form by insurance companies is not an admission of policy liability on the part of the insurance companies.

5. Any false reporting may be referred to the Police for investigation.

6. This repart will be forwarded by the insurers of the GIA Records Management Centre established by the General Insurance Association of Singapore {GIA} for
archiving and that copies of this report will, for a fee, be made available upon application by interested parties.

7. By the lodgement of this report 1o the insurers, you hereby consent to the archiving of this report al the centre and to copies of the repart being made available
aforesaid.

ACCIDENT STATEMENT

Date Of Report 14/02/2018 19:34

Date Of Accident 12/02/2018 08:55

Exact Location Of Accident ALONG UPPER SERANGOON RD
Country/State of Loss SINGAPORE

DETAILS OF OWN VEHICLE

Vehicle Registration Number FBLB392S

Name Of Registered Owner MOHD SHAMSUDIN B MD HANIFFA

NRIC No S1777679G

Email Address EXTREME2012@LIVE.COM
Mobile Phone No (LOCAL) +65-98509858
Alternative Phone No OFFICE-38509858
Ve i

Manufacturer HONDA

Model CB400SF MANUAL
tEir)::aecgf:;E%s;Ior which vehicle was being used at PRIVATE

Are yau'claiming under your own insurance policy NO

far repair to your vehicle?

If No, Please state action to be taken THIRD PARTY

Vehicle Catego

MOTORCYCLE

Name of Insurance Company FWD SINGAPORE PTE. LTD.

Type Of Coverage COMPREHENSIVE
Fleet Policy NO
Policy Number PNMC2018-00000245

Cover Note Number N.A.

Name of Driver

NRIC No S1777879G

Date Of Birth 26/03/1966

Occupation INDOOR

Date Of Driving Pass 17/07/1989

Driving Experience 28 YEARS AND 6 MONTHS
Gender MALE

Mobile Number (LOCAL) +65-88509858

Fax Number

Contact Number QFFICE-98509858

EMail Address EXTREME2012@LIVE.COM

Page 1 cf 25



Address ‘ NIL
Postcode

Was driver an employee of the Insured's Company NO

If No, Relationship of the Driver with the Insured OWNER

Vehicle Registration Number of Driver's Cwn -
Vehicle -
Insurance Company of Driver's Own Vehicle -

General Information of the Accident . .
Type Of Accident SIDE SWIPE

Weather Conditions CLEAR

Road Surface DRY

Was any foreign vehicle involved in this accident? NO

Number of vehicles involved in the accident

Was any body injured in the Accident? YES

Was any injured conveyed to hospital by YES

ambulance?

Was any other material or property damaged? YES

| hg\{ta. been approacI_\ed by u:jknown.person(s) NG

saliciting/offering accident claims assistance,

Number of Passengers (Includmg Drlver) 1

_BetallsofPoh_ : Ac i Ui

Was the accident reported to the pohce” YES

If Yes,Please state which Police Station

Police Station Name TRAFFIC POLICE DIVISION HQ
Police Station Address gﬁgﬁ;{?g&al AVENUE 3, POSTCODE: 408865 , COUNTRY:
Police Station Contact TEL NO: 65470000 - FAX NO:
Was notice of intended Prosecution given? NO

If Yes,against whom?

Carcumstances of Acmdent

ON THE ABOVE MENTIONED DATE, TIME AND LOCATION, | WAS RIDING ALONG UPPER SERANGCON ROAD TOWARDS
CITY, AT THE CROSS JUNCTION OF ALJUNIED ROAD AND WOODLEIGHT LANE, | WAS TRAVELLING AT THE SPEED OF
30-35KM/HR ON THE EXTREME LEFT LANE SUDDENLY A SILVER COLOURED CAR (SKAG6803A). FROM MY RIGHT{ NEXT
LANE) TRY TO OVERTAKE THE CAR INFRONT OF HIM AND SWAP INTO MY LANE, HIT MY RIGHT ARM WITH HIS LEFT
MIRROR AND | COULDN'T CONTROLLED MY BIKE AND | SKIDDED. | WAS SEND BY AN AMBULANCE TO TTSH, XRAY
SHOWS NO TRACE OF FRUCTURE. | WAS GIVEN DRESSING ON MY LEFT HAND KNUCKLE, RIGHT HAND SHOULDER
AND ARM, BOTH LEFT AND RIGHT KNEE. | WAS GIVEN 5 DAYS MEDICAL LEAVE.

Are accident photos avallable for attachment'? YES

Was there any video captured by Car Camera? NO

Was there any audio recorded? NO

Vehicle Registration Nurmber SKAGB0O3A

Vehicle Make/Model/Colour CHEVROLET/ CRUZE/ GREY
Details Of Properties NA

Vehicle Category PRIVATE CAR

Name of Driver CHIA KENG SOON MELVIN
NRIC/Passport Number 580279764

Contact Number 91710187

Page 2 of 25



Address

Postcode

Insurance Company Name

Nature Of Damage

Na. Of Passenger (Including Driver)

DETAILS OF INJURED PERSON 1

Name MCHD SHAMSUDIN BIN MD HANIFFA
Approximate Age

Injuries Sustain

Injured person in which vehicle? FBL6392S

Were seat belis worn?

Was this injured conveyed to hospital by
ambulance?

Address

Postcode

YES

Page 3 of 25
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POLICE REPORT
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Co.Reg.No: 197000288K

B A ” ”o c K ”'” MOTORCYCLE ACCESSORIES | SERVICE CENTRE
I « MODIFIGATIONS | SPRAY FAINTING AND BOLY, WORK ["METAL
" CD., Pte Lid WORKS | LEASING & RENTALS | FLEET SALES | INSURANCE SALES
QUOTATION
Customer : NO. : 32386

ERGO INSURANCE PTE LTD

302 ORCHARD ROAD

#09-01 TIONG BUILDING W /h/ DATE . 23/02/2018
SINGAPORE 238862 CLAIM NO. - 11100
MOTOR CLAIMS DEPT A POLICY NO. :

[y —
Z{)L/’M 0/# /FROM : RAYMOND
VEHICLE NO. : FBL6392S g g
L : HON/ CB4 F
MAKE/MODE ON / CB400S a 6 / da
/3/; Q’__’ {Page 1 of 2)
S/IN  Description Action Qty  Unit Price Amount
1 BALANCER HANDLE REPLACE 2.00 $38.00 Set_ 7600
P/N: 30071 -
2 COVER STARTER REPLACE 100  $192.00 et 192.00
—
3 COWLING FRONT REPLACE 100  $150.00 Cwy 15000
4 FUEL TANK ASSY (RED) REPLACE 1.00 $123000 2 1,230.00
5 HORN (BOSCH) TWIN / dZ REPLACE 1.00 $82.00 < AL 8200
—
6  LABOUR & supplyinstal 300  $5500 /§TD 165.00
P/N: 06766
- FOR DISMANTLING AND ASSEMBLING OF PARTS
QUOTED.
7 LEVER BRAKE REPLACE 1.00 $70.00 : g 0( 70.00 /
P/N: 18930
8 LEVER CLUTCH REPLACE 1.00 $35.00 (uv) 35.00
P/N: 18524 .
9 MIRROR (SET) REPLACE 1.00 $45.00 B Rv 45.00
10 SPRAY PAINTING - Front Cowling A spray 1.00 $70.00 4 O 7000
3 -
11 TRANSPORT CHARGES (MOTORCYCLE) CLASS 2A 4§ 1.00 $45.00 £ 4500
P/N: 45835
- TOWED BACK BIKE TO WORKSHOP.
21149 S
N oip B4 g / SUB TOTAL (0% $2,160.00
GST@7% /l $151.20
ik 75

SRR R

Address: M. 6 Gal, e
Fax: (iia B5 6281 2820, 183




Quota:cion Nos. : 32386

(Page 2 of 2)
. .
SIN Descriptidn Action Qty  Unit Price Amount
) GRAND TOTAL $2,311.20

Validity: 30 days

For & on Behalf of

Acknowledge & Accepted By
BAN HOCK HIN CO PTELTD

RAYMOND

This quotation is sent via emait / LAN-Fax and will bear a computer generated signature.

“rgyitants hence notify
foliowing:
s e Tat e aTef §g7@Y painting
o Togng 4y damaged part s dunng resurvey
e Sas onoes e sURRCt o confirmation
® T nArTe S0y 8 0N @ Tvithoul Prejudice‘ basis
o N ey i oS 1S | Howed
o epiementarn, M-St e resurveyed and
s s.:hioct 1o final approval from Insurance Company

Acknowledged by Repairer

Signaiure:

L—.. =)

LT BRI

Telephone: -G53 G231 632G |

Address: o 6. Defi lane 4. Singepcs 539430
65 5285 7530, (Inswanca Projact) -65 628

Fax: (ki




% BAN HOCK HIN
H Co., Ple Ltd

Customer :

ERGOQ INSURANCE PTE LTD

302 ORCHARD ROAD
#09-01 TIONG BUILDING
SINGAPORE 238862

VEHRICLE NO.
MAKE/MODEL

: FBLB3923%
: HON/CB400SF

Co.Aeg.No: 197000288K

MOTORCYCLE ACCESSORIES | SERVICE CENTRE

MODIFICATIONS | SPRAY PAINTING AND BODY WORK | METAL
WORKS | LEASING & RENTALS | FLEET SALES | INSUBANGE SALES

h

QUOTATION

NO. : 32427
Supplementary 1 To QTN: 32386

DATE : 08/03/2018
CLAIMNO. : 11100
FOLICY NC.

FROM : RAYMOND

S/N  Description Action
1 CAP METER COVER LOWER Replace
P/N: 56533
2 COVER CLUTCH RH {BLACK) Replace
PIN: 47666 k )
3 COVER METER LOWER BLACK Replace
P/N: 56532
4 GASKET CLUTCH COVER Replace
P/N: 57228
5 GASKET GOVER COIL PULSER
P/N: 30563
6 PROTECTOR CRASH (R&G) HONDACB400SF Sl 1‘” Replace
P/N: 49948
SUB TOTAL
GST@7 %
GRAND TOTAL

Validity: 30 days

For & on Behalf of
BAN HOCK HIN CO PTE LTD

RAYMOND

This quotation is sent via email / LAN-Fax and will bear a computer generated signature.

I N o

Address: o, 6. Defu jane 4, Singapore 53941¢

Telephone: +65 6281 6520 | Welr
Fax: (Main) +65 6281.2830. (Spare Parts) +65 6285 7530, (nsuranca/p

Qty  Unit Price Amount
200  $8400 (L] 168.00 -
1.00  $440.00 7 440.00 .
1.00  $122.00 lur 122.00 ~
1.00 $22.00 AL 2200 -
1.00 $8.00 7 800 "
100 $119.00 Ae§ 11900
$879.00
$61.53
$940.53

Acknowledge & Accepted By




’ V V LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

SdE BE B 51 Ubi Ave 1#01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408933
TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315
Reg. No: 199607198R GST Reg. No. 19-9607198-R
_ Afﬂllated 10, Federation lmrnatlonale Du Expom En Automohlh
ERGO INSURANCE PTE LTD Ref :  CS/EGI18003645/Ugbe2
5 TEMASEK BOULEVARD
#04-01 SUNTEC TOWER FIVE Date: 26-03-2018

SINGAPORE 038985

1. . " policy Particulars :- THIRD LAl
Insured Veh. SKA 6803A Veh. Inspected FBL 63928
Policy No. Coverage ($) 0.00
Claim No. DSMPCP1800323/SL/sa Excess ($) 0.00
Assign From SITI ATHKAH Assign Date 26/02/2018
2, o - ‘Viehicle Particul ‘Condition :
Make & Model HONDA CB400SF c.C 399
Engine No. HIDDEN Year of Reg. 2017
Chassis No. NC421801870 Colour RED
Odometer 12334 Steering IN ORDER
Brakes IN ORDER Modification SPORTS RIM
General GOOD
Size Make Balance
R/H Front Tyre |120/60Z R17 BRIDGESTONE 8 mm
L/H Front Tyre mm
R/H Rear Tyre |160/60Z R17 BRIDGESTONE 8 mm
L/H Rear Tyre mm
4. S . Description'of. Datha 5
THE VEHICLE SUSTAINED DAMAGES AT THE N/S BODY.
DAMAGES SEE DETAILS.
5. . coeooilo L reien L General Information
Accident Date  12/02/2018 Inspection Date 26/02/2018
Survey held at BAN HOCK HIN CO.PTE LTD
NO 6 DEFU LANE 4
SINGAPORE 539410
AJTHE INSPECTION WAS CONDUCTED ON A"WITHOUT PREJUDICE" BASIS.
B)IN ACCORDANCE TO YOUR INSTRUCTIONS, WE HAVE NOT AUTHORISED REPAI.RS _
5b. 3 Repair :

ESTIMATED NORMAL PERIOD FOR REPAIR 3 W’orklng Days




y L

-m ar wm
i BE B

TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315

Reg. No: 199607198R GST Reg. No. 19-9607198-R

ADJUSTMENT ON REPAIR COST FOR VEHICLE NO. FBL 63925

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408933

Page No.:1 of 1

aty| . Description
REPLACEMENT OF PARTS
2|BALANCER HANDLE @%$38.00 SCRATCHED 76.00 76.00
1ICOVER STARTER CUT 192.00 192.00
1JCOWLING FRONT CcuT 150.00 150.00
1|FUEL TANK ASSY (RED) DENTED 1,230.00 1,230.00
1|HORN (BOSCH} TWIN CRACKED 82.00 82.00
1|LEVER BRAKE BENT 70.00 70.00
1|LEVER CLUTCH cuT 35.00 35.00
1|1SET MIRROR BROKEN 45.00 45.00
2|CAP METER COVER LOWER @$84.00 (ADDITIONAL) CuT 168.00 168.00
1|COVER CLUTCH RH (BLACK) (ADDITICNAL) DENTED 440.00 440.00
1|COVER METER LOWER BLACK (ADDITIONAL) CUT 122.00 122.00
1|GASKET CLUTCH COVER (ADDITIONAL) NECESSARY 22.00 22.00
1|GASKET COVER COIL PULSER (ADDITIONAL) NECESSARY 8.00 8.00
1|PROTECTOR CRASH (R&G) HONDACB400SF MISSING 119.00 119.00
(ADDITIONAL)
LESS 10% DISCOUNT - -275.90
2,759.00 2,483.10
LABOUR
LABOUR- FOR DISMANTLING AND ASSEMBLING OF 165.00 150.00
PARTS QUOTED.
SPRAY PAINTING - FRONT COWLING. 70.00 60.00
TRANSPORT CHARGES (MOTORCYCLE) GLASS 2A - 45.00 35.00
TOWED BACK BIKE TO WORKSHOP.
280.00 245,00
GRAND TOTAL 3,039.00 2,728.10

RECOMMENDED COST OF REPAIRS - -

Report Ref No. CS/EGH8003845/Ugbe2

CHUA KANG SENG

Licensed Appraiser

DISCLAIMER OF LIABILITY TO THIRD PARTIES:- This Report is made solely for the use and benefit of the CHent named on the front page of this Report.




