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Vivian Lau (LKKAuto)

From: Vivian Lau (LKKAuto)

Sent: Tuesday, 10 April, 2018 10:39 AM

To: 'GERALD POH WEE BIN'

Cc: MT_Claim_SG

Subject: RE: Direct Settlement - Accident Involving SKA9465Y (OI : LPC - TBA) and GBE791A 

(TP : LKK REF - CC6/LPC18003644/Awa3) on 22/02/2018

Attachments: LKK Resurvey Photos.pdf; LKK Survey Photos.pdf; LKKAdjustment1.pdf; 

LKKInspection.pdf; LOD.pdf

Lonpac Ref: 17/18/18/VP05/020421 
LKK Ref: CC6/LPC18003644/Awa3 
 
Hi Gerald, 
 
We refer to the above matter. 
 
We have highlighted to your good office on 26/02/2018 of Third-Party’s request to do Direct Settlement with our 
Principal, Lonpac Insurance Bhd. 
 
This is a head-to-rear collision. BOLA 27 Liability is 100% . Liability is not in our insured’s favour. 
 
Summary to offer to third party repairer, Zero Gravity is as follows: - 
  

Claimed 
Amount 

Revised Amount 

1. Cost of Repair (w/GST) $5,927.74 $ 2,500.00 

2. Loss of USE(4days x $100.00) $ 400.00 $ 400.00(4days x $100.00) 

3. LTA/GIA search fee $ 7.45 $ 7.45 

Total $6,335.24 $ 2,907.45 

 
**04 days recommendation for repair  
 
Relevant supporting claim documents are attached herewith for your perusal and reference. 
 
The above is for your approval. 
 

 
 

Thank you 

Best Regards, 

Vivian Lau| Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6841-8625 | email: Vivianlau@lkkauto.com| fax: 6741-4108 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

  

  

  

  

 

 

 

From: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto)  

Sent: Monday, 26 February, 2018 6:25 PM 
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To: MT_Claim_SG <mt_claim@lonpac.com> 

Cc: 'GERALD POH WEE BIN' <geraldpoh@lonpac.com>; 'ERIC WOO JUN KIAT' <ericwoo@lonpac.com>; ONG LI LI 

<llong@lonpac.com>; Vivian Lau (LKKAuto) <vivianlau@lkkauto.com>; Joy Irene (LKKAuto) <JoyIrene@lkkauto.com>; 

Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com> 

Subject: Direct Settlement - Accident Involving SKA9465Y (OI : LPC - TBA) and GBE791A (TP : LKK REF - 

CC6/LPC18003644/Awa3) on 22/02/2018 

 

Dear Sir / Madam, 

 

We refer to the above matter. 

 

We have inspected TP vehicle GBE 791A at M/s Zero Gravity. 

 

Enclosed for your perusal is:  

- TP’s GIA report 

 

Please note that estimated cost of repair and preliminary advice is not ready yet. 

 

We will revert to you on preliminary advice in due course. 

 

Kindly assist to verify validity of our insured’s policy and let us have a copy of insured’s accident report for our 

necessary action. 

 

Our case handler in-charge is Vivian and she can be contacted at DID: 6841 8625. 

 

To check availability of the case handler , you may contact the undersigned. 

 
Thank you. 

Best Regards, 

Mei Kwan | Admin  

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6366 0055 | email: MeiKwan@lkkauto.com | fax: 67414108 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

 

 

 

 


