Vic (LKKAuto)

From: GERALD POH WEE BIN <geraldpoh@lonpac.com>

Sent: Wednesday, 27 November, 2019 §:39 AM

To: Vic (LKKAuto)

Cc: MT_Claim_5G

Subject: RE- <SEEK MANDATE> LPC REF 17/1B/18/\VPD5/020417 PRI for SKX212Z & your

Ref: SIM15288B - LKK REF CC4/LPC1B003638/R1ha3 [External Confidential]

Lonpac External - Confidential
Dear Vic,

Kindly proceed as proposed.

Best Regards

Gerald Poh

Senior Claims Executive | Lonpac Insurance Bhd
300 Beach Road, #17-04/07 The Concourse, Singapore 199555
Tel: (65) 6250 7388 Ext.255 | Fax: (65) 6296 2706

The all G883 lonpac.com.sg

Lonpac External - Confidential data is for use by authorised external parties only.

From: Vic (LKKAuto) [mallto:vicalpeh@lkkauto.com]

Sent: Saturday, 23 November 2019 12:30 pm

To: GERALD POH WEE BIN

Cc: Admin A; Vic (LKKAuto); MT_Claim_3SG

Subject: <SEEK MANDATE> RE: LPC REF 17/18/18/VP05/020417 PRI for SKX212Z & your Ref: SIM15288 - LKK REF
CC4/LPC18003638/R1ha3

Your Ref: 17/18/18/VP05/020417
Our Ref: CC4/LPC18003638/R1ha3

Dear Gerald,
ACCIDENT INVOLVING VEHICLES SJM 15288 (O1) / SKX 2122 (TP) /f OTHERS ON 22/02/2018

We refer to the subject matter and to the assignment dated 23™ February 2018 of Third-Party’s request to do Direct
Settlement with our Principal, Lonpac Insurance Bhd,

it was reported that Insured vehicle was involved in a 3 vehicle chain collision and was the 2 car and was pushed
forward from behind and hit the back of the TP vehicle.

As such, in view of the MCF and BOLA scenario 28 for chain collision, we have to settle the claim from the TP vehicle.

We propose to offer to TP repairer "SK AUTOMOBILE PTE LTD" as below:

TP CLAIMED REVISED - TO OFFER




Cost of Repair (w/gst) % 15,586.34 S 6,741.00
Loss of Rental ($200 x 8 days) S 1,600.00 S 1,440.00 (5180 x 8 days)
TOTAL | S 17,196.34 $ B,181.00
Breakdown of days is as follows:
Our surveyor’s recommended days to repair 8 days
TOTAL B days

The above is for your approval and/or further instructions please.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Vie Alpeh | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Lid

Phone: 6841-2096 | email: vicalpehi@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubl Industrial Park, Ubl Avenue 1, #o2-25 | S{408933)

§F IS .
SesBsm = Syve bhe Farth- Print only when necessary

This e-mall contain confidential and privileged material, and are for the sole use of the intended recipient. Use or distribution by an
unintended recipient Is prohibited, and may be a violatlan of law I you believe thal you recelved this e-maill in eror, please do nol
read this e-mall or any atlached ilems. Please delale the e-mall and all allachmants, including any copies thereof, and inform the
sender that you have deleted the e-mall, all attachments and any copies thereofl. Thank you

From: Mel Kwan (LKKAuto)

Sent: Friday, 2 March, 2018 10:49 AM

To: 'GERALD POH WEE BIN'

Cc: 'ERIC WOO JUN KIAT'; "MT_Claim_SG’; Admin A; ONG LI LI; Thin Thin (LKKAuto); CS A Team
Subject: RE: PRI for SKX212Z & your Ref: SIM15288B

WITHOUT PREJUDICE

Your Ref :17/18/18/VP05/020417
LKK Ref : CC4/LPC18003638/R1ua3

Dear Sir / Madam,
We refer to the above matter.
This is a third party direct settlement case.

We have not authorized repairs.

Enclosed revert of vehicle: SKX 2122

Enclosed for your perusal is:
- TP estimated cost of repair
- Preliminary advice



Kindly let us have a copy of your insured'’s GIA report for our necessary action.

Please take note that the case handler in-charge is Thin Thin and she can be contacted at DID: 6841
2360,

To check availability of the case handler, you may contact the undersigned,

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Mei Kwan | Admin

LEK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6366 0055 | email: MeiBwan@lkkauto.com | fax: 67414108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubl Avenue 1, #02-25 | S{408033)

From: Admin-D [LKKAUto)

Sent: Monday, 26 February, 2018 10:38 AM

To: 'GERALD POH WEE BIN' <geraldpoh(@|onpac.com>; assignments <assign |kkauto.com>
Cc: 'MT_Claim_SG' <mt claim@lonpac.com>; Admin A < in-a@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: PRI for SKX2127 & your Ref: 5JM15288

Dear Mr Gerald,
Thank you for the assignment.

Best Regards,

Catherine Chong | Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6741-8434 | email: gssignments®@ kkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Pava Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | ${408933)

From: GERALD POH WEE BIN |mailto:geraldpoh@lonpac.com
Sent: Friday, 23 February, 2018 3:14 PM

To: assignments@lkkauto.com
Cc: MT_Claim_5G <mt claim@lonpac.com>; SK Admin <admin@skauto.com.sg>

Subject: FW: PRI for 5SKX2122Z & your Ref: 5JM15288

Our Ref : 17/18/18/VP05/020417

Dear Catherine,

Kindly proceed to conduct the survey and revert to them on direct settlement.

Best Regards

Gerald Poh

Senior Claims Executive | Lonpac Insurance Bhd

300 Beach Read, #17-04/07 The Concourse, Singapore 199555
Tel: (65) 6250 7388 Ext.255 | Fax: (65) 6296 2706

From: SK Admin [mailto:admin@skauto.com.sg]
Sent: Friday, 23 February, 2018 3:02 PM



To: MT_Claim_SG; GERALD POH WEE BIN
Cc: JING XIONG KHOO
Subject: PRI for SKX212Z & your Ref: SIM1528B

Dear Sir / Mdm,

We the repairers of motor vehicle no, SKx2122
Kindly arrange surveyor to conduct a pre-repair inspection,

Location 1 Soon Lee St #04/44/45
Pionear Cantre
Singapore 627605

Contact No : Michael 9018 3598 / 8121 0478 Xiong

We appreciate your early reply.
Thanks.

Regards,

Huey Les

SK Automobile Pte Lid

Tel: 6789 5155 Fax: 6783 5155



SK Automobile Pte Ltd

23 Kaki Bukit Ave 4 #03-01

Vicom Inspection Centre (South Wing) ${415933)
Tel: +65 6789 5166 Fax: +65 6783 5155

Co. Reg No.201500047H GST Reg No. 201500047H

Date:  06/04/2018
Your Ref: SIM 152813
To: Lonpne fnsurance Bhd
100 Beach Road
#19-00 Shaw Towet
Singapore 189702
Thr:  LKK Auto Consultants Pre Lid
Attn: . Motor Claims Dept
Dear SirfMdm,
RE: THIRD FARTY CLAIM FOR VENICLE SKX2127 & SIMI15288 on 22/02/2018
We refer to the above matter.
Altached copies ol the following For your perusal:
1) Tax Invoice No. 1V | 8-80087 (S$6,741.00)
2) Loss of Rental 08days @ 5$200.00 (551,600.00) Invoice & Rental Agreement

1) 1.etter of Authorisation

Please look into the above claim and let us have your payment of 558,34 1,00 soonest.

Thank You.

Yours faithfully,

iTtE!Lee e
E-mail: admin@skaulo.com.sg



T

SK AUTOMOBILE PTE LTD
ROC Mo, 201500047H
23 Kakl Bukil Ave 4, #03-01
Vieam Inspeciion Centre (Soulh Wing) 5415833
Tel: 6789 5165 Fax: G783 5155

LETTER OF AUTHORIZATION
To Warkshop : SK Automohile Pte Lt
Fr Owner’s Name - l-r.-"‘? BM? *\M
Company (if any) - -
Atdress : P,I_L hzo dﬂﬂa fLu ﬂﬂ]f' Pre 4 1&?—%‘? £ ((:ﬂs'ua)
NRIC No i R1MMNT -
Accident on : __‘.hx 93‘! 14 inwolvingvehiclets) ST 15346
Along . PE CTua :1
I/We, Long  Deng )’\ﬂ“ the owner ol motar vehicle,

]
registration  no. S_Kﬂlm 2 herehy do authorize you to commence repairs to my
abovementioned vehicle,

IfWe confirm that you are authorized to handle the repair of the vehicle andfor to negotiate and
settle my claims relating to the above mentioned accident, which 1/we may have, against the other
third paity/parties or Insurers [excluding my own Insurer) andfor to Instruct lawyers on myfouy
behalf, to faclitate the third party claim for mefus.

You are hereby authorized to execute and/or sign any documents/discharge vouchers/agreements
regarding my/our clalm/fcase for my convenlence. You are also hereby sulhorized to recelve on
myfour behalf manies/dalms, correspantdences in connectian with this sald claim,

I/We canfirm that in the event of an unsuccessiul clalm against the negligent party, and/or iy own
insurer for the damages caused to my vehicle, | agree to pay all repair costs, car rental and any
incldental expenses incurred by you or to lodge an own damage (only for comprehensive cover) to
cover the expenses Incurred,

Witness's Name ; ‘{-*—"f Las Date :__?EI-” = 7~ \
Withess's Signatune © A - Owner's Slgnature : < .,-—" l

Favised ; 15/2/2007



.

AUTOMOBILE PTE LTD

ROC No.: 201500047H
23 Kaki Bukit Ave 4, #03-01

Vicom Inspeclion Centre (South Wing) 54156833
Tel: 6788 5156 Fax: G783 5166

To: lenpac_ Jdngurana !!Jucl
00 Beach Eaa:l

R19-00 chaw TTawer
¢ 0189 ;)

Dear SirfMadam
Accidentinvolving____ SC¥ MY and__ SIM 153@D on nlla_l*E

T M  Tual

I/wWe, \Dl\% B"""qld\ﬁﬁ — _, ani the registered

owner of the motar vehide no. W) 2

Please note that | have assigned all compensation monles due te me/us in the aliove sald accldent to

M/5 SK Automobile Pte Ltd,

I/We, hereby authorized you 1o release all compensation monies pertaining to the above-mentioned
accldent to M/S 5K Automobile Pte Ltd and forward your settiement chegue to M/5 SK Automobile

Pre Ltel whom | have authorized to collect the sald compensation/monies.

-

Signature of étamum

Tomvlved 15202007



LONPAC INSURANCE BHD

CLAIM NO  : [VIBINS/VPOS/O20417
DATE : 27 NOVEMBER 2019

DISCHARGE VOUCHER

I'We, LONG DENGHAN confirmed acceptance from M/s LONPAC INSURANCE
BHD andfor the owner of SJM 15288 the sum of Singapore Dollars Eight
Thousand One Hundred Eighty One Only ($8.181.00) in full and final satsfaction.
liguidation and discharge of property ¢luim competent to me/us upon the sad M/s
LONPAC INSURANCE BHD in respect of property claim sustained by mefus
whether now or hereafter to become manifest, arising either directly or indirectly from
an accident to my vehicle, SKX 2127 on 22 FEBRUARY 2018 along PIE (TUAS).

I /We hereby agree to indemnify and keep indemnify (CASSIDY CHAN KWOK
WAH / LONPAC INSURANCE BHD) against all claims and any claims
whatsoever made by any person/persons on our behalf in respect of the said accident.

I/'We further authorize you 1o pay the above settlement sum directly w M/S SK
AUTOMOBILE PTE LTD.

/'We hereby acknowledge that this payment is made on a without admission of
lighility basis and without prejudice to all related claims and i respect of our
msured’s recovery action,

i
f

! i
N Vot endan 3wl
Signaturt of vehicle owner/Date
i ’ |
Lone Penshan_ 23[1214

Name of vehicle owner/Date



SK AUTOMOBILE PTE LTD

23 Kaki Bukit Ave 4 #03-01

Vicom Inspection Centre (South Wing) S415933
Phone +65 6789-5155 Fax +65 6783-5155

CO Reg No. 20150004714 GS1 Reg No. 201500047H

DATE: 06-Apr-18
INVOICE # IV18-80087
VEH REG NO: SKX 212 7
Bill To:
LONPAC INSURANCE BHD
DESCRIPTION AMOUNT
Being cost of repair inclusive of labour charges, parts and accessories L1 6.300.00

for the abovementioned vehicle

Sub.Towl | § 8,300.00
7% GST | § 441,00

Total | § 6,741.00

Make all cheques payable to "SK AUTOMOBILE PTE LTD"

THANK YOU FOR YOUR BUSINESSI|



CARS FOR RENT (2016) PTE LTD
5 TANAH MERAH KECHIL ROAD

#17-05 SINGAPORE 486865

TEL: 6789 5165 FAX: 6783 5155

INVOICE

DATE INVOICE #
13032018 Vils0e41
Invoice To:
LONG DENGHAN
BLK 430 CHOA CHU KANG AVE 4
#07-558 SINGAPORE 680430
VEH REG NO TERMS
SKX212Z DUE ON RECPT
DESCRIPTION NO. OF DAYS RATE AMOUNT
CAR RENTAL FROM 22/02/18 TO 02/03/18 B $200.00 $1,600.00
TOTAL 21,600.00




CARS FOR RENT (2016 ﬂE LTD

5 T Marih Kochil Fomd #1705 5 4 No: 2454
Ti: 6780 6165 Fak: 07805155 P e 1
ROG No: 201600732N VEHICLE RENTAL AGREEMENT Sk ow o 0ol
HINER'S PARTICULAR o { voticlo o S LM VT aplace ven te
Name: (as In VC) ny ‘“‘ﬂ“‘“ Mitaage Out: 2.5 | Miiaage Out
NRIC/PASSPORT Np: — S50 JLT’LEL"’_ L @W
Adcress [1tes) "0 Cwo, Chu, ©- 'M‘_E_ "
o551 £ (RoUeY 2]2)i§ 7
1 0]-557 ¢( (RoYle) our owe 22/ Tena: /) 21
Nare. 5. Ackdvins o Eruoner — HIRE/PERION EXPIRY.
s | COLLISION DAMAGE WAIVER Excess 2000 YES I NO
. —— - | PERSONAL ACGIDENT INSURANCE YES / NO
Oceupntions Whhlﬂﬁn:@}lﬂ_.’ri.] CHARGES
Driving Loonco N WL Typa:  Local § kg ; 11 at _ N T
tasun Dale: mumiﬂ.[_‘“w ) I e Jop g e 1 ID&h 100
Tet:(0) A - wopg Tb170ULS | Wooky @8 po waek
ADDITIONAL DRIVER'S PARTICULARS | Monthly @4 par monih
Name: (as in 1AG) —_— - ~ | Hows ot por hore
NRIC/PASSPORT No: S Othors 08
P cow  of per day/month
Driving Licence Mo DAL Type:-  Local / Intarmational | PAI as pat dayfmantli
fnmun Date: Datool By | Dalivery Servico
Occupmtion; —— — Driving Expe sus-tomaL # 1Kany | 29
VEMICLE CHECK LIST | PETROLLEVEL -
on_|E | 1M (34 | F |
Iy E 1M | e | A | F
EXTENSION I (N —
Gallection Servico |
Minc.
TOTAL CHARGES §
Aented oul by : |
F J
Hirer's Signature =
[ Jcgugnter ] sye
[ 7D Yools [T dack [ Hub Caps T

[ Radio/Class  [_] €O [] catidgos

Ihmudlndwmﬂihmrndmdllbnunbn'lhﬂduﬂmhnurﬂnw.Iﬂh:nprmﬂnduhmﬂ:mdhurdhrpmrmmlm
thlullmuummmundmmmwmwmmmmwmmmmmmlmﬂmmmm
will be considered to have been mada on the charga/eredit card voucher. All information | have given CARS FOR RENT (2016) PTELTD In
connsction with this agresmant 1s thue,

* IMPORTANT

1 RILY RERBCN ADOVE 23 YEARE OF ADE Wi TH AIOS 1AM I TEARS DRVANG ENFERIENCE, AUTHOMBED, LICENBED AND SR THIB ACPEEMERT MAK DAGWE THE VEHICLE.
tmmmlm:wmmmnmuum mMTmmmmmmmmmumm

3 n!wm-mmmmmmmmnmmsmmmmmmmwmmmmnmm

& 1N CMIE OF ACCIEENT, THIl MITER BHALL MEFORT T0 RENTAL DFFICE SIMEDSATELY. F THERE 18 BODLY SUURIES , A POLCE REPONT MUST DE WADE WiTHIM P4 HOUNE.
& VEINOLE I OTROCTLY FOR SROAPORE USEONLY AMD biny WOT BE BAVEN CUT OF BINGAPCRE WITVHOUT FIECN CONSENT OF THE COLIMANY CARS FOR RENT [@2016) FTE LD

mmwm-mmamnmurmmuﬂ-MM'mw-mrwmmwttwmm WA LW BeAlLL DEERED TD
BE THE DAY AND TIME THE VEHICLE 1S METUSED TO CARS FOMN RENT (2010} PTE LTD AND 19E SAME SWALL IE ACCEPTED A CONCLUSHE BYDENCE OF THE AND BHALL 1T
BF CHALLENOED O DUEATIONED ON ANY ACCOUST WHATEORVER:

DATEIN | TIMEIN | MILEAGE | GHECKED BY REMARKS '@h ¥

7 ]

dl < !-:( o -
' { SIGNATURE OF HIRER/DRIVER




