Vic (LKKAuto)

From: Vic (LKKAuto)

Sent: Thursday, 25 July, 2019 11:07 AM

To: Julie Johari

Cc: Admin A; simon koh; KY Leong; Cecilia Chong (LKK Auto); SK Admin; Vic (LKKAuto)
Subject: RE: Accident involving SKX212Z & SIM1528B On 22/02/18 LKK REF

CC4/LPC18003638/R1ha3

Without Prejudice

Dear Julie,

We refer to your below email.

Please be informed that Joy is no longer with LKK and | will be taking over the matter.
We will get back to you for an update/offer in due course.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Vic Alpeh | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841-2096 | email: vicalpeh @lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)
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This e-mail contain confidential and privileged material, and are for the sole use of the intended recipient. Use or distribution by an
unintended recipient is prohibited, and may be a violation of law. If you believe that you received this e-mail in error, please do not
read this e-mail or any attached items. Please delete the e-mail and all attachments, including any copies thereof, and inform the
sender that you have deleted the e-mail, all attachments and any copies thereof. Thank you.

From: Julie Johari [mailto:julie@skauto.com.sg]

Sent: Thursday, 25 July, 2019 10:37 AM

To: Shu Pei (LKKAuto); Joy Irene (LKKAuto)

Cc: Admin A; CS A Team; simon koh; KY Leong; Cecilia Chong (LKK Auto); SK Admin
Subject: Re: Accident involving SKX212Z & SJM1528B On 22/02/18

Hi Joy

Refer to above matter

We sent out LOD dated on 06.04.2018

To date no one had get bck to us with an offer

Kindly advised



Looking forward to hear from you soon
Please do not hesitate to contact me should you have any queries thereof.

Best Regards,

M Julie
SK Automobibe Pte Ltd (201500047F)
23 Katei Bukit Avenue 4

#03-01 VICOM Inspection Centre
Singapore 415933

Tef: 6789 5155

Fax: 6783 5155

DID: 9623 4440 / 9099 6204

On Fri, Jun 28, 2019 at 11:36 AM Shu Pei (LKKAuto) <shupei @lkkauto.com> wrote:
Dear Sir / Madam,

Thank you for your email.

Our respective case handler will look into the matter and revert to you in due course.

Please note that: -

LKK ref Officer in charge
CC4/LPC18003638/R1ja3 Joy

To check availability of the case handler, you may contact the undersigned

Best Regards,
Shu Peil Admin
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6366-0055 | email: shupei @lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Julie Johari <julie @skauto.com.sg>
Sent: Friday, 28 June 2019 10:05 AM




To: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>; CS A Team <cs-a@lkkauto.com>

Cc: simon koh <simon @skauto.com.sg>; KY Leong <kyleong @skauto.com.sg>; Cecilia Chong (LKK
Auto) <CeciliaChong@lkkauto.com>; SK Admin <admin@skauto.com.sg>

Subject: Re: Accident involving SKX2127 & SIM1528B On 22/02/18

Hi Sir / Madam

Refer to above matter

We email you several times but no one had revert

Still waiting from your end to advise us with an offer

Kindly expedite & looking forward to hear from you soon

Please do not hesitate to contact me should you have any queries thereof.

Best Regards,

M8 Julie

SK Automodbile Pte Ltd (201500047F)
23 Kaki Butkit Avenue 4

#03-01 VICOM Inspection Centre
Singapore 415933

Teb: 6789 5155

Fax: 6783 5155

DID: 9623 4440



On Fri, Feb 15, 2019 at 11:31 AM Julie Johari <julie @ skauto.com.sg> wrote:

Hi Sir / Madam

Refer to above matter

We submit LOD dated on 06.04.2018

It already more then 6 months of submission.

To date no offer was revert back to us

Kindly advised and look into this matter as urgent

Looking forward to hear from you soon

Please do not hesitate to contact me should you have any queries thereof.

Best Regards,

Ms Julie

SK Automobile Pte Ltd (201500047H)
23 Kaki Bukit Avenue 4

#03-01 VICOM Inspection Centre
Singapore 415933

Tel: 6789 5155

Fax: 6783 5155



DID: 9623 4440

On Tue, Jun 5, 2018 at 5:39 PM SK Admin <admin @skauto.com.sg> wrote:

Dear Thin Thin,

We refer to the above matter, kindly assist to update us the claim status.
Pls check & revert to us the soonest.

Thanks for your kind attention

Regards,
Huey Lee

SK Automobile Pte Ltd

Tel: 6789 5155 Fax: 6783 5155

On Fri, Apr 6, 2018 at 5:53 PM, SK Admin <admin @skauto.com.sg> wrote:

Dear Thin Thin ,

Enclose the final bill & relevant documents for your perusal.

Kindly refer to them and revert back to us soon.

Breakdown as below:

Cost of repair : S$ 6,741.00 (incl' GST 7%)

Loss of rental : S$ 1,600.00 (08 days @ S$$200.00)

Total : S$ 8.341.00



We appreciate your early reply .

Thanks for your kind attention.

Regards,
Huey Lee

SK Automobile Pte Ltd

Tel: 6789 5155 Fax: 6783 5155



