Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

From: Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

Sent: Friday, 3 August 2018 1:57 PM

To: '‘benjamin@vtecauto.com.sg’; Simon Ho (LKKAuto)
Cc: SUR; Admin A

Subject: RE: Status of SGX718D

Dear Benjamin,

Please check with OIC Irene Tay .

Best Regards,

Veron Chen | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email :sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: benjamin@vtecauto.com.sg <benjamin@vtecauto.com.sg>
Sent: Friday, 3 August 2018 12:34 PM

To: Simon Ho (LKKAuto) <SimonHo@lkkauto.com>

Cc: SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>; Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>
Subject: Status of SGX718D

Dear All,

May i check what is the current status for my claim, my client's vehicle SGX718D and your insured vehicle YN2376H.
Is the payment to my company being process?

Thanks & Regards,

Ben

8 Kaki Bukit Avenue 4, #07-08/09
Premier@KB Singapore 415875
Mobile: 8823 1688/8402 8402
www.vtecauto.com.sg



