Vic (LKKAuto)

From: jen.lim@eurokars.com.sg

Sent: Wednesday, 26 September, 2018 3:10 PM

To: Vic (LKKAuto)

Cc: Admin A

Subject: RE: Your ref: SJV7084C Our ref: SDU1818T DOA: 20/02/2018
Importance: High

Dear Vic,

Please let us have your offer ASAP.

Thanks you.

Best Regards,

Jen

Insurance Claims Dept

EUROKARS SERVICES PTE LTD

27A Tanjong Penjuru

Singapore 609042

T: (65) 6331 0698 F: (65) 6331 0690
E: jen.lim@eurokars.com.sg

From: Jen Lim

Sent: 07 August 2018 1:47 PM

To: Vic (LKKAuto) <vicalpeh@Ilkkauto.com>

Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>

Subject: Your ref: SIV7084C Our ref: SDU1818T DOA: 20/02/2018

“Without Prejudice”
Dear Vic,

Attached is the covering letter, Repair Tax Invoice, GIA Search, Letter of Authority & Discharge voucher signed by
client for your perusal.

Await to hear from you with your offer of settlement as soon as possible.
Thank you very much.

Note : Documents send by email only

Best Regards,

Jen

Insurance Claims Dept
TRANS EUROKARS PTE LTD



12 Sungei Kadut Avenue Singapore 729648
Tel: +65 63633003 DID: +65 63602444 Fax: +65 63602899



