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Print Sent Message

 
This mail is associated with :

  
*SHD6776P (C0471115)

 [SHD244Y]
 TP

 COMFORT TRANSPORTATION PTE LTD
 Feb 21 2018 4:00PM

 [TRANS-CAB SERVICES PTE LTD]
 ComfortDelGro Engineering Pte Ltd
  

 
From   LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd (LKK_HQ), sent on 05/09/2018 12:05 PM.
To   AXA_SG; richard.angbs@axa.com.sg
CC   Admin-a@lkkauto.com; vicalpeh@lkkauto.com
Subject   Re: Fw: <SEEK MANDATE> Re: TP settlement - C0471115/P1680520
 
Dear Richard,
 
We refer to the subject matter.
 
Please be informed that we had offered to TP LOR/I @ 3 days but was rejected. TP had insisted to claim for 9 days
instead as per their vehicle log card (LOD uploaded in merimen).
 
Kindly advise further instruction.'
 
Thank you.
 
Vic Alpeh
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
Tel: 6841 2096
 
<-- Original Message --> 
From: AXA_SG
To: LKK_HQ;sur@lkkauto.com;assignments@lkkauto.com
CC: AXA_SG
Sent On: 28/02/2018 05:11 PM
Subject: TP settlement - C0471115/P1680520
 
Dear KALVIN ANG WEI KUN ,

  
Please proceed for direct settlement if damages consistent.

  
Regards,

 Ernest Tay


