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LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

51 Ubl Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubl Industrial Park, Singapore 408933

TEL: 6258 3561 FAX: 6256 4315

Reg. No: 199807198R GST Reg. No. 19-960T138-R

Affiliated to Federation Internationale Des Experts En Automobile

LONPAC INSURANCE BHD

300 BEACH ROAD

#17-04/07 THE CONCOURSESINGAPORE 188555

Ref . CC4/LPC18003578/Kyb3

Date ; 28-02-2018

Code . LPC2

—
B

Policy Particulars :- THIRD PARTY CLAIM

Insured Veh, SKR 1584% Veh. Inspected SJN 80288
Policy No. Coverage (§) 0.00
Claim No. Excess (§) 0.00
Assign From Assign Date 26/02/2018
2. Vehicle Particulars & Condition
Make & Model c.c a
Engine No. HIDDEN Year of Reg.
Chassis No. Colour
Odometer Steering
Brakes Modification
General
3. Conditions of Tyres
Size Make Balance
R/H Front Tyre mm
LfH Front Tyre mm
R/H Rear Tyre mm
L/H Rear Tyre mm
4, Description of Damages
5. General Information
Accident Date 08/02/2018 Inspection Date 22/02/12018
Survey held at SIONG LEE MOTOR
SIN MING INDUSTRIAL ESTATE BLOCK 12 SECTOR B
g?b‘] g:PCIHE 575656
5a. Remarks

A)THE INSPECTION WAS CONDUCTED ON A"WITHOUT PREJUDICE" BASIS.

BlIN ACCORDANCE TO YOUR INSTRUCTIONS, WE HAVE NOT AUTHORISED REPAIRS
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Yourref: To Be Advised Date: 26.02.2018

Our ref: COR/MLPCIRO03579/Kyb3

The Motor Claims Department

M/s LONPAC INSURANCE BHD

Dear Sir/Mudum.

PRELIMINARY ADVICE OF VEHICLE NO. SINSO28B
We refer 1o the above marter.

Please be informed that we had conducted the inspection of the above mentioned vehicle on 22.02.2018
at the premises of M/s Siong Lee Motor _and have the following o report:-

Waorkshop Estimate Amount : 58 3,537.66
Revised Estimate Amount : 8% 962.18
“Check” Items Amount : 55 2,202.75
Market Value + 88 -

LTA Reimbursement Value : 8% -

Nett Vilue + 5% -
Description of Damage: -
The vehicle sustained damages at the I; — -
Rear N/S Portion Mo
Comments/Present Status;

Damages Consistent

Estimated normal period for repairs: 2 days

Yours faithfully,

KENNETH KONG
Licensed Appraiser



e, W o#& B %%
-- SIONG LE£ MOTOR

Tel: 6457 0410, 6453 3478 Fax: 6552 0692

21 February 2018

~1. L
ATTN: MOTOR CLAIM DEPARTMENT 7 Arthag
e s 2,
ATTN: KOO TEK CHUAN "7 ZSpen,
H/P: 9671 8028 2
s

Dear Sirs /| Madam,

Accident Claim for Vehicle No.SJN8028B, Involving Vehicle No.SKR1594X
Accident on 08 FEBRUARY 2018, AT JOO CHIAT PLACE.

With reference to the above vehicle. We hereby submit a list of parts required
to be changed and append below the charges for changing and repairing ;

|Hn|sUPPLEmTARY PARTS REPLACEMENT QTY | LIST PRICE ]
1 |REAR BUMPER IPC | % 1,500.45 |7
2 |REAR BUMPER REINFORCEMENT IPC | $ 738.05 |7
3 |REAR BUMPER PAD IPC |8 Zf/es 480.20 4—
4 |REAR BUMPER LOWER GARNISH 3 Ji 369.70 | X
TOTAL LIST PRICE $ 3,097.40
LESS 10% $ (309.74)
TOTAL AMOUNT $ 2,787.66
LABOUR : 2/,
1 [LABOUR TO SPRAY PAINT & 400.00
2 |[LABOUR TO PANEL BEATING S Z2Fey 35000
TOTAL LABOUR| $ 750.00
TOTAL AMOUNT| § 3,537.66
THANK YOU
FROM:

SIONG LEE MOTOR
Mr Tan Leng Huat



Nivitha (LKK Auto)

From: ERIC WOO JUN KIAT <ericwoo@lonpac.coms>

Sent: Wednesday, 21 February 2018 11:02 AM

To: Cheonghoh Law; assignments@lkkauto.com

Cc: MT_Claim_SG

Subject: RE: Our Ref: 18/18/18/VP05/020391 Your Ref: LCH.lg/SM5L-80141.18 Accident

involving SKR1594X & SINBO28B along Joo chiat Place on 8/2/18 List of surveyors
Attachments: 21022018105948, pdf

1-30am® 32|>| 18

Dear Catherine, vihicle In
su@\wnnﬂﬁ/v

We will proceed to appoint Mohammed Rasul from LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd to survey

SIN 8028B.

Dear Nivitha,
FYA.
Thank you.

Best Regards,

Eric Woo

Claims Executive | Lonpac Insurance Bhd

300 Beach Road, #17-04/07 The Concourse, Singapore 199555
Tel: (65) 6279 9253 | Fax: (65) 6296 3767

From: Cheonghoh Law [mailto:mail@cheonghoh.sg]

Sent: Wednesday, 21 February, 2018 10:30 AM

To: ERIC WOO JUN KIAT

Cc: MT_Claim_SG

Subject: Re: Our Ref: 18/18/18/VP05/020391 Your Ref; LCH.lg/SMSL-80141.18 Accident involving SKR1594X &
SIN8028B along Joo chiat Place on 8/2/18 List of surveyors

Dear Sirs,”
We refer to the above matter and to your fax dated 14 February 2018.

Our client hereby nominate Mohammed Rasul named in your list serial no 7 to conduct the pre-
repair survey of the damages to our client's vehicle arising out of the above mentioned accident.

Please be informed that our client’s vehicle, SIN 8028 B is currently laying at our client's
workshop, Siong Lee Motor, 160 Sing Ming Drive #02-07 AutoCity Singapore 575722.

Contact Person :Mr Tan / Ms Kwee Pin
Telephone : 6453 1255

Kindly proceed to do the needful.

Thanks & regards
Catherine



CHEONGHOH LAW CORPORATION

Blk 53 Chin Swee Road #03-05

Singapore 160053

T: 6337 8700 | F: 6337 3700 | E: mail@cheonghoh.sg

On 20 Feb 2018, at 3:47 PM, ERIC WOO JUN KIAT <eriewoo@lonpac.com> wrote:

Dear Melody,

Please revert by tomorrow, else we will proceed to appoint LKK Auto Consultants
Pte Ltd to survey SIN 8028B.

Kindly advise the workshop to conduct survey.
Thank you.

Best Regards,

Eric Woo

Claims Executive | Lonpac Insurance Bhd

300 Beach Road, #17-04/07 The Concourse, Singapore 199555
Tel: (65) 6279 9253 | Fax: (65) 6296 3767

From: Cheong Hoh Lee [ :

Sent: Tuesday, 20 February, 2018 2:56 PM

To: ERIC WOO JUN KIAT

Cc: MT_Claim_5G

Subject: Re: Our Ref: 18/18/18/VP05/020391 Your Ref: LCH.lg/SMSL-80141.18 Accident involving
SKR1594X & SINB028B along Joo chiat Place on B/2/18 List of surveyors

Hi Eric,

As spoken, we will revert to you by tomorrow,

Regards,

Melody

Cheonghoh Law Corporation
Blk 53 Chin Swee Road #03-05
Singapore 160053

Tel: 6337 8700

Fax: 6337 3700

On Feb 19, 2018, at 12:46 PM, ERIC WOO JUN KIAT
<ericwoo(@lonpac.com> wrote:




Dear Sir/Mdm,
Kindly refer to our attachment and our fax on 14 February 2018.

Please advise If you are agreeable to our list of surveyors as single
joint expert and the workshop to conduct survey,

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Eric Woo

Claims Executive | Lonpac Insurance Bhd

300 Beach Road, #17-04/07 The Concourse, Singapore 199555
Tel: (65) 6279 9253 | Fax: (65) 6296 3767

<19022018124242.pdf>



Shu Pei !LKKAutu! e

From: GERALD POH WEE BIN <geraldpohi@lonpac.com>

Sent: Tuesday, 27 February 2018 10:21 AM

To: Shu Pei (LKKAUto)

Ce: MT_Claim_5G; Jas Khine (LKKAuto)

Subject: RE: OQur Ref 18/18/18/VP05/020397 Your Ref LCH Ig/SMSL-B0141.18 Accident

involving SKR1594X & SINB028B along Joo chiat Place on 8/2/18 List of surveyors
***LKK REF:.CC4/LPC18003579/Kyb3
Attachments: 27022018101636 pdf

Dear Shu Pel,
We attached a copy of insured’s GIA report for your attention,
Kindly assess liability first before commencing negotiations

as our insured is pursuing his claim against the third party.

Best Regards

Gerald Poh

Senior Claims Executive | Lonpac Insurance Bhd

300 Beach Road, #17-04/07 The Concourse, Singapore 199555
Tel: (65) 6250 7388 Ext.255 | Fax: (65) 6296 2706

From: Shu Pei (LKKAuto) [mailto:shupei@lkkauto.com]
Sent: Monday, 26 February, 2018 6:20 PM
To: GERALD POH WEE BIN; ERIC WOO JUN KIAT
Cc: MT_Claim_5SG; Admin A; Jas Khine (LKKAuto); Thin Thin (LKKAuto)
Subject: RE: Our Ref: 18/18/18/yP05/020391 Your Ref: LCH.lg/SM5L-80141.18 Accident involving SKR1594% &
SINB028B along Joo chiat Place on 8/2/18 List of surveyors ***LKK REF.CC4/LPC1B003579/Kyb3
WITHOUT PREJUDICE
Dear Sir / Madam,
We refer to the above matter.
This is a TP direct settlement case. We had inspected TP vehicle 5)N 80288 at M /s Siong Lee Motor,
Enclosed for your perusal is:
. Estimated cost of repair
- Preliminary advice
Meanwhile, kindly let us have a copy of your insured’s GIA report for our necessary action.
Kindly take note that the case handler In-charge is [as and she can be contacted at DID: 6841 2928.
Thank you.

Best Regardi,



Shu Pel| Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6366-0055 | email: shupmstikkauto com | fax; G741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubs Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S{a08833)

From: ERIC WOO JUN KIAT [mailto:ericwoo@|onpac.com]
Sent: Wednesday, 21 February, 2018 11:02 AM

To: Cheanghoh Law <mall@ch hoh.sg>; assignments@lkkauto.com

Cc: MT_Claim_5G <mt_claim@lonpac.com>
Subject: RE: Qur Rel: 18/18/18/vP05/0203291 Your Ref: LCH.Ig/SMSL-B0141.18 Accident involving SKR1534X & SIN8028B
along loo chiat Place on 8/2/18 List of surveyars

Dear Catherine,

We will proceed to appoint Mohammed Rasul from LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd to survey SIN
80288,

Dear Nivitha,
FYA.
Thank you,

Best Regards,

Eric Woo

Claims Executive | Lonpac Insurance Bhd

300 Beach Road, #17-04/07 The Concourse, Singapore 199555
Tel: (65) 6279 9253 | Fax: (65) 6296 3767

From: Cheonghoh Law [mailto:mall@cheonghoh.sg]

Sent: Wecnesday, 21 February, 2018 10:30 AM

To: ERIC WOO JUN KIAT

Cec: MT_Claim_SG

Subject: Re: Our Ref: 18/18/18/VP05/020391 Your Ref: LCH.lg/SM5L-80141.18 Accident involving SKR1594X &
SINBO28B along Joo chiat Place on 8/2/18 List of surveyors

Dear Sirs,
We refer to the above matter and to your fax dated 14 February 2018.

Our client hereby nominate Mohammed Rasul named in your list serial no 7 to conduct the pre-repair
survey of the damages lo our client's vehicle arising out of the above mentioned accident.

Please bz informed that our client's vehicle, SUN 8028 B is currently laying at our client's workshop,
Siong Lee Motor, 160 Sing Ming Drive #02-07 AutoCity Singapore 575722,

Contact Person :Mr Tan / Ms Kwee Pin
Telephone : 6453 1255



Kindly proceed to do the needful.

Thanks & regards

Catherine

CHEONGHOH LAW CORPORATION

BIk 33 Chin Swee Road #03-005

Singapore 160053

T: 6337 8700 | F: 6337 3700 | E: mail @cheonghoh.sg

On 20 Feb 2018, at 3:47 PM, ERIC WODO JUN KIAT <ericwoo @ lonpac.com> wrote:

Dear Melody,

Please revert by tomorrow, else we will proceed to appoint LKK Auto Consultants
Pte Ltd to survey SIN 8028B.

Kindly advise the workshop to conduct survey.
Thank you.

Best Regards,

Eric Woo

Claims Executive | Lonpac Insurance Bhd

300 Beach Road, #17-04/07 The Concourse, Singapore 199555
Tel: (65) 6279 9253 | Fax: (65) 6296 3767

From: Cheong Hoh Lee [mailto:mail@cheonghoh.sq]
Sent: Tuesday, 20 February, 2018 2:56 PM

To: ERIC WOO JUN KIAT

Cc: MT_Claim_SG

Subject: Re: Our Ref: 1B8/18/18/VP05/020391 Your Ref: LCH.lg/SM5L-80141.18 Accident invalving
SKR1594X & SINS02BB along Joo chiat Place on B/2/18 List of surveyars

Hi Eric,

As spoken. we will revert 1o you by tomorrow.

Regards,

Melody

Cheonghon Law Corporation
Blk 53 Chin Swee Road #03-05
Singapore 160053

Tel: 6337 8700

Fax: 8337 3700



On Feb 19. 2018, at 12:46 PM. ERIC WOO JUN KIAT <ericwoo® lonpac.com>
wrole;

Dear Sir/Mdm,
Kindly refer to our attachment and our fax on 14 February 2018.

Please advise if you are agreeable to our list of surveyors as single
joint expert and the workshop to conduct survey.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Eric Woo

Claims Executive | Lonpac Insurance Bhd

300 Beach Road, #17-04/07 The Concourse, Singapore 199555
Tel: (65) 6279 9253 | Fax: (65) 6296 3767

<|9022018124242 pdf>



Jas Khine !LI{I{Autu!

From: Jas Khine (LKKAuto)

Sent: Wednesday, 28 February 2018 2:46 PM
To: '"GERALD POH WEE BIN'

Cc MT_Claim_SG; Admin A

Subject: RE: POLICY NO - Z/18/VP05/016941
Dear Gerald,

Below content duly noted and will submit wp report to your good office.
Thank you.

Best Regards,

Jas Khine | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841-2028 | email: jaskhine@Ikkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: GERALD POH WEE BIN [mailto:geraldpoh@lonpac.com)
Sent: Wednesday, 28 February 2018 2:39 PM

To: Jas Khine (LKKAuto) <jaskhine @lkkauto.com>

Cc: MT_Claim_5SG <mt_claim@lonpac.com>

Subject: RE: POLICY NO - Z/18/VP05/016941

Dear Jas,

We shall proceed to write to the third party to reject their claim.
You may close your file and forward your bill to us.

Best Regards

Gerald Poh

Senior Claims Executive | Lonpac Insurance Bhd

300 Beach Road, #17-04/07 The Concourse, Singapore 199555
Tel: (65) 6250 7388 Ext.255 | Fax: (65) 6296 2706

From: Jas Khine (LKKAuto) [mailto:jaskhine@|kkauto.com]
Sent: Wednesday, 28 February, 2018 1:48 PM

To: GERALD POH WEE BIN

Ce: MT_Claim_SG

Subject: RE: POLICY NO - Z/18/VP05/016941

Dear Gerald,

As per video, Ol vehicle also rolled back slightly. However, at the time of the collision Ol vehicle fully stopped and being
hit by TP. Furthermore, TP was reversing out from side road and should exercise causing before to do so. Therefore,

liability is against TP.



Kindly advise your instruction whether we may proceed to reject the claim first.
Thank you.

Best Regards,

Jas Khine | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone; 6841-2928 | email: jaskhine@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108
81k 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5{408933)

From: GERALD POH WEE BIN [mallto:gera onpac.
sent: Wednesday, 28 February 2018 11:25 AM

To: Jas Khine (LKKAuto) <jaskhine @lkkauto.com>

Ce: MT_Claim_SG <mt_claim lonpac.com>

Subject: RE: POLICY NO - 7/18/VP05/016941

Dear Jas,

Our Insured vehicle is SKR1594X

Best Regards

Gerald Poh

Senior Claims Executive | Lonpac Insurance Bhd

300 Beach Road, #17-04/07 The Concourse, Singapore 199555
Tel: (65) 6250 7388 Ext.255 | Fax: (65) 6296 2706

From: Jas Khine (LKKAutD) ;

Sent: Wednesday, 28 February, 2018 11:23 AM
To: GERALD POH WEE BIN

Cc: MT_Claim_SG

Subject: RE: POLICY NO - Z/18/VP05/016941

Dear Gerald,
Can you have insured vehicle number as I'm unable to trace the case record.
Thank you.

Best Regards,

Jas Khine | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841-2928 | email: jaskhine @lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | $(408933)

From: GERALD POH WEE BIN |mailto:geraldpoh@lonpac.com]
sent: Wednesday, 28 February 2018 11:18 AM

To: Jas Khine (LKKAuto) <jaskhine@|kkauto.com>



Cc: MT_Claim_5G <m i onpac.com>
Subject: FW: POLICY NO - Z/18/VP05/016941

Dear Jas,

Kindly review the video footage before proceeding with the direct settlement.
Based on the footage, it appear that our insured was stationary and not reversing.
We note also that there were 2 jerks to his vehicle.

In addition, the sketch plan drawn by the third party driver does not commensurate
with the video recording provided by our insured.

Best Regards

Gerald Poh

Senior Claims Executive | Lonpac Insurance Bhd

300 Beach Road, #17-04/07 The Concourse, Singapore 199555
Tel: (65) 6250 7388 Ext.255 | Fax: (65) 6296 2706



TEL 6256 3581 FAX: G256 4315

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

51 Ubl Ave 1 #0125 Paya Ubl Industrial Park, Singapare 408533

Reg No: 188807188R GST Reg. No. 19-8607188-R

Affillatod to Federation Internationale Des Exports En Automobiie

LONPAC INSURANCE BHD Ref CC4/LPC18003579/Kyb3g2
417.04107 THE CONCOURSESINGAPORE 1sg5ss DM 01032018 Il“ll”l"lll
Code . LPC2
1. Policy Particulars :- THIRD PARTY CLAIM
Insured Veh. SKR 1584 Veh. Inspected SJN Bo28B
Policy No. Z18VPO5016941 Coverage ($) 0.00
Claim No. 18/18/18/VPD5/020391 Excess ($) 000
Assign From ERIC Assign Date 22/02/2018
2. Vehicle Particulars & Condition
Make & Model BMW X3 (A) c.C 1987
Engine No. HIDDEN Year of Reg. 2018
Chassis No. WEAWYS20000RE9723 Colour METALLIC SILVER
Odometer 35666 Steering IN ORDER
Brakes IN ORDER Modification STANDARD ALLOY RIM
General GOOD
3. Conditions of Tyres [ =
Size Make Balance
R/H Front Tyre |245/50 R18 PIRELLI 5 mm
L/H Front Tyre |245/50 R18 PIRELLI & mm
R/H Rear Tyre |245/50 R18 PIRELLI B mm
L/H Rear Tyre |245/50 R18 PIRELLI B mm
4, Description of Damages
THE VEHICLE SUSTAINED DAMAGES AT THE REAR N/S PORTION
DAMAGES SEE DETAILS
5. General Information
Accident Date  08/02/2018 [inspection Date 2210212018
Survey held at  SIONG LEE MOTOR
SIN MING INDUSTRIAL ESTATE BLOCK 12 SECTOR B
;?I'l g:PCI RE 575656,
5a. Remarks
AJTHE INSPECTION WAS CONDUCTED ON A"WITHOUT PREJUDICE" BASIS.
B)IN ACCORDANCE TO YOUR INSTRUCTIONS, WE HAVE NOT AUTHORISED REPAIRS.
5b. Estimate Days of Repair

|ESTIMATED NORMAL PERIOD FOR REPAIR 2 Working Days




y L7 LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

il i B a 51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park. Singapore 408833
TEL G256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315
Reg. Mo: 188607T18BR GST Reg. No. 19-88607188-R Page No.:1 ol 1
ADJUSTMENT ON REPAIR COST FOR VEHICLE NO. SJN B028B
- ———— : > T
Qty Description of Parts Condition | ~stmete B [ OV g
REPLACEMENT OF PARTS
1|REAR BUMPER * CHECK 1,509.45 -
2|REAR BUMPER REINFORCEMENT * CHECK 738.05 -
1|REAR BUMPER PAD DENTED / CUT 480.20 48020
1|REAR BUMPER LOWER GARNISH SERVICEABLE 388.70 .
LESS 10% DISCOUNT -308.74 -48.02
2 787 BB 432 18
ILABOUR
LABOUR TO SPRAY PAINT 400.00 280.00
LABOUR TO PANEL BEATING 350.00 250.00
T50.00 530.00
GRAND TOTAL 3,517.66 962.18
RECOMMENDED COST OF REPAIRS = [ es21s
(EXCLUDE CHECK ITEMS 75 NETT) : - - M

Report Ref No. CC4/LPC18003578/Kyb3g2

y 4%a

KOMNG SENG CHEONG
Licensed Appralser

CISCLAMBMER OF LIABILITY TO THIRD PARTIES:. Thin Report is made solely for the use and benefil of ite Clienl named on s ronl pege of this Repon.




