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Admin-A (LKK Auto)

From: Elaine Cheong [elaine.cheong@eqinsurance.com.sg]
Sent: Friday, 4 April, 2014 10:43 AM
To: Admin-A (LKK Auto)
Cc: KKLau; Kathy Lai
Subject: RE: Direct Settlement - Accident Involving SGH 6506T (OI : EQI - DM14/420-EC) & SHD 

5795R  (TP : LKK REF - CC3/EQI14004698/Kra3) on 09.03.2014
Attachments: OI SAS REPORT - SGH6506T.pdf

Dear Mei Kwan, 

 

As requested, attached a copy of our insured’s SAS report for your perusal. 

 

 

Thank you and Best Regards, 

 

Elaine Cheong 

Senior Executive, Claims 

 

EQ Insurance Company Limited 

22 Gemmill Lane, Singapore 069257 

DID  : 6500 6772 

Tel   : 6223 9433 

Fax   : 6223 4190 

Website: www.eqinsurance.com.sg 

 

From: Admin-A (LKK Auto) [mailto:admin-a@lkkauto.com]  

Sent: Friday, April 04, 2014 9:25 AM 

To: Elaine Cheong 
Cc: KKLau; Kathy Lai 

Subject: RE: Direct Settlement - Accident Involving SGH 6506T (OI : EQI - TBA) & SHD 5795R (TP : LKK REF - 

CC3/EQI14004698/Kra3) on 09.03.2014 

 

WITHOUT PREJUDICE                                                    URGENT 

 

Dear Elaine, 

 

We refer to our below email. 

 

Kindly let us have a copy of your insured’s GIA report. 

 

Thank You. 

 

Best Regards, 
Mei KwanMei KwanMei KwanMei Kwan    

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

DID: 6366 0055 

FAX: 6741 4108 

EMAIL: admin-a@lkkauto.com 

 

From: Admin-A (LKK Auto)  

Sent: Thursday, 13 March, 2014 4:26 PM 
To: 'Elaine Cheong' 

Cc: KKLau; Kathy Lai 
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Subject: Direct Settlement - Accident Involving SGH 6506T (OI : EQI - TBA) & SHD 5795R (TP : LKK REF - 

CC3/EQI14004698/Kra3) on 09.03.2014 

 

WITHOUT PREJUDICE 

 

Dear Ms. Elaine, 

 

We refer to the above matter. 

 

This is a TP direct settlement case. We had inspected TP vehicle SHD 5795R at Trans-cab Auto Services Pte Ltd. 

 

Enclosed herewith a copy of TP’s GIA report , estimated cost of repair and preliminary advice for your perusal. 

 

Meanwhile, kindly let us have a copy of your insured’s GIA report for our necessary action. 

 

Kindly take note that the case handler in-charge is Kathy and she can be contacted at DID: 6841 2928. 

 

Thank You. 

 

Best Regards, 
Mei KwanMei KwanMei KwanMei Kwan    

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

DID: 6366 0055 

FAX: 6741 4108 

EMAIL: admin-a@lkkauto.com 

 

 

 


