Mei Kwan (LKKAuto)

From: Jas Khine (LKKAuto)

Sent: Thursday, 22 February, 2018 11:23 AM

To: Ng Wai Yin

Cc: Bazlin Ahmad; Mei Kwan (LKKAuto)

Subject: FW: EQ REF : DM14HO00420 ~SGH6506T - TCS REF: AAD1403-102--Accident

involving SGH6506T & SHD5795R on 09.03.14 *** LKK REF -
CC3/EQI14004698/Kya3n2

Attachments: image004.wmz; image012.wmz; SHD5795R 09.03.2014 - GIA.pdf, AAD1403-102 -
LOD.pdf

Follow Up Flag: Follow up

Flag Status: Completed

Categories: HMK

Dear Wai Yin,

Noted with received.

We will look into the matter and will revert to you with our offer soon.

Dear Mei Kwan,

Please reopen the case with -1 and let me have the file for my further action.
Thank you.

Best Regards,

Jas Khine | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841-2928 | email: jaskhine@Ikkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Ng Wai Yin [mailto:waiyin.ng@transcab.com.sg]

Sent: Thursday, 22 February 2018 11:17 AM

To: Jas Khine (LKKAuto) <jaskhine@lkkauto.com>

Cc: bazlin.ahmad@eginsurance.com.sg

Subject: RE: EQ REF : DM14HO00420 ~SGH6506T - TCS REF: AAD1403-102--Accident involving SGHE506T &
SHD5795R on 09.03.14 *** LKK REF - CC3/EQI14004698/Kya3n2

WITHOUT PREJUDICE

Dear Jas

Enclosed is the GIA report and LOD for your action.

Original hard copy will pass to Kenneth’s to bring back your office.
Thank You

Best Regards,

Ng Wai Yin
Finance Department



TEL: 6603 1265 Ext.308

*** please be reminded that all claims correspondence to be send to claims@transcab.com.sg

TRANS-CAB SERVICES PTE LTD
No. 2 Ang Mo Kio Street 63, Singapore 569111

Main Line: (65) 6287 6666 Fax Line: (65) 6287 7764
/"‘"C ﬂg -

Website: www .tfranscab.com.sg

This message is confidential. It may also be privileged or otherwise protected by work product immunity or other legal rules. If
you have received it by mistake, please let us know by e-mail reply and delete it from your system; you may not copy this message
or disclose its contents to anyone. Please send us by fax any message containing deadlines as incoming e-mails are not screened
for response deadlines. The integrity and security of this message cannot be guaranteed on the Internet.

From: Jas Khine (LKKAuto) [mailto:jaskhine@I|kkauto.com]

Sent: Monday, 19 February, 2018 4:00 PM

To: Ng Wai Yin <waiyin.ng@transcab.com.sg>

Cc: Bazlin Ahmad <bazlin.ahmad@eginsurance.com.sg>

Subject: FW: EQ REF : DM14H000420 ~SGH6506T - TCS REF: AAD1403-102--Accident involving SGH6506T &
SHD5795R on 09.03.14 *** LKK REF - CC3/EQI14004698/Kya3n2

Dear Wai Yin,

Further to the below matter.

Please be informed that, we did not received any LOD with supporting documents from your good office up to date.
Therefore, we are unable to look into the matter.

Kindly post out your LOD with supporting documents to LKK office for our further action.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Jas Khine | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841-2928 | email: jaskhine@Ikkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Bazlin Ahmad [mailto:bazlin.ahmad@eginsurance.com.sg]

Sent: Monday, 19 February 2018 2:49 PM

To: Admin A <admin-a@Ikkauto.com>

Subject: EQ REF : DM14HO00420 ~SGH6506T - TCS REF: AAD1403-102--Accident involving SGH6506T & SHD5795R
on 09.03.14

Dear LKK

We refer to the above subject, kindly advise.

Thank You.

Regards,
Lynn Ahmad
Executive | Claims



edinsuronce

EQ Insurance Company Limited

5 Maxwell Road #17-00 Tower Block MND Complex Singapore 069110
did 65 6496 9881 | tel 65 6223 9433 ext 881 | fax 65 6223 4190
WWW.eginsurance.com.sg

W | .
". & Mermber of City state @__BR/ youlve got o friend

Privileged/Confidential information may be contained in this message. If you are not the intended recipient, please notify the sender immediately and delete all copies of it.

From: Ng Wai Yin [mailto:waiyin.ng@transcab.com.sq]

Sent: Monday, February 12, 2018 5:37 PM

To: Bazlin Ahmad

Cc: 'Jasmine Tan'; claims@transcab.com.sg

Subject: TCS REF: AAD1403-102--Accident involving SGH6506T & SHD5795R on 09.03.14

WITHOUT PREJUDICE

Dear Bazlin

We are making a claim against the owner of SGH 6506T.
Kindly let us know the latest claim settlement.

Thank You

Best Regards,

Ng Wai Yin

Finance Department

TEL: 6603 1265 Ext.308

*** please be reminded that all claims correspondence to be send to claims@transcab.com.sg

TRANS-CAB SERVICES PTE LTD
No. 2 Ang Mo Kio Street 63, Singapore 569111

Main Line: (65) 6287 6666 Fax Line: (65) 6287 7764
/""Cﬂg -

Website: www.tfranscab.com.sg

This message is confidential. It may also be privileged or otherwise protected by work product immunity or other legal rules. If
you have received it by mistake, please let us know by e-mail reply and delete it from your system; you may not copy this message
or disclose its contents to anyone. Please send us by fax any message containing deadlines as incoming e-mails are not screened
for response deadlines. The integrity and security of this message cannot be guaranteed on the Internet.



