Mei Kwan (LKKAuto)

From: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto)

Sent: Tuesday, 20 February, 2018 10:13 AM

To: diana@kkimhin.com.sg

Cc: service@kkimhin.com.sg; Admin A; CS A Team

Subject: RE: SFH1998B TP AIG Liability LKK ref. CC6/AIG13014849/Kg2a3 KKH ref. 130483

*** LKK REF: CC6/AIG13014849/Kpa3qg2-1

Follow Up Flag: Follow up
Flag Status: Flagged
Categories: HMK
Dear William,

We are currently preparing report to seek mandate approval from our principal.

Please hold.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Mei Kwan | Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6366 0055 | email: MeiKwan@Ikkauto.com | fax: 67414108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Shirley Hiew (LKK Auto)

Sent: Monday, 19 February, 2018 12:01 PM

To: diana@kkimhin.com.sg; Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@Ikkauto.com>

Cc: service@kkimhin.com.sg; Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>; CS A Team <cs-a@lkkauto.com>
Subject: RE: SFH1998B TP AIG Liability LKK ref. CC6/AIG13014849/Kg2a3 KKH ref. 130483

Dear William,
Thank you for your email.

We will check and revert to you once done.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Shirley Hiew | Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6366-0055 | email: ShirleyHiew@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: diana@kkimhin.com.sg [mailto:diana@kkimhin.com.sg]

Sent: Monday, 19 February 2018 11:46 AM

To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@|kkauto.com>

Cc: service@kkimhin.com.sg; Admin A <admin-a@I|kkauto.com>; CS A Team <cs-a@lkkauto.com>
Subject: Re: SFH1998B TP AIG Liability LKK ref. CC6/AIG13014849/Kg2a3 KKH ref. 130483




Hi Hsiao Tong and Team Admin,

The above refers. Please let us have your reply soonest possible.
Thanks and Happy Lunar New Year

William

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

Sent: Wednesday, February 07, 2018 12:40 PM

To: diana@kkimhin.com.sg

Cc: service@ k kim hin (service@kkimhin.com.sg) ; Admin A ; CS A Team

Subject: FW: SFH1998B TP AIG Liability LKK ref. CC6/A1G13014849/Kg2a3 KKH ref. 130483

Without Prejudice

Hi William,

Thank you for your email.

Hi Team Admin,

FYNA. CC6/AIG13014849/Kza3g2

“Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of resolving
the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be deemed / inferred
from this negotiation of terms/settlement.

In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the issues
of liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement.”

Best Regards,

Hsiao Tong, Chew | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6742-3197 | email: chewht@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: diana@kkimhin.com.sg [mailto:diana@kkimhin.com.sg]

Sent: Wednesday, 7 February 2018 12:23 PM

To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@|kkauto.com>

Cc: Service KKH <service@kkimhin.com.sg>

Subject: Re: SFH1998B TP AIG Liability LKK ref. CC6/AIG13014849/Kg2a3 KKH ref. 130483

Hi Hsiao Tong,
As spoken, attached are the documents for your attention.

Please look into this matter and let us have your reply soonest possible.



Thanks
William

From: diana@kkimhin.com.sg

Sent: Friday, October 13, 2017 2:42 PM

To: ashleychong@Ilkkauto.com

Cc: Hsiao Tong ; Service KKH

Subject: SFH1998B TP AIG Liability LKK ref. CC6/A1G13014849/Kg2a3 KKH ref. 130483

Hi Ashley,
We refer to the above.

In the midst of checking, we noted that payment have not been received by us. Can you please check and
let us know soonest possible.

Fyi, the signed DV was given to Kenneth on 16 Jun 2015.
Thanks & Warm Regards,
William

K. Kim Hin Auto Pte. Ltd.
Tel: 6452 7018 (Ext. 103)



