15152010 ) 1&/‘ q '; LKK:
INS. CASE OWNER: CC 4/ FWD1 %O / s e N
ASSIGNMENT
DOI: ime ° 7’3 ( 0 \,{ ‘g
Surveyor: . Date / Time : g
Registered in Merimen: }3 iy ‘Q
Pre-assign / CCU/ FTE ~— ‘
Insured Vehicle No. £ \)u q lg L Claim No.
Name of Insured Policy No.
Insured Tel No. HP: N Make / Model
Excess Sec II :S§ D.OA: M. 'I Place of Accident :
Is driver the owner? ( YES / NO ) Nature of Accident :
If NO, Driver Name / Age : Ol GIA REPORT: YES / NO ; TP GIA REPORT: YES / NO
Driver Tel No. : (V/L: YES/NO) Insured Liability : % Final ? Yes/No
INSRS: INSRS: INSRS: INSRS:
}:{:P: "‘ L TW?P: 1\?/??: -\:/?P:
§ : g el:
Liability : M’Y(&WU i Licability : L?ability : Liability :
RMKS: RMKS: RMKS: RMKS:
Date/ Time
Aw U P \p alaar Yaame )y STAGE DATE / PIC
LU YWU4 - ) AN A W L Non-Reporting Itr (1st);
’ Non-Reporting Itr (2nd):
\ an Q v aa A |Non-Reporting ltr (Final):
A\ 7 U" 5 PV INotification Itr (if non-pickup):
il "N [CSIPP T T T Call OL
gF SV TT  gwraTe oo After call lir to Ol:
Documentation Check List: Handler  Typist
20 '[/’"8 To C[L/\'C(/( ﬁ& Notification Itr (if non-pickup)
\ D 4 After call lir to OI
\{4 Authorisation To Act:
4 Release Voucher: [ ]
Final Repair Bill:
Car Rental Invoice:
Towing Invoice L_J l_]
LTA/GIA : L
|Medical Bill: | I
PIR: =
Mandate/Reject Instruction: || [ |
LOD L1 [ ]
Payment Breakdown Form:
PRELIMINARY ADVICE Date/Time: Sent By: Post-Repair Photos: L1 [ I
Jomers - ——
FINALIZATION Date/Time: Confirm with: Confirm by:
Repair Cost: S$ ( days) Reduction: % Email [__]call [ |
FINAL SETTLEMENT  Date/Time: Confirm with Emaill__J Cal__J]
Final Liability: % (Agreed / Assessed) BOLA S/N No. : If NO or B 28, Ass. Lia:
Repair Cost: S$
Loss of Rental (LOR): S$ ( days)
Loss of Use (LOU): S$ ($ X days)
Loss of Income (LOI): S§ (8 X days)
LORonly || LOUonly [ JLOoR+LOU[___] LOR+LOI[__] [Tick only one]
GIA/LTA Search S$
Medical: S$ 1) Claim status: Normal/Reject/Private Settle
Disbursement: S$ (e.g. Tow/ Independent ) 2) Report Format:
Legal Cost S$ 3) Survey fee:
Total: SS$ Global Sum S§:
FINAL PAYMENT Date/Time: Confirm with: Email__| canl |
Payee 1: S$ Name 1:
Payee 2: (Strike if N.A.) S$ Name 2:
Payee 3: (Strike if N.A.) S$ Name 3:




Nivitha (LKK Auto)

From: clara.li@fwd.com
Sent: Friday, 23 February 2018 12:07 PM
To: assignments@lkkauto.com; admin-a@Ikkauto.com; admin-d@Ikkauto.com;
sur@lkkauto.com
Cc AsherSng@lkkauto.com; motorclaims.sg@fwd.com
Subject: FW: Accident Involving SLT4110S & SJU7351L On 21/02/18
Attachments: SLT4110S GIA Report.pdf; Estimate Before Survey.pdf
3|12

| 1233 @ 23/ e

Hi LKK team,

powor © S hausty
Please refer to the email below and liaise with TP repairer for survey arrangement. \[dl“‘(JL nNot N

Attached is the repair estimate, TP GIA report.
Please explore direct settlement with TP repairer and create the case in Merimen.

Thank you.

Kind Regards
Clara Li
Senior Executive, Claims

FWD Singapore Pte. Ltd.
6 Temasek Boulevard, #18-01 Suntec Tower Four, Singapore 038986

T (65) 6727 5722
E clara.li@fwd.com
W fwd.com.sg
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Limited time offer!

From: Shawn Chua / TCAC [mailto:shawnchua@tanchong.com]
Sent: Friday, 23 February, 2018 11:53 AM
To: Motor Claims SG - SG Common

Cc: Kelvin Heng / TC AUTO CLINIC
Subject: Accident Involving SLT4110S & SJU7351L On 21/02/18

Dear Sir/Madam,

Our customer holds your insured driver, SJU7351L liable for the accident on 21/02/18 and would like to claim against your insured
driver. We hereby inquire whether you would like to have a direct settlement with our customer, SLT4110S.

If you minded to reach an amicable direct settlement with our customer, please let us have your substantive reply strictly by 28/02/18.
1



Otherwise our customer will proceed in a manner that he deems fit.

Kindly let me know when I can arrange a survey appointment with the owner.

Attached herewith the GIA Report and estimate of repair cost for SLT4110S.

Regards,

Shawn Chua

Service Executive

TC AutoClinic Pte Ltd
25 Leng Kee Road
Singapore 159097
DID: +65 67038515
HP: +65 96450023
Fax: +65 64795019
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ATTENTION:

The email and any attachments transmitted with it are private and confidential and intended solely for the
use of the individual or entity to whom they are addressed. If you have received this email in error, please
notify the sender immediately and delete this email and any attachments from your system. You should not
use, disclose, copy or store this email and any attachments.

Messages and attachments are scanned for all viruses known. However, you are advised that you open any
attachments at your own risk. If this message contains password-protected attachments, the files have NOT
been scanned for viruses by our mail domain. Please always scan for viruses before opening any
attachments.



