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Vic (LKKAuto)

From: Vic (LKKAuto)

Sent: Tuesday, 8 May, 2018 2:03 PM

To: Admin-D (LKKAuto); 'Ryder Auto workshop'

Cc: assignments; Admin A; Vic (LKKAuto); Bevan Lim (LKK Auto)

Subject: RE: SLR 8469S ( RYDER AUTO) - FINALISATION

Without Prejudice 

 

Dear Mr Chan, 

 

Noted with thanks. 

 
Best Regards, 

Vic Alpeh | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6841-2096 | email: vicalpeh@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

Save the Earth. Print only when necessary.Save the Earth. Print only when necessary.Save the Earth. Print only when necessary.Save the Earth. Print only when necessary. 

 

 

This e-mail contain confidential and privileged material, and are for the sole use of the intended recipient. Use or distribution by an 
unintended recipient is prohibited, and may be a violation of law. If you believe that you received this e-mail in error, please do not 
read this e-mail or any attached items. Please delete the e-mail and all attachments, including any copies thereof, and inform the 
sender that you have deleted the e-mail, all attachments and any copies thereof. Thank you. 

 

 

From: Admin-D (LKKAuto)  

Sent: Tuesday, 8 May, 2018 11:15 AM 

To: 'Ryder Auto workshop'; Vic (LKKAuto) 

Cc: assignments 

Subject: RE: SLR 8469S ( RYDER AUTO) - FINALISATION 

 
Dear Mr Chan, 

 

Thank you for your email. 

 

Dear Vic, 

 

Kindly take note. 
 

Best Regards, 

Catherine Chong | Admin  

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6741-8434 | email: assignments@lkkauto.com  | fax: 6256-4315 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

 

From: Ryder Auto workshop [mailto:ryderautoworkshop@gmail.com]  

Sent: Tuesday, 8 May, 2018 10:58 AM 
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To: Catherine Chong (LKK Auto) <admin-d@lkkauto.com> 

Subject: Fwd: SLR 8469S ( RYDER AUTO) - FINALISATION 

 
Dear Catherine, 
 
As spoken this morning, please take note of this case.  Hold on to the estimate.  Do not submit to 
insurance.  We need to negotiate with your surveyor on the finalised amount.  We will arrange asap. 
 
rgds 
 
san choon 
 
 

 
1 Kaki Bukit Ave 6, #01-56, Autobay @ Kaki Bukit, Singapore 417883 
Fax: 64815390 

 

5 Tuas Ave 3 BS Logistics Hub Singapore 639405 

Fax: 64815390 

 
 
---------- Forwarded message ---------- 
From: Ryder Auto workshop <ryderautoworkshop@gmail.com> 
Date: Mon, Apr 9, 2018 at 8:17 AM 
Subject: Re: SLR 8469S ( RYDER AUTO) - FINALISATION 
To: "Wilson (LKKAuto)" <wilson@lkkauto.com> 

Dear Wilson, 
 
Pls hold on to your report.  Don't submit yet because we need to adjust the amount. 
 
Tks 
 
san choon 
 
On Fri, 6 Apr 2018, 10:30 Wilson (LKKAuto), <wilson@lkkauto.com> wrote: 

Dear Ryder Auto, 

  

I  would like to finalised the above @$7000 / 6 Days Repair ( Subject to Insurance Approval ). 

  

Kindly revert to us back in due course. 

  

Thanks with best regards. 
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Wilson 

Surveyor 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Hp - 96404178 

 


