Vic (LKKAuto)

From: Ryder Auto workshop <ryderautoworkshop@gmail.com>

Sent: Friday, 22 June, 2018 6:02 PM

To: Vic (LKKAuto)

Subject: Re: Your Ref: SLR 8469S_Accident involving Vehicles SLB 4401Y AND SLR 8469S ON
23.02.18

Dear Vic,

As explained multiple times, we cannot accept $9,500. Too Low, Please adjust to $11,000.
Please close this case asap.
rgds

san choon

1 Kaki Bukit Ave 6, #01-56, Autobay @ Kaki Bukit, Singapore 417883
Fax: 64815390

5 Tuas Ave 3 BS Logistics Hub Singapore 639405
Fax: 64815390

i

On Fri, Jun 22, 2018 at 5:52 PM, Vic (LKKAuto) <vicalpeh @lkkauto.com> wrote:

Without Prejudice

Dear San Choon,

Accident involving Vehicles SLB 4401Y AND SLR 8469S ON 23.02.18

We refer to the above matter.



After further review, we would like to finalize the COR @ L/S $9,500.00 with 6 Repair Days (Subject to
our principal’s approval).

Thank you.

Best Regards,
Vic Alpeh | Case Handler
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841-2096 | email: vicalpeh@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)
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