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LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Fark, Singapore 408933
TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315

Reg. No. 199607198R GSET Reg. No. 19-9607198-R

Affiliated to Federation Internationale Des Experts En Automobile

AXA INSURANCE PTELTD

8 SHENTON WAY #24-01

Ref : CS/ASM18003417/R1qd3

AR TONERSNGAPORE o ooe: ez
Code: ASM
1 Policy Particulars :- OWN DAMAGE
Insured Veh. Veh. Inspected SDF 2626C
Policy No. Coverage (§) 0.00
Claim No. SaMo08J1 Excess ($) 600.00
Assign From SMARTCLAIM (YWONNE ANG) |Assign Date 22/02/2018
ol Vehicle Particulars & Condition
Make & Model c.c ]
Engine No. HIDDEM Year of Reg.
Chassis No. Colour
Odometer . Steering
Brakes Modification
General
3 Conditions of Tyres
Size Make Balance
R/H Front Tyre mm
L/H Front Tyre mm
R/H Rear Tyre mm
L/H Rear Tyre mm
4, Description of Damages
5 General Information
Accident Date  06/02/2018 Inspection Date
Survey held at FRESTIGE AUTOC
181 TANJONG KATONG ROAD SINGAPORE 438933
Sa. Remarks
A)THE MARKET VALUE IS S§emamee-- -—(EST. AVERAGE)

BYIN ACCORDANCE TO YOUR INSTRUCTIONS, WE HAVE AUTHORISED REPAIRS.




212012018 Claim Portal

LEK AUTO CONSULTANTS PTE LTD (OD) - Ml

« Service Request Details

Claim
S8MO008JI

Reference

None &

Loss Date
February &, 2018

Reguest Date
February 20, 2018

Due Date
February 27, 2018

Vendar Name
LKK AUTO CONSULTANTS PTE LTD (OD)

Type of Loss
Own Damage

Services
Accelerated survey and authorize

Actions

MNext Step
Agree to perform service

Decline Work || Accepl Worl

Vehicle Information

Incident Vehicle Registration #
SDF2626C

Make
MERCEDES

hitps:/ivp smartclaims.axa.com.sg/claim-porlalhtmlindex-vendor-service-requests. himi#/service-requests/?service RequestNumber=31177

mLl
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212012018 Claim Portal

Menu

Service Address

Primary Contact/Insured

KOH SIOW CHUANG ALBINA
27 CLAYMORE ROAD, #13-01 THE CLAYMORE, 229544, Singapore
96710575

Claim Handler

ANG Yvonne
6568804461
yvonne.ang@axa.com.sg

Additional Instructions
EXCESS 400

Messages Invoices History Documents Assessment Metrics Motes

https:ivp.smariclaims.axa.com.sg/claim-partalhtmlindex-vendor-service-requests. himi#/servica-requesis/?service RequestNumber=31177

212



Shiau Chan (LKKAuto)

From: Shiau Chan (LKKAuto)

Sent: Wednesday, 19 September 2018 1:48 PM
To: ‘Prestige Chong’

Subject: RE: SDF2626C

Dear June,

WITHOUT PREJUDISE

As spoken with you last Friday (14/09/2018).
The repair cost should be at Lump Sum $8,850.00 instead of 511,109.90 before excess $600.00.

Kindly amend your discharge voucher and tax invoice to repair cost at Lump Sum $8,850.00 and send it back to us.

Best Regards,

Shiau Chan (Ms) | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: siewsc@Ilkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315 Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1,
#02-25 | S(408933)

————— Original Message-----

From: Prestige Chong <prestige.chong@gmail.com>
Sent: Tuesday, 27 March 2018 5:29 PM

To: Shiau Chan [LKKAuto) <siewsc@lkkauto.com>
Subject: Re: SDF2626C

Hi Shiau,
Please find attached invoice for your persual.

Thanks and regards
June

On 2/28/18, Shiau Chan (LKKAuto) <siewsc@Ilkkauto.com> wrote:
> Dear June,

>

> Received with thanks.

>

> Best Regards,

> Shiau Chan (Ms) | Case Handler

> LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

> Phone: 6256-3561 | email: siewsc@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315 Blk 51,
> Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

>

> -----Original Message-—-

> From: Prestige Chong [mailto:prestige.chong@gmail.com]

> Sent: Wednesday, 28 February 2018 3:16 PM

> To: SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>

> Subject: SDF2626C

=

> Hi,



a/18/2018 Claim Paortal

« Re:2ND IA OF VEHICLE SDF 2626C UPLOADED

Type
@ Question

Message
LUMP SUM REVISE TO $8850 BEFORE EXCESS. PLEASE PROCEED

hitps:/'vp.smartclaims.axa.com.sgfclaim-portal/htmlfindex-vendor-service-req uests himig/service-requestsiview-message/7serviceRequesiNumbe... 11



gra/2018 Claim Portal

<« 2ND IA OF VEHICLE SDF 2626C UPLOADED

Type
© Question

Message
Dear Yvonne, please be informed that 2nd 1A of vehicle SDF 2626C uploaded. Damages consistent. repair
cost economical, kindly approve on supplementary. we will re-finalise repair cost with repairer. - Shiau Chan

hitps:/ivp. smariclaims.axa com sg/claim-portalhtmifindex-vendor-service-requests. himi#(service-requests/view-message/7seniceRequestiNumbe .. 111
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51 LB AVE L, #0125 PAYA LB NN CTRIAL FAREK, SIMGAPURE SR8 FEL @ (BaSy 62EaASAT FAN & (UmS) GrEnA AL E

Immediate Advice
To : AXA Insurance Pte Ltd Date: 14/09/18

Survey Details:

Date of loss 6-Feb-18
Date of appointment 20-Feb-18
Date of survey 21-Feb-18
Lacation of survey PRESTIGE AUTO
Vehicle Details:
Claim Type: Own Damage
Vehicle number SDF 2626C
Make and Model MERCEDES CLK200ML
Date of registration 5/10/2000
Excess S 600.00
Market Value 5 22,000.00
Parf Rebate 5 10,633.00
Mett Loss S 11,367.00
Repair details:
[Initial Estimate B 18,677.79 |(EST $16,677.79 +

SUPP $2,000.00)
Proposed/Revised repair cost:

Parts 5 8,429.90
Check items (estimate) 5 -

Labour 5 2,680.00
Total 5 11,109.80
Lump Sum(if applicable) s 8,850.00

|Number of days for repair | 9 |
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S LD AVE I, #1.22 PAYA URBI INDUSTRIAL PARK, SINCGAPORE JBR9L0 TEL @ (065 62561561 FANX - (aS) 256itis

Remarks:

KINDLY APPROVE ON SUPPLEMENTARY,

DAMAGES CONSISTENT. REPAIR COST ECONOMICAL.

Mandate:
Liability(TP) %
Proposed repair cost 5
Loss of use 5 |no. of days
Loss of rental 5{no. of days
Loss of income S{no. of days
LTA search fees S
Others S

Proposed Total #VALUE!
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; LETTER OF UNDERTAKING! AUTHORIZATION FOR LUMP SUM REPAIR 5

.1, Neme) (Nric) KOH SToW CHUANG, NLBINA he  owner :

authorized driver of vehicle [Registration No. . ("Vehicla") do hereby ;

Dot : gu!i‘mrizu the [Werkshop/insurer] to repalr the Vehicle on a lump sum basis instead of part !
:: o ."-.-_..'_ ..'. 3 .--&:' Pﬂﬂ.

2. Th é[‘ﬁﬂlﬂ;@-ﬂﬂﬁ’l@“mﬂ has _gxp!__slhg:i_ o me the difference between lump sum repair and
/SR pork Tenle 0% 1 conwenifefba cf my autharization for lump sur rept for the
1y . o . .- [d-ﬂ_ I. ] .. -:_; T ] J ' . % :. s

1 im:i_tﬁ}uﬁ sum repair;the Workshop may use a mixture of genuine parts,

anufaciurer (OEM) parts, reconditioned and second hand parts to
d | note that the [Workshop/Insurer] will not be furnishing a detailed

prica for such [ump sum repalr.

e P e LKL I B s s e,

Insuranc Pte Lid‘("AXA Insurance") dogs not encourage lump sum
gly recommends repairs for vehicles on a part by part basis

onfim that [ will hold AXA Insurance harmless from any claims
ir.of the Vehicle which | have authorized.

T o R T e A

the:owner of the Vehicle to authorize the lump sum.
a.owner of the Vehicle of the contents of this Letter

R i e e s
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51 UBLAVE 1, #01-25 PAYA UBI INDUSTRIAL PARK, SINGAPORE 408933 TEL : (065) 62563561 FAX (065} 62564315

Your Ref: S§M008JI Date: 23" February 2018

Our Ref: CS/ASMIRB003417/R1gd3

The Motor Claims Department
AXA Insurance Singapore Pte L td

Attn: Yvonne
Dear Sirs/Mdm

PRELIMINARY ADVICE OF VEHICLE NO__SDF 2626C

We thank you for the instruction on _20/02/2018 .

Please be informed that we had conducted the inspection of the abovementioned vehicle
on 21/02/2018 (4.20pm) at the premises of M/s PRESTIGA AUTO and
have the following to report:-

Workshop Estimate Amount : 8% 16.677.79
Revised Estimate Amount : S% 8.553.79
“Check” Items Amount : 8% 6,363.76
Total ' S% 14,917.55 F
Market Value b 22.000.00 .
LTA Reimbursement Value 1 8% 10,633.00
Nett Value 183 11,367.00
Description of Damage: ——
The vehicle sustained damages at the s e —
o/s front portion. front
offside

Comments/ Present Status:

Damages consistent.

Pending for Lump Sum repair letter from repairer
Recommend days of repair: 9 days

We have authorised the repairs.

Yours faithfully

Rasul
Automaobile Assessor



PARF/COE Rebate Enquiry

Enquire PARF/COE Rebate for Registered Vehicle

Vehicle Owner Particulars

Owner |D Type:
Cwner ID:

Vehicle Details

Vehicle No.:

Vehicle to be Exported:
Intended De-registration Date:
Vehicle Make:

Vehicle Model:

Primary Colour;
Manufacturing Year:
Engine No.:

Chassis No.:

Maximum Power Qutput:
Open Market Value:
Original Registration Date:
First Registration Date:
Transfer Count:

Actual ARF Paid:

Intended PARF Rebate Details
PARF Eligibility:

PARF Eligibility Expiry Date:
PARF Rebate Amount:

Intended COE Rebate Details

Singapore NRIC

09712

5DF2626C

No

22 Feb 2018
MERCEDES BENZ
CLK200MLAT
Black

2000
11195632019021

WDB2083442F 169646

$49,140.00
05 Oct 2000
05 Oct 2000
0

$68,796.00

Forfeited

$0.00

https://vrl.Ita.gov.sg/lta/vrl/action/enquireRe bateByPublicBeforeDeregInput?FUNCTI...

Page 1 of 2

22/2/2018



PARF/COE Rebate Enquiry Page 2 of 2

COE Expiry Date; 30 5ep 2020

COE Category: B - Car (1601cc & above)
COE Period(Years): 10

PQP Paid: $40,810.00

COE Rebate Amount: $10,633.00

Total Rebate Amount: $10,633.00

The information contained herein is correct as at 22 Feb 2018

OK

https://vrl.lta.gov.sg/lta/vrl/action/enquireRebateByPublicBeforeDeregInput?FUNCTIL...  22/2/2018



MCC418018568-01 [ Cycle & Carisge indusiries P Lad « Pandan Loop
EMTRY DATE & TIME: Q6022018 16:08
SUBMITTED BY! Lim Xn ¥’

SINGAPORE ACCIDENT STATEMENT

IMPORTANT NOTICE

1. Pleasz report comectly the details of the accident to speed up the claims process,

2. This Form must be complated by the Policyhelder andior the Authorisad Driver,

3. invformation provided must be as truthful and accurate ss possisle. Any wiful misregresentation or witholding of material facts may allow INSurancs Sompanes 1o
repudiate policy ability.

4. The issua and acceptance of this Form by msurance companies is not an admission of palicy liabiity on the part of the insurance companies.

5. Ay false reporting may be referred to the Police for investigation,

6. This repont will be forwarded by the iInsurers of the GIA Records Managament Centre established by tha Genesal Insurance Association of Singapore (GlA) for
archiving and that coples of this report will, for a fas, be made available upon application by interasted partes,

7. By the lodgemant of this rapart to the Insurers. you hereby consent o the archwving of this report at the centre and 1o copies of the report being mede available
aforesaid

ACCIDENT STATEMENT

Date Of Report 06/02/2018 16:08
Date Of Accident 06/02/2018 11:45
Exact Location Of Accident ALONG BUKIT TIMAH RD TOWARDS KHEAM HOCK RD
Country/State of Loss SINGAPORE

DETAILS OF OWN VEHICLE
Vehicle Registration Number SDF2626C
Insured/Policyholder
Mame Of Registered Owner KOH SI0OW CHUANG ALBINA
NRIC No 501209712
Email Address MOEMAIL
Mobile Phone No (LOCAL) +65-967 10575
Alternative Phone No OFFICE-96710575
Vehicle Particulars
Manufacturer MERCEDES-BENZ
Model CLK 200 ML

Exact Purpose for which vehicle was being used at
time of accident

Are you claiming under your own insurance policy

for repair to your vehicle? Lo

If Mo, Please state action {o be taken

Vehicle Category PRIVATE CAR

Insurance Company

Mame of Insurance Company AXA INSURANCE PTE LTD
Type Of Coverage COMPREHENSIVE

Fleat Policy NO

Paolicy Number
Cover Note Number
Driver

Mame of Driver
MRIC Mo

Date Of Birth
Occupation

Date Of Driving Pass
Driving Experience
Gender

Maobile Number

Fax Mumber
Contact Number
EMail Address

GADBS8TTN

KOH SIOW CHUANG ALBINA
§01209712

26/03/1954

INDOOR

23/04/1992

25 YEARS AND 9 MONTHS
FEMALE

(LOCAL) +65-96710575

OFFICE-967 10575
NOEMAIL

Page 1 of 13



Address 18 TREVQSE CRESCENT
Postcode 298032
Was driver an emplovee of the Insured's Company MO

If Mo, Ralationship of the Driver with the Insured ~ OWNER
Vehicle Registration Mumber of Driver's Own B
Vehicla -

Insurance Company of Driver's Own Vehicle -

General Information of the Accident

Type Of Accident COLLISION - HEAD ON COLLISION
Weather Conditions CLEAR

Road Surface DRY

Other Infermation

Was any foreign vehicle involved in this accident? NO
Mumber of vehicles involved in the accident

Was any body injured in the Accidant? NO
Was any injured conveyed o hospital by

ambulance?

Was any other material or property damaged? YES

| have been approached by unknown person|s)

soliciting/offering accident claims assistance. He
Number of Passengers (Including Driver) 2
Details of Police Action

Wasz the accident reported to the police? NO
If Yes,Please state which Police Station

Was notice of intended Prosecution given? NO

If ¥es against whom?
Circumstances of Accident

| WAS DRIVING STRAIGHT, CROSSING BUKIT TIMAH TOWARDS KHEAM HOCK ROAD. AT THE POINT OF CROSSING
BUKIT TIMAH, THE TRAFFIC LIGHT WAS GREEN. VEHICLE B (SKV5248X) WAS DRIVING THE OPPOSITE WAY TOWARDS
MY CAR AND TURNED RIGHT AT THE JUNCTION INTC BUKIT TIMAH INTO MY PATH. AT THAT POINT, OUR CARS
COLLIDED.

Attachment(s)

Are aceident photos available for attachment? YES

Was there any video captured by Car Camera? NO

Was there any audio recorded? [ [n]
Wehicle Registration Number SKW5248X

Vehicle Make/Model/Colour

Detailz Of Properties

Vehicle Category PRIVATE CAR
MName of Driver

NRIC/Passpaort Number

Contact Number

Address

Postcode

Insurance Company Name

Mature Of Damage

Mo, Of Passenger (Including Driver)

Page 2 of 13



Sketch Plan
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Sketch Plan #2
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Sketch Plan #3
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Sketch Plan #4
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Accident Photo
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Accident Photo

08/02/2018 14:52

Page 10 of 13



Accident Photo

Page 11 of 13



Accident Photo
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Addendum Sheet

GENERAL INSURANCE ASSDCIATION OF SINGAPDRE RECORDS MANAGEMENT CENTRE
: 1 m i BaFies Chiay ¥1B-00 Simgapars (ME580
i N m Tel 105) L2248 DOIG e (ES) E224 0000
AR ATRN Ceerabing Howrs | Monday 1a frday, 0000 = 17.00
TR e ATGENE R W TS V% SEEEEDOMME [ GIY Bag Ne  MASDTLTTH

IIMPORTANT NOTE: Please submitthe completed Addendum form to the same Authorised Reporting Centre
with whom you submitted the Original Report.

ADDENDUM

{44 PARTICULARS OF PERSON MAKING THE AMENDMENTS:

Sriginal ReportNo . ".ffﬂ | J Whmﬁ gstrationNo gﬂfc} {"&é {*

M armeas homnin KRIC) ¢ m[” ;%ig J &Ua‘ljalcmlfpimm ‘ ‘5) Oljif \-‘E:i 3 ll. z

[*Vehicle Drover /Vehicle Dwner} ("] Please delete as appfopriate

Address Singapore( I

Contact (Tel) Mobile No

Email Address o

Date of Accident (D 5"—'9 I 8 Time of Accident J !4_5
Place of Accident E).h ‘T':L“ Q W Rd -ﬁ:LHS Kli‘é’ﬂ (et *IGCF L)C'
Insurance Company _l&XA .

(B] ADDITIONALINFORMATION /AMENDMENTS:

| have made a report on the above mentioned accident and would like to Include additional infarmation or
make the following amendments:

EEHEI’? 1o ‘oD Claciu

Vb
T,
Ml

Page 130f 12



1 “Without Prejudica” basis

PRESTIGE AUTO AIR CON ACCESSORIES
191 TANJONG KATONG ROAD SINGAPORE 436993

TEL 6742 6767 FAX6842 3217 " ENOSIRRTY el ik 08 et A
bpact fo final approval rom Insurance Company
Quality Check and Estimated Quotation For Repairs ATy
Ackn
Customer KOH SIOW CHUANG ALBINA chie, J4.Fpo- 2018 -
Address 18 TREVOSE CRESCENT § (298032 Flom iﬂfa CHONC
AnnsT
Attn Make: MERCEDES £
Fax Iadel CLK 200ML
Tal ; . Hp: 98710575 wah Mo SDF2626C Hf ‘idﬂ'fﬂﬁﬁ’
We thank you for your endguiry and are pleased to submit our guatation cost of repair for your vehicle as follows | -
1A}
.ﬂl Descriplon ! Qty I Taotal (5) qd
1 FRONT FOG LIGHT RIGHT 1 = aa |SUE
2 HEADLAMP UNIT RIGHT LEFT SIDE TRAFFIC 1 - 102862 | CRk T
4  STIFFENING HEAD LAMP PANEL RIGHT FRONT LIGHTING UNIT 1 < z1a24 M ?[F
4 COVERING FRONT CROSS MEMBER OUTER 1 wasa LSt
5 BEAM FRONT CROSS MEMBER INNER ! aose [L XX 2 u){ 1y @ m Yo
& STRUT BRACE PANEL BETWEEN STIFFENING AND CROSS MEMBER 1 140,08 [Pt
7 STIFFENING FRONT CENTRAL 1 274 05 [RS8 L
§ PROTECTIVE GRILLE RAD-GRILLE ! sag e LY ERCBY- Lw
& HOOD BONNET ' - 7se0z AT
10 RAIL RIGHT BUMPER MOUNTING 1 - S8 A1 =
11 IMPACT ABSORBER INSIDE RIGHT 1 7 easT MO T qu‘(
12 IMPACT ABSORBER INSIDE CENTRAL s 108.16 |1 VT
12 COVER BUMPERPANELLING. RIGHT COVER 1 ~ 25.80 AL T fRP LY rupl{'
14 COVER BUMPERPANELLING, CENTRAL TRIM 1 ~ 5578 [ME= y‘b
15 BUMPER BOTTOM 1 sa7 95 (WAL
16 LICENSE PLATE MOULDING s o/ 28611 ®
17 RAIL RIGHT PROTECTOR 1 < 24357 [pard £
18 BUMPER TOP GEPRIMERT 1 143033 (PE7
15 FROMNT FENDER 1 882 .06 P-‘— £
20 CAPACITOR AIC CONDENSER 1 117685 | kg
21 RADIATOR { CHARGING AIR INTERCOOLER | 1 vanTo® 3d ﬂ
72 RADIATOR 1 140884 |7
Sub-Total (A) l 1320779
(B)
No | | Towi(s) LN
27 LABOUR TO REPAIR AND REPLACE FRONT DAMAGED PARTS 1,480T0 Fou X !
24 SPRAY PAINTING ON FRONT AFFECTED AREA | goeT | 1ET9 T
25 REMOVE, REFIX AIR CON SYSTEM AND REFILL GAS g (12 -
26 CHECK WIRING SYSTEM AND REFORCES HEADLAMP aooo |Ye —
27 TO DIAGNOSE AND RESET SYSTEM AFTER REPAIR sz fRO0
28 CHEGHK WHEEL ALIGHMENT M éﬂ =
29 TOWING CHARGES e |
Validity of guote will be 14 days within Singapore Sub-Total (B} | § 3,470.00
Tota (A + B
| B L4 7.71

1 (e above estimale is scceplabie kndly inf us have
¥our aukhorisalion 1o procesd with e repar
Pioase cosmim, sagn,and revar Mis fax,as so0n BR possibls

X
PRESTIGE ALITO AIR CON ACCESSORIES Signature OF Customar Company Stamp
Prectios Autn Bir-Can Arrpgenries i

§91 Tanjong Eatang Hoad
Singapore 43695
ol | [E5] B .

Fax ' [B5) B2 421




PRESTIGE AUTO AIR CON ACCESSORIES
191 TANJONG KATONG ROAD SINGAPORE 436993
TEL:6742 6787 FAX.6842 3277

Customer . AXA INSURANCE PTE LTD Date, 27-Mar-2018
Address © B SHENTON WAY #24-01 AXA TOWER 5068811 Inveice No: PADDOT
Attr - Make, MERCEDES
Fax: 68804740 Model: GLIK 200ML
Tel : 1800 580458848 weh No, SDF2826C
(A}
Mo, Description I_QE I Total (5)
1 |FRONT FOG LIGHT RIGHT 1 414.00)-
2 HEADLAMP UNIT RIGHT, LEFT SIDE TRAFFIC 1 1,028 62| -
3 STIFFENING HEAD LAMP PANEL RIGHT FRONT LIGHTING UNIT 1 214,24
4 |HOOD BONNET 1 1,758.02| -
5 |RAIL RIGHT BUMPER MOUNTING 1 56.81-
& IMPACT ABSORBER INSIDE RIGHT 1 63.67|-
7 COVER BUMPERPANELLING, RIGHT COVER 1 26,69 -
& |COVER BUMPERPANELLING, CENTRAL TRIM 1 55.78|
9 LICENSE PLATE MOULDING 1 256 11|~
10 'RAIL RIGHT PROTECTOR 1 243.57| -
11 BUMPER TOP GEPRIMERT 1 1,430.33|~
12 FRONT FENDER 1 BB2.06| —
13 |FRONT WINDSHIELD 1 1,800.00|CM4 <
{4 FRONT RIGHT WHEEL COVERING X2 (TOP) | 2 200.00| PE#7
15 |LABOUR TO REPAIR AND REPLACE FRONT DAMAGED PARTS _ _ 1,200.00
16 SPRAY PAINTING ON FRONT AFFECTED AREA 1,000.00| -
17 REMOVE, REFIX AIR CON SYSTEM AND REFILL GAS B 120,00 -
18 CHECK WIRING SYSTEM AND REFORCES HEADLAMP 4p.00| -
19 |TO DIAGNOSE AND RESET SYSTEM AFTER REPAIR _ 200.00|-
20 CHECK WHEEL ALIGHMENT o _ 60.00|-
21 TOWING CHARGES _ ] 60.00|,
Sub-Total (&) | - 11,109.80
(B}
No.| | vouaigs)
LESS BASIC OWN DAMAGE EXCESS - KOH SIOW CHUANG ALBINA _ 600.00
WINDSCREEN EXCESS 100.00
Total $10,409.80

PRESTIGE AUTD MR CON ACCESSORIES



PRESTIGE AUTO AIR-CON ACCESSORIES

191 Tanjong Katong Road

Shell Service Station
Singapore 436993

27 MARCH 2018

DISCHARGE VOUCHER

I/We, KOH SIEW CHUANG ALBINA

Hereby acknowledge that my vehicle no, SDF2626C Mercedes CLK 200ML has been repaired to my satisfaction
and collecton =2 -L{‘«*'L-'f-al_,

I/We agree the sum of SGD $10,409.90 to be paid to repairer PRESTIGE AUTO AIR CON ACCESSORIES for such
repairs shall be in full discharge of all claims against the insurance company AXA INSURANCE COMPANY

In respect of all claim against the insurance sustained to my said motor vehicle in the accident which occurred.

isa ! bt

Signature of Owner Signature of Witness

Name: Koh Siew Chuang Albina Name: jv* Yo 1 )

NRIC: 5012058712 NRIC: &%Z ;?,o&:}i(' E?
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PRESTIGE AUTO AIR CON ACCESSORIES

791 TANJONG KATONG ROAD SINGAPORE 436992
TEL:ST42 6787 FAX 6842 3217

Cuslomer . AXA INSURANCE PTE LTD Daie, 27-Mar-2018
Aodress B SHENTON WAY #24-01 AXA TOWER S0D66611 Invoice No. PADCDT

amn: Glraw Claaen Make: MERCEDES

Fax. GBE04T4D Model CLK 200ML
Tel 160C 8804886 WVeh No: SDF2626C
(A
No, Dascription I o ] Total (5}
| 1 LUMP SUM REPAIR COST S - . 885000
TR R HIES SRR SR e = == =il B
L - s e v St e
Sub-Total (A) |S 8.850.00
ll.’.B}

|.ESS BASIC CVYN DAMAGE EXCESS -KOH SOWCHUANG ALBINA

Total §8,250.00

PRESTISE AUTD AR CON ACCESSORIES
Prastige Auty Air-Enn Arcessories

1ul Tanjanyg Katany Road
Singapore 235533

Yel: (65} 6742 8787

ran; [G5] 8542 4717
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PRESTIGE AUTO AIR-CON ACCESSORIES
191 Tanjong Katong Road
Shell Service Station
Singapore 436993

27 MARCH 2018

DISCHARGE VOUCHER

I/We, KOH SIEW CHUANG ALBINA

Hereby acknowledge that my vehicle no. SDF2626C Mercedes CLK 200ML has been repaired to my satisfaction
and collect an 29 MARCH 2018

I/We agree the sum of 5GD 58250.00 to be paid to repairer PRESTIGE AUTO AIR CON ACCESSORIES for such
repairs shall be in full discharge of all claims against the insurance company AXA INSURANCE COMPANY

In respect of all claim against the insurance sustained to my said motor vehicle in the accident which oceurred.

\ v
Whalh

Signature of Owner Signature of Witness

Name: Koh Sgw Chuang Albina Name: t;\ztw-t._ kel

NRIC: 501208712

NRIC S%Z ?ﬁ&.‘}q E:.



LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

i 51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubl Industrial Park, Singapore 408933
- TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315
Req. No: 199607198R GST Reg. No. 19-9507198-R

Affiliated to Federation Internationale Des Experts En Automobile
AXA INSURANCE PTE LTD Ref : CS/ASM18003417/R1gd3s2
8 SHENTON WAY #24-01 _
A TOWERINCAPORE 631 owe: wo0ave [ HHIAINIE
ATTMN: YWONNE ANG Code : ASM

1. Policy Particulars :- OWN DAMAGE

Insured Veh. Veh. Inspected SDF 2626C
Policy No. GADBS9TT/M Coverage ($) 0.00
Claim No. SBMO0BJ1 Excess ($) 600.00
Assign From YWVONNE ANG Assign Date 20/02/2018
7 Vehicle Particulars & Condition
Make & Model MERCEDES BENZ CLK200OML |ec.c 1908
Engine No. HIDDEN Year of Reg. 2000
Chassis No. WDB2083442F 169646 Colour BLACK
Odometer D54977 Steering IN ORDER
Brakes IN ORDER Modification SPORTS RIM
General FAIR
3. Conditions of Tyres
Size Make Balance
R/H Front Tyre |205/55R16 MICHELIN & mm
L/H Front Tyre |[205/55R16 MICHELIN & mm
R/H Rear Tyre |205/55R16 MICHELIN & mm
L/H Rear Tyre |205/55R16 MICHELIN & mm
4. Description of Damages
THE VEHICLE SUSTAINED DAMAGES AT THE O/S FRONT PORTION.
DAMAGES SEE DETAILS
5, General Information
Accident Date  06/02/2018 Inspection Date 21/02/2018
Survey held at PRESTIGE AUTO
191 TANJONG KATONG ROAD SINGAPORE 436993
Sa. Remarks
A)THE MARKET VALUE 1S 5$22,000.00(EST. AVERAGE)
B)IN ACCORDANCE TO YOUR INSTRUCTIONS, WE HAVE AUTHORISED REPAIRS.

Sb. Estimate Days of Repair

ESTIMATED NORMAL PERICD FOR REPAIR: 9 Working Days
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ADJUSTMENT ON REPAIR COST FOR VEHICLE NO. SDF 2626C

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

; 51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408933

TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315
Reg. Mo: 199607186k GST Reg. No. 19-8607198-R

Page No.-1 of 2

Report Ref No. CS/ASM18003417/R1qd3s2

2 Estimate By | Our Adjusted
Qty Description of Parts Condition [ n i t;}l )
REP PART
1IFRONT FOG LIGHT RIGHT {CQNSISTENT} SCRATCHED 414 .00 414,00
1|HEADLAMP UNIT RIGHT, LEFT SIDE TRAFFIC CRACKED 1,028.62 1,028.62
(COMNSISTENT)
1|STIFFENED HEAD LAMP PANMEL RIGHT FRONT LIGHTING |BENT 214.24 21424
UNIT (CONSISTENT)
1|COVERING FRONT CROSS MEMBER OUTER SERVICEABLE 143.52 -
(CONSISTENT)
1|BEAM FRONT CROSS MEMBER INNER (CONSISTENT) SERVICEABLE B10.56 -
1|STRUT BRACE PANEL BETWEEN STIFFENING AND SERVICEAEBLE 140.08 =
CROS5 MEMBER (CONSISTENT)
1|STIFFENING FRONT CENTRAL (CONSISTENT) SERVICEAEBLE 274.05 -
1|PROTECTIVE GRILLE RAD-GRILLE (CONSISTENT) SERVICEABLE 646.18 -
1|{HOOD BONNET (CONSISTENT) BENT 1. 758.02 1. 758.02
1|RAIL RIGHT BUMPER MOUNTING (COMNSISTENT) BENT 56.81 56.81
1|[IMPACT ABSORBER INSIDE RIGHT (CONSISTENT) MISSING B3.67 63.67
1|IMPACT ABSORBER INSIDE CENTRAL (CONSISTENT)  |SERVICEABLE 108.16 :
1|COVER BUMPERPANELLING, RIGHT COVER MISSING 26.69 26.69
(CONSISTENT)
1|COVER BUMPERPANMNELLING, CENTRAL TRIM DEFORMED 55.78 55.78
(CONSISTENT)
1|BUMPER BOTTOM (CONSISTENT) SERVICEABLE 647.95 -
1|LICENSE PLATE MOULDING (CONSISTENT) cuT 256:11 25611
1|RAIL RIGHT PROTECTOR (CONSISTENT) MISSING 243 57 243 57
1|BUMPER TOP GEPRIMERT (CONSISTENT) DEFORMED 1,430.33 1.430.33
1|FRONT FENDER (CONSISTENT) BUCKLED 882.06 882.06
1|CAPACITOR A/C CONDENSER (CONSISTENT) SERVICEABLE 1,176.85 =
1|RADIATOR (CHARGING AIR INTERCOOLER) SERVICEABLE 1,331.70 !
(CONSISTENT)
1|RADIATOR (CONSISTENT) SERVICEABLE 1,498 84 -
1|{FRONT WINDSHIELD (CONSISTENT) (ADDITIONAL) CRACKED 1,800.00 1,800.00
2IFRONT RIGHT WHEEL COVERING (TOP} (CONSISTENT) |DEFORMED 200.00 200.00
(ADDITIOMAL)Y
15,207.79 8,429.90




LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Al BE B 51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408933
g TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315
Reg, Mo. 199607198R GST Reg. Mo, 19-96071%8-R Page No.:2 of 2

Qty Description of Parts Condition \'E::II:T::::?E}J DurA::lsj}uat&d
LABOUR
LAB?ER TO REPAIR AND REPLACE FRONT DAMAGED 1,400.00 1,200.00
PARTS.
SPRAY PAINTING ON FRONT AFFECTED AREA. 1,200.00 1,000.00
REMOVE, REFIX AIR CON SYSTEM AND REFILL GAS. 150.00 120.00
CHECK WIRING SYSTEM AND REFOCUS HEADLAMP. B80.00 40.00
TO DIAGNOSE AND RESET SYSTEM AFTER REPAIR, 420.00 200.00
CHECK WHEEL ALIGNMENT. 120.00 60.00
TOWING CHARGES. 100.00 &60.00

3,470.00 2,680.00

GRAND TOTAL 18,677.79 11,109.50
RECOMMENDED COST OF LUMP SUM REPAIRS 8,850.00
(TO ITS PRE-ACCIDENT CONDITION)
LESS EXCESS -600.00
NETT LIABILITY 8,250.00

Report Ref No. CS/ASM18003417/R1gd3s2

N

MOHAMMED RASUL BIN MOHD YUNUS

Automotive Assessor

3

ADRIAN LING WAI PING

Licensed Appraiser

B.Eng AMSOE AMIRTE AMSAE-A M.MATAI




