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LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
51 Uibl Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubl Industrial Park, Singapore 405933
TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315
Reg. No. 109807198R GST Reg. Mo, 19-8607198-R

Affiliated to Federation Internationale Des Experis En Automobile

AIG ASIA PACIFIC INSURANCE PTELTD Ref : CCB/AIG18003307/Ahb3
78 SHENTON WAY #08-16 |HI|!I|”III|.”I‘I
CHARTIS BUILDING Date : 21-02-2018
SINGAPORE 079120
Code: AIG
1. Policy Particulars :- THIRD PARTY CLAIM
Insured Veh. SFT 33138 Veh. Inspected GBG 2027A
Palicy No. Coverage ($) 0.00
Claim No. Excess (§) 0.00
Assign From Assign Date 21/02/2018
2. Vehicle Particulars & Condition
Make & Model c.c Q
Engine No. HIDDEN Year of Reg.
Chassis No. Colour
Odometer = Steering
Brakes Modification
General
3. Conditions of Tyres
Size Make Balance
R/H Front Tyre mm
L/H Front Tyre mm
R/H Rear Tyre mm
L/H Rear Tyre mm
4, Description of Damages
5 1 General Information
Accident Date  19/02/2018 Inspection Date 21/02/2018
Survey held at MG SOLUTION PTE LTD
23 KAKI BUKIT AVE 4
(SOUTH WING) #02-03B
VICOM INSPECTION CENTRE,
SINGAPORE 415833
Sa. Remarks
AJTHE INSPECTION WAS CONDUCTED ON A"WITHOUT PREJUDICE" BASIS.
)N ACCORDANCE TO YOUR INSTRUCTIONS, WE HAVE NOT AUTHORISED REPAIRS




-

MG SOLUTION PTE LTD
23 Kaki Bukit Avenue 4 (South Wing) #02-03 Singapore 415933
Tel: (+65) 6243 1373 | Fax: (+65) 6243 1376

Reg, No: 201427944N

b

70 . AIG DATE  : 20/02/2018
ATTENTION . MOTOR CLAIMS DEPT JOB TYPE : T/P CLAIM
ESTIMATE REPORT
VEHICLE DETAILS
VEHICLE NO . GBG2027A
MODEL : NISSAN CABSTAR Viie
o1 FLL0 CH61%
CHASSIS NO J /
ACCIDENT DETAILS ~ DATE : 19-Fab-78
TIME : 09:50HRS
THIRD PARTY REQUESTOR / CONTACT :  JACK LI
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Ligl-18310 SN 40
Lorms 30/~ TR8°LY Total $1,620.60
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2|70 SPRAY PAINT AFFECTED AREA $1,00000 i
3| TUFF COAT $250,00[ 3
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Vic (LKKAuto)

From: MG Solution <mg3solution@gmail.com>

Sent: Wednesday, 23 May, 2018 2:46 PM

To: Vic (LKKAuto)

Ce: Asher Sng (LKKAuto); Admin A

Subject: Re: 3rd Party Claim for Accident involving Vehicle GBG2027A & SFT33138 on
19/02/2018

Attachments: T1189135 for GBG2027A (SMG188143).pdf

Your Ref: SFT3313B
Our Ref: GBB2027A

Dear Vic,

We refer to our tele-conversation earlier, we are pleased to accept the offer.
Please find attached TAX INVOICE for your kind onward action.

Tax Invoice No. TI189135 @ 551,391.00 (Inclusive of 7% GST) -Agreed
Loss of Use @ 55600.00 (4 Days x 55150) -Agreed
LTA Search @ 557.45 -Agreed

Please look into the above claim and let us have your payment of $51,998.45 soonest.
Best Regards,

SuWong

MG SOLUTION PTE LTD

No 23 Kaki Bukit Avenue 4

AAS Kaki Bukit Centre

#02-03B Singapore 415933

Tel: 6243 1373 | Fax: 6243 1376

On Wed, May 23, 2018 at 2:37 PM, Vic (LKKAuto) <vicalpeh(@lkkauto.com=> wrote:

Without Prejudice

Dear Su Wong,

We refer to your below email.

Purely for an amicable settlement, we are prepared to accept your counter offer of 51,998.45 (all in).



Kindly forward a copy of the Final Repair Invoice for payment processing.

Thank you.

"Please note that our above offer and any settlement arising from the above offer are made an a without prejudice bosis, and
should not be construed as an admission of liability on our part or on the part of our Insured Driver. Terms of such settlement
shouid also not be disclosed in any other related matter(s) in respect of the accident. Our offer made in respect of this present
matter s mode solely to resolve this matter only. No reference shall be made to this offer or any settlement arising from this offer
in any other related matters.

Best Regards,

Vie Alpeh | Case Handler
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
Phone: 6841-20096 | email: vicalpeh@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

[ .24 T
SeERER  m= Sove the Earthe Print only when pecessary:

This e-mall contain confidential and privileged material, and are for the sole use of the inténded recipient. Use or distnbution by an
unintended recipient is prohibited, and may be a violation of law. If you believe that you received this e-mail in error, please do not
read this e-mail or any attached items. Please delete the e-mail and all attachments, including any copies thereof, and inform the
sender that you have deleted the e-mail, all attachments and any coples thereof, Thank you,

From: MG Solution [mailto:mg3solution@gmail.com|
Sent: Wednesday, 23 May, 2018 12:15 PM
To: Vic (LKKAuto)

Cc: Asher Sng (LKKAuto); Admin A
Subject: Re: 3rd Party Claim for Accident involving Vehicle GBG2027A & SFT3313B on 19/02/2018

Your Ref; SFT33138B

Our Ref: GBB2027A

Dear Vic,



We refer to below email, we would like to counter propose below:

Repair cost $1391.00 (Inclusive of GST) - Agreed

LOU $ 600.00 (4 days x 5150) - Request: including of 1 PRI
LTA Search S 7.45 (Inclusive of GST) - Agreed

Total $1998.45

Best Regards,

Su Wong

MG SOLUTION PTE LTD
No 23 Kaki Bukit Avenue 4
AAS Kaki Bukit Centre
#02-03B Singapore 415933

Tel: 6243 1373 | Fax: 6243 1376

On Wed, May 23, 2018 at 12:07 PM, Vie (LKKAuto) <vicalpeh(@lkkauto.com> wrote:

Without Prejudice

Dear Su Wong,

We refer to your below email.



Purely for an amicable settlement on a without prejudice basis and without admission of liability to our Insured’s
part. We propose a global sum of $1,950.00 (all in) to settle your client’s claim.

Kindly confirm acceptance and forward a copy of the Final Repair Invoice to us a copy for payment processing.
The above amount is to be made payable to MG SOLUTION PTE LTD.

Thank you.

"Plagse note that our above offer and any settlement arising from the above offer are made on o without prejudice basis, and
should not be construed os an admission of liability an our part or on the part of our Insured Driver. Terms of such settlement
should also not be disciosed in any other reloted motter(s) in respect of the occident. Our offer made in respect of this present
matter is made solely to resolve this matter only. No reference shall be made to this offer or any settlement orising from this
offer in any other related maotters,

Best Regards,

Vie Alpeh | Caze Handler

LEK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841-2096 | email: vicalpeh@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Pava Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

LXK e
RER W Sove the Earth- Print only when necessary:

This e-mall contain confidential and privileged material, and are for the sole use of the intended recipient. Use or distribution by
an unintended recipient is prohibited, and may be a violation of law. If you believe that you received this e-mail in efror, please
do not read this e-mail or any attached items. Please delete the e-mail and all attachments, including any copies thereof, and
inform the sender that you have deleted the a-mail, all attachments and any copies thereof, Thank you

From: MG Solution [mailte:mg3solution@gmail.com]
Sent: Friday, 18 May, 2018 10:48 AM

To: Vic (LKKAuto)
Cc: Asher Sng (LKKAuto)
Subject: 3rd Party Claim for Accident involving Vehicle GBG2027A & SFT33138 on 19/02/2018



Your Ref: SFT3313B

Our Ref: GBB2027A

Dear Vic,

Please find attached our LOD for your onward action. Original Copy will send to you by POST.
Please feel free to contact the under mentioned should you require any further information.
Your prompt action will be greatly appreciated.

Best Regards,

Su Wong
MG SOLUTION PTE LTD

Mo 23 Kaki Bukit Avenue 4

AAS Kaki Bukit Centre
#02-038 Singapore 415933

Tel: 6243 1373 | Fax: 6243 1376



MG SOLUTIONPTELTD |\ |
23 Kaki Bukit Ave 4 (South Wing) #02-038 7~
Vicom Inspection Centre, Singapore 415333
Tel: 6243 1373 Fax: 6243 1376
GST Reg. No.: 201427944N

MOTOR CLAIM DISCHARGE
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Tel: 6243 1373 Fax: 6243 1376
(GST Reg. No. 20-1427944-N)

MG SOLUTION PTE LTD

23 Kaki Bukit Ave 4, AAS Kazki Bukit Centre #02-03 Singapore 415833

PROFORMA BILL

Bill To:
AIG ASIA PACIFIC INSURANCE PTE LTD
7TESHENTON WAY

#07-12 AIG BUILDING

SINGAPORE 072120

ATTN : MOTOR CLAIMS DEPARTMENT

Bill No. :

188143

Date : 18-May-2018

Vehicle Number : GBG 20274

Tax Invoice will be issue upon amount finalised.

QTty CLAIM AMOUNT
I |To carried out accident repair as per surveyor's recommendation s 1.300.00
{Lump Sum)
BEFORE GST 1,300.00
% G3T 81.00
TOTAL| § 1,351,00

Please note that our above offer and any settlement arising from the above offer are made on & without
prejudice basis with sole intention of resolving the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal
proceeding. Terms of such seftlement should also not be disclosed in any other related maltter(s) in
respect of the gccident. No reference shall be made to this offer or any settlement arising from this offer

inan

arner e

ted matters.
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Date

T

MG SOLUTION PTE LTD

23 Kaki Bukit Ave 4, AAS Kaki Bukit Centre #02-03 Singapore 415333
Tel: 6243 1373 Fax: 6243 1376 .
(GST Reg. No. 201427944N)

v

: 18/05/2018

Your Ref : SFT3313B

To : AIG ASIA PACIFIC INSURANCE PTE LTD
Attn : Motor Claims Department
Dear Sir/Mdm,

RE: ACCIDENT INVOLVING VEHICLE GBG2027A & SFT3313B ON 19/02/2018 AT
ALONG BEDOK RESERVOIR ROAD TOWARDS EUNOS LINK.

We refer to the above matter.

Attached copies of the following for your kind perusal:

1)

Proforma Bill No.188143 (@ $$1,391.00 (Inclusive Of 7% GST)
Loss of Use @ S5600.00 (4 Days x S5150)

LTA Search (@ S57.45

Authorisation to Act

GIA Report

Hope the above is in order and kindly let us have your confirmation soon.

Tax invoice will be issue upon amount finalized.

Thank You,

Yours faithfully,

Shawon

S.Hm"n.ﬁ Chia

HP: 9188 6931
E-mail: mg3solutionf@ gmail.com
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51 UBI AVE 1, #01-25 PAYA UBI INDUSTRIAL PARK, SINGAPORE 408933 TEL : (065) 62563561 FAX : (06567414108

Our Ref: CC6/AIG18003307/Ahb3

07 MARCH 2018

CHIANG KOON JOO

BLK 232A SERANGOON AVE 2
#11-123

SINGAPORE 551232

Dear Sir/Madam.
ACCIDENT INVOLVING SFT 3313B AND GBG 2027A ON 19/02/2018

We refer to the above accident where we are acting for AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte
Ltd to resolve the claim against you and/or your authorized driver under the Auto
Insurance policy taken up with them.

Based on the accident report and accident scenario, liability is down against us. We will
therefore proceed to negotiate for an amicable settlement with the Third Party.

Should you however wish to further discuss on the matter prior to our negotiations and
settlement, please contact us within 7 days from the date of this letter.

Please note that your No-Claim Discount (NCD)(if any) will be affected and reduced by
30% (20% for commercial vehicles) upon next renewal due to this Third Party claim.
However, if your policy has a NCD protector feature, it will be deemed utilized for this
claim and your NCD will be protected.

Please call us if you have further queries,

Yours faithfully,

BevarrLim

Case Handler

DID: 6749 4274

FAX: 6741 4108

Email: vicalpeh@lkkauto.com

c.c.  AlG Asia Pacific Insurance Pre Lid
(Motor Claims Dept)
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LETTER OF AUTHORITY |

N
Name + COMPLEMWENT PTE. LTP. \J
Address 12 EfE BUbl] Rebp 44U
BHRTLEY Bz CENTRE < (413f07)
Contact No
TG
Allr ASIA PACIFIC (NSUESANCE PTE LTD
Dear Sirs,
ACCIDENT INVOLVING __ G B G »0>Th  anp SFT 23128 on Afe>]>uid
AT/ALONG__PEDUC RESERVOIR RuoAD TowhepS Eunps (nK
W We, COMPLEMENT PTE. 1D , am/are the registered owner of

motor earno. __ 06 & 1 1A

Please note that| have assigned all compensations monies due to me/us In the above said accident
to M/S MG SOLUTION PTE LTD.

I/We, heraby authorize you to rzlease all compensation monies pertaining to the above-mentionad
accidentto M/S MG SOLUTION PTELTD 2nd forward yoursettlementchegque toM/S MG SOLUTION
PTELTD whom | had authorized to collect the said compensation monles.

Thank you

Lcajr

Signature of Claimant Witness 8y
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RELEASE VOUCHER
(AlG Asia Pacific — EXPRESS THIRD PARTY CLAIM)

{"the workshop™) harsby zonfirm that wail
Rave reached an sgreement with the ‘eppainied suveyar of AlG Asla Paoific lhsurance Pis. Ltk
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This Is pursuant to the inspection conducted sn 2oty

{date) at "ths workshop”,

Wedl confirm that we/l srafam authnrzad hy the nuner COUAPUEMENT PO “:hhlrd party claimant”)
of vehicle no, FB& TOTHA o maka the claim as sat out in the sbove paragraph and wejl
authority to setfle the matter on his/her behalf In's manner thet wel
authority given by “the third party claimant’.

hava full
desm fit. We/l enclose herain the lsiler of

We/l further confirm that we/| will Indsminify AIG Asla Pacific insuranca Pts. Lid for all damagsg,
expansa that they will or have slrezdy incurred |n e avant th2t "the third perty claimant” siter s above sajg
sgrasment lodges 3 further clsim sgainst the former for any |uss 2nd expanses suffarsd parizining to costs of
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loes andfor

{vehicla no.)-as a resull

Wedl confim that the spreement rzached sbove s In fult 20d Gnal setlamary of any ciaim of “tha (g papy

slalmant” purstiail 1o the segident 2 thot wriher this satfement i3 raze

123 on 8 without sreludics end without
gdmbssion of lzbillty basis:

This sgmement Is subjact 1o the spplicetion of Singepere 2w 2nd the S
jurigdication over any disouts 2rising ot of the s2ma,

Dzrad s % dey of

Signed by A\’.’.fs"ﬂ’:ﬁamed SUNBYST

™)
Chopped 2 Signed by “ths wor kshog"
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MG SOLUTION PTE LTD

23 Kaki Bukit Ave 4, AAS Kaki Bukit Centra #02-03 Singapore 415933
Tel: 6243 1373 Fax: 6243 1376
(GST Reg, No. 20-1427944-N)

i‘ jf;* X | Lt. A\ J il
Bill To: INVOICE No : T1 189135
AIG ASIA PACIFIC INSURANCE PTE LTD
78 SHENTON WAY PB No : 188143
#07-12 AIG BUILDING
SINGAPORE 079120 Date : 23-May-2018
ATTN : MOTOR CLAIMS DEPARTMENT Vehicle Number : GBG 2027A
aTty DESCRIPTION AMOUNT
1 |To carried out accident repair as per surveyor's recommendation $ 1,300.00
(Lump Sum)
BEFORE GST 1,300.00
7% GST 91.00
TOTAL | 5 1,391.00

L

Co's stamp & Autherised Signature




202012013 Recaipt

X
Land Transport Autharity
10 Sin Ming Drive
Singapaore 575701
GST Registration No. : M4-0006529.2
Frint DateiTime : 20 Feb 2018/ 11:45.01

Recelpt Date/Time : 20 Fab 2018/ 11:45:01

Tax Invoice/Receipt
Receipt No, | [TNET-00000-1680220-000800

Previous Receipt Na.
SN Item Description/ Amount GST Amount
Business Transaction Reference Befors Amount After GST
No. GST (S§) (S8) (S5)
Result of Insurance Enquiry - SFT33138
As at 19 Feb 2018/09:50:00

Insurance Co: AIG ASIA PACIFIC INSURANCE PTE. LTD.
1 Insurance Enquiry - SFT33138

Enquiry Fea 7.00 D49 T.45
201802201144 20086360
Sub-Total T7.00 049 749
Total Before Rounding T.00 045 749
Rounding Difference 0.0=
Total Amount Payable 7.45
Paid By
20180220114424738 E:l‘:‘r”n:f;:nfj:gs Oetl 7.45
Tatal 745
Cash Change 000
Tancerad Amount 745
Excess Refundahls Amount Q.00

THANK YOU AND HAVE 4 NICE DAY

Flease ensure that all payments to the Authority ora good and promptly setiled by the peyment servics
provider / financial Instiution. Otherwise, the transaction and receipt Is cansidered vold and lzte fes
may apply.

hitps fvrl s govsgiishliaclion/complelePayment "FUNCTION ID=F 130100177

111



2202018 Vehicle |rsurance Particulars Enguiry

Vehicle Insurance Particulars Result

Vehicle No. Incident Date/Time Insurance Company Name

SFT3313B 19Feb2018/0%:50:00 AIG ASIA PACIFIC INSURANCE PTE.LTD.

Print OK SaveasPDF

hitps:ihvrl it gov. 2aftasrlactioninsEnquiryPaymentAsk FRUNCTION. ID=F 07050085 TAbZTmNum=ITNET-00000-1 80320- 000800

1"



Merimen e-Claims Page 1 of |

|olCLAIH SUBFULDER"-{PIHﬂh‘lg for 5”]’““? Repﬂrtj

Fastiann
CLAIM SUBFOLDER TRACKING o .
Case | Notifisd Est Subrmitted | Ad) Assigned fﬂ-d; Rpt | Adf Submitted Ins Auth’ed |SwEtes
o | 20Fe8 2018 21Feb 2018 56130000  $1,300.00 oo for Jprvay
Iﬂl | kot may rpt | l Eﬂm“"‘ﬁl; view Rt | u cancel Case |

Raference Claim Details

'CLAIM SUBFOLDER DETAILS [[Created by adjuster]
Insured: | Chiang Koon Joo, _ID: 568354024
:I:DMPL'EHINT PTELTD, Co.Reg. No.: 1388045300

T15/02/2018 09:00 - ;59

; | Bate of Loss! |15 months and 22 Days From LTA Reg Date (Man Yr))
- Palicy/Cover | 2100395679 (Comprahensive)

i L O ke, L U o | NoteNo.: |Coverage: 19/12/2017 - 18/12/2018

Vehicle Reg. | 2
Palicy No.
SFT33138 (Claimant): | 1700021498

L. - S B £ - -
MG Solution Pte Ltd (HQ) 23 Kaki Bukit Avenue 4 #02-038, VICOM Inspaction Centre, 415633 Kaki Bukit - Tel: 91886931
Handling AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte. Ltd. (Express) - Tel: 65-6419-3000 ... [Handled by Mohd-Rasheed, Rashidah - £2151767)
Insiirer:

Claimant's.
| Insurer:

{Adjuster: |

'ASSOCIATED MAIL RECEIVED view All | Compase Case Mail |

-'ﬁm-r! are i;u_;ﬁalr for this r;;e:_

AL ASSOCIATED TASKS™ View All_| _Search Tasks | _Create New Task | _Complete | |

Due Date Priority Type Task Group Subject Handler Assigned By Completed On Created On Done? |
Mo results, [

https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRadjuster&fuseaction=dsp ... 30/5/2018§



Menmen e-Claims

Upicad Documents |  Upload Photos | Compose New Latter | Upload video | Upload Audio |

Claim Documents

*GBGI027A (94558029875G)
[SFT3313B]
™
COMPLEMENT PTE LTD
Feb 19 2018 9:00AM
[Chiang Koon Joo]
MG Solution Pte Ltd

Page | of 2

!Lamuftumnniun:u_ [1 per page ~]| &
[No_|Finallzad On | LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd {HQ) o Thumbnail| Print
Ef: (Draft) | Third Party Express Settlement — Payment Breakdown (i) Edit
===

| Assessment Reports lperpage %
[tio_|Finalized Cn AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte. Ltd, (SG) | [Thumbnail| Print

, Accldent Statement

il._ 2_2:02!15 i Fromu00 - Rag, Wo: SFT33038, Cwimant: CHIANG KO0N JO0 0 | toad S i
|Photos/Images ,|3 per m ]' & |
No_ Relabel /Reorder | LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd (HQ) Thumbmail Print |
lt  [26/D4/1816:31 | General View © | s | (4|
2 26/04/1816:31 | General View B O  oowc | &
3 28/04/1816:31 | General View 0 | s |
‘4 i_gg,.rua;la 16:31 Genaral View O s | B
5 26/04/18 16:31 General View 0 | adis | M
6 26/04/18 16:31 General View 0| tadws | A

7 26/04/18 16:31  General View 0 | wadwe | A
8 |26/04/1816:31 | General View 0 | wars | A

; e e - R 4 B
9 |26/04/18 16:31 | General View 0 | wedwrs | A
10 |26/04/18 16:31 | General View 0 | wadwrs | A |
11 26/04/18 16:31 | General View 0 | adws | B |
12 [26/04/18 16:31 General View | oadirs | A
Documentation B [ per page E: |l
No_|Relabel/Reorder |LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd (HQ) Thumbnail| Print
1 |21/03/18 15:58 | TP GIA REPORT € | Lvad PO

|2 |06/03/18 16:37  |LETTER TO OI B 0 | Load PoF
3 22/05/18 17:51 | TP ESTIMATE - MARKED - | CondPOF |
4 |30/05/180%:33  WORKSHOP INVOICE | Load POF
5 |30/05/18 09:33  AUTHORISATION TO ACT FORM € | Lood FOF
|6 |30/05/18 09:33 | Release Vouchar €Y | Losa FoF
7 |30/05/1809:33 | LTA SEARCH © | ood FoF

Documents Checklist
DOCUMENTS CHECKLIST Reset | Save | Print ||

There are no document checklists configured.

https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRdoc& fuseaction=dsp_doc...

30/5/2018



Merimen e-Claims Page 2 of 2

Dur Checklist Remarks - LKK Auto Co Itants Pte Ltd (HQ)

Show Remarks To! O Handling Insuwrer
Nots! Bemgid gre prvibs ofles you 4how it ko othar parties

https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRdoc& fuseaction=dsp_doc... 30/5/2018



Preview Page | of |

NOTE: TO BE COMPLETED BY SURVEYOR TEAM

THIRD PARTY EXPRESS SETTLEMENT
(PAYMENT BREAKDOWN)

]'Vnhll:ll MNo: SFT3313B (Insd veh) Model: ISSAN CABSTAR 3.0 5M/T
GBG2027TA (TP veh) 2DR 2WD EURO 5 (A)

| Date of Accident: |19/02/2018

Global Sum Settlement [ : ] [ ] Yes I [%] No
Repair Estimale bt 4,896.29
Final Repair Cost -} 1.391.00
Loss of Use ‘% 600.00 4.00 days at $150.00 per day
Rental (if any) 4 0.00 days
LTA | GIA Search Fee - 745
Others: '8 0.00
]
Final Settlement Sum 4 1,998.45

Is Third Party Workshop GIA Registered? [ 1 YES [X ] NO (Kindlyindicate
below)

A) For Non GIA Registered Workshop: Agreed Liability 100 (%)
BOLA Applicable: Yes/ No BOLA Scenario No:

B) For GIA Registered Workshop:

BOLA Liability: (%) Assessed Liability (*): (%)
* Assessed Liability to be filled only for chain collisions and for cases where BOLA doss not apply.
Remarks

Payment Instruction: Payee's Breakdown

1) |MG Solution Ple Ltd 2 1,098 45
2) .5
3 -1
4) . §
JOANNE LEE KHANG MIN oy
LKK Auto Censultants Ple Lid Date

Please attach all the supporting documents to the form.
(Final Repair Bill; Rental Invoice; Release Voucher; Authorisation to Act; Survey Report; Medical
Report! Bill (if any)

https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=SVCdoc& fuseaction=dsp_doclt... 30/5/2018



Adjuster Report

L

Page | of 4

KK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd (coregna1sssoriser)
51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25, Paya Ubi Industrial Park
Singapore 408833

Tel: 6256-3561 Fax: 6844-8805 Email: sur@lkkauto. com:assignments@Ikkauto.com

VEHICLE DAMAGE INSPECTION REPORT

Our Flle No: CCB/AIG18003307/AHB302
Date: 30/05/2018
REFERENCE
Handling Insurer: AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Ple. Lid.  Policy No: 2100395679
ﬁ::i:'“““' Vehicle cna2027a Insured Vehicle No: SFT33138
Date of Loss: 18/02/2018 Nature of Claim: ™ Claim No: 945580298756
DESCRIPTI NTIFICA 1
Reg No: GBG202TA
Make & Model: I;I{i?hhi CABSTAR, 3.0 SMIT ABS 2DR 2WD EURO Engine No: 7D30021912N
Reg. Date: 28/06/2017 (Man. Year: 2016) Chassis No: JN1SC2F24Z0850623
Colour; Silver Odometer: 19160 km
Engine Capacity: 2953 cc
Market Value/MNew Car Price: N/A
Sum Insured (S§): Market Value/New Car Price
ITl |2 F SURVEY
General Condition: Steering (Serviceabla): Yes Foolbrake (Serviceable): Yes
Handbrake (Serviceable): Yes Engine Modification: No  Pre-accident Condition:
CONDITION OF TYRES
Front Tyre Size: 175/80 R15 Rear Tyre Size: 155 R13
Front Lefi Side: Cunlop 6 mm Rear Lefi Side: Duniop 6 mm
Front Right Side: Dunlop B mm Rear Right Side: Dunlop 6 mm
The above values represant the remaining lyre treads depth
COST OF CLAIMS | - Repairer's  Adjuster's Difference  Diff %)
Paris 1,825.97 893.51 1,032 46 5381
Miscellaneous ltems 0.00 0.00 0.00
Labaur 2,650.00 730.00 1.920.00 72.45
Paintwork Labour 0.00 0.00 0.00
Towing 0.00 0.00 0.00
Calculated Gross Total (S5) 4,575.97 1,623.51 2,952.46 64.52
Approved Total (Overridden) (S§) 1,300.00
(S5) 457597 1,300.00 3.275.97 71.59
+ GST 7.00/7.00% (5§) 320.32 91.00 22932 71.59
Nett Amount (S5) 4,896.29 1,391.00 3,505.29 71.59
+ Loss of Use (4.0 x S5150.00/day) (5%) 600.00
+ DocfSearch Fee (5§) 7.45
MNett Liability (S5%) 1,998.45

NSPECTION
Date of Assignment:
Date Inspacted:

https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRadjuster&fuseaction=gen_...

21022018

21/02/2018 Inspacted At: MG Salution Pte Ltd (HQ)

23 Kaki Bukit Avenue 4 #02-038, VICOM

30/5/2018



Adjuster Report Page 2 of 4

Inspection Centre
Singapore 415933
Estimaied Period of Repair: 3.0 days

Adjuster: ADRIAN LING Manager: VIC ALPEH

NOTE This report represents.our findings af the time and place of inspection sfated horein, Such inspection has been carded oul (o the best of our
knowlodge and abifty but any other Kabilly underany other circumstances is heraby axpressly excluded.

https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRadjuster& fuseaction=gen_... 30/5/2018



Adjuster Report Page 3 of 4

REPAIR DETAILS

Recommended Parts

No. Qty PartMo. Particulars Condition Repairer's Amount
1 1 *TAILLAMP LH Cracked 250.30FN *250.30FN
2 1 *TAIL LAMP BRACKET Repair BO.00DFN *FN
3 1 *END PANEL Dented 1,255.30FS *480.00FS
4 2 *END PANEL STOPPER Cut 110.00FS *60.00FS
5 i *END PANEL STOPPER BRACKET Bent 255.30F “183.20FL

F=Franchise par. S=SpcNett LsListilemDisc. N=NattitemDise

Sub Total (S5) 1,859.90 §973.50

- List Item Discount on L ltems 0.00/30.00% (S%) 0.00 54.96

- Nett ltem Discount on N items 10.00/10.00% (S$) 33.93 25.03

Total Parts (S5) 1,925.97 8931.51

Report was unsubmitied during this print-out. J

https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRadjuster&fuseaction=gen_... 30/5/2018



Adjuster Report Page 4 of 4
Recommended Miscellaneous Items
There are no new miscellansous items selected.
Recommended Labour
No Particulars Lab.Type Repairer's Amount
Labour items
1 TO PANEL BEAT ,REMOVE AND RENEWAL PARTS New 1,400.00 450.00
2 TO SPRAY PAINT AFFECTED AREA MNew 1,000.00 250.00
3 TUFF COAT MNew 250.00 30.00

Gross Labour Cost (55) 2,650.00 730.00

Reporl was unsubmitted during this print-out.
< END OF ESTIMATES =
https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRadjuster&fuseaction=gen_... 30/5/2018



