JDI Irene (LKKAuto)

From: Claims Dept of CTI <claimsdept@sg.cntaiping.com>

Sent: Monday, 27 August 2018 10:27 AM

To: Joy Irene (LKKAute); Admin A

Cc: Jowyn Tay; Alfred Toh; Chee So Chow; Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)
Subject: RE: SNM18D00894C02/0/LKKDS & SKG6127L (TP : LKK REF -

CCH/CTI18003267/Ukb3 ) on 13.02.2018

LKK REF -CC6/CTI18003267/Ukb3
CTI REF — SNM18D00894C02/0 (GBE32705)

Dear loy Irene

We refer to your email and reminders pertaining to the above matter.
¥ou may proceed to resolve claim at $6,236.45.

We await your payment advice to enable Jowyn to act accordingly.
Best Regards

Alfred Toh
Senior Executive
Claims Department
China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pte. Ltd.
3 Anson Road #16-00 Springleaf Tower Singapore 079909
DID: +65 63896183
FAX: +65 6224 7478/6224 7175
Email: claimsdept@sg.cntaiping.com
alfred.toh .cntaiping.com

www.sg.cntaiping.com

.
]
¥

FRSARY
In Simgapare sinee 1938

N

Disclaimer ;

This message is confidential; its contents do not constitute a commitment by China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pte. Ltd except
where provided for in a written agreement between you and China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pre. Ltd. Any unauthorized
disclosure. use or dissemination, either in whole or partial, is prohibited. If you are not the intended recipient of the message,
please notify the sender immediately.

From: Joy Irene (LKKAuto) [mailto:Joylrene@lkkauto.com]

Sent: Monday, August 27, 2018 10:11 AM

To: Alfred Toh <alfred.toh@sg.cntaiping.com>; Jowyn Tay <jowyn.tay@sg.cntaiping.com>

Cc: Claims Dept of CTl <claimsdept@sg.cntaiping.com>; Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: SNM18D00894C02,/0/LKKDS & SKG6127L (TP : LKK REF -CC6/CTI18003267/Ukb3 ) on 13.02.2018

LKK REF -CC6/CTI18003267/Ukb3



Joy Irene (LKKAuto)

From: Claims Dept of CTl <claimsdept@sg.cntaiping.com>

Sent: Monday, 27 August 2018 10:27 AM

To: Joy Irene (LKKAuto); Admin A

Cc Jowyn Tay; Alfred Toh; Chee So Chow; Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)
Subject: RE' SNM18D00B94C02/0/LKKDS & SKG6127L (TP : LKK REF -

CCe/CTI18003267/Ukb3 ) on 13.02.2018

LKK REF -CC6/CT118003267/Ukb3
CTl REF - SNM18D00894C02/0 (GBE32705)

Dear Joy Irene

We refer to your email and reminders pertaining to the above matter.
You may proceed to resolve claim at $6,236.45.

We await your payment advice to enable Jowyn to act accordingly.
Best Regards

Alfred Toh

Senior Executive

Claims Department

China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pte. Ltd.

3 Anson Road #16-00 Springleaf Tower Singapore 079909

DID: +65 6389 6183

FAX: +65 6224 7478/6224 7175

Email: claimsdept@sqg.cntaiping.com
alfred.toh@sg.cntaiping.com

ANNIVFRSARY
J'-S.qudm 1948

Disclaimer :

This message is confidential; its contents do not consiituie a commitment by China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Ple. Led except
where provided for in a written agreement berween you and China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pte. Ltd. Any unauthorized
disclosure, use or dissemination, either in whole or partial, is prohibited. If you are not the intended recipient of the message,
please notify the sender immediately.

From: Joy Irene (LKKAuto) [mai1m:mwrene@!kkauto.mm]

Sent: Monday, August 27, 2018 10:11 AM

To: Alfred Toh <alfred.toh@sg.cntaiping.com>; Jowyn Tay <jowyn.tay@sg.cntaiping.com>

Cc: Claims Dept of CTI <claimsdept@sg.cntaiping.com=; Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: SNM18D00894C02/0/LKKDS & SKGB127L (TP : LKK REF -CC6/CTI18003267/Ukb3 ) on 13.02.2018

LKK REF -CC6/CTI18003267/Ukb3



CTI REF — SNM18D00894C02/0 (GBE32705)

Dear Sirs,
We refer to our e-mail below dated 21/06/18.
Kindly advise mandate.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Joy Irene | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

DID: 6841-2409 | email: joyirene @lkkauto.com | Fax: 6741-4108
8lk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

All contents of this email is intended strictly for the addressee(s) only.It may contain confidential and/or privileged
information.If you are not the intended recipient {or have received this email in error) please notify the sender
immediately and destroy this email. Any unauthorized copying, disclosure or distribution of the material in this email
is strictly forbidden.

From: Joy Irene (LKKAuto)
Sent: Wednesday, 8 August 2018 10:12 AM
To: 'Alfred Toh' <alfred.toh@sg.cntaiping.com>; 'lowyn Tay' <jowyn.tay@s .cntaiping.com>

Cc: 'Claims Dept of CTI' <claimsdept@sg.cntaiping.com>; Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com=>
Subject: RE: SNM18D00894C02,/0/LKKDS & SKGB127L (TP : LKK REF -CC6/CTI18003267/Ukb3 | on 13.02.2018

LKK REF -CC6/CTI118003267/Ukb3
CTI REF — SNM18D00894C02/0 (GBE3270S)

Dear 5irs,
We refer to our e-mail below dated 21/06/18.
Kindly advise mandate.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Joy Irene | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

DID: 6841-2409 | email: joyirene@lkkauto.com |Fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

All contents of this email is intended strictly for the addressee(s) only.It may contain confidential and/or privileged
information.If you are not the intended recipient (or have received this email in error) please notify the sender
immediately and destroy this email. Any unauthorized copying, disclosure or distribution of the material in this email
is strictly forbidden.

From: Joy Irene (LKKAuto)
sent: Tuesday, 31 July 2018 2:43 PM



To: 'Alfred Toh' <alfred.toh@sg.cntaiping.com>; Jowyn Tay' <jowyn.tay@sg. ntaiping.com>
Ce: 'Claims Dept of CTI' <claimsdept@sg.cntaiping.com>
Subject: RE: SNM18D00894C02/0/LKKDS & SKG6127L (TP : LKK REF -CC6/CT118003267/Ukb3 ) on 13.02.2018

LKK REF -CC6/CTI118003267/Ukb3
CT1 REF — SNM18D00834C02/0 (GBE3270S)

Dear Alfred/Jowyn,
We refer to our e-mail dated 21/06/18.
Kindly advise mandate.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Joy Irene | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

DID: 6841-2409 | email: joyirene@lkkauto.com | Fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408533)

All contents of this email is intended strictly for the addresseel(s) only.lt may contain confidential and/or privileged
information.!f you are not the intended recipient (or have received this email in error) please notify the sender
immediately and destroy this email. Any unauthorized copying, disclosure or distribution of the material in this email
is strictly forbidden.

From: Joy Irene (LKKAuto)

Sent: Monday, 16 July 2018 11:14 AM

To: 'Alfred Toh' <alfred.toh@sg.cntaiping.com>; Jowyn Tay' <jowyn.tay@sg.cntaiping.com>

Cc: 'Claims Dept of CTI' <claimsdept@sg.cntaiping.com>

Subject: RE: SNM18D00894C02,/0/LKKDS & SKG6127L (TP : LKK REF -CC6/CTI18003267/Ukb3 ) on 13.02.2018

LKK REF -CC6/CT 118003267 /Ukb3

CTI REF — SNM18D00894C02/0 (GBE32705S)
Dear Alfred/Jowyn,

wWe refer to our e-mail below.

Kindly advise mandate.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Joy Irene | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

DID: 6841-2409 | email: ';ogirene@1kkauto.ggm| Fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)



All contents of this email is intended strictly for the addressee(s) only.It may contain confidential and/or privileged
information.If you are not the intended recipient (or have received this email in error) please notify the sender
immediately and destroy this email. Any unauthorized copying, disclosure or distribution of the material in this email
is strictly forbidden.

From: Joy Irene [LKKAuto)

sent: Thursday, 21 June 2018 4:28 PM

To: 'Alfred Toh' <alfred.toh@sg.cntaiping.coms>; "Jowyn Tay' <jowyn tay@sg.cntaiping.com>

Cc: 'Claims Dept of CTI' <claimsdept @sg.cntaiping.com>; CS A Team <cs-a@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: SNM18D00894C02,/0/LKKDS & SKG6127L (TP : LKK REF -CC6/CTI18003267/Ukb3 ) on 13.02.2018

LKK REF -CC6/CTI18003267/Ukb3

CTI REF — SNM18D00894C02/0 (GBE32705)

Dear Alfred/Jowyn,

TP rejected our 6.5 days offer and counter proposed 11 days.

TP append the breakdown for 11days of LOR for your reference;

NO. OF DAY

DATE DAY DESCRIPTION (Vehicle In workshop)
13-FEB-2018 | TUE ACCIDENT DATE 1* Day

14-FEB-2018 | WED 2™ Day

15-FEB-2018 | THUR 3 Day

16-FEB-2018 | FRI CNY 4*" Day

17-FEB-2018 | SAT CNY 5 Day

18-FEB-2018 | SUN WEEKEND 6" Day

19-FEB-2018 | MON 7' Day

20-FEB-2018 | TUE DATE OF SURVEY

NOTE: The recommended 5 days by the appointed surveyor excludes the above days. Total count 12 days.

Our revised offer at 11 days below.

OUR REVISED
TO OFFER

Cost of Repairs + 7% G5T $ 5,100.00 (with GST)

Loss of Rental $ 1,100.00 (5100 x 11 days)

LTA Search Fee 5 7.45

GlA Search Fee 5 29.00

TOTAL ) $6,236.45

For your mandate.
Thank you.
Best Regards,

Joy Irene | Case Handler
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd



DID: 6841-2409 | email: joyirene@lkkauto.com | Fax: 5741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

All contents of this email is intended strictly for the addressee(s) only.It may contain confidential and/or privileged
information.If you are not the intended recipient (or have received this email in error) please notify the sender
immediately and destroy this email. Any unauthorized copying, disclosure or distribution of the material in this email
is strictly forbidden.

From: Claims Dept of CTI [mailto:claimsdept@sg.cntaiping.com]

Sent: Wednesday, 16 May 2018 10:44 AM

To: Joy Irene (LKKAuto) <Joylrene@lkkauto.com>; Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>

Cc: Jowyn Tay <jowyn.tay@sg.cntaiping.com>, Alfred Toh <alfred.toh@sg.cntaiping.com>; Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)
<chewht@Ilkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: SNM18D00854C02/0/LKKDS & SKG6127L (TP : LKK REF -CCE,"CTIIEUDEZE?;‘ Ukb3 ) on 13.02.2018

LKK REF -CC6/CTI118003267/Ukb3
CTI REF - SNM18D00894C02/0 (GBE32705)

Dear loy Irene

We refer to your email of 15 May 2018 pertaining to the above matter.
Please proceed to resolve the property damage claim at $5,786.45,
We await your payment advice to enable Jowyn to act accordingly.
Best Regards

Alfred Toh

Senior Executive

Claims Department

China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pte. Ltd.

3 Anson Road #16-00 Springleaf Tower Singapore 079909
DID: +65 6389 6183

FAX: +65 6224 7478/6224 7175

Email: claimsdept@sg.cntaiping.com

alfred.toh@sg.cntaiping.com
www.sg.cntaiping.com

ANNIVERSARY
flﬂwmﬁﬂ.lf.”

Disclaimer :

This message is confidential; its contents do not constitute a commitment by China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pre. Lid, except
where provided for in a written agreement hetween vou and China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pre. Ltd. Any unauthorized
disclosure, use or dissemination, either in whole or partial, is prohibited. If you are not the intended recipient of the message,
please notify the sender immediately.

From: Joy lrene [LKKAuto) [mailto:loylrene@lkkauto.com]
sent: Tuesday, May 15, 2018 4:50 PM



To: Angie Foo <angie.foo@s .cntaiping.com>

Ce: Alfred Toh <alfred.toh@sg.cntaiping.com>; Claims Dept of CT <claimsdept@sg.cntaiping.com>; Admin A
<admin-a@lkkauto.com>
Subject: REF: SNM18D00894C02/0/LKKDS & SKG6127L (TP : LKK REF -CC6/CTI18003267/Ukb3 ) on 13.02.2018

REF: SNM18D00894C02/0/LKKDS

Dear Ms. Angie,

This is a head-to-rear scenario where our insured vehicle hit TP from the rear. BOLA 27-100%. Liability is not in our
favour,

We have informed insured where insured agreed to settle and aware of NCD issue.

summary of offer to repairer M/s T K LEE AUTOMOTIVE PTE LTD is as follows:

TP CLAIMED T " OUR REVISED
TO OFFER
Cost of Repairs + 7% G5T $ 10,362.96 (per estimate) (no GST) $ 5,100.00 (with GST)
Loss of Rental $ 1,560.00 (5120 x 13 days) $  650.00 ($100 x 6.5 days)
LTA Search Fee 5 7.45 5 7.45
GlA Search Fee 5 29.00 5 29.00
TOTAL $11,959.41 $5,786.45

Attached documents for your perusal and reference.
For your approval.
Thank you.

Best Regards,

Joy Irene | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

DID: 6841-2409 | email: joyirene@ikkauto.mm] Fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

Al contents of this email is intended strictly for the addressee(s) only.It may contain confidential and/or privileged
information.!f you are not the intended recipient {or have received this email in error) please notify the sender
immediately and destroy this email. Any unauthorized copying, disclosure or distribution of the material in this email
is strictly forbidden.

From: Angie Foo [mailto:angie.foo@sg.cntaiping.com]

Sent: Friday, 23 February, 2018 9:36 AM

To: Shu Pei (LKKAuto) <shupei@Ikkauto.com>

Cc: Jowyn Tay <jowyn.tay@sg.cntaiping.com>; Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com>; Zaini (LKK Auto)
<Zaini@Ikkauto.com>; Admin A <admin-a |kkauto.com=>

Subject: OUR REF: SNM18D00894C02/0/LKKDS & YR REF: SKG6127L (TP : LKK REF -CC6/CTI18003267/Ukb3 ) on
13.02.2018

Dear Shu Pei,

We refer to your email of 22.2.2018



\We attached a copy of Assignment letter and SAS Report for your necessary action.

kindly take note, the claim handler is Jowyn Tay 6389 6174.

Thank you

Regards,

Angie Foo

Executive

Motor Division

Claims Department

China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pte Lid
3 Anson Road #16-00
Springleaf Tower
Singapore 0799809

Co.Reg. No.200208384E
DID: 6389 6186

Fax' 6224 7478 /6224 7175

Email: angie foo@sg.cntaiping.com
Email claimsdepti@sg.cntaiping.com
Website: www.sg.cntaiping . com

Dusclaimer

This massage is confidential. its contents do nof conghfule a commitment by Ghina Taiping [nsurance {Singapore) Ple. Lid. except where provided forin &
written agreement between you and China Taping Insurance (Singapora) Pte. Lid Any unauthorized disciosure, use or dissemination, either in whole o
partial, is protubited. If you &re ot the intended recipient of the message, please nofify the sender immediately

From: Shu Pei (LKKAuto) [mailto:shupei@lkkauto.com]
sent: Thursday, 22 February, 2018 9:50 AM

To: Claims Dept of CTI

Cc: Jowyn Tay; Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto); Zaini (LKK Auto); Admin A

Subject: Direct Settlement - Accident Involving GBE32705S (O : CTI - TBA) AND SKG6127L (TP : LKK REF -
CCe/CTI18003267/Ukb3 ) on 13.02.2018

WITHOUT PREJUDICE
Dear Sir / Madam,
We refer to the above matter,

This is a TP direct settlement case. We had inspected TP vehicle SKG 6127L at M/s LEE BROTHERS
AUTOMOTIVE PTE. LTD.

Enclosed for your perusal is:
TP GIA report
TP estimated cost of repair
- Preliminary advice
Meanwhile, kindly let us have a copy of your insured’s GIA report for our necessary action.
Kindly take note that the case handler in-charge is Zaini and he can be contacted at DID: 6841-2132.
Thank you

Rest Regards,
Shu Pei| Admin



LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
Phone: 6366-0055 | email; shupei@kkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108
Bik 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

This email has been scanned by the Symantec Email Security.cloud service.
For more information please visit http://www.symanteccloud.com

This email has been scanned by the Symantec Email Security.cloud service.
For more information please visit http://www.symanteccloud.com

This email has been scanned by the Symantec Email Security.cloud service.
For more information please visit http://www.symanteccloud.com




T K LEE AUTOMOTIVE PTE.LTD.

NO. 1 KAKI BUKIT AVE 6 #02-47 AUTOBAY
SINGAPORE 417883 Co.Reg. No. : 20121026672
TEL: 6509 5521 / 6509 5524 FAX: 6509 5523

Attn:The Motor Claims Department
CHINA TAIPING INSURANCE (S) PTE LTD
3 ANSON ROAD #16-00
SPRINGLEAF TOWER
SINGAPORE 079909 Yrs Ref.: GRE32T0S
Our Ref.: TKLO218-2412

Date.: 26.03.2018

¥ F
Accident involving  SKG6127L And GBE32705 On 13.02.2018 At 1300Hrs Along
Slip Road to Toh Guan Road

We refer to the above matter. We are instructed that above accident was caused solely and completely by
the negligence of your insured, as a result of which, our client have sufferd loss and expenses.

We are insturcted by our client to make a property damages claims as:-

Amount
1. Cost of repair 55 5,100.00
2. Loss of Rental (13days (@ S55120Per day } 5% 1.560.00
3. Survey fee 5% -
4, LTA Search Fee S5 7.45
5. E-File Search Fee 5% 29.00
Claim Amount 558 6,696.45

Enclosed are the following documents for your perusal.

Letter of Authority

Rental Agreement / Receipt

E-File Serach Fee/ LTA Receipt
Vehicle Registration Card

Driver's Driving License / ldentity Card

J |Original Final repair Bill

Original Survey Report & Inv

Original Photographs of [SKG(‘:IE?L ]
J|GIAS Reports of [SKG61271. ]

4 |Certificate of Insurance

Report Of A Traffic Accident

<|&ISIS-

Your prompt action will be greatly appreciated.

Kindly acknowledge receipt of the above said documents and your favourable reply 15
greatly appreciated.

Yours faithfully,
otive Pte. Ltd.




31 LBEAVE 1 #01-25 PaYa LB ISDUSTRIAL PARK. SINGATORI JURYAS TEL ; (h3) 6236IER] FAN (Al

Our Ref: CCo/CTIHIEODIZ6T/UKDS

28 FEBRUARY 2018

HAW WAH TRADING CO PTE LTD
6 HOUGANG AVENUE 3

#1-Th

SINGAPORE 530006

ATTN: HR / MANAGEMENI

Dear Sir/Madam.,

ACCIDENT INVOLVING GBE 32708 AND SKG 61271 ON 13.02.2018

We refer to the above accident where we are acting for China Taiping Insurance
(Singapore) Pte Ltd to resolve the claim against you and/or your authorized driver under

the Auto Insurance policy taken up with them.

Based on the accident report and accident scenario, liability is down apainst us. We will
therefore proceed to negotiate for an amicable settlement with the Third Party.

Should you however wish to further discuss on the matter prior to our negotiations and
settlement, please contact us within 10 days from the date of this letter.

Please call us if you have further queries.

Yours faithfully.

Zaini
Case Handler
(DID: 6841 2132
FAX: 6741 4108
Email; Zainii@lkkauto.com

cc.  China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pre Lid
(Meotor Claims Dept)



Date:

To: d\\H _[(}\W;Pt 1“']145 (SF?E\ﬁJ Q-)w_ \)raﬂ

RE: ACCIDENT INVOLVING VEHICLE NO.: gth Bﬂ'()fl A 6g% %}% 3

AT/ALONG Qﬂ? Yore T2 BTN Qyon
ON \?-1['}][&

I/We, ‘%tmaﬂ 'b.-n &L‘H of (NRIC No./ROC NO.)
2 AL 1463700k 228D Anchorunle. Qo H#04-058 B4 254

owner of vehicle no, Qtﬁt {]'.M L in consideration of M/S l I\ ] gg E“ IQmEtI“E Pm L i

repairing my/our vehicle SLE'I 6”7“/ at my/four instruction and hereby authorise

M/S T K lee Aitomotive Pte |td  to demand claim settle receive whatever

amount settled / payable by the Insurance Company and/or third party or to commence legal
proceedings, if necessary, under my name, for the cost of repairs, car rental and/or loss of use,

etc. and to their appointing solicitor to act for me/us in respect of the said accident/claim and

all claimed and/or settled shall belong to them absolutely.

| further agree and undertake to indemnify them against the above mentioned claim costs

which my arisen therewith.

Sl &0

Signature of Owner :

Date:




f N
J 1
MOTOR CLATMS DISCHARGE VOUCHER
Policy Mo : DMOVSNI0NES2T71701 Claim Mo 3 SNM18D0ODB24/C0Z/0
Claimant FIRMAN BIN SURI
Amount i £56,2368.45

SINGAPORE DOLLARS SIX THOUSAND TWO HUNDRED THIRTY SIX ONLY
AND CENTS FORTY FIVE.

I/We agree to accept the above ment icned amount to be paid teo mefus in full &
final settlement of all claims, costs & disbursements for injuries / damages
sustained by mefus through an accldent inwolving

Claimant Vehicie No. @ SKG 6127L+7
tnsured Vehicle No. : GBE 32708 7
Date of Loss : 13.02.2018 o
Place of Accident : TOH GUAN ROAD

IN COMSIDERATION of the payment made to ma/us of the aforementioned sum by
CHINA TAIPING INSURANCE (SINGAFORE) ETE. LTD., I/We agree absolutely to
discharge CHINA TAIPING INSURANCE (SINGAPORE) PTE. LTD. and/er

Insured Name : HAW WaH TRADING CO PTE LITD
Driver Wame : WONG CHIN YONG
from all claims, present or future in respect af all loss, injury or damage

gustained by me/us arising cut of the said accident.

I acknowledge that this payment i1s made without admission ef liability on the
part of CHINA TAIPING INSURANCE (SINGAPORE) PTE. LTD;

(1] Repalr Cost g5 5,100.00
{2} Loss of Rental 5% 1,100.00
(3] GIA / LTA Search Fee 55 36:45

TOTAL: w - . v o s 6,236.45

: ) [\ [ 4 e 7] -
Ulaimant Name : %\{Yrkifl Eglf] o NRIC No 1 = f'}gg 'J’¥ =

Signature : s | MEGE 4 \%!0‘{ §o)



T K LEE AUTOMOTIVE PTE. LTD

1 Kaki Bukit Avenue 6, #02-47 Autobay. Singapore 417883

Tel: (65) 6509 5524 Fax: (65) 6509 3523
Co. Reg. No.: 2012102662

Messrs:  CHINA TAIPING INSURANCE (8) PTE LTD

1 ANSON ROAD

INVOICE

0609

(Claim Mo.; TKLO218-2412

#16-00 SPRINGLEAF TOWER AceDate: 13/02201%
SINGAPORE 079909

Veh. No./ Model ;

SKG 61271 VOLKS POLO Date :

23/03/2018

QTY.

DESCRIPTIONS

AMOUNT

Repair Cost :
Inclusive of supply parts, panel beating, spray painting
and labour.

S.100.00

TOTAL AMOUNT 5,100.00
E. & Q.E.
* Please make all payments within 7 days.
* All service and repairing are in good order & conditions. /
[
I,‘ T -\;}
ey | ':f-.- :
S

N b

L _‘-

Customer Sign & Chop

TK LEE AU'rt’_mﬂp’rn’E PTELTD




CARZ RENTAL PTE. LTD.

| Kaki Bukit Avenue 6, #02-47 Autobay,
Singapore 417883
Fax: (65) 6509 5523

ROC NO: 201312119K

Tel: (65) 6509 5521

T e
“_. 1_;‘ {‘I ;,_ 1) ,-_} IL

VEHICLE RENTAL AGREEMENT

Hirer Particulars - Veh. No. 7 L/ { | Replace veh. No.
Mame Rrmaen ﬂy /] ) \ Make | Model _1( A W P’. ! K_L Auto/Manual
Address It 3LfD AnChorvale 24 Datertime Out | /2 /2L (4 5C/H] |xmou
A4S S'o4425 4 caermetn |\ 9BAE IS [k
nRicPassport| S X 5 453 Z | Mobile Estimated Date/Time Retum
Tel (O) Fax Rental charges - s$ S$
Authorised Driver's Particulars - Hours @ Per Hour
Name A ave /% | Days @ /A | Perday (540
Address ' ! Weeks @ Per Week
Months @ Per Month
MRIC/Passport . . Mationality Sub-Total
pateatBith | 10 | 19 &’ ‘) Occupation Less Discount
DiLicence No, : Mobile Sub-Total /;étfj
Expiry Date Tel {0} Optional Charges - -
Country of Issue Tel (H) Delivery o Per Trip
(A) - ACCIDENTS (D)- DENTS (S)- SCRATCHES Collection | @ Per Trip B
_thhers
Sub-Tolal
Add T% GST
(A) Estimated Total Rental
_Extenslnn -
Extension Rental *
Surcharge (Malaysia) X
PAL X ]
: _ ]
Others -
Misc ©
Cash/MNets/Cheque/VISAME Card Mo:
ouT K N ACCESSORIES CHECK Sub-Total
| m it || L1570 700t Add 7% GST
z 3 L I (B) Extensionfothers Total
E A - F |[Js/rRm [ Radin/CD

Physical Damage Excess

Hirer's Acknowledgement

{A) + [B) Grand Total Rental Charges

Singapore s \,t Less Prepayment
Malaysia S5 \\\}x Balance Due
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Receipt Page 1 of 1

Land Transport Authority

10 Sin Ming Drive

Singapore 575701

GST Registration No. - M4-0006528-2
Print Date/Time : 13 Feb 2018 / 16:36: 11
Raceipt Date/Time - 13 Feb 2018 [ 16:36:11

Tax Invoice/Receipt
Receipt No. | [TNET-00000-180213-001 577
Previous Receipt No

S/N Item Description/ Amount GST Amount
Business Transaction Reference Before Amount After GST
No. GST (8§) (S5) (5%)

Result of Insurance Enquiry - GBE32705

As at 13 Feb 2018/13:00:00

Insuranice Co: GHINA TAIPING INSURANCE (SINGAPORE) PTE LTD
1 Insurance Enguiry - GBE32705

Enquiry Fee 7.00 .49 748
20180213163516556235
Sub-Total 7.00 0.48 7.48
Total Before Rounding 7.00 0.4% 7.49
Rounding Difference 0.04
Total Amount Payable 7.45
Paid By
20180213163530980 f:::rtnff;; HE:E}TS DeoR 7.45
Total 745
Cash Change 0.o0
Tendered Amount 7.45
Excess Refundable Amount 0.00

THANK YOU AND HAVE A NICE DAY!

Please ensure that all payments to the Authority are good and promptly settled by the payment service
provider / financial institution. Otherwise, the transaction and receipt is considered void and late fee

may apply.

htps:/vrl.lta.gov.sg/lta/vrl/action/completePayment?FUNCTL... 1 3/2/2018
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B GENERAL RECORDS MANAGEMENT CENTRE

0 ah & Raffles Quay #18-00, Singapore 048580
0. J o INSURANCE Phona: <65 6224 0010 Fax: +65 6224 0030
£ ASSOCIATION Operating Hours: Monday to Friday 9am to 5pm
i ¢ 14000
RECORDS MANAGEMENT CENTRE GST Registration Mo 17735

" 'u__.\.

TAX INVOIGE

Qur Ref No; GR-18-026369
Date of Reguesl. 20/02/2018 Your Ref No: WALE IN SUDIEMAN

TK LEE AUTOMOTIVE FTE LTD
1 KAKI BUKIT AVE 6, #02-14 AUTOBAY
SINGAPORE 417883

Dear Sir/Madam,
Your Vehicle Mo: SKGE127L
Date of Accident; 13/0272018

Place of Accident. SLIP RD TO TOH GUAN RD
Involving Vehicle No:  GBE32705

GENERAL INSURANCE ASSOCIATION OF SINGAPORE

DESCRIPTION [AMOUNT (SS)

E-File Search Fee (Public) 14.02
[GST Amaount 0.98
| Total Amount Due (GST Inclusive) i 5._@]

Thank You.

This is a computer generated document and requires no signature.

For GIARMC Official use:
Date;
[ 1 GIRO [X] Cash [] Cheqgue



A GENERAL INSURANCE ASSOCIATION OF SINGAPORE
g GE RA RECORDS MANAGEMENT CENTRE
= g NE L & Raffles Quay #18-00, Singapore 048580
_ e INSURANCE Phone: +65 5224 0010 Fax: +65 6224 0030
ASS0CIATION Operating Hours: Monday to Friday 8am to Spm
GST Registration Mo: M400017735

TAX INVOICE

Qur Ref No: GR-18-026371
Date of Request: 20/02/2018 Your Ref No: WALK IN SUDIRMAN

TK LEE AUTOMOTIVE PTE LTD
1 KAK| BUKIT AVE 8, #02-14 AUTOBAY
SINGAPORE 417882

Dear SirfMadam,

Date of Accident: 130272018
Vehicle No: SKGE127L
Place of Accident: TOH GUAN RD EAST SLIP RD TO TOH GUAN RD
Involving Vehicle No:  GBE32705

With reference to your application for the accident report, we have attached the following accident reporis as requested:

[DOCUMENTS  |ACCIDENT LOCATION [PER DOC (S5) |QTY |AMOUNT (S%) _[
GBE32705 TOH GUAN RD EAST SLIP RD TO TOH GUAN RD 14.00(1 13.08
GST Amount D.g2
Total Amount Due (GST Inclusive) 14E

The images provided to you are taken from the onginal reports forwarded 1o the centre by the members of the General Insurance
Association of Singapore and we take no responsibility for their accuracy or contents and shall be under no liability whatsoever for
any loss or damage arising out of or in connection with the reports or their images.

Thank You.

This is @ computer generated document and reguires no signature.

For GIARMC Official use:
Date:
[ ] GIRO [X] Cash[] Cheque



