Poh Kin (LKKAuto)

x

From: Poh Kin (LKKAuto)

Sent: Tuesday, 22 May 2018 2:56 PM

To: ‘claimsdept@sg.cntaiping.com’

Cc ‘boonsen.chong@sg.cntaiping.com’; ‘alfred.toh@sg.cntaiping.com’; Admin A; Hsiao
Tong (LKKAuto); Vic (LKKAuUtO)

Subject: <Seek Mandate> Direct Settlement - Accident Involving SLE 3971J (OI : CTI -
SNM18D00999C02/1) and GBG 1950R (TP : LKK REF - CCR/CTI18003266/Ups3) on
14/02/2018

Attachments: LKK ADJUSTMENT pdf: LKK INSPECTION.pdf; LKK RESURVEY PHOTO 2.pdf; LKK

RESURVEY PHOTO.pdf: LKK SURVEY PHOTO.pdf; TP LOD GBG 1950R pdf
Importance: High
Your ref : SNM18D00999C02/1
Our ref : CC6/CT118003266/Ups3
Dear Sirs/Madam,
ROAD TRAFFIC ACCIDENT INVOLVING SLE 3971J (Ol) & GBG 1950R (TP) ON 14/02/2018
We refer to the above matter.

It is a head-to-rear collision. Liability is down against our insured driver.
We did clarify with insured the nature of the accident and he's aware that NCD (if any) would be affected.

We seek your approval to offer Third Party repairer "Fastech Auto Pte Ltd" at $9,856.00(all-in).

The summary is as follows: -

Amount Amount Revised
Claimed
1. Cost of Repair (w/GST) 521,678.95 5 8,774.00
2. Loss of Rental (9days x $180) S 1,620.00 % 1,080.00 (9days x $120.00)
3. GIA Search Fee 5 2.00 5 2.00

Total 523,300.95 $9,856.00
**(7 days recommendation for repair.
Enclosed here with all the relevant documents for your perusal.

For your approval please.



Poh Kin (LKKAuto)

From: Claims Dept of CTl <claimsdept@sg.cntaiping.com®>

Sent: Wednesday, 27 June 2018 2:17 PM

To: Poh Kin (LKKAuto), Admin A

Cc: Chong Boon Sen; Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto): Alfred Toh; Chee So Chow; kKklau; Olivia Lau
(LEKAUtD)

Subject: RE: <Seek Mandate> Direct Settlement - Accident Involving SLE 3971 (O1 : CTI -
SNM18D00999C02/1) and GBG 1950R (TP : LKK REF - CC6/CTI18003266/Ups3) on
14/02/2018

LKK REF - CC6/CTI18003266/Ups3
CT1 REF — SNM18D00999C02/1 (SLE3971))

Dear Poh Kin
We refer to your email of even date pertaining to the above matter.

Please proceed to offer as follow:

Cost of Repairs 58,774.00

Loss of Rental ($60.00 x 9 days) $ 540.00 & UP TO $900.00 ($100.00 per day)
GlA Search Fee s 2.00

Total $9,316.00 & up to 59,676.00

We await your payment advice to enable Boon 5en to act accordingly.
Best Regards

Alfred Toh

Senior Executive

Claims Department

China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pte. Ltd.

3 Anson Road #16-00 Springleaf Tower Singapore 079909
DID: +65 6389 6183

FAX: +65 6224 7478/6224 7175

Email: claimsdept@sg.cntaiping.com

alfred.toh@sg.cntaiping.com
www.sg.cntaiping.com

ANNIVERSARY
Iu Singapore vince 1938

Disclaimer



FASTECH AUTO PTE LTD

1 Kaki Bukit Ave 6 #01-48 Autobay

Singapore 417883

Tel No: 67452063 / 67467158 Fax No: 67458520
Tax Reg No: 200006262D

Date : 26.03.2018
China Taiping Insurance Singapore Pte Ltd
3 Anson Road

#16-00 Springleaf Tower
Singapore 079909

Attn: Motor Claims Department

ACCIDENT INVOLVING VEHICLE: GBG 1950R  / SLE 3971J ON  14.02.2018

We are the authorized repair workshop for the owner of motor vehicle no:  GBG 1950R . which was involved
in the captioned accident with your insured vehicle no: SLE 3971J . The vehicle owner has requested and
authorized us to assist him in presenting his’her claim against the party responsible for the damage to the vehicle.

As the accident was caused by the negligent act of your insured driving, we are submitting these claims for
your consideration on behalf of the owner/claimant.

1} Cost of Repair (inclusive of GST) b 8.774.00
2}  Rental $ 1.620.00
3)  GIA Search Result b 2.00

5 10,396.00

We enclosed herewith the following documents to support the claims:

a) Final Repair Invoice &) Vehicle Registration Log Card
b) I/C & Driving License f) Letter of Authorisation, etc...
¢) GIA Report/ GIA Search Result g) Car Rental Invoice / Agreement

d) Insurance Certificate

Kindly look into the matter and let us hear from you on the settlement of our customer’s claims
as soon as possible.

Please note that it is a condition of any settlement reached that it shall be without prejudice to
any personal injury claim (if any) of the owner/claimant.

Thank you.
Y ours faithfully,

Jason Tang (jason(@ fastgchauto.com.sg)
FASTECH AUTO PTE LTD

ey iy v okl Long
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STURTAVE 1, #0123 PAYA URTINDUSTRIAL PARK, SING APORE 408533 TEL : (065) 62563561 FAX : 10631 62304315

Our Ref: CCo/CTIIBO03266/Ups3
26 MARCH 2018

DEREK LIEW KOK WAH
BLK 858 WOODLANDS ST 83
#03-216

SINGAPORE 730858

Dear Sir/Madam,
ACCIDENT INVOLVING SLE 3971J AND GBG 1950R ON 14/02/2018

We refer to the above subject matter. We write to inform you that we are the loss adjuster
appointed by your motor insurer, China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pte Ltd to deal with
the third party claim against your policy.

Based on the accident report and accident scenario, liability is down against us, We will
therefore proceed to negotiate for an amicable settlement with the Third Party.

Should you however wish to further discuss on the matter prior to our negotiations and
settlement, please contact us within 10 days from the date of this letter.

Please call us if you have further queries.

Yours faithfully,

CHEW H51AO TONG

Case Handler

DID: 6742 3197

FAX: 6741 4108

EMAIL: chewht@lkkauto.com

c.e.  China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pte Lid
(Mator Claims Dept)



DATE

14.02.2018
TO : China Taiping Insurance Singapore Pte Ltd
RE . ACCIDENT INVOLVING VEHICLE NO. GBG1950R  and
SLE 3971J ONLY

ALONG  LORBTOA PAYOH EXIT SLIP RD INTO BRADDELL RD

ON 14.02.2018

I'We, SENG FOODSTALL

of (NRIC No./ROC No.) 53271452X

of BLK 202 BISHAN ST 22 #18-71 5-570282

owner of vehicle no. GBG 1950R in consideration of M/s FASTECH AUTO
PTE LTD repairing my/our vehicle GBG 1350R ~at my/our instruction and hereby
authorise M/s FASTECH AUTO PTE LTD to demand claim settlement whatever

amount settled/payable by the Insurance Company and/or third party or to commence legal
proceedings, if necessary. under my name, for the cost of repairs, car rental and/or loss of use.
ete. and to their appointing solicitor to act for me/us in respect of the said accident/claim and

all claimed and/or settled shall belong to them absolutely.

I/We further agree and undertake to indemnify them against the above-mentioned claim cost

which may arisen therewith.

Signature of Owner

SENG FOODSTALL
Mame of Owner




MOTOR CLAIMS DISCHARGE VOUCHER

Folicy Ho : DMPCSN30D21841704 Claim Mo @ SHMIBDOOSSOLCOZ/1
Claimant SENG FOODSTALL
Amount :  550.586.00

DOLLARS NINE THOUSAND FIVE HUNDRED EIGHTY SIX ONLY

I/We agree to accept the above mentioned amount to be pald to me/fus in full &
final settlement of all claims, costs & disbursements for injuries / damages
sustained by méfus through an accident invelwing

Claimant Vehicle No. @ GBG 1950R
Insured Vehicle No. : SLE 3971J

Date of Loss + 14/02/2018
Flace cf ARccident + 2LIP ROAD OF LORONG € TOA PAYOH TOWARDS BRADDELL ROAD

IN CONSIDERATION of the payment made to me/fus of the aforementioned sum by
CHINA TAIPING INSURANCE (SINGAPORE) PTE. LTD., I/We agree abszolutely to
discharge CHINA TAIPING INSURANCE (SINGAPORE] PTE. LTD. andfor

Insured Name : DERERK LIEW KOK WAH
Criver Mame : DEREK LIEW KOK WAH

from all claims, present or future in respect of all loss, injury or damage
sustained by mefus arising out of the said accident.

T acknowledge that this payment is made without admission of liability on the
part of CHINA TAIPING IMSURANCE (SINGRPORE) PTE. LTD.

(1) General Damages 55 =
(2) Cost of Repalr/Bxesss 55 B,774.00
(3) Loss of Yse/Rental/Easning 55 g210.00
{41 GlA/Police Reports/
Investigation Results/Search Fees 85 2.00
(5] Medical Reports/Expenses 55 =
{&] Survey Fees/E.T. Fees 5% =
{7} Cost including Disbursement 55 -
TATAE: commmse 5 % & 5 @ 3 % % & 6 E R 9,586.00

el t.-—
Claimant Name : — NRIC Mo : SO06415 1)

0
25 /07 [ 2018

Jignature Date

s%# This Discharge Voucher applies oly 1o the claimant’s claim
for his property damage and will nol affect his personal
Mﬁn£Mmmﬂhummnudhumdmmmahm
Frtiier. the setilement terms herein should not be uged 25 =0
Evidenice to prejadice in the claimant’s personal mjuses chaim
andior other upinsured losses claim mrising of he

suhject gatier in this actnn



TAX INVOICE

FASTECH AUTO PTE LTD

1 Kaki Bukit Ave 6 #01-48 Autobay

Singapore 417883

Tel No: 67452063 / 67467158 Fax No: 67458520
Tax Reg No: 200006262D

China Taiping Insurance Singapore Pte Ltd
3 Anson Road

#16-00 Springleaf Tower

Singapore 079909

Tax Invoice ;20145

[Date : 26032018
Vehicle No :GBRG 1950R
Make/Model NISSAN NV200

Chassis/Eng#

Accident Date ;14022018
Claim No (0218-

Reference
Policy No
Amount
To proceed on lump sum repair 5% 8,200.00
E.& O.E. Total : 5% 8.200.00
GST @ 7% : 5§ 574.00
Amount Due  : 8% S,ﬁi.ﬂgﬂ

l

||~
{

FASTECH AUTQ PTE LTD"
All Invoices are subjected to GST




Dynamic Car Rental

1 KAKI BUKIT AVENUE 6, #01-46/48/50 AUTO
TEL: (+65) 6741 7244, 6746 5405 FAX: (+65) 67

Co. Reg. No. 5292B467K
RENTAL TERMS AND CONDITIONS

BAY, SINGAPORE 417883.
45 8520, 6746 5786

No. }?931

| Mame

ADDRESS

Koy g1 ll

"REG, Mo
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NAMED DRIVER C‘EE L’}.E. ﬁ"‘f {C

baTE Off EXPIRY

%I%N%ECEEFPG _f PLACE OF ISSUE

PASSFORT NO =

DATE OF ISSUE PLACE OF ISSUE

ADD NAMED DRIVER

)

DRIVING LICENCE NO DATE OF EXPIRY PLACE OF ISSUE

FPASSPOAT MO DATE OF 13SUE PLAGE OF ISSUE

IMPORTANT NOTES:

Thig-vehicle is licenced to carry. 04 passengars only

Mo rafund will bé givan for vehicle returms édrly.

Mo refund will be givan for perod lefl In vehicle.

Hirer is kahie 1o pay first $2000 under section L & 1l In any accident plus loss of earnings whila
damaged vehiche & undar regair

Hirgr k5 llable: 1o pay all parking fee: and traffic summonsas

Wahicle satum during cifice hour only.
Mo Service on Public Holiday and Sunday,

ADDITIONAL CONDITIONS:
* @engraphical areas: Singapore & West Malaysia.
* Driver must be:

a) 18 years old and above.:

1) helding & valid relevant class of driving license.

Additional Own Damage Excess of 551,000 is appleable for any namedunnamed drivers
wia:

@) age 22 to 23 years old;

b) age 66 to 7O yaars old;

¢} with driving experiance ol 1 year 1o less 1han 2 years in SiNgapore on the relevan! classes
of driving licansa,

* Adeitional All Claims excess of 552,000 is applicable for @ny namediunnamed drivers who:
a) is 18 years oid io 21 years ald andfor
by Is 71 years old and above andior
o with driving experience af less than 1 year on the relevant classes of driving licanse.

* Upon raturning the replacement vehicle, you must ensure that ail expensive and imporant
lams to be removed away from this replacement vehicls, Well will not be nesponaile for
any raparting of such kosses

* Hifer is fiable 1o pay first $2000 under section | & 1l in any accident plus loss of eaming while
damage vehicls &5 undir repair.

Hirer i sespensibls lor Addmional 52.000.00 Excass
to-fhis THIRD PARTY DAMASE / INJURY cleims

X

PER DAY PER WEEK
3 5

[Tir] TI
i | %8 J-05
Y] 9% OUT o
ouT ] f
i TIME USED v
DRIVEN
HOURS | @55
q DAYS &53{¥D’VU {&WV\]
| WEEKS | @S58
MONTHS | @58
BY INITIALLING, HENTER | uB-TOTAL
AGREES TO PAY ADD FEE
FOR COLLISION DAMAGES
WAIVER: (C.DW.)
TOTAL RENTAL
DELIVERY FEE
COLLECTION FEE

PER MONTH
§

BY INITIALLING, RENTER
AGREES TO PAY ADD FEE
FIOR PERSONAL ACCI DENT
INSURANCE (P.AL)

PER DAY PER WEEK
5 5

PER MONTH
3

PREPAYMENT

TOTAL CHARGE

CHECHK

DEPOSIT

CASH

RECEIFT NO.

WETT CHARGE

AMOUNT DUE / REFUND

| HAVE READ THE TERMS AND CONDITIONS ON BOTH SIDES
OF THIS RENTAL AGREEMENT AND AGHEE THEHEGF.

SIEANED BY THE FARTIES HERETOON THE i ieianiimrmm i it bss i b gem bl

e

DYNAMIC CAR RENTAL

X




DYNAMIC CAR RENTAL

1 Kaki Bukit Ave 6 #01-46 Autobay

Singapore 417883

Tel No: 6741 7244 / 6746 5405 Fax No:67458520
Co. Reg No: 52928467K

To: SENG FOODSTALL Invoice : DCR-2018-02-17

Date : 24.02.2018
Agreement No © 18831

Ref . LOD
DESCRIPTION AMOUNT
Rental charges for vehicle : SGW3568E ( 0218-20145 ) g 1,620.00
Rental Period from 15.02.2018 to 24.02.2018
E. & O, E. Total 3 1,620.00
Hayly L Dok Leng

for Dynamic Car Rental



150212018 Invaice

GENERAL INSURANCE ASSOCIATION OF SINGAPORE

NERAL RECORDS MANAGEMENT CENTRE
& Raffles Quay #18-00, Singapore 048580

INSURANCE Phone: +65 6224 0010 Fax: +65 6224 0030

ASSOCIATION Operating Hours: Monday to Friday 9am to S5pm
RECORDS MANAGEMENT CENTRE GST Registration No: M400017735

Third Party Insurer Enquiry

Our Ref No: GR-18-025286
Date of Request: 15/02/2018 Your Ref Mo: Online Purchase

Kim Chwee Auto Pte Lid

1 Kaki Bukit Avenue 6 #01-48
AutoBay@Kaki Bukit
Singapaore 417883

Dear Sir/Madam,

Enquiry Date 15/02/2018
Enguiry By Jason Tang Jun Zhong
‘E Vehicle No. SLE3971J
.cident Date 14/02/2018

Enguiry Result

TP Vehicle No. Insurer Period of Insurance Insurer Tel. No.
SLE3971J China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pte. Ltd, 16/04/2017-15/04/2018 63849 6111
Thank You.

The images provided to you are taken from the original reports forwarded 1o the centra by the members of the General Insurance Association of
Singapore and we lake no responsibility for their accuracy or contents and shall be under na liability whatsoever for any loss or damage arising out of
or in connection with the reports or their images,

This is a computer generated document and requires no signature.
-~

hitps:iisingapore merimen, comiclaimsindex cfm?fusebox=MTRsas&fuseaction=dsp_geninviparefid=1725117&CFID= 2BES1601&CFTOKEN=2120... 12



15:02/2018 Invoice

‘A GENERAL INSURANCE ASSOCIATION OF SINGAPORE
ki ﬁ"ERAL RECORDS MANAGEMENT CENTRE

6 Raffles Quay #18-00, Singapore 048580
INSURANCE Phone: +65 6224 0010 Fax; +65 6224 0030
i ASSOCIATION Operating Hours: Monday to Friday Sam to Spm
= istrat ’ 00017735
RECORDS MANAGEMENT CENTRE ST Registration No: M4

TAX INVOICE
Our Ref Me: GR-18-025286
Date of Reguest 15/02/2018 Your Ref No: Oniline Purchase
Kim Chwes Auto Ple Lid
1 Kaki Bukit Avenue 6 #01-48
AutoBay@kaki Bukit
Singapore 417883
Dear SirfMadam,
Enquiry Date 15/02/2018
Enquiry By Jason Tang Jun Zhong
;P Wehicle No. SLE3971J
-cident Date 14/02/2018
DESCRIPTION AMOUNT (S%)
TP Insurer Enguiry 1.87
GST Amount 0.13
Total Amount Due (GST Inclusive) 2.00
Thank You.

This is a computer generated document and requires no signature.

For GIARMC Official use:
Date:
[X] GIRO [] Cash [ ] Cheque
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