Vic (LKKAuto)

From:
Sent:
To:
Cc:

Subject:

Hi Both,

Sayedinah <sayedinah@motorimage.net>

Tuesday, 2 October, 2018 4:00 PM

Shu Pei (LKKAuto); Vic (LKKAuto)

Denise Tay (LKKAuto); Admin A; Daniel Lim; Daniel Jude; Kuan Wei Loong;
Mohamed Isman; Kenneth Kong (LKKAuto); 'CST'; motor.survey@axa.com.sg
Re: SJJ1308K - SLW1607E (TP) - 3RD PARTY CLAIM - FINALIZED

kindly take note that my insured has paid the repair cost in full to Motorimage Enterprises Pte Ltd and will
engage his legal counsel to recover repair,rental and medical from AXA directly. We will close the case our

end .

Regards
Sayedinah Ali
Service Executive

Motor Image Enterprises Pte Ltd

19 Lorong 8 Toa Payoh Singapore 319255
HP;92992693 DID:67038109 FAX:+65-62535535

Email:sayedinah@motorimage.net

Website:www.tanchong.com :: www.motorimage.net

From: Shu Pei (LKKAuto) <shupei@lkkauto.com>

Sent: Tuesday, 28 August 2018 5:51 PM

To: Sayedinah; Kenneth Kong (LKKAuto); Vic (LKKAuto)

Cc: Denise Tay (LKKAuto); Admin A; Daniel Lim; Daniel Jude; Kuan Wei Loong; Mohamed Isman
Subject: FW: SJJ1308K - SLW1607E (TP) - 3RD PARTY CLAIM - FINALIZED

Dear Sir / Madam,

Thank you for your email.

Our respective case handler will look into the matter and revert to you in due course.

Please note that: -

LKK ref

Officer in charge

CC4/ASM18003242/Khb3

Kenneth / Vic

To check availability of the case handler, you may contact the undersigned.

Best Regards,
Shu Pei| Admin
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6366-0055 | email: shupei@Ikkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)



From: Sayedinah <sayedinah@motorimage.net>

Sent: Tuesday, 28 August 2018 5:43 PM

To: Kenneth Kong (LKKAuto) <KennethKong@Ikkauto.com>

Cc: Denise Tay (LKKAuto) <denisetay@Ilkkauto.com>; Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>; Daniel Lim
<daniellim@motorimage.net>; Daniel Jude <danieljude@motorimage.net>; Kuan Wei Loong
<weiloong@motorimage.net>; Mohamed Isman <isman@motorimage.net>

Subject: FW: SJJ1308K - SLW1607E (TP) - 3RD PARTY CLAIM - FINALIZED

Importance: High

Hi Kenneth,
Attached for your reference and closure on an urgent basis.

Regards

Sayedinah Ali

Service Executive

Motor Image Enterprises Pte Ltd

19 Lorong 8 Toa Payoh Singapore 319255
HP;92992693 DID:67038109 FAX:+65-62535535
Email:sayedinah@motorimage.net

Website:www.tanchong.com :: www.motorimage.net

From: Daniel Jude

Sent: Saturday, 12 May 2018 11:23 AM

To: kennethkong@lkkauto.com

Cc: Sayedinah <sayedinah@motorimage.net>; Daniel Lim <daniellim@motorimage.net>; Kuan Wei Loong
<weiloong@motorimage.net>; Katherine Chong <katherinechong@motorimage.net>; Christy Sai
<christy@motorimage.net>

Subject: SJJ1308K - SLW1607E (TP) - 3RD PARTY CLAIM - FINALIZED

Hi Kenneth,
Attached for your reference and follow-up.

Best Regards

Daniel A Jude

Service Executive

Motor Image Enterprises Pte Ltd

19 Lorong 8 Toa Payoh Singapore 319255

HP: 8611 3195

Email: danieljude@motorimage.net

Website: www.tanchong.com : www.motorimage.net




Disclaimer: This e-mail is confidential. It may also be legally privileged. If you are not the addressee you may not copy, forward, disclose or
use any part of this message. If you have received this message in error, please delete it and all copies from your system and notify the
sender immediately by return e-mail. Internet communications cannot be guaranteed to be timely, secure, error-free or virus-free. The

sender does not accept liability for any errors or omissions.



