Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

From:
Sent:
To:

Cc:
Subject:

Attachments:

Hi Hsiao Tong,

dithium Tan <ahpei21@hotmail.com>

Monday, 12 March 2018 11:20 PM

Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

roger@Icp.com.sg

Re: ACCIDENT INVOLVING FBG 2241Y AND SHD 9213C ON 13/02/2018 /
RY/R6-013-18/kl

eReport.pdf

| do not agree with that the liability is caused entirely by my negligence.

| have attached my police report for your reference. | also have the video footage of the accident retrieved from my
motorcycle. As the file is too large to be sent, kindly call me to arrange for a meet up if required.

Do not to make any offer or settle the claim by SHD 9213C without getting my consent. | have appointed Roger Yek
(in cc.) from Lawrence Chua Practice LLC to act for me to make a claim against the driver of SHD 9213C for
my injury. Kindly contact him at 6221 1311 to discuss liability.

Please quote the file reference RY/R6-013-18/kl when you contact him to discuss this case. This will help him to

identify and retrieve the file.

Regards,
Tan Pei Pei
Mobile: 9752 9788

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@Ikkauto.com>
Sent: Thursday, March 8, 2018 9:53 AM

To: AHPEI21@HOTMAIL.COM

Subject: ACCIDENT INVOLVING FBG 2241Y AND SHD 9213C ON 13/02/2018

08 MARCH 2018

Our Ref: CC3/EQI18003140/Kps3

MS TAN PEI PEI

Dear Sir/Madam,

ACCIDENT INVOLVING FBG 2241Y AND SHD 9213C ON 13/02/2018

We refer to the above subject matter. We write to inform you that we are the loss adjuster appointed by
your motor insurer, EQ Insurance Company Ltd to deal with the third party claim against your policy.

We have received a claim from SHD 9213C against your insurance policy.

Based on the accident report and accident scenario, liability is down against us. We will therefore proceed
to negotiate for an amicable settlement with the Third Party.

Should you however wish to further discuss on the matter prior to our negotiations and settlement, please
contact us within 10 days from the date of this letter.



Please note that your No-Claim Discount (NCD) (if any) will be affected and reduced by 30% (20% for
commercial vehicles) upon next renewal due to this Third Party claim. However, if your policy has a NCD
protector feature, it will be deemed utilized for this claim and your NCD will be protected.

Please call us if you have further queries.

Yours faithfully,

CHEW HSIAO TONG

Case Handler

DID: 6742 3197

FAX: 6741 4108

EMAIL: chewht@lkkauto.com

c.c. EQINSURANCE COMPANY LIMITED
(Motor Claims Dept)



