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Bevan Lim (LKK Auto)

From: Kuenzler Martin <Martin.Kuenzler@lgt.com>

Sent: Friday, 9 March 2018 5:07 PM

To: Bevan Lim (LKK Auto)

Cc: Vic (LKKAuto); Admin A

Subject: RE: Your Ref: SLK 3591R,Our Ref:  CC3/AIG18003130/ms3 ACCIDENT INVOLVING SLK 

3591R AND SG 5576K ON 18/12/2017 

Signed By: martin.kuenzler@lgt.com

Follow Up Flag: Follow up

Flag Status: Flagged

Thank you 
 
It has been clearly my fault, we should settle therefore 
 
Regards 
Martin 
 

From: Bevan Lim (LKK Auto) [mailto:bevanlim@lkkauto.com]  

Sent: Friday, March 09, 2018 4:56 PM 
To: Kuenzler Martin 

Cc: Vic (LKKAuto); Admin A 
Subject: Your Ref: SLK 3591R,Our Ref: CC3/AIG18003130/ms3 ACCIDENT INVOLVING SLK 3591R AND SG 5576K ON 

18/12/2017  

 

Your Ref: SLK 3591R 
Our Ref:  CC3/AIG18003130/ms3 
             
Dear Sir/Madam, 
 
ACCIDENT INVOLVING SLK 3591R AND SG 5576K ON 18/12/2017  
 
We refer to the above accident where we are acting for AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte Ltd to resolve the claim against you 
and/or your authorized driver under the Auto Insurance policy taken up with them. 
 
Based on the accident report and accident scenario, liability is down against us. We will therefore proceed to negotiate for 
an amicable settlement with the Third Party. 
 
Should you however wish to further discuss on the matter prior to our negotiations and settlement, please contact us within 
7 days from the date of this letter. 
 
Please note that your No-Claim Discount (NCD)(if any) will be affected and reduced by 30% (20% for commercial vehicles) 
upon next renewal due to this Third Party claim. However, if your policy has a NCD protector feature, it will be deemed 
utilized for this claim and your NCD will be protected.  
 
Please call us if you have further queries. 
 

 

 
Best Regards, 

Bevan Lim | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6749-4274 | email: BevanLim@lkkauto.com| fax: 6741-4108 
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Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

Save the Earth. Print only when necessarySave the Earth. Print only when necessarySave the Earth. Print only when necessarySave the Earth. Print only when necessary.... 

 

_______________________ 
LGT Bank (Singapore) Ltd. 
3 Temasek Avenue | #30-01 Centennial Tower | Singapore 039190 | www.lgt.com/asia 

This message may contain confidential information and is intended only for the named addressee. Any dissemination, 
disclosure, copying or use by persons or entities other than the intended recipient is prohibited. If you have received this 
in error, please notify the sender and delete the material from your system. LGT Bank (Singapore) Ltd. and/or its 
associated entities (collectively “LGT”) makes no representation or warranty of any kind relating (but not limited) to the 
accuracy or completeness of any information provided in this email. LGT accepts no liability whatsoever for any direct, 
indirect consequential loss arising from or in connection with any use of, or reliance on, this email and the information 
contained herein. This email is subject to important disclaimers, risk disclosure and other conditions available at 
http://www.lgt.com/asia/emaildisclosure 

Note: LGT receives monetary benefits in connection with transactions effected for customers as part of its business. 
Please refer to the document “Services and Fees” for details. A copy of the “Services and Fees” is available upon 
request. 


