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Vic (LKKAuto)

From: Khar Kian Toh <tohkk_90@hotmail.com>

Sent: Wednesday, 16 October, 2019 2:02 PM

To: Vic (LKKAuto)

Cc: Rasul (LKKAuto)

Subject: RE: FINALIZE FOR VEHICLE SJU3622G LUMPSUM $2,000.00 WITH 4 REPAIR DAYS

Attachments: SJU3622G TAX INVOICE LOD LOA LTA SEARCH.pdf

Dear All, 
 
Kindly acknowledge above attachment is our Tax invoice, LOD, LOA , and LTA Search Fee, 
 
Breakdown: 
                                                                                                                               Amount($) 
1) Repair cost                                                                                                         $2000.00 
2) Loss of Use (4days =$100x4 days)                                                                    $400.00 
3) Miscellaneous (LTA Search Fee)                                                                       $7.45 
                                                                                                                                    
                                                                                                     Total                  $2407.45  

 
Please check and revert. 
 
Best Regards, 
Toh Khar Kian 

 
Li Sheng Automobile Trading 
18 Pandan Loop #01-18 Singapore 128236 (Blk K) 
Mobile: (65) 83987469 l Fax: 67744885 
Email : tohkk_90@hotmail.com 

 

 

 

From: Khar Kian Toh  

Sent: Wednesday, 24 July, 2019 12:48 PM 

To: Rasul (LKKAuto) <Rasul@lkkauto.com> 

Subject: RE: FINALIZE FOR VEHICLE SJU3622G LUMPSUM $2,000.00 WITH 4 REPAIR DAYS 

 

Hi Rasul,   

The above attachment is the after paint photo and reverse sensor photo and finalize estimate. 

Can help to finalize FOR VEHICLE SJU3622G LUMPSUM $2,000.00 WITH 4 REPAIR DAYS. 

No Supplementary item. 

Please check and revert.  

 
Best Regards, 
Toh Khar Kian 
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Li Sheng Automobile Trading 
18 Pandan Loop #01-18 Singapore 128236 (Blk K) 
Mobile: (65) 83987469 l Fax: 67744885 
Email : tohkk_90@hotmail.com 

 

 

From: winson ong [mailto:winsonls@yahoo.com]  

Sent: Friday, 19 July, 2019 11:12 AM 

To: Toh Khar Kian <tohkk_90@hotmail.com> 

Subject: Fw: FINALIZE FOR VEHICLE SJU3622G LUMPSUM $2,000.00 WITH 4 REPAIR DAYS 

 

 

 

Thanks 

 

Winson Ong 

97684247 

LI SHENG Automobile Trading 

Blk K Pandan Loop #01-18  

Singapore 128236 

 

 
----- Forwarded message ----- 
From: Rasul (LKKAuto) <Rasul@lkkauto.com> 
To: winson ong <winsonls@yahoo.com> 
Cc: Richard Toh Chin Huat <lishengauto@yahoo.com.sg>; Joy Irene (LKKAuto) <JoyIrene@lkkauto.com> 
Sent: Thursday, 11 July 2019, 09:26:25 am GMT+8 
Subject: RE: FINALIZE FOR VEHICLE SJU3622G LUMPSUM $2,000.00 WITH 4 REPAIR DAYS 
 

Hi Winson, 

  

Finalised amount confirmed 

  

  

  

Best Regards, 

Rasul | Assessor 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: Rasul@lkkauto.com | fax: 6841-4315 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 
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Save the Earth. Print only when necessary. 

  

From: winson ong [mailto:winsonls@yahoo.com]  
Sent: Tuesday, 6 March, 2018 8:54 AM 
To: Rasul (LKKAuto) 
Cc: SUR; Richard Toh Chin Huat 
Subject: FINALIZE FOR VEHICLE SJU3622G LUMPSUM $2,000.00 WITH 4 REPAIR DAYS 

  

Hi Morning Rasul,  

  

The above attachment is the after paint photo and reverse sensor photo and finalize estimate. 

  

Can help to finalize FOR VEHICLE SJU3622G LUMPSUM $2,000.00 WITH 4 REPAIR DAYS. 

  

No Supplementary item. 

  

Please check and revert.  

  

Thanks 

  

Winson Ong 

97684247 

LI SHENG Automobile Trading 

Blk K Pandan Loop #01-18  

Singapore 128219 


