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Vivian Lau (LKKAuto)

From: Loi Ai Ting <aiting.loi@cyclecarriage.com.sg>

Sent: Thursday, 16 August, 2018 5:13 PM

To: Vivian Lau (LKKAuto)

Cc: Thin Thin (LKKAuto); Lauro Araos Songcuan Jr; Cheng Jo Jo; Andre Chow En De; Tay 

Jian Ye

Subject: RE: Your Ref: SLC 9724C ,Our Ref: CC4/EQI1803035/R1wa3,Accident involving 

Vehicle SLC 9724C & SJU 8680E ON 12/02/2018

Hi, Vivian, 

 

Checked with the owner, owner said he do not have company stamp.  

 

He have checked with Registrar of Companies that it is NOT A MUST to have company stamp, therefore he did not 

prepare one.  

 

We have several other cases without company stamp also. 

 

Appreciate your understanding. 

 

 
Best Regards, 
 
Loi Ai Ting 
Customer Service Advisor 
 
 

 
 
Cycle & Carriage Singapore •  209 Pandan Gardens, Singapore 609339 
T: +65 6568 4556  •  F: +65 6565 1240  •  www.cyclecarriage.com.sg 
 

 
 

 

From: Vivian Lau (LKKAuto) [mailto:vivianlau@lkkauto.com]  

Sent: Thursday, 16 August, 2018 3:57 PM 

To: Loi Ai Ting 

Cc: Thin Thin (LKKAuto); Lauro Araos Songcuan Jr; Cheng Jo Jo; Andre Chow En De 

Subject: RE: Your Ref: SLC 9724C ,Our Ref: CC4/EQI1803035/R1wa3,Accident involving Vehicle SLC 9724C & SJU 

8680E ON 12/02/2018 

 

WTHOUT PREJUDICE 
 
Dear Ms Loi, 
 
We refer to the email below.  
 
Kindly let us have a copy of the Authorisation to Act with your client’s company chop and sign 
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Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of 

resolving the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be 

deemed / inferred from this negotiation of terms/settlement. 

  

In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the 

issues of liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement. 

   

 

 

Thank you 

Best Regards, 

Vivian Lau| Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6841-8625 | email: Vivianlau@lkkauto.com| fax: 6741-4108 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

  

  

  

  

 

 

 

From: Loi Ai Ting [mailto:aiting.loi@cyclecarriage.com.sg]  

Sent: Wednesday, 15 August, 2018 11:05 AM 

To: Vivian Lau (LKKAuto) <vivianlau@lkkauto.com> 

Cc: Thin Thin (LKKAuto) <thinthin@lkkauto.com>; Lauro Araos Songcuan Jr <lauro.songcuan@cyclecarriage.com.sg>; 

Cheng Jo Jo <jojo.cheng@cyclecarriage.com.sg>; Andre Chow En De <andre.chow@cyclecarriage.com.sg> 

Subject: RE: Your Ref: SLC 9724C ,Our Ref: CC4/EQI1803035/R1wa3,Accident involving Vehicle SLC 9724C & SJU 

8680E ON 12/02/2018 

 

Hi, Vivian, 

 

Noted with thanks. 

 

Awaiting for your payment. 

 

Appreciate. 

 

 

Regards, 

Loi 

 

From: Vivian Lau (LKKAuto) [mailto:vivianlau@lkkauto.com]  

Sent: Wednesday, 15 August, 2018 10:07 AM 

To: Loi Ai Ting 

Cc: Thin Thin (LKKAuto); Lauro Araos Songcuan Jr; Cheng Jo Jo; Andre Chow En De 

Subject: RE: Your Ref: SLC 9724C ,Our Ref: CC4/EQI1803035/R1wa3,Accident involving Vehicle SLC 9724C & SJU 

8680E ON 12/02/2018 

 

WTHOUT PREJUDICE 
 
Dear Ms Loi, 
 
We refer to the email below.  
 
We confirm settlement amount $ 11,108.60 
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For EQ cases settlement below $ 20,000.00 no DV needed.  
 
As such we will process to closed the matter.  
 
 

 

EQ 

“Please note that our above settlement is made on a without prejudice basis, and should not be construed as an admission of liability on 

our part or on the part of our insured/driver.  Terms of such settlement should also not be disclosed in any other related matter(s) in 

respect of the accident.  Our offer made in respect of this present matter is made solely to resolve this matter only.  No reference shall be 

made to this offer or any settlement arising from this offer in any other related matters. 

 

Settlement and payment are subject to production of original documents on demand at any time and execution of Discharge Voucher (for 

settlement sum above $20,000/-) by the Plaintiff/Claimant.  Further all original documents shall be retained by us after we have made 

payment on the settlement sum.” 

 

 

Thank you 

Best Regards, 

Vivian Lau| Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6841-8625 | email: Vivianlau@lkkauto.com| fax: 6741-4108 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

  

  

  

  

 

From: Loi Ai Ting [mailto:aiting.loi@cyclecarriage.com.sg]  

Sent: Tuesday, 14 August, 2018 11:11 AM 

To: Vivian Lau (LKKAuto) <vivianlau@lkkauto.com> 

Cc: Thin Thin (LKKAuto) <thinthin@lkkauto.com>; Lauro Araos Songcuan Jr <lauro.songcuan@cyclecarriage.com.sg>; 

Cheng Jo Jo <jojo.cheng@cyclecarriage.com.sg>; Andre Chow En De <andre.chow@cyclecarriage.com.sg> 

Subject: RE: Your Ref: SLC 9724C ,Our Ref: CC4/EQI1803035/R1wa3,Accident involving Vehicle SLC 9724C & SJU 

8680E ON 12/02/2018 

 

Dear Vivian, 

 

For amicable settlement, we accept your offer of total at $11,108.60. 

 

COST OF REPAIR                                             $ 10,250.60 
Loss of RENTAL ( $100.00 x 8days +GST)      $      856.00 
LTA SEARCH                                                   $          2.00 
             

                                                                          $ 11,108.60 
 

Kindly issue DV through email. 

 

Appreciate. 

 

 
Best Regards, 
 
Loi Ai Ting 
Customer Service Advisor 
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Cycle & Carriage Singapore •  209 Pandan Gardens, Singapore 609339 
T: +65 6568 4556  •  F: +65 6565 1240  •  www.cyclecarriage.com.sg 
 

 
 

 

From: Vivian Lau (LKKAuto) [mailto:vivianlau@lkkauto.com]  

Sent: Monday, 13 August, 2018 9:46 AM 

To: Lauro Araos Songcuan Jr; Andre Chow En De; Loi Ai Ting; Coco Lu Ting; Yusof Bin Hashim; Tay Jian Ye 

Cc: Thin Thin (LKKAuto) 

Subject: Your Ref: SLC 9724C ,Our Ref: CC4/EQI1803035/R1wa3,Accident involving Vehicle SLC 9724C & SJU 8680E 

ON 12/02/2018 

 

WTHOUT PREJUDICE 
 
Your Ref: SLC 9724C  
Our Ref: CC4/EQI1803035/R1wa3 
 

Dear Sir/Madam, 
 
Accident involving Vehicle SLC 9724C & SJU 8680E ON 12/02/2018 
 
We refer to the above matter. 
 
On a without prejudice basis, our principal propose settlement as follow:  
 
COST OF REPAIR                                             $ 10,250.60 
Loss of RENTAL ( $100.00 x 8days +GST)      $   850.00 
LTA SEARCH                                                   $     2.00 
             
                                                                          $ 11,108.60 
 
Kindly confirm acceptance 

 

EQ 

“Please note that our above settlement is made on a without prejudice basis, and should not be construed as an admission of liability on 

our part or on the part of our insured/driver.  Terms of such settlement should also not be disclosed in any other related matter(s) in 

respect of the accident.  Our offer made in respect of this present matter is made solely to resolve this matter only.  No reference shall be 

made to this offer or any settlement arising from this offer in any other related matters. 

 

Settlement and payment are subject to production of original documents on demand at any time and execution of Discharge Voucher (for 

settlement sum above $20,000/-) by the Plaintiff/Claimant.  Further all original documents shall be retained by us after we have made 

payment on the settlement sum.” 

 

 

Thank you 

Best Regards, 

Vivian Lau| Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6841-8625 | email: Vivianlau@lkkauto.com| fax: 6741-4108 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

  

  

  



5

  

 

DISCLAIMER:- This email and any attachment to it is confidential and intended only for the use of the 
individual or entity named above and may contain information that is privileged. If you are not the intended 
recipient, you are notified that any dissemination, distribution or copying of this email or any attachment is 
strictly prohibited. If you have received this email in error, please notify us immediately by return email and 
destroy the original message. Any views expressed are those of the individual sender, and not necessarily 
the views of Cycle Carriage Industries Pte Ltd and/or any of its related corporations.  
DISCLAIMER:- This email and any attachment to it is confidential and intended only for the use of the 
individual or entity named above and may contain information that is privileged. If you are not the intended 
recipient, you are notified that any dissemination, distribution or copying of this email or any attachment is 
strictly prohibited. If you have received this email in error, please notify us immediately by return email and 
destroy the original message. Any views expressed are those of the individual sender, and not necessarily 
the views of Cycle Carriage Industries Pte Ltd and/or any of its related corporations.  
DISCLAIMER:- This email and any attachment to it is confidential and intended only for the use of the 
individual or entity named above and may contain information that is privileged. If you are not the intended 
recipient, you are notified that any dissemination, distribution or copying of this email or any attachment is 
strictly prohibited. If you have received this email in error, please notify us immediately by return email and 
destroy the original message. Any views expressed are those of the individual sender, and not necessarily 
the views of Cycle Carriage Industries Pte Ltd and/or any of its related corporations.  


