Thin Thin (LKKAuto)

From: Thin Thin (LKKAuto)

Sent: Wednesday, 25 July 2018 10:33 AM

To: ‘chan pick yuen'

Cc: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto)

Subject: RE: SKX5873H Part By Invoice *** LKK REF: CC6/11118002978/Aua3
Attachments: Ol Statement.pdf

Dear Chris,

Enclosed herewith our insured statement as requested.

Kindly let us have your video footage as stated in your client report to justify your client’s claim smoothly and promptly.
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Best Regards,

Thin Thin Hlaing | Case Handler
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
Phone: 6841-2360 | email: thinthin@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: chan pick yuen <chris_chanbebe@hotmail.com>

Sent: Wednesday, 25 July 2018 10:28 AM

To: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto) <Meikwan@lkkauto.com>

Cc: Thin Thin (LKKAuto) <thinthin@Ilkkauto.com>

Subject: Re: SKX5873H Part By Invoice *** LKK REF: CC6/11118002978/Aua3

Dear Sir / Mdm,

Your insured is taxi & hit from behind . send us your insured report .



You better ask your taxi ( taxi sure got video, if your taxi cant submit video that mean he got fault ) driver
send your video if he no do agreed to bear liability . Thanks

Regards,
Chris Chan Pick Yuen

From: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto) <Meikwan@lkkauto.com>

Sent: Wednesday, July 25, 2018 10:16 AM

To: chan pick yuen; Thin Thin (LKKAuto)

Cc: Admin A; Vivian Lau (LKKAuto)

Subject: RE: SKX5873H Part By Invoice *** LKK REF: CC6/11118002978/Aua3

Dear Chris,
We refer to the above matter.

Please provide us the evidence i.e. video and scene photo

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Mei Kwan | Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6366 0055 | email: MeiKwan@Ikkauto.com | fax: 67414108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto)

Sent: Wednesday, 25 July, 2018 9:55 AM

To: chan pick yuen <chris_chanbebe@hotmail.com>; Thin Thin (LKKAuto) <thinthin@I|kkauto.com>
Cc: Admin A <admin-a@Ilkkauto.com>; Vivian Lau (LKKAuto) <vivianlau@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: SKX5873H Part By Invoice *** LKK REF: CC6/11118002978/Aua3

Dear Sir / Madam,

Thank you for your email.

Please note that: -

LKK ref Officer in charge
CC6/11118002978/Aua3 Thin Thin - 6841 2360

Our respective case handler will look into the matter and revert to you in due course.

To check availability of the case handler, you may contact the undersigned.
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Thank you.

Best Regards,

Mei Kwan | Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6366 0055 | email: MeiKwan@Ikkauto.com | fax: 67414108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: chan pick yuen <chris chanbebe@hotmail.com>
Sent: Monday, 23 July, 2018 9:38 PM

To: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>

Subject: SKX5873H Part By Invoice

Dear Sir and Madam,

Enclosed is our GIA report , invoice, & LOU
Please advise OIC & claim no .

As request following :

1. RC S$1300(AS AGREED)

2. LOU $150 ( $ 50X 3DAYS)

Total $ 1450./-.

Please let us have your offer soon . Thanks

Regards,

Chris Chan Pick Yuen
HO BENG TRADING
HP:92712214



