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L5¢ &S
Enquire PARF/COE Rebate for Registered Vehicle

L Whi:leﬂmhtimhr: ) . )
Chainar ln'ﬂrm Singapore NRIC

thwurtn:

|_Vehicle Details _

 Vehicle No. .  sxpemiam
| VehdetobeBwportsd: T e -
'|mmu-rmmn:n= - © 28keb2058
;;Iﬁh”lh: . - HGNER o R R
| VehicleModet: -  cvcisvmsar
| pdmayColows e T T -
| Menutacturing¥ear: 2011 - S
s 0 L e T
| Comsssne: T | HMFB1630CS200208
AN O T S nﬂmtmm "~ el .
| OsenMoreetvaie © so1e0s00
| Orighal RegatrationDite: - 26sn2022 -
| FrstRegistrationDate: ~ 2ssn2012 .
T e )
Actual ARF Paid: d  saeeo0 -
i MMRFMDIHE
| PARF Exgibility i - ves T -
PARF Elgibility Expiry Date a © 25Jan2022 I
— PASFRebateAmownt  s1ape300 :
| Minnohd COF Ribsta il = ol
CCE Expiry Dat=: 25 Jan 2002
| coEcstsgory . A-Car(1600cc&below) o
| COEPeriodevears: w7
— e —— -
" COE Rebate Amount - s1828900 Yy M

wmm $32 332 00

| Message —

Trarrsfer of ownershio or de-registration is not allowed for this vehicle, Plesse contact LTA at  1800-CALL LTA (1800-2255 582) for further
assiftance.

The inforrration contained herein is corract as at 01 Feb 2018

enoo, 1ooo @ TH WA TAHN LIGH¥D I¥V4d 0T:TE 8T0Z EZ0/T1



Enquire Road Tax Expiry Date (Details)

Veicke Particulars o -

Yehicle No:: 1 EXDTFT14M n N

Rosd Tax Explry Date: 25 Jul 2017 (Road tax has expired. it is an offence to use the vehicke
| o . N B - on the roads without valid road tax)

etrichs Malos: HOMNDA . . ’ -

Vahiche Madek a ) EMCL;!I_TISAT_ o )
| Please note: _ - : -
| The Information contafned herein s correct as ot 01 Feb 2018/ 19:40,

OK | SaveasPOF
IH WHIAHH L1O0EHD X¥d 03T A10Z f0.2]

¢oo0/ 2000



15/02 2018 13:25 FaX CREDIT REVIEW HL ifoool /o001

21512018 PARFICOE Retiste Enquiry DELUL\5
Celing -

Enquire PARF/COE Rebate for Registered Vehicle

‘Vehicle Owner Particulars -
e e L
Owner ID: o - I
Vehicle Details
Vahldu;Nn.: : SKDP?HM. ——— TR
e e
Intendu;:t_lge-registratiuun Date: “ 28 Feb 2018 - -
e e
Vehicle Model; - o CNI&:& VTIS AT
Primary Colour: End
[ endastewes . = .
Engine No.: o R156B11000361
crasiNos  ;weetesocsaoo208
MmimamPowerOutoct  s20Kw(2sbhe)
i Open Market Value: $21.606.00 o
t-:'rigilnal Eﬁﬁ—wiﬁGnBaE;_ y N iﬁ Jaﬂ-ZDTI [r——
First Registration Date: | - . mm zd;.lanlﬂl-z- B _' o
TransferCmmt:_ iy - W IJ — - — s I
| AcwalARFPaE 52160600 N .
Intended PARF Rebate Details _ B
 PARF Eligibility: T Yes _
nrmoemBenDes  2smem:z
e aeem

Intended COE Rebate Details
COE Expiry Date: 25 Jan 2022
mam.m.wmwwﬁmmaﬁmwm;mﬂ




15-02 2018 13:26 FAX CREDIT REVIEW HL @ oool/ 000l

215208 PARF/ICOE Rebate Enquiry

' COECategory: _ © A-Car(1600cc & below) n
COE Period(Years): 10 :
QP Paid: ' -~ sassse0
COERebateAmount:  $i828%00

" Total Rebate Amount: | $3233200
Message
“Transfer of awnership or de-registration is not allowed for this vehicle. Please contact LTA at 1800-CALL LTA
(1800-2255 582) for further assistance. |

Theirfnnmﬁoncmﬂmdherﬂn Iscontctasatiﬁ&hzma

hitpa:/furt Ita. gov sgMaivrifactionfenquiraebateByPubicBeforeDereginput 7FUNCTION_ID=F0304009TT



Caline Funa {I.I{Imuinl

From: Bryan Ang (LKKAuUto)

Sent: Thursday, 15 February 2018 1:01 PM
To: Poh Xeng TEO; Norrita (LKKAuto)
Ce SUR

Subject: RE: Valuation Reguest @ 13/02

D=ar Poh Keng
My surveyor will inspect the vehicle this afterncon.
The Indicative value for SKD 9714M Is:-

MV S50K
Fi3. $43K

Bist Regards,

Bryan Ang

LIKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

phone. 6256-3561 | emall: bryanang(@lkkauto com | fax 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S{408933)

From: Poh Keng TEO [mailto:pohkeng@dbs.com)
Sant: Thursday, 15 February 2018 12:21 PM

To: Norrita (LKKAuto) <nprrita@lkkauto.com>
Ce: SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: Valuation Request @ 13/02

Hi Miss Rita,

Please call Mr Yew at his mobile no. 96331670.
Thank you

Poh Keng

From: Poh Keng TEO
Sunt: Thursday, 15 February 2018 11:58 AM
To: 'Norrita (LKKAuto)' <norrita@lkkauto.com>

Cc: SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: Valuation Request @ 13/02

Hi Miss Rita,

The contact no. at the Grandstand is 6574 3008.
Plaase confirm If your surveyor is going down today?

Thank you
Poh Keng



From: Norrita (LKKAuto) [mailto:norrita@Ikkauto.com]
Sent: Thursday, 15 February 2018 11:46 AM

To: Poh Keng TEQ <pohkeng@dbs.com>
Ce: SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>
Subject: [External] RE: Valuation Request @ 13/02

De=ar Ms Poh
Kindly provide the Direct no. at the Grandstand .

Thank you

Bist Regards,

Rita AB |

LEK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 email: sur@lkkauto.com |Fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, PayaUbl Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

From: Poh Keng TEO [mailto:pohkeng@dbs.com]
Sent: Thursday, 15 February 2018 11:18 AM

To: Norrita [LKKAuto) <norrita@Iik m>
Subject: FW: Valuation Request @ 13/02

From: Poh Keng TEO

Sent: Thursday, 15 February 2018 11:15 AM

To: 'sur@lkkauto.com.' <sur@lkkauto.com.>

Ce: 'Celine Fong (LKKAuto)' <celinefong@Ikkauto.com>; Yuen Chiu AU YONG <yuenchiua dbs.com>
Subject: RE: Valuation Request @ 13/02

From: Poh Keng TEO

Sent: Thursday, 15 February 2018 10:51 AM

To: 'sur@lkkauto.com,' <suri@| mi.>

Cc: 'Celine Fong (LKKAuto)' <celinefong@Ikkauto.com>; Yuen Chiu AU YONG <yuenchiuauvong@dbs.com>

Subject: RE: Valuation Request @ 13/02
Hi Sur,

Would you be able to assist urgently?

Thank you

Pah Keng

From: Poh Keng TED

Sent: Thursday, 15 February 2018 10:48 AM

Ta: 'Celine Fong (LKKAuto)' <celinefong@lkkauto.com>; Yuen Chiu AU YONG <yuenchivauyong@dbs.com>

‘Subject: RE: Valuation Request @ 13/02



Hi Celine,
Will you be able to provide the indicative value for SKD3714M?

Thank you
Regards
Poh Keng

From: Celine Fong (LKKAute) [mailto:celinefong@lkkaute.com
Sent: Wednesday, 14 February 2018 2:56 PM

To: Yuen Chiu AU YONG <yuenchiuauyong@dbs.com>
Ce: Poh Keng TEO <pohk dbs.com>

Subject: [External] RE: Valuation Request @ 13/02

Dzar Au Yong,
The Valuation of vehicle as below:
GrandStand
1) SKDB437U MV: $35K FS: $27.3K
WC Pl

1) SKG5070Y MV; $86K FS: $68.9K
2) SKD9714M —Vehicle not in WCEGA

Hest Regards,

Celine Fong

LEK Auto Consultants Pre Lid

phone: 6256-3561 | email: celinpfong@likkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Bik 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Yuen Chiu AU YONG [mailto:yuenchivauyong@dbs.com]
Sent: Monday, 12 February 2018 9:51 PM
To: Celine Fong (LKKAuto) <celinefong@lkkauto.com>

C:: Poh Keng TEQ <pohkeng@dbs.com>
Subject: Valuation Request @ 13/02

Hi Celine,

Do need your assistance to obtain valuation for the following vehicles urgently.

CrandStand
1) SKDB43TU
!HQ@ Plaza

1) SKG5070Y
Z) SKDS714M



Log-cards faxed over

Thank you.

Au Yong

C3GAWWM Credit Collection
Risk Management Group
D3S Bank Lid

DID: +65 6878 9079

CONFIDENTIAL NOTE:

The information contained in this email is intended only for the use of the individual or entity named above and may
contain information that is privileged, confidential and exempt from disclosure under applicable law. If the reader of
this message Is not the intended recipient, you are hereby notified that any dissemination, distribution or copying of
this communication is strictly prohibited. If you have received this message in error, please immediately notify the
sender and delete the mail. Thank you.

CONFIDENTIAL NOTE:

The information contained in this email is intended only for the use of the individual or entity named above
and may contain information that is privileged, confidential and exempt from disclosure under applicable
law. If the reader of this message is not the intended recipient, you are hereby notified that any
d:ssemination, distribution or copying of this communication is strictly prohibited. If you have received this
message in error, please immediately notify the sender and delete the mail. Thank you.

CONFIDENTIAL NOTE:

The information contained in this email is intended only for the use of the individual or entity named above and may
contain information that is privileged, confidential and exempt from disclosure under applicable law. If the reader of
this message is not the intended recipient, you are hereby notified that any dissemination, distribution or copying of
this communication is strictly prohibited. If you have received this message in error, please immediately notify the
siinder and delete the mail. Thank you.
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