Bevan Lim (LKK Auto)

From: Shu Pei (LKKAUta)

Sent; Wednesday, 28 March 2018 7.04 PM

To: claims@torgues.com

Cc: Admin A; Bevan Lim (LKK Auto)

Subject: RE: Accident Involving SJJ 2770 B & SJR 4251 C on 10.02.2018
Attachments: image010.wmz; image021.wmgz; 5J) 2770 B LOD.pdf

Dear Sir / Madam,

Thank you for your email.

Our respective case handler will look into the matter and revert to you in due course.

Please note that: -

LKK ref Officer in charge
CC4/ASM18002921/Amb3 Bevan

To check availability of the case handler, you may contact the undersigned.

Best Regards,

Shu Pei| Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6366-0055 | email: shupei@ kkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5{408933)

From: Torque 5 Claims [mailto:claims@torque5.com)

Sent: Wednesday, 28 March 2018 6:14 PM

To: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com=

Cc: claims@torgueS.com

Subject: Accident Involving 5J) 2770 B & SIR 4251 C on 10.02.2018

WITHOUT PREJUDICE
Dear Sir/Mdm,
Attached is the Final repair bill, Loss of rental, LTA fee and GIA fee of the above mentioned vehicle.

Claim amount as per below:-

1. Repair Cost $ 1,712.00
2. Loss of Rental for 03 x $100/- per day 3 300.00
3. LTA/GIA fee % 31.00

TOTAL: 2,043 00

The above settlement is in respect of our client’s claim for damages pertaining to his motor vehicle and shall not prejudice our
client’s claim in respect of damages
and consequential loss in relation of his personal injuries.



Kindly acknowledge by replying to this email and let us have your offer soon.
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Your assistance is greatly appreciated
Thank you

Warmest Regards,
Suanne Tan

Claims Officer | Motor Claims Department

Hotling (65) 6452 4457 | Fax (65) 6452 4584
Mobile (65) 8468 2089

Email suannetan@torgques.com

Address 8§ Kaki Bukit Ave 4, #01-49/50/51/52/53/54

Premier (@ KB, Singapore 415875
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Bevan Lim (LKK Auto)

From: Bevan Lim (LKK Auto)

Sent: Friday, 13 April 2018 8:26 AM

To: 'scorpey@yahoo.com’

Cc: Vic (LKKAuUto)

Subject: OUR REF : CC4/ASM18002921/Amb3 YOUR REF : SJR 4251C ACCIDENT
INVOLVING SJR 4251C AND 5)) 27708 ALONG CARPARK OF 110 EUNQS AVE 7 ON
10.02.20185¢

13 APRIL 2018

SIMON YEO CHOON HOCK
ELK 10 TAO CHING ROAD
#14-24

SINGAPORE 618725

Dear Sir/Madam,

OUR REF : CC4/ASM18002921/Amb3

YOUR REF :SJR 4251C

ACCIDENT INVOLVING SJR 4251C AND SJJ 2770B ALONG CARPARK OF 110 EUNOS AVE 7 ON
10.02.2018

We refer to the above subject matter. We write to inform you that we are the loss adjuster appointed by your
motor insurer, AXA Insurance Pte Ltd to deal with the third party claim against your policy.

We have received a claim from M/s TORQUE 5 PTE LTD, acting on behalf of the owner of SJJ 2770B against
your motor insurance policy.

Based on the accident report, accident scenario, it was reported that your vehicle had collided with the Third
Party stationary vehicle SJJ 2770B. As such, liability is down against us.

Please be informed that your No Claim Discount (NCD) may be affected as a result of the claim against your
policy.

We shall proceed to deal with the claim(s) subject to the merits of the case and according to the rights afforded
under the policy. Should you not be seeking the protection of your policy and seek to take conduct of third party
claim(s) arising from this incident, at your own cost and defence, please reply to us within 7 days from the date
of this letter.

Your full co-operation in the handling of the claim is required and kindly submit the following to
bevanlim@l|kkauto com within 7 days from the date of this letter_if not provided at AXA's reporting centre.
The list below is not all inclusive and further document may be required:

« Police report, Police Investigation result, appeal against the Traffic Police offence and status (if any)
s Driver's driving license or foreign driving license (if any)
* Coloured photographs of accident scene (if any)

1



Coloured photographs of damage to all vehicles involved (If any)
Video footage of accident (if any)

« Statement and/or police report from independent witness(es) (if any)

= If you or your passenger(s) are filing a claim against any of the involved Third Party(s), you are to keep
us informed of your legal representative(s) and the status of the claim

To protect your interest(s) in the handling of this claim, please do not discuss liability with any of the Third
Party(s) and/or their legal representatives, or make any compromise or settlement without AXA’s prior
knowledge and consent.

This letter should not be regarded as a waiver by AXA of their rights to repudiate any claim because of any
breach of policy terms and conditions you and/or your autherised driver may have committed.

In the event of receiving and handling of any third party injury claim(s), AXA shall keep you informed of the final
indemnity upon conclusion of the matter(s).

If you need any clarification, please do not hesitate to contact us at 6749 4274 or email us at

bevanlim@lkkauto.com.

Please quote the claim reference when you contact us that we can assist you more effectively.

Best Regards,

Bevan Lim | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6749-4274 | email; BevanLim@lkkaoto.com| fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)
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Torque 5 Pte Ltd

‘»Y F (1A Mo.8 Kaki Bukit Ave 4, Premier @ Kaki Bukit, #01-50 Singapore 415875
¥ i J L Tel: +65 6452 4457 | Fax: +65 6452 4584 | Email: enquiry@torgues.com

Co. Reg. No.: 201313221G

LETTER OF AUTHORISATION
Accidenton 10 [02[3013 |13 along_ 110 Eun

Involving vehicles Sg3 23Tl ; STR HISI €

Inconsideration of Torque 5 Pte Ltd, B Kaki Bukit Ave 4, Premier @ Kaki Bukit #01-50
Singapore 415875, repairing my/our motor vehicleno __SJJ 3%Hpf  at my request,

I/We, Tbien Tnng Yak San (“the claimant”) of Blk &9 Bishan ST [
# 65 - & {.gs?ﬁ:icﬁ} (address) bearing NRICNo _S ¥33s0406 € the owner
of motor vehicleno _ £33 93% £ , hereby authorize them to demand claim, settle

and receive whatever amount settle payable by the insurance company or third party or
commence legal proceeding for cost of repairs, loss of use and etc to any of their appointed
solicitors to act for me/us in respect of the said accident/claim and all the amount claimed
or settled shall belong and make payable to them absolutely by the insurance company of
the third party. |/We further authorized them to give an absolute discharge on my/our
behalf and to sign discharge voucher(s) and any other documents necessary or incidentals to
the conduct and disposal of my/our above claims.

I/We further agree to fully co-operate and attend all court hearings that are necessary to
prosecute the claims maintained by Torque 5 Pte Ltd.

I/We further agree and undertake to indemnify them against my/our claim for costs which
arise therewith,

In the event that my/our claim Is unsuccessful, |/we undertake to pay to Torque 5 Pte Ltd
the cost of repairs to my/our vehicle.

In the event that the settlement/payment cheque is being made in my/our favour, |/we
hereby undertake to return the full amount to Torque 5 Pte Ltd account, within 7 days from
receiving and clearance of the said settlement/payment cheque. Falling which, Torque 5 Pte
Ltd will have the legal rights to take legal proceedings against me/us to recover the said sum,
with further costs and disbursements to be incurred by me/us.

I/We further authorize Torque 5 Pte Ltd to settle the aforesaid claim in a manner that you
deem fit and to utilize the monies to pay your charges without further reference to me/us.
The payment to Torque 5 Pte Ltd shall amount to a good discharge of Torque 5 Pte Ltd
obligation to me/us in respect of the settlement monies.

QUE 5 »
Dated this (o) dayof 03 (month) 20__I& _(year) ‘PWG
Jordes
M ]SS
: . ' %% 2agays1®
Sign‘éd by “the claimant” Signed by ﬁ,qﬁue 5 Pte Ltd

Name: Johign ]Ea% Yk Scn Name: Wfﬂh

NRIC No: __S 3336330 €
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\u¥ redefining / insurance

CLAIM REF : SBMOOBRY
INSURED : SIMON YEQ CHOON HOCK

DISCHARGE VOUCHER

We/l JOBIAN TANG YAN SAN, NRIC No. $7820220,/C) hereby agree to accept the sum of doflars [two
thousaimd forty-three anly] (55 2,043.00) pald to us/me by AXA INSURANCE PTE LTD as full and final
settlement of all claims of whatever kind including damages for persanal Injuries and damages to
property that wae/| may have against the said AXA INSURANCE PTE LTD or their Insured or the driver
of motor vehicle ng, SIR 4251C as a result of an accddent on 10" February 2018 of which we/|
were/was the driver/ awner/ hirer/ passenger/rider/pillion/ Insurer of mator vehicle no. 51) 27708,

Wae/fl hereby declare that the said insurer or owner andfor driver of Insured vehlcle shall not be
liable for any further clalm(s) whatsoever and whasoever present or future that we/l may have
against the sald Insurer, owner and/or driver of vehide no. SIR 4251C In connection directly or
indirectly with the sald accident and give our/my full and final discharge.

We/l hereby declare that we/l arefam the person(s) entitied to recelve the above settlement and
hereby undertake to Indemnify AXA INSURANCE PTE LTD against any claim made or to be made in
respect of this settlemant,

It Is understood and agreed that payment herein Is made without admission af llabllity whatsoever
an the part of the said insurer, awner and/for driver of vehicle no. 5I/R 4251C.

Dated this 16 day of Novembe v 2018

J%(J
Claimant’s Signature e JIr :
MRIC no.f Company Stamp : __S? H_?-‘:' 12 b!’f"

Occupation/ Business : ~

Address . Bk 109 BishanSteer | 2808180 S( S0 05 )
Telephone Nao. —
Witness's Name : l"\!'-* Llr""'"ﬂ.'l ]
Witness's Signature 2 :
Witness's NRIC Na. : SB92%4964F

F*r i g L“"”".F TIN—
A Wazurnice Ple Lid [Compary Reg. Mo, 1898035130) ot . A 1 ity oamari i ol gy
8 Shentan Way, #2401 AXA Towey, Singapore 083811 W R S afviing lioem e mame accunin
Cusbomer Cenlre UB1-04
Tel: +65 GAE0 4RBA Fax «65 G338 2522 Wabslls: vaveacy com sy

My expcy a

fion af
b’mp Claim hm‘m Wuﬂw.‘ only

) ¥ dam
¥ olhar cigimsg g rm:;‘ 0 6 preficig
ame accuiany




3 Torque 5 Pte Ltd
Mo.B Kaki Bukitc Ave 4, Premier @ Kaki Bukit, #01-50 Singapore 415875
@ RQU E Tel +65 6452 4457 | Fax: +65 6452 4584 | Emall: enquiry@torques.com
Co. & GST Reg. Ne.: 201313221G

Tax Invoice

AXA Insurance Singapore Pte Ltd Inv. No. 1 T51811098
8 Shenton Way Inv. Date : 16 Mowv 2018
#27-01 AXA Tower Ref . 10/02/2018
Singapare 0GEA11 Terms : 30 Days
Veh. No. ¢+ S)j27708
Make & Model : SUZLK] SX4 1.6NBE AT
# Dascription Qty UOM  Unit Price Disc Amt
1 TOSUPPLY SPARE PARTS AND LABOUR FOR 1.00 1,600.00 0.00 1,600.00
ACCIDENT REFAIR PARTS LUMP SUM AMOUNT
Subtotal : 5% 1.600.00
GST 7.0% : 5% 112.00
Total : 5% 1,712.00
I agree to the price as listed above and For TORQUE 5 PTE, LTD,
affirm that the goods are received in good QUE
>
condition, ! "\ﬁ$ ﬁ)

{Autharised 59"'@

n..
201313320
BAGE L OF 1

[Customar's Signature and Company Stamp)



Jobian Tang Yak San
109 Bishan Street 12 #05-180 s570109

c/o

Torque 5 Pte Ltd

8 Kakl Bukit Avenue 4, #01-50
Premier @ KB, Singapore 415875

Tel: 6452 4457 Fax: 6452 4584

Mo.8 Kaki Bukit Ave 4, Premier @ Kakl Bukit

#01-50 Singapore 415875
Tel: +65 6452 4457 Fax: +65 6452 4584

Email: leasing@torque5.com
Company Reg. No: 201530768C

Rental Invoice
Inv No. : 51803008
Date : 08 Mar 2018
Ref : 527708
Currency : 5GD
Terms : COD
RA No. : R1B030007
Veh No. : SGH5369D

#

Rental Period

Rate Disc Amt

1

Rental (05/03/2018 17:15 to 08/03/2018 14:30)

| agree to the price as listed above and
affirm that the goods are received in good

condition,

{Customer's Signature and Company Sl:amp:_ -

360.00 0.0000 360.00

Subtotal : 5% 360.00
G5T 7.0% : 5% 0.00
Total : 5% 260.00

For TORQUE 5 LEASING PTE LTD

PAGE 1 OF 1




RENTAL AGREEMENT

8 Kaki Bukit Ave 4 Premier @ Kaki Bukit
#01-50 Singapore 415875

Tel: 6452 4457 Fax: 6452 4584

Emall: leasing@torgues.com

Company Reg. No: 2015307680

T 001944

HIRER'S PARTICULAR

Veh. No/Model: ST171 38R s lf ¥Y

- u I
Name: j,ﬂlbn;a_n 1Ll'r"l'-} inll ~an

Rental Veh. No/Model: SOH Segg7 P Fuds  LiEr

NRIC/Passport No: = 352 6220C Date/Time Qut; 5;3}'20:&‘ 5 i,
Address: |y, Bt stroct Date/Timeln: & [3]2018 i'—iﬂ?""l
12 #05 - g0 SPe sq 0109 ouT IN
- = e o J b
Tel] A6 FoBELS (\ i o & --rf“\ i 3
Driving license No: Exp: E FE 3
ADDITIONAL DRIVER'S PARTICULAR Milage: 2)3 jab Milage: L | 3170
Name: Rental Charges 5% 55
NRIC/Passport No: Hours @ per hour
Address: < |pays @| o |[perday
Weeks @ per week
Months@ per month
Subtotal| 560
Tel: GST @ 7%
Driving license Mo: Exp: Others
(A} - ACCIDENTS (D) - DENTS (S) - SCRATCHES TOTAL CHARGES| 5€ Q
Maode of Payment:
Cash/Nets/Cheque/Credit Card:
Deposit Deposit
Amount | Refunded
Remarks: Received by

Physical Damage Excess Acknowledgement
Singapore - Own Damage $52,000

Singapore - 3rd Party Damage 552,000

Malaysia [if applicable) 558,000

:-'nr Driver aged < 27 or a-bun 65 and/or 543,000

ess than 2 yrs driving experience

il oF A {Additional)

IfWe agreed to the terms and conditions above, overleaf and
that all information given are true & correct in all respect.
Miy,/Our driving license(s) isfare current and not disqualified
from driving. You may charge all amount due on the rental to
my/four credit card,

a
A

IMPORTANT NOTE:

1. OHLY PERSONS ABOVE 22 YEARS OF AGE, HOLDING A WALID SINGAPORE LICENCE FOR
MORE THAN 2 YEARS, AUTHORISED, LICENSED AND SIGNING THIS AGREEMENT MAY DRIVE
THE VEHICLE.

1. \ehicle s strictly for use in Singapore only and may not be driven out of Singapore without
the prior written consent of Torque 5 Leasing Ple Lid,

3. Use of vehicle for Blegal purposes (e.g. in connection with theft, drug pedalling or
trafficking, smuggling} Is strictly prohibited,

4, In case of accident, the hirer shall report to Torgque 5 Leasing Phe Ltd immediately.

Hirer Signature/Date

for Torqua QINSIHE Bte Ltd
P
W R v
ronave YL
g =

eq no: 201530768C @Y

>
Owner Signature/Date G117 3y




32872018

RECORDS MANAGEMENT CENTRE

Invoice

GENERAL INSURANCE ASSOCIATION OF SINGAPORE
GENERAL RECORDS MANAGEMENT CENTRE

Singapore 048580

& Raffles Quay #18-00,
INSUMNC Phone: +65 6224 0010 Fax: +65 6224 0030
ASSOCIATION Operating Hours: Monday to Friday 9am to 5pm
GST Registration Mo M4D0017735

TAX INVOICE

Our Ref Na: GR-18-022684
Date of Raguest: 10/02/2018

Torque 5 Pie Lid
Mo, B Kaki Bukit Ave 4,

Your Ref Mot Online Purchase

#01-50

Singapore 415875

Dear SirMadam,

Enquiry Date 10/02/2018

Enquiry By Stephania Tao Wan Ting

TP Vehicle No, SJR4251C

Accident Date 10/02/2018

DESCRIPTION AMOUNT (S5)

TP Insurar Enguiry 1.87
GST Amount 0,13
Total Amount Due (GST Inclusive) 2,00

Thank You.

This is a computer genarated documeant and requires no signature.

For GIARMC Officlal use:
Date:
[X] GIRQ [ ] Cash [ ] Cheque

hitps:fisingapore meriman.comiclaimsindax. cfm?fusebox=MTRsas&fuseacion=dsp_geninvip&rafid=1720851 &CFID=31163425&CF TOKEN=35052baf7d9e3 1R




211072018

GENERAL

INSURANCE
ASSOCIATION

RECORDS MAMAGEMENT CENTRE

Inwoice

GEMERAL INSURANCE ASSOCIATION OF SINGAPORE
RECORDS MANAGEMENT CENTRE

G Raffles Quay #1800, Singapore (48580
Phana: +85 8224 0010 Fax: +85 6224 0030
Operating Hours: Monday to Friday Sam o Spm
GST Heglstration No: M40O0G1 7735

Third Party Insurer Enquiry

Qur Ral Mo GR-16-022684

Date of Raquasl: 1040212018 Waur Raf Na: Onling Purchacs

Tarque 5 Ple Lid

Mo, 8 Kaki Bukit fve 4,

#01-50

Slngapore 415875

Dear Sieddadam,

Enquiry Dala 1040252018

Enguiry By Stephanin Teo Wan Ting . -j‘qﬁi 0 B

TP Vehicle Mo, SJR4251C S-]:j

Accidant Data 101272018

Engulry Result

TP Wahicke Ma, Insuresr Pariod of Insurance Insurer Tal. Mo,
5JR4251C AXA, Ingurance Pg Lid 24/106/2017-23/06/2018 6338 7288
Thank You,

Thue Images provided to you are teken from the original repants farwarded 1o the corre by tha members of the Genaeral lsurance Association of Singapare and we Lake na responaibllity for thair

Bceuracy of contonila and shall be undaer ra labliity whatsogver for any loss or damage ardeing out of or In connection with the reparts or thalr imagas,

This |s 8 competer genersted document and requires no signature.

hitps./isingapore.marimen.com/claimsdndex cfm?fusebox=MTRsas&fuseaction=dsp_geninvip&refid=1720951&CFID=283784714CFTOKEN=06002d3... 112



2132018 Invoice

GENERAL INSURANCE ASSOCIATION OF SINGAPORE

RECORDS MANAGEMENT CENTRE
¥ o GENERAL & Raffles Ouay #18-00, Singapore 048580
7 INSURANCE -#none: +65 6224 0010 Fax: +65 5224 0030

0T ASSDCIATION Operaling Hours: Monday lo Friday Sam bo Spm
RECORDS MANAGEMENT CLNTIE S0 negistration No: MAODOTTT35

TAX INVOICE

Our Rl No: GR-18-023910
Drate of Request: 13022018 Your Ref No:

Targue 5 Ple Lid
Mo, B Kaki Bukit fum 4,

Online Purchase

HO1-50

Singagare 416875

Dt Sirkipdam,

Dale of Accident, o208

Wehichs No: S4J27708

Place of Accident: 110 EUNOS AVE T CARPARK

Inveiving Vehicla Mo SJR4251C

Wilh reflerence 1o your application for 1he accidenl rapad, we hava allached he following accigen! reports as requesied;

DOCUMENTS ACCIDENT LOCATION PER DOC (5%) aTy AMOUNT (55)

SIR4251C 110 EUNDS AVE T CARPARK 14.00{1 13.08
GET Amount 0.52
Tatal Amount Due (GST Inclushea) 14.00

The Images provided lo you are taken from the original repors forwarded (o the canire by the members of the Genersd Insurance Asaaclation of Singapore and we take
ne responsibility lor thedr acouracy or contenis and shall be under no liability whalsoever for any koss or damape arising ot of or in connection wilh the reparts or thale

imapes.
Thank You

This Is a compular generated documeant and requires no signaiura.

For GIARMC Official use:
Dala:
(¥} GIRO [ ] Cash | ] Chegque

hitps:isingapora marimen. comiclalmaindoy. cfm?lusabar=MTRaar& fureaction=dsp_geninvar&refid=172287 24 CFID=285153T44CFTOKEN=dG. ..

11




2132018 Invaice Sfﬁm

GENERAL INSURANCE ASSOCIATION OF SINGAPORE

| RECORDS MANAGEMENT CENTRE
' GEN ERhL Riaffias Cuay #18-00, Sinpapors 048580

: !
INSURANCE Foone: +85 6224 0010 Fax: +65 6224 0030

S ASSOCIATION Gperaling Hows: Monday 1o Friday Sam to Spm
RE CORDS MANAGEMONT CENTRE B0 Registration No: MADDDITTES

SEARCH RESULTS

Our Raf No: GR-18-023905
Dale of Reguest: 130212018 Your Rel No: Online Purchase

Torgue & Fle Lid

Mo, 8 Haki Bukil Ava 4,
#01-50

Singapore 415875

Daar SirfMadam,

Your Search Critara:

Ciabn of Accidant: 1¥02I2018

Piace of Accidant: 110 EUNOS AVE T CARPARK

Client Vahicle Mo 54427708

‘Wilh referance lo your search criberia ke the accident report, the following documents ware found to closely malch your search criteria:

RECQ. VEHIGLE ACCIDENT LOTAT ICH ACCIDENT DATE
SJR4251C CARPARK OF 110 EUNOS AVE T 1v02/2018 11:30
Thank You,

Trup images providod Lo you are isken from the oiginel rapars krwarded (o live centie by (e members of the Gererol Insuronce Association of Singapore ared wi laka oo fesponsibiiiy fod
their accuracy or cantanls and shall be urdes no iabilly whalsosver for any kss or damage arising oul of of in coaneclion wilh the repars or thelr Images.

This is & compailer generaled documant and requires no signature,

hitps:isingapare meriman. com/clalmafindex. ol Hussbox=MTRsas&iuseaction=dsp_geninviparelio=1 7229664 CFID=285153T4ACFTOKEN=cdG... 12




2308 Irvvoice

s i GENERAL INSURANCE ASSOCIATION OF SINGAPORE
R GENERAL RECORDS MANAGEMENT CENTRE
: ] & Ratlles #1800, Siny re (4 BERD
¢ INSURANCE -¢ro-e +§1¥24 0010 Fax: 465 6224 0030
SR ASSOCIATION Operaling Hours: Monday Lo Friday Sam 1o Spm
GET Regisalion No: MAGO0TTTIE

RECORUS MANAGEMENT CEMTRE

TAX INVOICE

Ciur Rl Ne: GR-18-023905
Dale of Regueast: 1302018 Your Red Mo Onding Purchasa

Torque 5 Pla Lid

Mo, B Kak| Bukil Ave 4,
B01-50

Bingapore 415RTE

Dipar Sirfbdadam,

Youwr

Dale of Accident: 10022018

Place of Accident: 110 EUNOS AVE T CARPARK
Clhent Vishiche No: SM2TT08

DESCRIPTION AMOUNT (55)

E-Fila Saarch Feo (Fublic) 14,02
GST Amount 0.98)
Tedal Amount Dua (GST Inclusiva) 15.00/

Thank You

This is & compuler generaled documant and reguires no signature,

For GIARME Officlal usa:
Data:
[¥} GIRG [ ] Cash [ ] Chegue

hitps:isingapore. meriman. comiciaimalindas. cfm Husebox=MTRsasBfuseaction=dap_geninvip&refid=1722866RCFID=2B5153T48CFTOKEN=cdB... 242




