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LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

51 bl Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industnal Park, Singapore 408833

TEL: B256 3561 FAX: 6256 4215

Reg No: 193607198R GST Reg. No. 15-8607198-R

Affiliated to Federation Internationale Des Experts En Automohile

AIG ASIA PACIFIC INSURANCE PTELTD Ref :

78 SHENTON WAY #08-16
CHARTIS BUILDING

Date : 13-02-2018

CCE/AIG1B002913/Uhs3

MUY

SINGAPORE 079120
Code: AIG
1. Policy Particulars :- THIRD PARTY CLAIM
Insured Veh. SKH 7258E Veh. Inspected SLP 18862
Policy No. Coverage ($) 0.00
Claim No. Excess ($) 0.00
Assign From Assign Date 13/02/2018
% Vehicle Particulars & Condition
Make & Model c.c ]
Engine No. HIDDEN Year of Reg.
Chassis No. Colour
Odometer Steering
Brakes Modification
General
3. Conditions of Tyres
Size Make Balance
R/H Front Tyre mm
L/H Front Tyre mm
R/H Rear Tyre mm
L/H Rear Tyre mm
4. Description of Damages
5. General Information
Accident Date  07/02/2018 |Inspection Date 13/02/2018

Survey held at

PEGASUS ENGINEERING & TRADING PTELTD

51 DEFU LANE 10
SINGAPORE 539218

5a.

Remarks

AJTHE INSPECTION WAS CONDUCTED ON A"WITHOUT PREJUDICE" BASIS.
BjIN ACCORDANCE TO YOUR INSTRUCTIONS, WE HAVE NOT AUTHORISED REPAIRS.




' -~~~ PEGASUS

_‘ w

ENGINEERING & TRADING PTE LTD

GST/ ROC COMPANY NO : 201101753C

Cifficer in Charge : WEE TZE FAH

Quotation
From : Customer :
PEGASUS ENGINEERING & TRADING PTE LTD GRAB RENTALS PTE LTD
C/0 51 DEFU LANE 10 18 SIN MING LANE
539216 #01-08 MIDVIEW CITY

SINGAPORE 573960

Tel . Altn : ihy lavit b @
Emai : Tel (Wi 15| |ED
Fax :
Quotation No : Q018/02-1062 Quotation Date : 08/02/2018 Terms : 30 DAYS
Vehicle No : SLP1B96Z Chassis No : MHFB29F3102009808 Third Party Insurer :
Madel : VIDS Date of Accident :
.amarks : TP INSURER: AIG, INSURED'S VEH NO: SKH7258E, DATE OF ACCIDENT: 07,02.2018
| ITEM | DESCRIPTION | _QTry | UNITPRICE | AMOUNT (SGD)]
1 FRONT DOOR SIDE MIRROR MOTOR ASSY 1 12127000 /L 121270
2 LESS25% (ITEM 1) 1 -303.1800 -303.18
3 PANEL BEATING, KNOCKING AND STRAIGHTEN THE NECESSARY 1 150.0000 150.00
PORTION, REMOVE AND RENEWAL OF PARTS, ADJUST AND
REALIGN THE SAME /00
4  PUTTY AND SPRAY PAINTING OF THE AFFECTED PORTION 1 100.0000 100.00
.w’ fa//
— [ S
r— . jita nenca nolity
I I .I i .II.. I 1ing I g
- ey
Giltul Pepudice” bases P /J
I ._.-..-?-:*. and
i) insurEnce COmpany
A # 10y L
Dat Sub Total 1,159 52
B GST(7.00%) 81.17
Total {(SGD) 1,240 69

Please conduct the survey at
Fegasus Engineering @ Tan Lim Mator Ple Ltd c/o 51 Defu Lane 10 Singapore 539216



Vic (LKKAuto)

—————————— e ———————

From: Pegasus Engineering <claims@pegasusengrg.com.sg>

Sent: Wednesday, 18 July, 2018 9:23 AM

To: Wic (LKKAuto)

Subject; Re: LOD - THIRD PARTY CLAIM - SLP1896Z YOUR REF : SKH7258E ON 07.02.2018
Attachments: 18072018092731 pdf

Without Prejudice
Dear Vic

Enclosed the signed DV for your process of payment.

Thanks & Regards,

Sharon Ow

Pegasus Engineering & Trading Pte Lid
51 Defu Lane 10

Singapore 539216

Tel - HR58 1846
Fax : 6487 6070
Email : claims(@pegasusengre.com.sg

On Mon, Jul 16, 2018 at 3:14 PM, Vic (LKKAuto) <vicalpeh/@lkkauto.com> wrote:

Without Prejudice

Dear Sharan,

Woe refer to the below email.

Purely for an amicable settlement, we are prepared to increase and settle your client’s on a global sum of $240.00
{all in}.

It agreeable, kindly chop and sign the attached DV and forward back to us for payment processing.

Thank you.

"Please note that our above offer and any settlement arising from the ahove offer ore made on a without prejudice basis, and
should not be construed as an admission of liability on our part or on the part of our Insured Driver. Terms of such settlement

1



should aiso not be disclased in any other related matter(s) in respect af the accfdent. Our offer made in respect of this p_resenr
matter is mode solely to resolve this matter only. No reference shall be mode to this offer or any settlement arising from this offer

in any other relgted matters,

Best Regards,

Vie Alpeh | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Lid

Phone: 6841-2006 | email: vicalpeh@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubt Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(4080323)

This e-mail cantain confidential and privileged malerial, and are for the sole use of the inlended recipient. Use or distribution by an
uriintendad recipient is prohibited, and may be a violation of law. If you belléve that you received this e-mail in error, please do not
resad this e-mail or any attached items. Please delete the e-mail and all attachments, including any copies theraaf, and infarm the
sender that you have deleted the e-mail, all attachmenis and any copies thereaf, Thank you.

From: Pegasus Engineering [mailto:claims@pegasusengrg.com.sg

Sent: Monday, 16 July, 2018 B:49 AM

To: Vic {LKKAuta)

Subject: Re: LOD - THIRD PARTY CLAIM - SLP1B96Z YOUR REF : SKH7258E ON 07.02.2018

Without Prejudice

Dear Vic,

Please reply our counter propose and please send DV if agreeable.



Thanks & Regards,

Sharon Ow

Pegasus Engineering & Trading Pte Ltd
51 Defu Lane 10

Singapore 339216

Tel : 6838 1846
Fax ¢ 6487 6070

Email : claimsigpegasusengrg. Com.sg

On Thu, May 3, 2018 at 5:05 PM, <claims@pegasusengrg.com.sg> wrote;

Hi Vie,

Our client is unable to accept as he wasted whole day for the survey (came at 12 noon).

Thus, for a quick and amicable settlement. we counter propose at $241.44,

Best regards,

Sharon (p)

From: Vic (LKKAuto) <vicalpeh@lkkauto.com=

Sent: Thursday, 3 May 2018 4:38 PM

To: Pegasus Engineering <claims(@pegasusengrg com.sg>

Ce: Admin A <admin-a@/lkkauto.com>; Vic (LKKAuto) <vicalpeh(@lkkauto.com™>: Asher Sng
(LKKAuto) <AsherSnp@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: LOD - THIRD PARTY CLAIM - SLP1896Z YOUR REF : SKH7258E ON 07.02.2018

Without Prejudice

Dear Sharon.

We refer further to your below email.



Purely for an amicable settlement on a without prejudice basis and without admission of any liability to
our Insured’s part, we offer a global sum of $210.00 (all in) to settle your client’s claim.

If agreeable. kindly chop and sign the attached DV then forward back to a copy for payment processing.

The above amount is to be made payable to PEGASUS ENGINEERING & TRADING PTE LTD.

Thank you.

"Please note that our above offer and any settlement arising from the above offer are made on a without prefudice basis, and
should not be construed as an admission of lability on our part or on the part of our Insured Driver. Terms of such settlement
should also not be disclosed In any ather related matter(s) in respect of the accident. Our offer made in respect of this present
matrer is made solely to resalve this matter only. No reference shall he made to this offer or any settfement arising from this offer
in any other related matters,

Hest Regards,
Vie Alpeh | Case Handler

LEK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841-2096 | email: vicalpeh@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #o2-25 | S{408933)

y
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= ST Save the Earthe Print only when necessary:

This e-mail contan confidential and privileged metenal, and are for the sole use of the intended reciplent. Use or distribution by
an unintandad reciptent is prohibited, and may be a violatlon of law. If you belleve that you received this e-mall in error, pleass
do not read this e-mall or any attached items. Please delete the e-mall and all attachments, including any copies thereol, and
inform the sender that you have delated the e-maill, all sttachments and any coples thereof. Thank you.

From: Asher Sng (LKKAuto)

Sent: Monday, 19 March, 2018 3:41 PM

To: Pegasus Engineering; Vic (LKKAuto)

Ce: Admin A

Subject: FW: LOD - THIRD PARTY CLAIM - SLP1896Z YOUR REF : SKH7258E ON 07.02.2018



Without Prejudice

Hi Sharon,

Thank vou for the email.

Please note that the case handler for this case 15 Vic.

Hi Vie,

FYA.

Thank You.

Best Regards,

Asher Sng | Cose Handiar

LKK Auto Consultants Ple Lid

phone: 6841-6051 | emoit gshesng@kkautocom | fax: 6741-4108

Bik 51, Payo Ubi Industrial Pork, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5[408%33)

From: Pegasus Engineering [mailto:claims@pegasusengrg.com.sg|

Sent: Monday, 19 March 2018 1:06 PM

To: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>: Asher Sng (LKKAuto) <AsherSng@lkkauto.com>
Subject: LOD - THIRD PARTY CLAIM - SLP18967 YOUR REF : SKH7258E ON 07.02.2018

WITHOUT PREJUDICE

Dear Asher,



Refer to the above accident.

It appears that the accident was caused by your insured. Enclosed documents to substantiate our client’s
property damaged claim as our client had authorized us to quantify, to act and to reach settlement within 6
weeks on their behalf: -

Please reply.

Thanks & Regards,
Sharon Ow

Pegasus Engineering & Trading Pte Ltd
51 Defu Lane 10
Singapore 539216

Tel ¢ 6858 1846
Fax : 6487 6070
Email  :claims/@pegasusengrg.com.sg
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Tal 4556437

, 101, 56X Centre 2, Singapors 038807
Fao: +65

§027 700
Co. Reg. No. 200412212G  G5T Reg. No. 20-M1E1G

Certificate of Insurance

ROAD TRANSPORT ACT 1887 (MALAYSIA)
THE MOTOR VEHICLES (THIRD-PARTY RISKS) RULES, 1959 (FEDERATION OF MALAYSIA)

THE MOTOR VEHICLES (THIRD-PARTY RISKS AND BﬂHPﬂﬂﬁhﬁﬂgéiﬂﬂT {CAP. 189 OF THE REVISED EDITION)

{REPUBLIC OF SINGAPO

THE MOTOR UEHIL‘.‘.LEg&Tl'ﬂRDuPARTY RISK AND COMPENSATION) RULES, 1986 EﬂmNéREEPDLiJ:M OF SINGAPORE)

ANY AMENDMENT, ACT OR ACTS PASSED IN SUBSTITUTION TH

5.

Form M.Z.400 COMMERCIAL VEHICLE - FLEET
Cars for Hire Comprehenshie

Certificate No. A 23063766 MEF

Excess : 3GDZ, 000
Index Mark and Raglstration Number of Vehicle
SLP1B96Z
Namae of Policyholder
Grab Rentals Pte. Ltd.
Effective Dats of the Commencement of Insurance for the purposes of the Act
g1/02/2018

Date of Expiry of insurance
31/01/2019
Persons or Clesses of Persons entitied to drive®

Any other person provided he is driving on the Pelicyholder's order or with the
Policyholder's permission.

‘Fmridndﬂ-nthp-mmMhpﬂﬂhﬂh:@ﬂ%ﬁhﬂulwmmwlmwmhmwm

tha Motar Vahicle or has been so and s not disqualified of & Court of Law or by reason of any
enaciment or regulation in that behalf from driving the Motor Vehicle.
Limitations as to use*

Use for the carriage of passengers or goods in connection with the

Policyholder's business.

Use for sccial domestic and pleasure purpcses.

The Policy doess not cover

{1} Use for racing pace-making reliability trial or speed-testing.

{2) Dse whilst drawing a trailer except the towing (other than for
reward) of any one disabled mechanically propelled vehicle.

* Limitations rendarad Inoparativ Section & of Ihe Molor Vehicles Risks and Compansation) Act (Chapter
m}wmﬁdmw!rgwm1w;u-m},mmummw. {

or if the has been lost or dasi

This Certificate ls not rensfersbie 1o a new owner of the vahicle, If for a mmmwmmm its currency, the
Cartificats musi rgﬂm'

be retumed to the Insurer within 7 days of the termi
that o com

xd, A
ww;ﬁ to tha affect m hfcumﬁéﬂ';'.““ ply with this obligation is an offence under the Motor Vehicles

I'WE HEREBY CERTIFY Ihat tha Palicy lo which this Certificats relates

issued in accordance with the provisions of the Mator Vehlcles

s
[Third-Pary Risks and Compensation) Act (Chapter 189) and Part IV of the Road Transport Act, 1887 (Malaysia) or any Amendment, Act
or Acts passed in substitution thersol.

; MSIG Insurance (Singapore) Pte. Ltd.

Approved nsurers

K.

Chiaf Executive Officar

JLGRINB01Z81445
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9A Lok Yang Singapore 628628 Tel: 6858 1846 / HP 9628 6508
¢/o 51 Defu Lane 10 Singapore 539216 Fax: 6858 0877

Ourief SLP 1896 2 b 1 (o |1k

Your Ref __5 1< 728 % E

Claims Department -Executive In Charge
AIS Asia pacific Insurance Pre Ltd

Dear Sir/Madam,

> and SkHTZSGE em G102]/2018

ACCIDENT INVOLVING _='" ¢ 7

i
&
B Hire

Refer to the above accident and please acknowledge receipt of this letter within 14 days.

It appears that the accident wos caused by your insured. Enclosed documents to substantiate our client's
property damaged claim as our client had authorized us to quantify, to oct and to reach settlement within &
weehs on their behalf: -

O Original survey report/ copies of photographs

_@0riginal Tax-invoice number -\’ [§o2-1222 O police report / police result
O Certificate Of Insurance O-ehicle search result
2 O, dnl TagrFt Vg kol dfademant
O Authorization To Act < Owner/Hirer o Kot . iz i

*Survey under insurance instruction / Independent surveyor / ijllmy.

e

a) Cost of repair {inclusive 65T) $_107.00
b) Survey fees / Photographs os per request $
c) Vehicle Search fees / GIA fees / Police Report fees / Reporting fees $ 1-4 1
d) Less of rental _Lduys @ 5#1 s $ Lo 45
e) Loss of earnings /rentolfees | _days®@§! & 1 [ O
f) Administrative charges to negotiate settlement $ £

{ Waive if 100% offer mode within acknowledge timeframe)
g) $

Total % 21 .Y

-----------------------

* Driver's injury and other lasses exclude in this claim,
If you are agreesble to the obove, please forward discharge voucher for our client's signature and payment
issued directly to * Pegasus Engineering & Trading Pfe Ltd" within 28 days.

Yours faithfully,
Sharon Ow
Email cloimsBpegasusengrg. com.sg
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Medm BA = Ple Lid

1 UL AVE 1, #01-25 PAYA UBI INDUSTRIAL PARK, SINGAPORE 408933 TEL : (065) 62563561 FAX @ (D65) 67414

Our Ref: CC6/A1G18002913/Uhb3

30" April 2018

LIM CHOON BU
39 Cambridge Road,
#06-125,

Singapore 210039

Dear Sir'Madam,
ACCIDENT INVOLVING SKH 7258E AND SLP 18967 ON 07.02.2018

We refer to the above accident where we are acting for AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Ple
Ltd to resolve the claim against you and/or your authorized driver under the Auto
Insurance policy taken up with them.

Based on the accident report and accident scenario, liability is down against us. We will
therefore proceed to negotiate for an amicable settlement with the Third Party.

Should you however wish to further discuss on the matter prior to our negotiations and
settlement, please contact us within 7 days from the date of this letter.

Please note that your No-Claim Discount (NCD)(if any) will be affected and reduced by
30% (20% for commercial vehicles) upon next renewal due to this Third Party claim,
However, if your policy has a NCD protector feature, it will be deemed utilized for this
claim and your NCD will be protected.

Please call us if you have further queries.

Yours faithfully,

j_-r_:‘ ¥
Chong Poh Kin
Case Handler

DID: 6841 2132
FAX: 6741 4108

Email: vicalpeh/@lkkauto.com

cc.  AlG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte Ltd
{Motor Claims Dept)

108



AUTHORIZATION TO ACT

TO: PEGASUS ENGINEERING & TRADING PTELTD

FROM: OWNER OF VEHICLE NUMBER

ACCIDENT INVOLVING

ALONG/AT _ D1citind!

We hereby authorize you to act on our behalf in pursuance of our claim for all damages during
the repair arising out of the above accident.

This letter serve as the '"AUTHORITY TO ACT.

We also hereby authorize all agreed settlement payment be made in favour to PEGASUS
ENGINEERING & TRADING PTE LTD.

MName : Grab Rentals Pte Ltd

CoRegNo 2016172006

Address : 18 Sin Ming Lane #01-08 Midview City Singapore 573960
Contact : 6655 0005
Date
Signature
III
b p Ty X
\ (& o\
L \.! |81 FR000
2 ,f. ;
./'

Owner



RELEASE VOUCHER
AIG Asia Pacific - Express Third Party Claim)

“We/l, PEGASUS ENGINEERING & TRADING PTE LTD (“the workshop™) hereby confirm
that we/l have reached an agreement with the appointed surveyor of AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte
Lid LKK AUTO CONSULTANTS PTE LTD (name of surveyor) with respect to the amount
claimed for $$240.00 (Global Sum — all in) for vehicle no. SLP 1896Z that was damaged pursuant
to the accident which occurred on 07/02/2018 (date) along CAIRNHILL ROAD (location)
involving vehicle no/s SKH 7258E. This is pursuant to the inspection conducted on 13/02/2018 (date)
at "'the workshop™.

We/l confirm that we/l are/am authorized by the owner GRAB RENTALS PTE LTD (“the third-
party claimant™) of vehicle no. SLP 1896Z make the claim as set out in the above paragraph and
we/l have full authority to settle the matter on his/her behalf in a manner that we/l deem fit. We/l
enclose herein the letter of authority given by “the third party claimant™.

We/l further confirm that we/l will indemnify AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte Ltd for all damages,
loss and/or expense that they will or have already incurred in the event that “the third party claimant”
after the above said agreement lodges a further claim against the former for any loss and expenses
suffered pertaining to costs of repairs and/or rental and/or loss of use pursuant to the damage to SLP
1896Z (vehicle no.) as a result of the accident.

We/l confirm that the agreement reached above is in full and final settlement of any claim of “the
third party claimant™ pursuant to the accident and that further this settlement is reached on a without
prejudice and without admission of liability basis.

This agreement is subject to the application of Singapore law and the Singapore Courts have

exclusive jurisdiction over any dispute ansing out of the same.

(month) 2018 (year)

Jllt.'.,l
v

Dated this "rg (day) of

Signed by appointed surveyor Signed by “the workshop™ (with chop)

o s dncumnlm I-I'I-'[ul:ﬁ'l and
g8 gnly, All person

mﬂﬂ arising thigralrom aie n:cludeﬁ{fdrm'r-

mmﬁumwmmdmmum h



<~~~ PEGASUS
ENGINEERING & TRADING PTE LTD

GST/ ROC COMPANY NO : 201101753C
Tax Invoice

From :

PEGASUS ENGINEERING & TRADING PTE LTD
C/O 51 DEFU LANE 10
536216

Officer in Charge : WEE TZE FAH
Tel:
Email :

GRAB RENTALS PTE LTD

Customer :

18 SIN MING LANE
#01-08 MIDVIEW CITY
SINGAPORE 573860

Attn ¢
Tal:
Fax

Inv No : IV18/02-1223 Inv Date : 28/02/2018

| Term : 30 DAYS

Vehicle No : SLP1896Z

Chassis No : MHFB25F 3102006808

Model : VIOS
Remarks : TP INSURER: AIG, INSURED'S VEH NO: SKH7258E, DATE OF ACCIDENT: 07.02.2018
| ITEM | DESCRIPTION [ QTY | UNITPRICE | AMOUNT (SGD)|
1 PANEL BEATING, KNOCKING AND STRAIGHTEN THE NECESSARY 1 50.0000 50.00
PORTION, REMOVE AND RENEWAL OF PARTS, ADJUST AND
REALIGN THE SAME
2 PUTTY AND SPRAY PAINTING OF THE AFFECTED PORTION 1 50.0000 50.00
Cheques should be made payable 1o PEGASUS ENGINEERING & TRADING PTE LTD Sub Total 100.00
GST(7.00%) 7.00
Total (SGD) 107.00

PEGASUS ENGINEERING & TRADING PTE LTD

AP
P

body @z
.-II.' { g .:?1 o {?-r
-‘alII V- NS .\_:y

Authorised Signature




282018 Vahizie Hub

@

Enquire Vehicle & Owner Information ( Vehicle No. SKH7258E As At 07 Feb 2018/ 14:30:00)
Law Firm Search Details

Search Reason: Insurance ¢lalm in relation to traffic accident
Law Firm Case No.: SLP18%6Z

Current Owner Details

Owner |D Type: Singapore NRIC

Crwner 10 549035372

Owner Nama: LIM CHOON BU (LIN CHURNWLU

Reglstered Address Type: HDB/HUDC

Registered Block/House a9
Mo
Registered Street Name: CAMBRIDGE ROAD

Registered Unit No: #04-125
Registered Bullding Name: -
Registered Postal Code: 210039
Current Vehicle Detalls

Vehicle No- SKHT258E
Make Description/Model MERCEDES BENZ / E 250 BLUEEFFICIENCY
Insuranca Company Name: AIG ASIA PACIFIC INSURANCE PTELTD.

wmmm.wmmwwmnmwumm_m-ﬂ BO10TIET

m



Our Ref: GR-ACC-2017-02

01 June 2017

Pagasus Englneering & Trading Pte Ltd
No. 51 Defu Lane 10
Singapore 538216

.T:- whom [t may concermn,

Re: Vehicle Rental Rates for Loss of Rental Claims.

Groo

Rentals

Mailing Address

18 Sin Ming Lane,
#01-08 Midview City,
Singapore 573960
Co. No. 2016172006

With regards to-the above subject matter, we are pleased to inform you our Grab Rantal rate
for our various vehicles which are as follows:

S/No. | Make & Model Dally Rental Rates (S%)
01 Toydta Frius 1,798cc, 90kw, 120bhp, Automatic $7585
02 Mazda 3 1.5 (A) Sedan $ 66.95
[ok] Missan Qashgal 1.2L $78.95
04 Honda Vezal 1.5L 57785
Q5 Haonda Vezel 1.5L Hybrid $84.95
06 . | Tovota Vios 1.5L $66.55 1

Please note that the above stated rate is our daily rental rate to our drivers. For your necessary
actions on third party accident claims on loss of rental.
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.-.CLAIM SUBFULDER...{PBHﬂIHﬂ for Eur\'E.Y Hﬂpﬂft)

Fastiane
|CLAIM SUBFOLDER TRACKING - o
Case _'Nutlﬁed | Est Submitted | Aed] Aessigned | agy Rt | Ag) Submirtsg 1ns Auth’ed |Status
i | 08 Feb 2018 il | $$100.00 | $§100.00 m o By
s ;
o Ry gom Adj Aot | Edn Estirate |! wiew Rgt | _ Cancel Case |

Main Reference Claim Details

(CLAIM SUBFOLDER DETAILS =~~~ |[Created by adjuster]
| Insurea: | Lim Choon Bu (Lin ChunWu), 1D: 569035372
| Main |
| Claimant: |

{Vehicle Reg. ' | 07/02/2018 14:00 - :59
{No.: SLPLApAE Date of Loss: | g Months and 9 Days From LTA Reg Date [Man )]

|Caim Type: | TP / 516425039356 m;‘:";:.gi""‘" 2100926838 |Compretiensive)

Paolicy Ne.
| (Craimant):

GRAB RENTALS PTE LTD, Co Reg. No.: 2018172005

A29065 THEMKF

Excess: o
| Repairer: Pegasus Engineering & Trading Pte Ltd (HQ) 51 DEFU LANE 10, 535216 Defu Lane - Tel: 68581546

Handling AlG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte. Ltd, (Express) - Tel: 65-6415-3000 ... [Hardied by Kesaval, Jaclyn-M]
{Insurer: _.|._13'_':.|}'.“;"“-_"‘.\‘-‘$E‘f_ﬂ_|'@§|ﬂ-?ﬂfm . .

| Claimant’s |HEIG Tel:

Insurer; Insurance (Singapore) Pte. Ltd. (HQ) - Tel: +A5 6827 76888

Adjuster: | LKK Auto Consultants Fte Ltd (HQ) - Tel: 6256-3561 ... [Handled by MARCUS CHUA] ... [Final Rpt due 23/02/2018]

ASSOCIATED MAIL RECEIVED view al |  compose Case Man ||
« AlG_SG (14/02/2018): Reguest To Upload TP GIA Report ]

ALL ASSOCIATED TASKS™ View All | Search Tasks | Create New Task | Complete |

Due Date  Priority Type Task Group Handler  Assigned By Completed On  Created On  Done? |
Mo results.

https://singapore. merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRadjuster&fuseaction=dsp ... 23/7/2018




Merimen e-Claims

Claim Documents

*SLP1B96Z (51642503935G)
[SKH7258E]
TP
GRAB RENTALS PTE LTD
Feb 7 2018 2:00PM
[Lim Choon Bu (Lin ChunWu)]

Pegasus Engineering & Trading Pte Ltd

Page 1 of 2

Upload Documents | Ugioad Photos I Compose New Leter | Uiplond Viden ] Upload Ausdio | View | View in Browser
|l.uthmfﬂnrmpumi:n:ﬂ !1 per page l
_h‘l_q_ Finalized On ll..ltl Auto Consultants Ple Ltd (HQ) 1‘hurnbnnll Print

1 |(Draft) | Third Party Express Settlement - Payment Breakdown (1] Edil |

Assessment Reports 1 per page D E

No | Fimakzed On AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte. Ltd. (SG) ] Thurnhnlll Print.

, Accident Statement

: 14/02/18 15:41 Frovm:5C « Aeg. Not SKHTISSE, Claimant) LIM CHOOM BU [LIN CHUNWU) n Load HTM

{Fhotne/ Ibmes R _ Dperpage [Vl M

|m> llu-mlfmrw LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd (HQ) e — Thumbnail | Print.

!t -ISI'DIHE 20: D'ﬁ Odometer Reading ﬂl Leea PG | [

2 13/02/1820:06 | General View - 0 | ceciec |

3 13/02/1820:06 | Chassis Number - © | eacwc | A

4 13/02/18 20:06 | General View 0 | s | B

IS 13/02/1820:06 | General View 0 | wamws | A

55_ 13/02/18 20:06 | General View 0 tdies | 4

i7 13/02/18 20:05 | General View 0 | ades | A

B |[1302/18 10:06 | General View O | leadic | A

9 [13/02/18 20:07 | General View 0 | weawrs | F

10 13/02/18 20:07 | General View 0 | lcadwrc | &

11 [13/02/1820:07 | General View 0 | lcacws |

12 [13/02/18 20:07 | General View O | eows | &

13 |13/02/18 20:07 General View 0D | aows | & |

14 13/02/1820:07 | General View | @ | Loedp } o

‘Documentation N Lperpage  [V]

'ﬁtu 'Rulitlelf Reorder | LMK Autc Consultants Pte Ltd (HQ) Thumbnall | Print
[19/02/18 15:22 | TP GIA REPORT Load PDF

2 |19/02/1815:72 | TP ESTIMATE- MARKED Load FOF

'3 5u3m5r1a 16:17 LETTER TO Ol Load POF

4 |03/05/1816:26 | TP WEEKLY STATEMENT 3 - B | @) | Loaa poF

5 [03/05/18 16:26 TP WEEKLY STATEMENT 2 O | Load PoF

6 f;_;_{ggﬂ ] _gg_gq | WORKSHOP INVOICE Load POF

7 [23/07/18 08:09 | AUTHORISATION TO ACT FORM = Load FDF

8 23/07/18 08:09 Release Voucher Load PDF

a9 23/07/18 08:00 | RENTAL RATES p Load PRF

10 |23/07/18 08:09 | LTA SEARCH © | LoodroF

Documents Checklist
in&cuuﬁi'r:sm&nm Reset | Save I Print |

https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRdoc& fuseaction=dsp_doc... 23/7/2018
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There are no document checklists configured.

Our Checklist Remarks - LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd [HQ)

Show Remarks To: L] Handling Insurer
Mote: Bemarks s Privats unlsid yal Ahew I Lo ather parpEy

https:/singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRdoc& fuseaction=dsp_doc... 23/7/2018
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Preview
NOTE: TO BE COMPLETED BY SURVEYOR TEAM
THIRD PARTY EXPRESS SETTLEMENT
(PAYMENT BREAKDOWN)
|'H’ehlcin No: SKHT258E (Insd veh) Model: TOYOTAVIOS 1.5E (A)
SLP1896Z (TP veh)
[Dala of Accident: |07/02/2018
Global Sum Settlement | .| [X] Yes | 1 1 No
Repair Estimate - 1,240.69
Final Repair Cost '8 240.00
Loss of Use '3 1.50 days at $100.00 per day
Rental (if any) b days
LTA f GlA Search Fee -
Others: %
3
Final Setllement Sum (Glabal Sum) o} 24000

Is Third Party Workshop GIA Registered? [ ] YES [X ] NO (Kindly indicate
below)
A) For Non GIA Registered Workshop: Agreed Liabifity 100 (%)

BOLA Applicable: Yes/ No  BOLA Scenario Ne:

B) For GIA Registered Workshop:

BOLA Liability: (%) Assessed Liability {*): (%)
* Assessed Liability to be filled only for chain collisions and for cases where BOLA does not appiy.

Remarks

Payment Instruction: Payee's Breakdown
1) |Pegasus Engineering & Trading Pte Lid
2)
3)
4)

240

o | 4 | 65 | O

23 Jul
JOANNE LEE KHANG MIN 2018
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Lid Date

Please attach all the supporting documents to the form,
(Final Repair Bill; Rental Invoice; Release Voucher, Authorisation to Act; Survey Report; Medical

Report! Bill (if any)

https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=5VCdoc& fuseaction=dsp_doclt... 23/7/2018



Adjuster Report

Page 1 of 4

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd (co regno1sssorisar
51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25, Paya Ubi Industrial Park

Singapore 408933

Tel: 6256-3561 Fax: 6844-8B805 Email: sur@lkkaute.com,assignments@ikkauto.com

VEHICLE DAMAGE INSPECTION REPORT

Our File No: CCE/AIG18002913/UHBA02
Date: 23/07/2018
BEFERENCE
Handling Insurer:  AlG Asia Pacific Insurance Ple. Lid.  Policy No. 2100326838
ﬁf':““"“‘ Vehicle ¢ o18967 Insured Vehicle No: SKH7258E
Date of Loss: 07/02/2018 MNature of Claim e Claim No: 5164250383506
RIFTION TIF TION OF V
Reg No: SLP1896Z
Make & Model: TOYOTA VIOS, 1.5 E (A) Engine MNo: ZNR¥X 145256
Reg. Date: 29/05/2017 (Man. Year: 2017} Chassis No: MHFB29F3102009808
Colour: Grey Odometer: 54204 km
Engine Capacity 1496 co
Market Value/New Car Price: N/A
Sum Insured (S5): Market Value/New Car Price
ITI F I
General Condition: Steering (Serviceable): Footbrake (Serviceable), Yes
Handbrake (Serviceable): ¥es Engine Modification: Pre-accident Condition;

CONDITION OF TYRES

Front Tyre Size: 195/50 R16 Rear Tyre Size: 195/50 R16
Front Lefl Side! Falken & mm Rear Left Side: Falken & mm
Front Right Side: Falken & mm Rear Right Side; Falken 6 mm
Tha abiwve wilies reprasent the remaining e lresds depth
COST OF CLAIMS ~ Repairer's Adjuster's Difference  Diff %
Parts 800.52 0.00 a9 52 100.00
Miscellanecus llems 0.00 0.00 0.00
Labour 250.00 100.00 150.00 G60.00
Paintwork Labour 0.00 0.00 0.00
Towing 0.00 D00 0.00
Gross Total (S5) 1.159.52 100.00 1,059.52 91.38
+ GST 7.00/7.00% (S%) 81.17 7.00 7417 91.38
Nett Amount (S%) 1,240.69 107.00 1,133.69 91.38
+ Loss of Use (1.5 x 55100.00/day) (S5%) 150.00
+ Doc/Search Fee (S§) 749
Nett Liability (S8) 264.49
Global Sum Settlament (S§) 240.00
IM I
Date of Assignment: 13/02/2018
Date Inspected: 13/02/2018 Inspected At: Pegasus Engineering & Trading Pte Lid

https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRadjuster& fuseaction=gen_...

(HQ)
51 DEFU LANE 10
Singapore 539216

23/7/2018
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Estimated Period of Repair: 1.0 days

Adjuster: MARCUS CHUA Manager: VIC ALPEH

NOTE: This repont represents our findings &7 the fims and plece of mapection afafed herein. Such inspection hos been carmed ouf 1o (ha besl of our
krawledpe and ability but any other labitly under any other circumsiances 15 herehy expressly exciuded,

https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRadjuster& fuseaction=gen_... 23/7/2018
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REPAIR DETAILS
Recommended Parts
No. Qty Part No. Particulars Condition Repairer's Amount
1 1 *FRONT DOOR SIDE MIRROR MOTOR ASSY Hepair 1.212.70FL *-FL
F=Franchise pan. L=ListitemDisc
Sub Total (5%} 1,212.70 0.00
- List item Discount on L ltems 25.00/25.00% (S§) 3n3.18 0.00
Total Parts (58) 908.52 0.00

Repor was unsubmitted during this print-oul. I

https://singapore. merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRadjuster& fuseaction=gen_... 23/7/2018



Adjuster Report

Recommended Miscellaneous Items

There are no new misceilaneous items selected.

Recommended Labour

Page 4 of 4

No Particulars Lab.Type Repairer's Amount
Labour ltems
1 PANEL BEATING ,KNOCKING AND STRAIGHTEN THE New 150.00 100.00
NECESSARY PORTION ,REMOVE AND RENEWAL OF
PARTS ADJUST AND REALIGN THE SAME }
2 PUTTY AND SPRAY PAINTING OF THE AFFECTED PORTION}  New 100.00 0.00
Gross Labour Cost (S$) 250.00 100.00
Report was unsubmitted during ihis print-out.
< END OF ESTIMATES >
https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRadjuster& fuseaction=gen_... 23/7/2018



