Shu Pei (LKKAuto)

From: Shu Pei (LKKAuto)

Sent: Friday, 30 August 2019 2:58 PM

To: Joel Goh

Subject: RE: Claim Ref: DM18HO00470-JG, GBG6034C (Ol) SHA 218P (TP), DOA: 10/02/18
Attachments: LKK INSPECTION PHOTOS.pdf; LKK REINSPECTION PHOTOS.pdf; LKKInspection.pdf;

LKKAdjustment1a.pdf; LOD.pdf; PAYMENT BREAKDOWN.pdf; LKKInvoice1.pdf

Dear Joel,
As per requested.

Thank you

Best Regards,

Shu Pei| Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6366-0055 | email: shupei@I|kkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Accounts (LKKAuto) <account@lkkauto.com>

Sent: Friday, 30 August 2019 2:50 PM

To: Shu Pei (LKKAuto) <shupei@lkkauto.com>

Cc: Accounts (LKKAuto) <account@lkkauto.com>

Subject: FW: Claim Ref: DM18HO000470-JG, GBG6034C (Ol) SHA 218P (TP), DOA: 10/02/18

Hi Shu Pei
Please assist.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Chew Lian | Account Dept

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

DID: 6742 9588 | email: account@lkkauto.com | fax: 6844-8805
Bk 51, PayaUbi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #01-25 | $(408933)

The content of this e-mail message and any attachments are confidential and may be legally privileged, intended solely for the addressee. If you are not the intended recipient, be
advised that any use, dissemination, distribution, or copying of this e-mail is strictly prohibited. If you receive this message in error, please notify the sender immediately by reply
email and destroy the message and its attachments.

From: Joel Goh [mailto:joel.goh@eginsurance.com.sq]
Sent: Friday, 30 August, 2019 2:22 PM




To: Accounts (LKKAuto)
Subject: RE: Claim Ref: DM18H000470-1G, GBG6034C (OI) SHA 218P (TP), DOA: 10/02/18

Dear Chew Lian
Please assist to forward us the full set of documents inclusive of settlement package.
Best Regards,

Joel Goh
Executive | Claims

o

eqﬁ surance
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EQ Insurance Company Limited

5 Maxwell Road #17-00 Tower Block MND Complex Singapore 069110
did 65 6500 6772 | tel 65 6223 9433 ext 772 | fax 65 6223 4190

WWWw.eginsurance.com.sg &
~b‘ & Mornber of City state
Privileged/Confidential information may be contained in this message. If you are not the intended recipient, please notify the senc

From: Accounts (LKKAuto) [mailto:account@lkkauto.com]

Sent: Friday, August 30, 2019 12:22 PM

To: Steve Lim; Janet Tan; Joel Goh; Fiona Wong; Vincent Yeo

Cc: Accounts (LKKAuto)

Subject: RE: Claim Ref: DM18HO00470, GZ 6034C (OI) SHA 218P (TP), DOA: 10/02/18

Dear All
Attach please find our invoice, the email assignment and survey report for the above.

We look forward to your payment soon.

Best Regards,

Chew Lian | Account Dept

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

DID: 6742 9588 | email: account@lkkauto.com | fax: 6844-8805
Blk 51, PayaUbi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #01-25 | S(408933)
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