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B P 74 LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Bgm ma 51 Ubl Ave 1#01-25 Paya Ubl Industrial Park, Singapore 408933
- TEL: 525G 15681 FAX: 8256 4115

Reg. No: 189607 188R GST Reg. No. 19-0607188-R

Affiliated to Federation Intemationale Des Experts En Automobile

INDIA INTERNATIONAL INSURANCE PL Rel :  CC4/1118002893/Uks3
305.02 108 BUILDING SINGAPORE 049711 Pe:: RRCANS |‘ HWIIWHIWW
Code: 12
1. Policy Particulars :- THIRD PARTY CLAIM
Insured Veh, SHC B4B5X Veh. Inspected SLG 666A
Policy Ne. Coverage (5) 0.00
Claim No. Excess (§) 0.00
Assign From Assign Date 13/02/2018
2, Vehicle Particulars & Condition
Make & Model c.c 0
Engine No. HIDDEN Year of Reg.
Chassis No. Colour
Odometer . Steering
Brakes Modification
General
3. Conditions of Tyres
Size Make Balance
R/H Front Tyre mm
L/H Front Tyre mm
R/H Rear Tyre mm
L/H Rear Tyre mm
4. Description of Damages
5. General Information
Accident Date  07/02/2018 Inspection Date 130212018
Survey held at VFIX AUTO SERVICE PTELTD
B0 KAKI BUKIT AVE 6, ARK@KB, 417892 KAKI BUKIT
SINGAPORE 417882
Sa. Remarks
AITHE INSPECTION WAS CONDUCTED ON A"WITHOUT PREJUDICE" BASIS.
B)IN ACCORDANCE TO YOUR INSTRUCTIONS, WE HAVE NOT AUTHORISED REPAIRS.




PARF/COE Rebate Enquiry

Enquire PARF/COE Rebate for Registered Vehicle

Vehicle Owner Particulars

Owner |0 Type: Foreign Identification
MNumber

Cwner 1D, 5668P

Vehicle Details

Vehicle No.: SLGE&AAA

Vehicle to be Exported: Nao

Intended De-registration 14 Feb 2018

Date:

Vehicle Make: JAGUAR

Vehicle Model: KIS OLAT ABSD/AB
2WD 4DR GAS/D SR

Primary Calour: Black

Manutacturing Year: 2010

Engine No.: 101116823514508PN

Chassis Mo, SAJACZIF4BLV15997

Maximum Power Qutput: 283.0kW (379 bhp)

QpenMarket Value: S87,797.00

Original Registration Date: 19 May 2011

First Registration Date: 19 May 2011

Transfer Count: 2

Actual ARF Paid: £87,797.00

Intended PARF Rebate Details

PARF Eligibility; Yes

PARF Eligitility Expiry 18 May 2021
Date:

PARF Rebate Amount; $57.068.00

Intended COE Rebate Details

COE Expiry Date: 18 May 2021
COE Category: E - CpenCategory
COE Period(Years): 10

QP Pald: $62.010.00

COE Rebate Amount: $20,182.00

Total Rebate Amount: $77,25000

The information contained herein Is correct a5 at 14 Feb 2018

https://vrl.Ita.gov.sg/lta/vrl/action/enquireRebate By PublicBeforeDeregInput ZFUNCTI...

Page 1 of 2

14/2/2018



t Viix Auto Service Pte Ltd

®
k I B0 Kaki Bukit Ave &
. Ark@KB Singapore 417892
Email; viixauto@gmail com

Tel 62489268 Fax: 64452368

M/S INDIA INT'L INS PTE LTD ESTIMATE
64 CECIL STREET DATE : 12/02/2018
#05-01 10B BUILDING ACC DATE : 07/02/2018
SINGAPORE 049711 REF NO. : VFIX-TP20180420
POLICY NO :
Attention: Motor Claim Department
RE : VEHICLE NO.5LG 666 A JAGUAR XL
DESCRIPTIONS UNIT PRICE AMOLUNT S5
1 1 FRONTSHOCK ABSORBER LH A7 3.52[}.00?
2 1 FRONT WHEEL KNUCKLE LH A7 125300
3 1 FRONT LOWER ARM LH 7 ogs.00
4 1 SPORTRIM ;p/g_.( 1.540.00 /0001
$ 7.298.00
LABOUR & MISCELLANEOUS: AMOUNT S§
I To remove damaged body panels with all necessary components/attach- ) 00 1,000.00
ments apply hot-works where necessary
2 To spray paint replaced/repaired body panels inclusive of preparatory d 03' 1,000.00
works and painting materials
1 To conduct front wheel alignment 100.00 /
5 2,000.00

GRAND TOTAL - §  9,298.00

SINGAPORE DOLLARS : NINE THOUSAND TWO HUNDRED & NINETY EIGHT ON
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Nivitha (LKK Auto)

From: Motor Claim - lll <motorclaim@iii.com.sg>
Sent: Monday. 12 February 2018 4:37 PM
To: viix auto; 'sur@Ikkauto.com’, Catherine Chong (LKK Auto)
Ce: Manivel Priyadarshini
Subject: RE: PRE-REPAIR INSPECTION FOR SLG666A AND SHCB485X ON 07/02/2018
Attachments: Il NOA.DOCX
444 @ 122 | 201
Dear Sir / Mdm, "
whide In
Please conduct a survey on TP vehicle SLGEG6A and let us have your report urgently. Rﬁun @ ll‘ml.
a0\g
This claim will be handled by Ms Priya. f.WM"'\][ o H\o }\

"Hindly upload this survey request email to merimen,

Thank You.

Best Regards,

Gabriel Wee

Maotor Claims Dept.

India International Insurance Pte Ltd

64 Cecll Street | #05 108 Bullding | Singapore 049711
Tel: 6347 6100, Ext - 248

From: vfix auto [mailto;vfixauto @gmail.com)

Sent: 12 February, 2018 3:24 PM

To: Motor Claim - |Il <motorclaim@iii.com.sg>

Subject: Re: PRE-REPAIR INSPECTION FOR SLGBE6A AND SHCB485X ON 07/02/2018

Dear Gabriel
We would like to appoint LKK.

Thanks

Irene

Wi Auto Services Pto Ltd
60 Kkl Bukit Ave & Ark @B Singapore 417852 | E: viauto@gmail com | T +65 BA5S2957 | F- +65 64452358

On Mon, Feb 12, 2018 at 2:01 PM, Motor Claim - [11 <motorclaim@iii.com.sg> wrote:

Dear Sir / Mdm,



We acknowledge receipt of your email.

We proprose using one of the following motor surveyors:

s LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
s Vicom Assessment Centre Pte Ltd

Please notify us within 02 days of receipt of this letter for surveyor agreed on or if you have any objections to the
above list.

Best Regards,

Gabriel Wee
Motor Claims Dept.
India International Insurance Pte Ltd
#05 108 Building | Singapore 049711
Tel: 6347 6100, Ext - 248

From: vfix auto [mailto:vfixauto@gmail.com]

Sent: 12 February, 2018 11:59 AM

To: Motor Claim - Il <motorclaim@ili.com.sg>

Subject: RE: PRE-REPAIR INSPECTION FOR SLG666A AND SHCB485X ON 07/02/2018

Dear Sir | Mdm,

Please find attached copy for your arrangement.

Thanks



| Vfix Auto Services Pte Ltd
50 ki Bukls Ave § Ark@KB Singapors 417852 | £ viauto@gmail.oom | T +55 4552957 | F- +65 54452368
Kindly note that by submitting this claim to us, you are deemed to have agreed to us collecting, using,
disclosing and processing your personal data, sharing your personal data with our service providers
(located both inside and outside Singapore) and/or with other insurers in the general insurance industry,
including the General Insurance Association of Singapore. This enables us to ensure proper processing,
handling and/or dealing with your claim, which includes investigating the said claim, and complying with
applicable laws. If you do not agree to the same, kindly let us know immediately.

DISCLAIMER:

This email 1s intended solely for the person to whom it has been addressed.

It may contain confidential and/or legally privileged information.

If you are not the person for whom this e-mail was intended, or if this e-mail has reached
vou by mistake, please delete it immediately and inform us of the error and also be hereby
notified that any use, distribution, transmission, printing, copying or dissemination

of this information in any way or in any manner is strictly prohibited and may be unlawful.
[nternet communications may not be entirely secure or accurate as information could be
intercepted, corrupted, lost, delayed or contain viruses.

Therefore, we do not accept liability for any errors or omissions in the content of this
message or any delay in delivery which may arise as a result of Internet transmission

or any modification.

Print this email only if it is absolutely necessary and help in preservation of environment.
India Intemational [nsurance Pte Lid.

Registration No. 198703792-K

Kindly note that by submitting this claim to us, you are deemed to have agreed to us collecting, using,
disclosing and processing your personal data, sharing your personal data with our service providers (located
both inside and outside Singapore) and/or with other insurers in the general insurance industry, including
the General Insurance Association of Singapore. This enables us to ensure proper processing, handling
and/or dealing with your claim, which includes investigating the said claim, and complying with applicable
laws. If you do not agree to the same, kindly let us know immediately.

DISCLAIMER:

This email is intended solely for the person to whom it has been addressed.

It may contain confidential and/or legally privileged information.

If you are not the person for whom this e-mail was intended, or if this e-mail has reached
vou by mistake, please delete it immediately and inform us of the error and also be hereby
notified that any use, distribution, transmission, printing, copying or dissemination

of this information in any way or in any manner is strictly prohibited and may be unlawful.
Internet communications may not be entirely secure or accurate as information could be
intercepted, corrupted, lost, delayed or contain viruses.

Therefore, we do not accept liability for any errors or omissions in the content of this
message or any delay in delivery which may arise as a result of Internet transmission

or any modification.

Print this email only if it is absolutely necessary and help in preservation of environment.
India International Insurance Pte Ltd.

Registration No. 198703792-K



viix

Viix Auto Service Ple Lid
40 Koki Bukit Ave &
Your Vehicle No. : SHCB485X Ark@KB Singapore 417892

Our Vehicle No. : SLGE66A Emait: vimauto@gmail.com
Tel: 44489248 Fax: 444527348

07 FEB 2018

M/S INDIA INT'L INS PTE LTD
64 CECIL STREET

# 05-01 10B BUILDING
SINGAPORE 049711

ATTN: MOTOR CLAIMS DEPT

Dear Sir / Madam,

ACCIDENT INVOLVING SLG666A AND SHCB485X ON 07 FEB 2018

We refer to the above matter.

We hereby give 2 days’ notice to conduct a pre-repair inspection of vehicle

number SLG666A at 60 Kaki Bukit Ave 6, ARK@KB, Singapore 417892,

Thank you.

Yours faithfully,

Vfix Auto Service Pte Ltd
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Wi Auto senvice Fre Lhd
&0 Kokl Bukit Ave &

Ohur Ref, No. : VFIX-TP201B0420 AL ERE Singopore 417872
Emait vfsguto@gmall.com

Tel 44487248 Fou 444527368
MOTOR CLAIMS DEPT CoReg , Mo 201 802764H

51 Reg Mo 201 602744
INDIA INT'L INS PTE LTD
64 CECIL STREET
#0501 OB BUILDING
SINGAPORE (49711
WITHOUT PREJUDICE
Dear Sir / Madam

PROPERTY CLAIM ONLY

ACCIDENT INVOLVING SLG666A  AND SHCB485X ON 07 FEB 2018
ALONG CAVENAGH ROAD TOWARDS ORCHARD ROAD

We refer 1o the above-mentioned accident.

We are wntng on  behall of MS XIANG MEl1 LIN the registered owner
of motor vehicle number SLGH66A which wa mvolved i the above asccidemt

We are instructed that the above accident was caused by the negligence and munagement of vour
msured's  vehicle number SHCB485X As a result of the above acadent, our client's vehicle
was damaged and our client's has been put to loss and expense, particulars of which are as follows -

i (ost of Repair 53 1.284.00)
2  Loss of Use (1 days X § 12000 ) L 1200001
3  LTA Fees =8 745
TOTAL AMOUNTS S5 1,411.45

We enclased a list of the supporung documents -
()  Onginal Final Repair Bl
(b} LTA Tax Invaice
(c) 3lA / Palice Report lodged by Our Client
{(d) Lerer of Authonry

Kindly acknowledge recapr of the above said documents and your favourable reply 15 pready
appreciated.

Yours Faithfully,
VFIX AUTO SERVICE PTE LTD

} o

- L

Kelvin Poh



To:  |NDIA INTERNATIONAL INSURANCE PTE LTD
64 CECIL STREET
#04-00 & #05-00 108 BUILDING
SINGAPORE 049711

Dezr Sii [ Madam,

Claimant

ACCIDENT INVOLVING _ -Ms LLL & AND  TRC BN x on otles 1§ AT

“HRIEMBRGH Wh Taad  OhGwmes  Rh
If\We, KA, HEL LW , am/are the registered owner of
motor carno. SLG LLLF

Please be informed that | have assigned all compensation monies dus to me/us in the shove
accident to VFIX AUTO SERVICE PTE LTD

I/ We hareby suthorized you to release 21l moniss pertaining to the sbove mentioned scident
10 VFIX AUTO SERVICE PTE LTD 2nd forward the settlement cheque to VFIX AUTO SERVICE PTE
LTD whom 1/we have suthorizad to collect the szid compensation monies.

Thank you,

Signature of Claimant & Signature miWitness
Company Stamp if 2pplicable
ICho: G OUSS -'_;._ 4 ¥ Cna: SIEXIEI S 7T

Date: C tl [ | A% Date; o I &l
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DISCHARGE VOUCHER
lIl-Direct Settlement (PODS)

india Ref: MCT 18020235
Cinimant Ref - SLG 6584

Wel,

WEIX AUTO BERVICE FTELTD

with the appointed Surveyor of Intfia Inlemational Insurance Pte Lid

nlwnmmtuwmmhss

usaleomtall, §§ 745 (search fee), vehicle no SLCGSaA thal wae

(dale) ol CAVENAGH AD TWOS ORCHARD B3
vehecin), This i porsuant 1o the inspection conducied an

on 072018

Wall confirm that we/l srelam autharized by the ownar
claimant™) of vahicle no. SLG S66A 4o make Ihe claim as sel oul in the above pora
mmmmmmulﬂlmMWlMﬂﬁl Wﬁlmdmhmuhnuu’atu{mnmwwnhr'ﬂﬂﬁrd

party claimant”

Wail lurther confirm thal wedl will indemnify India int
mumrmm-dmuummsnmmwmmm‘m
further cloim against the lnnnmhrw!mandupmmmﬁmdmaingtomlt
of use pursuant la the damage 1o _SLGBBGA

inoy wall or

Waill mﬂmhtmmmmhnluﬂwrﬂlmmm
wmtnwmm-mmmmm

basis

This agreemant is subject to the application ol Singapora

("lha workshop™| hereby canfirm thal wefl have reached an agresman
L.MMDEWULTMSPTE LTD

{ g

1,264.00

13022018

HLANS ME] LIN

(repair cost) S$_13000
demaged pursuant io he aocident which occurmed
{locslion) involving vehicke no. SHC BABSH (rmuned
(date) at “the workshap’

dispule snsing oul of tha same.

wellauthorize youto pay thetolal amountof 53_1.411.43

Dated his ...

CLAIMANT:

Signature

Marmne.

NRIC:

Matioralily:

day of

Ocoupation:

(vahicle no. ) as & result af the accident,

[loss of

{“tha third party

graph and wa/l have full authorty Lo sellle

srmational Insursnca Pie Lid lor all damages lass andior expansa ihat
the above sald agreement lodges a
of repairs andfor rental andlor loss

gni of all caims of “the thind pary claimant”
mmumﬂﬂmawﬁwlmmﬁMHMnmuﬂw

law and the Singapore Courts have exclusive jurisdiclion over any

fo VFIX AUTO SERVICE PTELTD

Loanne L
5‘{%1!.:'31&

by L e PVYE G
ML o) HAEAL
AL A Zan

Prelmawny

WITNESS:

Signalure:

HRIC:

Address:

Mationality

Decupation:

CHE
polnied Surveyor

LMK AUTD CONGULTANTS PTELTD
Ll E—

51 UBI AVE 1, PAYA LB INDUSTRIAL PARK

#02-25 SINGAPORE 40893



INDIA INT'L INS PTE LTD
i CECIL STREET

#05-01 108 BUILDING
SINGAPORE (49711

vfix

Viix Auto Service Fle Lid
A0 Kokl Bukll Ave &

Ark@EB Singapore 417852
Email vikoulo@gmaoi.com
Tal A448974R Foux: 44452348

Co Reg . No: 201 602744H
G5T Reg No: 201502964H

FINAL REPAIR BILL

DATE
VEHICLE NO
MAKE/MODEL
ACC DATE
CLAIM NO
POLICY NO

: 05/04/2018

SLGOO6NA

: JAGUAR X]

07/02/2018

: VFIX-TP2Z018042

LUMP SUM REPAIR COST

Repur Amount
The GST

Total

SINGAPORE DOLLARS : ONE THOUSAND TWO HUNDRED

& EIGHTY FOUR ONLY

Kehvin Poh

AMOUNT 3%

1,200,00
84,00

1,284.00




Land Transpoft Authority
10 Sin Ming Drive

Singapore 575701 S-;LG c.éét PI

GST Registration No. - M&-0008528-2
Print Date/Time : 07 Feb 2016/ 14 0858
Receipt Date/Time : O7 Feb 2018/ 14.08:.47
Tax Invoice/Recelpt
Recempt N TTNET-00000-180207-001026
Previous Recep! No

S/N Item Description/ Amount GST  Amount
Business Transaction Reference Before Amount After GST
No. GST(88) (S8) (5%)
Result of Insurance Enguiry - SHCE485X
As at 07 Feb 2018/08:25.00

Insurance Co INDIA INT'L INS PTE LTD
1 Insurance Enguiry - SHCE4B5X
Enguiry Fes 700 4B 749
20180207 140804482067

Sub-Total 7.00 048 T49
Total Before Rounding 7.00 049 749
Rounding Difference 004
Total Amount Payable T48
Paid By

Cregil Card: Visa

romoaminiiie MasterCand -
. T45
Cash Change o
. TA45
Excess Refundable Amount -

THANK YO AND HAVE A NICE DAY!

Please ensure that all psyments to the Authority are good and promptly settled by the payment service
provider / financial institution. Otherwise, the transaction and receipt is considered void and late fee

may apply.



Merimen e-Claims Page 1 of 1

...CLAIM SUBFOLDER...(Pending for Survey Report)

Direct Settlement

| CLAIM SUBFOLDER TRACKING

| Case |Notfied  [EstSubmitted  |AdjAssigned  [AdIRgt | AdjSubmitted  |ins Authed | Status
|y | MeFen2018 églf,f s $$1,200.00  $$1,200.00 |""‘""' for Survey
|. | _Edit Reg | ey i | | Edit Extimates | | view Aot | |:I e |

Main Reference Claim Details
| CLAIM SUBFOLDER DETAILS - [Created by adjuster]
nsured: COMFORT TRANSPORTATION PTE LTD, Co. Aeg. No.: 1993038218

[Main )

;| XIANG METLIN,  ID: GO425668P |

Vehice Reg. 07/02/2018 00:00 - 59

[No.: |SLaseeA o Of LSS | 50 Months and 19 Days From LTA Reg Date (Man rr))
|Clain Type: | TP / MCT18020225 :ﬂ;ﬁ?‘“ MEOMOLS

{ | YR

[vehicle Reg

| puticy Ne. |
:?umm}__im {Clat " |GA1B198%

 Ewcess
Repairer: Viix Auto Service Pt Ltd (HQ) 60 Kaki Bukit Ave 6, ARK@KE, 417892 Kaki Bukit - Tel! 84552057
[anANS | india International Insurance Ple Ltd (HQ) - Tel: 63476100 . [Mandled by Priva)
faamant® | AXA Insurance Pte Ltd (HQ) - Tel: 6338 7248

Adwster: | LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd (HQ) - Tei: 6256-3561 . [Handied by MARCUS CHUA]  [Final Rpt due 23/02/2018]

ASSOCIATED MAIL RECEIVED view Al | Compose Case mail |

o 111 SG (20/02/2018): Alert - Ad) Mandate Approved (S30.00) - SLGES8A - Claim Handler: Priya

—— S— ]

ALL ASSOCIATED TASKS™ view All | Search Tasks | Croste bew Task | Compiete |
Due Date Priority Type  Task Group Subject  Handler Assigned By Completed On Created On Done?

https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRadjuster& fuseaction=dsp_... 27/4/2018



Merimen e-Claims

Claim Documents

*SLGG66A [MCT18D20225)
[SHCBaB5X]
TP
XIANG MEI LIN
Feb 7 2018 12:00AM
[COMFORT TRANSPORTATION PTE LTD]
Viix Auto Service Pte Ltd

Page | of 2

Upload Documants I Upioad Photos | Compose New Letter | M{Mmmivi
Photos/Images Tperpage  |v]| A |
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LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd co reg Ne tessor 1sery
51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25, Paya Ubl Industrial Park

Singapore 408833

Tel: 6256-3561 Fax: 6844-8805 Email sur@lkkauto.com;assignments@/kkauto.com

VEHICLE DAMAGE INSPECTION REPORT

Our File No: CC4/M1B002B83/UEB3Q2
Date: 27104/2018
REFERENCE
Handling Insurer: India International Insurance Ple Ltd  Policy Na. MCOMODO015
Claimant Vehicle 51 ceesa Insured Vehicle No :  SHC8485X
Date of Loss: 07/022018 Malure of Claim P Claim No. MCT18020225
RIPTION & | ATI
Reg No: SLGGEEA
Make & Model JAGUAR XJ, 5.0 (A) Engine No: 10111823514508PN
Reg Date: 19/05/2011 (Man. Year: 2010) Chassis No: SAJACZ2F4BLYV15997
Colour; White Cdometer 61922 km
Engine Capacity: 5000 cc
Market Valua/New Car Price: N/A
Sum Insured (58): Market Value/New Car Price
CONDITION OF VEHICLE AT THE TIME OF SURVEY
General Condition: Steering (Serviceable). Footbrake (Serviceable). Yes
Handbrake {Serviceable); Yes Engine Modification Pre-accident Condition:
M N OF TYR
Front Tyre Size: 255367 R20 Rear Tyre Size: 2B5/30Z R20
Front Lefl Side: Pirelhi 8 mm Rear Lefi Side: Pirelli 8 mm
Front Right Side: Piralli 8 mm Rear Right Side: Pirelll 6 mm
Thi above vilues represent e remaring [yre resds depth
COST OF CLAIMS Repairer's  Adjuster's Difference  Diff %
Pars 7.288.00 1,000.00 6.298.00 B6.30
Miscellangous Items Q.00 0.00 0.00
Labour 2.100.00 500.00 1,600.00 76,18
Paintwark Labour 0.00 0.00 0.00
Towing 0.00 0.00 0.00
Calculated Gross Total (S§) 9,398.00 1,500.00 7,898.00 84.04
Approved Total (Overridden) (S5) 1,200.00
(S5) 9,398.00 1.200.00 8.198.00 8723
+ GST 7.00/7.00% (S$) 657 86 84.00 573.B8 8723
Nett Amount (5§) 10,055.86 1,284.00 8,771.86 87.23
+ Loss of Use (1.0 x 5§120.00/day) (S§) 120.00
+ Docl/Search Fee (S§) 7.45
Nett Liability (S$§) 1.411.45
INSPECTION
Date of Assignment: 12/02/2018
Date Inspecled: 13/02/2018 Inspected At Viix Auto Service Ple Lid (HQ)

https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm? fusebox=MTRadjuster&fuseaction=gen_...

60 Kaki Bukii Ave 6, ARK@EKB
Singapore 417882

27/4/2018



Adjuster Report Page 2 of 4

Estimated Period of Repair 1.0 days

Adjuster: MARCUS CHUA Manager: Asher Sng Rong Yi

NOTE: This repor mpresents our findings at the fime and pace of nepection stafed heren. Such inspechion Nas bevn carmed out [o the bast of our
knowisdge and shilify but any offver liabiity under ary cther circumaances (s hemnby sxpressly exclbded,
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Adjuster Report

REPAIR DETAILS

Reference

Part Source: MRM-SG Version: 1.0 (Last Synchronised: 12 Mar 2018)

Parts: 143 JAGUAR XJ 5.0 (A) (Catalogue:Menmen Singapore 1.0)

Labour: Repairer's {Price-denominated Standard List)

Print Code: (Unsubmitted, no print-code for SLGEEBA)

|Validity: These estimates are valid only if they contain the print code (above) on all estimate pages. running page

numbers with the END OF ESTIMATES marker on the las! estimale page

|Further Info: ltems/values not in ruﬁ&rmqu m@m are mﬂxfd rmhan mtu_mic *_.

Recommended Parts

Page 3 of 4

No. Qty Part No. Particulars Condition Repairer's Amount

1 1 ‘FRONT SHOCK ABSORBER LH Not Necessary 3,520.00F *~F

2 1 *FRONT WHEEL KNUCKLE LH Not Necessary 1.253.00F *~F

3 1 *FRONT LOWER ARM LH Not Necessary SB5.00F ~F

4 1 *SPORT RIM Dented / Bent 1.540.00FS  *1,000.00FS
F=Franchesa pan. S=SpcNet

Total Parts {55) 7,298.00 1,000.00
Report was unsubmitied during this print-out J
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Recommended Miscellaneous [tems
There are no new miscellaneous lems selacted.
Recommended Labour
No Particulars Lab.Type Repairer's Amount
Labour llems
1 TO REMOVE DAMAGED BODY PANELS WITH ALL New 1,000.00 200.00
NECESSARY COMPONENTS /ATTACHMENTS APPLY HOT-
WORKS WHERE NECESSARY
2 TO SPRAY PAINT REPLACED /REPAIRED BODY PANELS MNew 1.000.00 200.00
INCLUSIVE OF PREPARATORY WORKS AND PAINTING
MATERIALS
| TO CONDUCT FRONT WHEEL ALIGNMENT New 100.00 100.00
Gross Labour Cost (S$) 2,100.00 500.00
Report was unsubmitted during this print-out, ]
< END OF ESTIMATES >
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