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Catherine Chong (LKK Auto)

From: Catherine Chong (LKK Auto) <admin-d@lkkauto.com>

Sent: Tuesday, 13 March, 2018 1:22 PM

To: ‘Albert Hong'; 'assignments’

Ce: 'SUR'

Subject: RE: Appoint LEK to conduct TP survey;  Our Ref: C10001339
Dear Albert,

Thank you for your email,
Please be informed that no survey done for this vehicle, we will close this file at our end without billing.

Best Regards,
Catherine Chong | Admin
LEK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6741-8424 | email: gssignmeniz@likauto.cony | fax: 6256-4315
Bik 51. Payd Ubd Industridl Park, Ubl Avenue 1, #02-a5 | S(408943)

From: Albert Hong [mailta:albert. hong@budgetdirect.com.sg]
Sent: Tuesday, 13 March, 2018 12:41 PM

To: assignments <assignments @lkkauto.com>

Cc: SUR <sur@lkkauto.com=

Subject: RE: Appaint LKK to conduct TP sufvey; Our Ref: C10001339

Hi Team,

We understand from third party that she will be doing a direct settlement with our insured.
As LKK have not survey the vehicle, we would like to cancel this survey assignment.

Kindly reply to confirm,

Thank you,

Regards,

Albert Hong
Senior Executive, Claims

T +65 6540 2182
F +65 6725 0853
E albert.hong@budgetdirect.com.sg

Budget
Direct
msurance

Customer Care: +656221 2111
Claims: +65 6221 2199
Claims (Int.): +65 6540 2158



Catherine Ch_u_ng (LKK Auto)

From: Albert Hong <alberthong@budgetdirect.com.sg>

Sent: Tuesday, 13 March, 2018 12:41 FM

To: assignments

Ce: SUR

Subject: RE: Appaint LKK to conduct TP survey; Our Ref: C1000133%
Hi Team,

W= understand fram third party that she will be doing a direct settlement with our insured.
Ag LKK have not survey the vehicle, we would like to cancel this survey assignment.

Kindly reply to canfirm.

Thank you.

Regards,

Albert Hong
Senior Executive, Claims

T +65 6540 2182
F +65 6725 0853
E albert.hong@budoetdirect.com.sg

Dlgrect

insurance

Customer Care: +565 6221 2111
Claims: +65 6221 2199
Claims (Int.): +65 6540 2199

190 Clemenceau Avenue

#73-01, Singapore Shopping Centre
Singapore 239924
budgetdirect.com.sq

Auto & General Insurance [Singapore) Pte. Limited (co. Reg. No. 201626103G) trading as Budget Direct Insurance.

From: Albert Hong

Sent: Monday, 12 February, 2018 5:44 PM

To: assignments <assignments@lkkauto.com>

Ce: SUR <sur@lkkauto.coms

Subject: Appoint LKK to conduct TP survey; Our Ref: C10001339

Hi Team,
Plzase accept assignment and liaise with TP workshop.

Thank you,



Regzards,

Albert Hong
Senior Executive, Claims

T +65 6540 2182
F +65 6725 0853
E alberth budgetdirect.

Budget
Direct
nsurance

Customer Care: +65 6221 2111
Claims: +65 6221 2199
Claims (Int.): +65 6540 2199

180 Clemenceau Avenue

#03-01, Singapore Shopping Centre
Singapore 239924
budgetdirect.com.sg

Auto & General Insurance (Singapore) Pte, Limited {co. Reg. No. 201626103G) trading as Budget Direct Insurance.

From: nitha [mailto:nitha @mava.com.sg)
Sent: Monday, 12 February, 2018 5:29 PM

Teo: Claims <claims@budgetdirect.com.sg>

Cc: 'Suann’ <suann@mova.com,sg>; 'Billy' <billy@mova. .
Subject: TP CLAIMS - SDB3195 AGAINST SKI8B30K ON 06/02/18 AT FERRER RD

Dear Sir/Madam,

Your Ref: SKIBE3I0K
Kindly assist to revert the officer in charge, liability for the above case and arrange survey.

Thank you.

Best Regards
Nitha
Clabms Oifficer

Mova Automotive Pia Lid
Tel 6272 3882 Fax. 8270 8314

00

Aulomotive Pla Ltd



Nivitha (LKK Auto)

From: Albert Hong <albert hong@budgetdirect.comsg>

Sent: Monday, 12 February 2018 5:44 PM

Te: assignments

Ce: SUR

Subject: Appoint LKK to conduct TP'survey;  QOur Ref: C10001339
Attachments; EST pdf; RPT_pdf

Hi Team,

Please accept assignment and lalse with TP warkshaop,
Thank you.
Regards,

Albert Hong
Senior Executive, Claims

T +65 6540 2182
F +65.6725 0853
E albert. hongsibudgetdirect.com.sg

Budget
th'eect

insurance

Customer Care: +65 6221 2111
Claims: +65 6221 2199
Claims (Int.): +65 6540 2199

190 Clemenceau Avenue

#03-01, Singapore Shopping Centre
Singapare 239924
budgetdirect.com.sq

Auto & General Insurance (Singapore) Pte. Limited (co. Reg. No. 201626103G) trading as Budget Direct Insurance.

From: nitha [mallto:nithai@mova .com.sg)

Sent: Monday, 12 February, 2018 5:29 PM

Te: Claims <claims@budgetdirect. com.sg>

Ce: 'Suann' <suann@mova.com.sg>; 'Billy' <billy@maova.com. sg>

Subject; TP CLAIMS - SDBS19S AGAINST SKIS830K ON 06/02/18 AT FERRER RD

Dear Sir/Madam,

Your Ref: SKIB830K
Kindly assist to revert the officer in charge, llability for the above case and arrange survey.

Trank you!



Hest Ragards
Nutira.

Claims Cificer
KAtsun Autdmotive Pre Lid
Tel: 6272 3882 Fax &I70 E314

@MOVA ¢ o

Autlomolive Plte Lig



