Thin Thin (LKKAuto)

From: Thin Thin (LKKAuto)

Sent: Monday, 30 July 2018 1:01 PM

To: 'Lee, Ming-Yao'

Cc: Adrian Ling (LKKAuto)

Subject: RE: <MANDATE> Your Ref: 6990267538SG ; Our Ref: CC6/AIG18002683/Aua3
[ACCIDENT ON 07/02/2018 INVOLVING VEHICLES SLV 7357S AND SJH 6571T]

Attachments: market price.pdf

Dear George,

We refer to the below matter.

Please be inform that we have check with our surveyor Mr Adrian.

At a current COE pf about $ 32K, a similar make and model is marketed for about S 57K. At the time of accident (Feb

2018), COE was renewed at $ 38,655, an increment of about 6K-7K from current COE price. Please see the attached of a
current advertisement.

Therefore, a more reflective market value at the time of accident should be about 57K (current car price) + 7 K (
difference on COE price between accident date and current date) = 64K

Nett value = 64K — 38.6K = 25.4K

Best Regards,

Thin Thin Hlaing | Case Handler (on belf of Mr Adrin)
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
Phone: 6841-2360 | email: thinthin@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Thin Thin (LKKAuto)

Sent: Friday, 20 July 2018 11:03 AM

To: 'Lee, Ming-Yao' <MingYao.Lee@aig.com>

Subject: RE: <MANDATE> Your Ref: 6990267538SG ; Our Ref: CC6/AIG18002683/Aua3 [ACCIDENT ON 07/02/2018
INVOLVING VEHICLES SLV 7357S AND SJH 6571T]

Dear George,

We acknowledge your email below.

We will check with our surveyor and will revert back to you.

Thanks.

Best Regards,

Thin Thin Hlaing | Case Handler



LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
Phone: 6841-2360 | email: thinthin@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Lee, Ming-Yao <MingYao.Lee@aig.com>

Sent: Friday, 20 July 2018 10:55 AM

To: Thin Thin (LKKAuto) <thinthin@l|kkauto.com>

Subject: RE: <MANDATE> Your Ref: 6990267538SG ; Our Ref: CC6/A1G18002683/Aua3 [ACCIDENT ON 07/02/2018
INVOLVING VEHICLES SLV 7357S AND SJH 6571T]

Hi Thin Thin,

Based the information gathered from other independence adjusters, market value should be around S$ 50k — 51k,
please verify.

Regards,

George Lee

AlIG

Complex Claims Examiner

Claims | AlG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte. Ltd

78 Shenton Way #08-16 Singapore(079120)

Tel +(65) 6419 1769 | Fax +(65) 6835 7416

Ming-Yao.Lee@aig.com | www.aig.com.sg

From: Thin Thin (LKKAuto) [mailto:thinthin@Ikkauto.com]

Sent: 09 July 2018 13:36

To: Lee, Ming-Yao; CS A Team

Subject: RE: <MANDATE> Your Ref: 6990267538SG ; Our Ref: CC6/AIG18002683/Aua3 [ACCIDENT ON 07/02/2018
INVOLVING VEHICLES SLV 7357S AND SJH 6571T]

Dear George,
We refer to the below matter.

Market value : $ 67,000.00
PQP Paid : $ 38,655.00
Nett Value: $ 28,400.00

Best Regards,

Thin Thin Hlaing | Case Handler
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
Phone: 6841-2360 | email: thinthin@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)
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From: Lee, Ming-Yao [mailto:MingYao.Lee@aig.com]

Sent: Tuesday, 3 July 2018 3:19 PM

To: CS A Team <cs-a@lkkauto.com>

Cc: Thin Thin (LKKAuto) <thinthin@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: <MANDATE> Your Ref: 6990267538SG ; Our Ref: CC6/A1G18002683/Aua3 [ACCIDENT ON 07/02/2018
INVOLVING VEHICLES SLV 73575 AND SJH 6571T]

Hi LKK,
Please help to forward to surveyor to examine the market value / repair limit of above mentioned vehicle.

Regards,

George Lee

AIG

Complex Claims Examiner

Claims | AlG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte. Ltd

78 Shenton Way #08-16 Singapore(079120)

Tel +(65) 6419 1769 | Fax +(65) 6835 7416

Ming-Yao.Lee@aig.com | www.aig.com.sg

From: Lee, Ming-Yao

Sent: 03 July 2018 15:17

To: 'Thin Thin (LKKAuto)'

Subject: RE: <MANDATE> Your Ref: 6990267538SG ; Our Ref: CC6/AIG18002683/Aua3 [ACCIDENT ON 07/02/2018
INVOLVING VEHICLES SLV 7357S AND SJH 6571T]

Hi Thin Thin,

Understand that TPV was a 10 years old vehicle, appreciate if you could obtain the market value / repair limit of the
vehicle.

Regards,

George Lee

AlIG

Complex Claims Examiner

Claims | AlG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte. Ltd

78 Shenton Way #08-16 Singapore(079120)

Tel +(65) 6419 1769 | Fax +(65) 6835 7416

Ming-Yao.Lee@aig.com | www.aig.com.sg

From: Lee, Ming-Yao
Sent: 28 June 2018 16:49
To: 'Thin Thin (LKKAuto)'



Subject: RE: <MANDATE> Your Ref: 6990267538SG ; Our Ref: CC6/AIG18002683/Aua3 [ACCIDENT ON 07/02/2018
INVOLVING VEHICLES SLV 7357S AND SJH 6571T]

Hi Thin Thin,
We are reviewing the matter. Please hold hands.

Regards,

George Lee

AIG

Complex Claims Examiner

Claims | AlIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte. Ltd

78 Shenton Way #08-16 Singapore(079120)

Tel +(65) 6419 1769 | Fax +(65) 6835 7416

Ming-Yao.Lee@aig.com | www.aig.com.sg

From: Thin Thin (LKKAuto) [mailto:thinthin@Ikkauto.com]

Sent: 27 June 2018 14:48

To: Lee, Ming-Yao

Subject: RE: <MANDATE> Your Ref: 6990267538SG ; Our Ref: CC6/AIG18002683/Aua3 [ACCIDENT ON 07/02/2018
INVOLVING VEHICLES SLV 7357S AND SJH 6571T]

Dear George,
We refer to the below matter.

Please let us have your mandate approval.

Best Regards,

Thin Thin Hlaing | Case Handler
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
Phone: 6841-2360 | email: thinthin@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Thin Thin (LKKAuto)

Sent: Friday, 8 June 2018 6:42 PM

To: 'Lee, Ming-Yao' <MingYao.Lee@aig.com>

Subject: <MANDATE> Your Ref: 6990267538SG ; Our Ref: CC6/AIG18002683/Aua3 [ACCIDENT ON 07/02/2018
INVOLVING VEHICLES SLV 7357S AND SJH 6571T]

Your Ref: 6990267538SG
Our Ref: CC6/A1G18002683/Aua3 “Without Prejudice”

Dear George,



ACCIDENT ON 07/02/2018 INVOLVING VEHICLES SLV 7357S AND SJH 6571T
We refer to the above accident.

The accident occurred while Ol turning right and collided with TP vehicle which was travelling straight from opposite
direction.

We did clarify with OID the nature of accident. We had informed Ol about TP claim.

We seek your approval to offer to TP repairer, New Hock Teck Motor Pte Ltd is as follows: -

Amount Claimed Amount Revised
1 Cost of Repair S 67,982.00 S 25,000.00
2 Loss of Rental (13days x $120) S 1,560.00 S  1,300.00
3 LTA Search Fee S 7.45 S 7.45

S 69,549.45 S 26,307.45
Total amount of claim (Liability 100%) $ 26,307.45

For your approval in Merimen please.
Relevant documents are uploaded in Merimen.

Best Regards,

Thin Thin Hlaing | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841-2360 | email: thinthin@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

IMPORTANT NOTICE:

The information in this email (and any attachments) is confidential. If you are not the intended recipient, you must not
use or disseminate the information. If you have received this email in error, please immediately notify me by "Reply"
command and permanently delete the original and any copies or printouts thereof. Although this email and any
attachments are believed to be free of any virus or other defect that might affect any computer system into which it is
received and opened, it is the responsibility of the recipient to ensure that it is virus free and no responsibility is
accepted by American International Group, Inc. or its subsidiaries or affiliates either jointly or severally, for any loss or
damage arising in any way from its use.



