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§ LSS LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
;_{; ;; ; 51 Libi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubl Industrial Park. Singapore 408933
- TEL 62%6 1561 FAX. B256 4315

Reg MNo: 1996807198R G5T Reg. No. 18-8807188-R

Affiliated to Federation Internationale Des Experis En Automobile

INDIA INTERNATIONAL INSURANCE PL Ref CCa/I18002667/Khb3
805.02 108 BUILDING SINGAPORE 048711 Pate - Debz-2018 'H"ﬂllmmullll
Code = llI2
1. Policy Particulars :- THIRD PARTY CLAIM
Insured Veh. SHC 3854H Veh. Inspected SGV 9938J
Policy No. Coverage ($) 0.00
Claim No. Excess ($) 0.00
Assign From Assign Date 08/0272018
2. Vehicle Particulars & Condition
Make & Model cc a
Engine No. HIDDEN Year of Reg.
Chassis No. Colour
Odometer F Steering
Brakes Modification
General
3. Conditions of Tyres
Size Make Balance
R/H Front Tyre mm
L/H Front Tyre mm
R/H Rear Tyre mm
L/H Rear Tyre mm
4, Description of Damages
5. General Information
Accident Date  05/02/2018 Inspection Date 0B/D2/2018
Survey held at POON SIANG SEOW
No.180 SIN MING DRIVE
#05-13 SIN MING AUTOCITY
SINGAPORE 575722
Sa. Remarks
AJTHE INSPECTION WAS CONDUCTED ON A"WITHOUT FREJUDICE" BASIS
B)IN ACCORDANCE TO YOUR INSTRUCTIONS, WE HAVE NOT AUTHORISED REPAIRS




Ji

FOMR WY

POON SIANG SEOW

Sin Ming Autocity, No. 160 Sin Ming Drive, #05-13, Singapore 575722

Tel: 6453 7511

Fax; 6453 8048 Email: siti1@singnet.com.sg Regn. No. D5386B00K

Aoy Atha,,
zy
/{r .5,, f (74

Ny A S,

Evergreen Rent A Car Pte Lid -
BIk 159 Sin Ming Road Z
#01-07 Amtech Building
Singapore 575825
Dear sir
Estimate cost of repair to vehicle no. SGV 9939]
To supply
1. Rear bumper ‘q‘l 508.20 ~—
2. Rear bumper Conner Ba 15300 —
3. Rea bumper sensor A~ 35000 X
4. Rear bumper reflector Lot 4000 —
5. Rear bumper mudflat = 65.00 4
6. Rear panel T 53500
7. Rear exhaust box T 607,90 ¢
8. Tail gate garish Cat 36480 —
9. Tail gate rubber P 106.00 £
Rear panel top garish 2¢ [ S~ 128.00 ¢
Labour charges
Rust proofing va 80.00 X
Panel beating 80000 %o
Spray painting 680.00 5 Zor
Total

Atmm

Your faitfully

ALBERT POON




Vic !LKKAutu!

From: Albert Poon <sittil@singnet.com.sg>

Sent: Thursday, 1 March, 2018 5:13 PM

To: Vic (LKKAuto)

Subject: RE: Emailing: SGV 9939) LKK REF CC6/II1BO02667/Khb3
Hi vic

Thanks

Albart

M: 96169634, B458 1169

POON SIANG SEOW

Sin Ming Autocity

No.160 5in Ming Drive, #05-13, 5(575722)
Tel: 6453 7511 Fax:6453 8046

Email: sittil@singnet.com.sg

From: Vic [LKKAuUto) [mallto:vicalpeh@lkkauto.com]

Sent: Thursday, 1 March, 2018 4:18 PM

To: Albert Poon <sittil@singnet.com.sg>

Cc: Admin A <admin-a@Ilkkauto.com>; Asher Sng (LKKAuto) <AsherSng@Ikkauto.com>; Vic (LKKAuto)
<vicalpeh@Ikkauto.com>

Subject: RE: Emailing: SGV 9939) LKK REF CC6/11118002667/Khb3

Without Prejudice
Dear Albert,
We refer further to our below emall.

Purely for an amicable settlement an a without prejudice basis and without admission of any liability to our
Insured's part, we have our principal’s mandate and we offer below amount to settle your client’s claim:

Cost of Repair 5 1,400.00
Loss of Rental ($120.00 x 7 days) 5 300.00
LTA Search Fee 5 7.45

TOTAL $  1,707.45

If agreeable, kindly chop and sign the attached DV then forward back to us the original signed hard copy together
with the original hard copy of the LOD, Authorization to Act letter and all supporting documents for payment
processing.

The above amount Is to be made payable to POON SIANG SEOW.

Thank you.



“Please note that our above offer and any settlement arising from the above offer are made on @ without prejudice basis, and
should not be construed as an admission of liabllity on our part or on the part of our Insured Driver. Terms of such settlement
should also not be disclosed in any other related matter(s) in respect of the accident. Our offer made in respect of this present
matter is mode solely to resolve this matter only. No reference shall be made to this offer or any settlement grising from this offer
in any ather refated matters.

Best Regards,

Vic Alpeh | Case Hondler

LEK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841-2006 | email: vicalpeh@lkkauto com | fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #oz-25 | S(a08933)

LXK = Save the Earth: Print only when necessary’

This &-mail contain confidential and privileged matarial, and are for the sole use of the Intended recipient. Use or distribution by an
unintended reciplenl is prohibited, and may be a violation of law, If you believe that you recelved this e-mall in error, please do nol
tead this e-mail or any atlached items. Please delete the e-mail and all attachments, including any copies thereof, and inform the
sander thal you have delated the e-mail, all attachments and any coples therea!. Thank you.

——Driginal Message-—-

From: Vic [LKKAuto)

Sent: Thursday, 22 February, 2018 3:12 PM

To: Albert Poon

Cc: Admin A; Vic [LKKAuto); Asher Sng (LKKAuto)
Subject: RE: Emailing: SGV 9939)

Without Prejudice

Dear Albert,

We refer further to our below email.

Please be informed that liability is clear for this matter.

We are currently in the midst of seeking mandate approval to our principal and we will get back to you for an
update/offer in due course.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Vic Alpeh | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841-2096 | email: vicalpeh@|kkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108 Blk 51, Paya Ubl Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1,
#02-25 | S{408933) Save the Earth. Print only when necessary.

This e-mall contain confidential and privileged material, and are for the sole use of the intended recipient. Use or
distribution by an unintended recipient is prohibited, and may be a violation of law. If you believe that you recelved
this e-mail in error, please do not read this e-mail or any attached items. Please delete the e-mail and all
attachments, including any coples thereof, and inform the sender that you have deleted the e-mall, all attachments
and any copies thereof. Thank you.

——Driginal Message——



From: Albert Poon [mallto:sittil @singnet.com.sg]
Sent: Tuesday, 20 February, 2018 2:01 PM

To: Vic (LKKAuto)

Subject: RE: Emailing: SGV 9939

Thanks

Albert
M: 96169634, B458 1169

POON SIANG SEOW

Sin Ming Autocity

No.160 Sin Ming Drive, #05-13, 5(575722)
Tel: 6453 7511 Fax:6453 BD46

Email: sittil@singnet.com.sg

——0riginal Message—-

From: Vic (LKKAute) [mailto:vicalpeh@lkkauto.com)

Sent: Tuesday, 20 February, 2018 1:52 PM

To: Albert Poon <sittil@singnet.com.sg>

Ce: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>; Vic (LKKAuto) <vicalpeh@lkkauto.com>; Asher Sng (LKKAuto)

<AsherSng@lkkauto.com>
Subject: RE: Emailing: SGV 9939)

Without Prejudice

Dear Albert,

We refer to your below email.

Please be informed that we are pending for Direct Settlement approval from our principal.
We will follow up and will get back to you for an update.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Vic Alpeh | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841-2096 | email: vicalpeh@Ikkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108 Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1,
#02-25 | 5(408933) Save the Earth. Print only when necessary.

This e-mall contain confidential and privileged material, and are for the sole use of the intended recipient. Use or
distribution by an unintended recipient is prohibited, and may be a violation of law. If you believe that you received
this e-mall in error, please do not read this e-mail ar any attached items. Please delete the e-mail and all
attachments, including any copies thereof, and inform the sender that you have deleted the e-mall, all attachments
and any copies thereof. Thank you.

—0Original Message—-
From: Albert Poon |mallto:sittil@singnet.com.sg]
Sent; Tuesday, 20 February, 2018 1:37 PM



To: Vic (LKKAuto)
Subject: Emailing: SGV 9539/

HI VIC
Please get back to us ,so that we can hold the case

Thanks

Albert
M: 96169634, 8458 1169

POON SIANG SEOW

5in Ming Autocity

No.160 Sin Ming Drive, #05-13, 5(575722)
Tel: 6453 7511 Fax:6453 BD46

Emall: sittil@singnet.com.sg

Your message is ready to be sent with the following file or link
attachments:

5GV 99339)

Note: To protect against computer viruses, e-mail programs may prevent sending or receiving certain types of file
attachments. Check your e-mall security settings to determine how attachments are handled.
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Merimen a-Claims
Print Received Message

This mail is associaled with :

“5GV9339J (MCT18020183)
[SHC3654H]
i

EVERGREEN RENT-A-CAR PTE LTD
Feb 5 2018 4:00PM
[COMFORT TRANSPORTATION PTE LTD]
Poon Siang Seow

From India International Insurance Pte Ltd (HQ) (II_SG), sent on 28/02/2018 17:02 PM.

To LKK_HQ

Subject  Alert - Adj Mandate Approved (S$1707.45) - 5GV9939J - Claim Handler: NATALIE LEE

Approved: 1707.45,

https://singapore merimen.comiclaims/index, cfm?fusebox=5VCmailkluseaction=dsp_PrinlACFID=28452170&CFTOKEN=60dM66188e3d0f5-BB4

n



Land Tran spor%n thority

Enquire Vehicle Registration Detalls

Owner Parlculars
mﬁmw 200813077H
Owner ID Type Company ¢
Owner Nama: EVERGRECN RENT A CAR PTE_ LTD.
Rogistered Addregsl 159 SIN MING ROAD #01-07 AMTECH BUILDING SINGAPORE 575625
Birth Diste: 3
Vehicle Particulars
Vehicle No.: SG\VE19)
Provious Vehica Na.: .
gﬁm‘f‘ of 20 Jun 2017
ariginal Regn Date: 28 Jun 2007
Haoglstration Date: 20 Jun 2007
Yenr af Manulacture: 2008
Woniclo Typo: Private Hire {Sull-Drive) Motar Car
Vehicls Schami: -

Virhicla Allnchmanl 1: Mo Attachment
Vphicia Mipenmant 2 -
Viahicle Atlschinent X .

Vehicio Male: HONDA
Yahicke Madal. CRV24 A
Primary Colour: Silver
Secondary Colour, -

Passenger Capacly: 4

Chasals No.: HE31000063
enging No.: K24AT204332

m CopachyPowar  oaet e -
Maximum Power Oulput.  125.0 kW (167 bhp)
Progallont! Patral

Max Uniaden Waight: 1480 kg

Maximum Laden Welght. 1758 kg

Qpen Markel Value: $32414.00

PARF Eligibility, Faraied
PARF Elginlity Explry
Date:
Minlmum PARF Banafit: -
Ma. of Transfors: 3
iU Label Na.: 1020007648
COE Na.: 20070TONDTOOE0TTH
COE Expiry Dmie; 28 Jun 2022
COE Catngory. E - Opan Catagary
COE Registration
B- 1801cc & above
oAb Car }
Cucin Premiem (QF) /

Provalling Cuata $18,530.00 / -






77 Pesi HE M 2%
POON SIANG SEOW

Sin Ming Autocity, No 160 Sin Ming Drive, #05-13, Singapore 575722
Tel: 6453 7511 Fax: 6453 8046 Email: sittil@singnet.com.sg Regn. No: 05396600K

Your Rel;
our Ref: SGV 9939

Date: 20/02/2018
INDIA INTL INS PTE LTD

Attention; Motor claim dept
Dear Sir

ACCIDENT ON 05/02/2018 INVOLVING SGV 99390 AND SHC 3654H
ALONG LUCKY PLAZA

EVERGREEN RENT-A-CAR PTE LTD OF Vehicle No: SGV 9939)

We are instructed by the above named to claim damages against

SHC 3654H connection with a road traffic accident on 05/02/2018
Particulars of Loss and Expenses

| Cost of repair ( recommended by vour survevor) $1.400.00
2 Lossofuse for 3 davs SUV $ 450.00
3 Loss of use provided under NIMA PROTOCOL 2DAY $

4  GIA Search fee $ 745

TOTAL $1.857.45

Yours Faithfully
V>

ALBERT POON



Name: N ES D &2 A Lal ¢ =D

Address: ji'q\ D w0 WeO h—-o 4

% "
WMIE 0~ ‘—‘-'\J WOv= e

NPl SASL2S

Date:
F W OB X i
10 POON SIANG SEOW
Sin Ming Autocity
No. 160 Sin Ming Drive
#05-13 Singapore 575722
Tel: 84537511 Fax: 64518048
Emall. sittl1 @singnet com.sg
Dear Sirs
MY ACCIDENY
| am the owner of motor vehicle SV 4521 N which was Involved in
The above accident.

I refer to the repair to my vehicle. | hereby instruct you to proceed with the repairs of
my damaged vehicle. Since | would not be able to pay you for the repairs and you have
agreed not to exercise your lien on my vehicle for the repairs. | hereby give you authority
to claim all costs, expenses and damages caused to my vehicle in particular appointing

a surveyor and solicitor on my behalf to protect your interest.

| further authorize the workshop to settle my claim in a manner that they deem fit and the
workshop is further authorized to receive payment further to settlement of my claim with
payment cheque/s being made in favour of the workshop.




ERE
INVOICE

AL EL 10524
POON SIANG SEOW
R AE—-FONMKOE-T+T=F
Sin Ming Autocity, No. 160 Sin Ming Drive, #05-13, Singapore 575722.

Email: sitti1@singnet.com.sg

TEL: 6453 7511 FAX: 6453 8046
Specialising in Automobile Repairs, Spray Painting and Motor Accident Claims

R\ E N

W \NOWV OTEle O NIR \QSOga-XE R D
Co. Reg No. : 05396600K

“¥ & £
QUANTITY DESCRIPTION $ AMOUNT cis

Vgt s ! -~ c.bhjrllﬂﬂoﬁ 2667 [ \ap 3

Oune $0 %! —~ RV {1281

el BO &3 {.ﬂ.-«(n;-""

Ly Fel

Vst () Usa |
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i85 A @
Issuedby ..............) a-'l‘}
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IMIVA INTIRNATIONAL INSURARCT PIT LTD
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EXPRESS SETTLEMENT

QISCHARGE VOUCHER
lil-Direct Settlemeant (PODS)

india Refl: MCT18020183
Claimant Ref  SGV 88344

Ve POON SIANG SEOW e workshop™) hereby confirm thal well have reached an agresment
with the appainted Surveyor of India Intermational insurance Ple Lid _LKK AUTO CONSULTANTS PTELTD  (name
of Surveyor with respect to the amount claimed for S5 1,400.00  (repair cost) S§__ 300.00  (loss of
usiipaeted), 55 745  (pearch fes), vehice noSGV S939.) hal was damaged pursuant o he acciden! wiuch occured
on 05/0212018 (dats) st LUCKY PLAZA EXIT TD ORCHARD ROAR.:stion) involving vehicle noSHC 36854Hinsured
vehicdle), This s pursuant to fhe inspection conducied on _OB/OZ2/2018  (date) at “Ihe workshog'

Weil confirn that we/l arefam authonzed by the owner  EVERGREEN RENT-A-CAR PTE LTD  (he thind panty
claimant™) of vehice &GV 8838010 make the claim es sel oul in the sbove paragraph and weil have full suthorty io selfie
the matter on histher behall in 8 manner that we/l desm fil. Wall snclose hersin the latter of authority given by “the third
party clammani”

Vel furher confirm that wedl will indemnify india Intematonal Insurance Pie Lid for all damages, ioss andior expense that
they will or have sleady incured n the event thal “the third party cleimant” sfier the above sald sgreement lodpges &
further clsim sgainst the former for sy loss and expenses siffered paraining 1o cosl of repairs andior mental and/or loss
of use pursuant fo he damage 1SGV 9838J (vehicle no ) as & result of the accident

Wl confirm thal the agreemant reached abowe is in Jll and final settement of all caims of Sthe third pary clamant”
pursuani fo the acodant and that further this sefiement 13 eached on o without prejudice and without admission of labiity

hasis

This sgreement is subject lo the application of Singapore law and the Singapore Courts have exclusive jurisdicion ower any
dispute arsing oul of ihe same

Wie/l autharize you to pay the total amount of 55 1,707.45 1o POON SIANG SEOW

Dated lhlu.......\....duynf -3 PSSR VA, ‘_9' o
CLAIMANT: 9, WITNESS: @T‘_
Signature Signature: =4 e
Sigred by “the workshop® (with chop) Signad by eppointed Surveyor
N DLLCLN Poon LAcon w R Nk LKK AUTO CONSULTANTS PTE LTD
NRIC Luksyas |H NRIC 199607 198R
Address L\C\bo U2™MIDE BUO e f1UBIAVENUE 180128
Ly W OS -3\ SACK I PAYA UBI INDUSTRIAL PARK (S) 408933
Nationality < ete Nationality — B —

Occupation: WAE emaglon Oceupation:
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Land Transport Authority
10 Sin Ming Drive
Singapare 575701

GST Regstrabon No. - M4-0006528-2

Print Date/Time 06 Feb 2018/ 18:29:08
Receipl Date/Tima © 06 Feb 2018 / 18:29:06

Tax Invoice/Receipt
Receipt No. - ITNET-00000-180206-001707

Previous Recaipt No
S/N Item Description/ Amount
Business Transaction Reference Before
No. GST (S8)
Result of Insurance Enguiry - SHC3854H
As at 05 Feb 2018M16:12:00

Insurance Co: INDIA INT'L INS PTE LTD
1 Insurance Enguiry - SHC3654H

Enguiry Fes 7.00
201802061627559733876
Sub-Total T.00
Total Before Rounding 7.00
Rounding Difference

Total Amount Payable

Paid By

GST
Amount

(S%)

0.49

0.48
048

Direct Debit eNETS Debi

20180206182800878 o ot Banking)

Total

Cash Change

Tendared Amaount

Excess Retundable Amount

THANK YOU AND HAVE A NICE DAY!

Amount
After GST

(S8)

748

748
749
0.04
7.45

745

745
0.00
7.45
000

Please ensurp that all payments to the Authority are good and promptly settled by the payment service
provider | financial institution. Otherwise, the transaction and receipt is considered void and late fee

may apply.

6272018, 6:29 PM



Merimen e-Claims Page | of |

...CLAIM SUBFOLDER...(Pending for Survey Report)

Direct Settlamant

(CLAIM SUBFOLDER TRACKING o
Case  |Motified | st Sunmitten Ad) Assigned Adj Apt | Ad] Submitted Ins Auth'ed Status
| Pending
i 12 Feb 201R E,?nh 2018 5%1,400.00 | 5%1,400.00 Survey Il.lzm
Eait Reg | B Ady mpr | | EO Estimates II view Rt | Concel Case |

Hain

CLAIM SUBFOLDER DETAILS | [Created by adjuster]
Insured: COMFORT TRANSPORTATION PTE LTD, Co. Reg. No.: 199303821R
Main Clavmant: EVERGREEN RENT-A-CAR PTE LTD, Co. Reg No.; -
| Vemicle Reg. No.: N Date of Loss: | 05/02/2018 16:00 - :59
Claim Type: | Policy/Caver Note No.: MOOMOO015
| Vehitle Reg. Mo, (Insured): | SHC3654H Policy No. {Claimant): S117V0I608/VPZ/RO3
Excess:

Repairer: Poon Slang Seow (HQ) 160 Sin Ming Drive, #05-13 Sin Ming AutoCity, 575722 Sin Ming - Tel:

tiog In m ;?tlmlﬂunll Insurance Pte Ltd (HQ) - Tel: 63476100 ... [Handied by NATALIE LEE - 53476100
Clalmant’s 1nsurer: | Liberty Insurance Pte Ltd (HQ) - Tel: 6221 B611
Adjuster: LMK Auto Consuftants Pte Ltd (MQ) - Tel: 6256-3561 ... [Handled by KENNETH KONG] ... [Final Rpt

- due 21/02/2018]

ASSOCIATED MAIL RECEIVED View Al | Compose Case Mail ||
= 111 5G [26/02/2018); Alert - Adj Mandate Approved (5$1707.45) - 5GV9939) - Claim Handier: NATALIE LEE
o [l SG(21/02/2018): Alert - Ad] Mandate Approved (5$0.00) - SGV9939) - Claim Handler: NATALIE LEE

ALL ASSOCIATED TASKSS View All | Search Tasks | Create New Task | Complets |

Dus Date  Priority Type Task Group Subject Handlar Assigned By Completed On Created On  Dona?
No results.

https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRadjuster&fuseaction=dsp _c... 8/3/2018



Merimen e-Claims

Claim Documents

*SGV9939) (MCT18020183)
[SHC3654H]
™
EVERGREEN RENT-A-CAR PTE LTD
Feb 5 2018 4:00PM
[COMFORT TRANSPORTATION PTE LTD]

Page | of 2

Poon Siang Seow
Upioad Documents |  Upload Photos | Compase New Letter | View [View in Browser| v |

Photas/Images [3perpage [v] A
(Mo |Relabel/Reorder | LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd (HQ) Thumbnail | Print
1 I8/02/18 09:23 | Odometar Reading 0| cadirc |
2 28/02/1809:23 |Chassis Number @ e |

1 28/02/18 02:23 | General View 0 ars B

F |28/02/18 09:23  Genaral View ﬁ Load 0G| &

§ 200218 09:23 | Genersl View @ e |2

& 280218 09:23 | General View - O s |9

7 |28/02/1809:23 | General View O waws |2

@ |28/02/1809:23 | General View O wows |2
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LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd coreqne 1998071088,
51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25, Paya Ubi Industrial Park

Singapore 408933

Tel: 5256-3561 Fax: B844-BB0S Email: sur@lkkauto.com;assignmenis@ikkaulo.com

VEHICLE DAMAGE INSPECTION REPORT

Cur File No: CCa/I118002667/KHB3G2
Date: 08/03/2018
REFERENCE
Handling Insurer- India International Insurance Pie Lid  Policy No: MCOMOD15
flaimant Vehicle sGvesas) Insured Vehicle No:  SHC3654H
Date of Loss: 05/02/2018 Nature of Claim: TP Claim No: MCT18020183
DESCRIPTION & IDENTIFICATION OF VEHICLE
Reg No SGVv9939J
Make & Modal: HONDA CR-V, 2.4 (A) Engine No: K24AT204332
Reg. Date: 20/0872007 (Man. Year. 2006) Chassis No: RE31000663
Colour; Metallic Grey Odometer: 163780 km
Engine Capacity: 2354 cc
Market Value/New Car Price: NiA
Sum Insured (55); Market Value/New Car Price
CONDITION OF VEHICLE AT THE TIME OF SURVEY
General Condilion: Steering (Serviceabla); Yes Footbrake (Serviceable); Yes
Handbrake {Serviceable): Yes Engine Modification: No  Pre-accident Condition:
NDITION OF TYR
Front Tyre Size: 235/55 R18 Rear Tyre Size: 235/55 R18
Front Left Side Nexen B mm Rear Lefi Side: Nexen 7 mm
Front Right Side Nexen B mm Rear Right Side: Nexen 7 mm
The abowe values represent the emaining hyre reada depih
COST OF CLAIMS ~ Repairer's Adjuster's Difference  Diff ‘ji|
Parts 2,858.00 B852.88 200512 70,18
Miscellaneous llems 0.00 0.00 0.00
Labour 1,650.00 950.00 700.00 42 42
Paintwork Labour 0.00 0.00 0.00
Towing 0.00 0.00 0.00
Calculated Gross Total (S5) 4,508.00 1,802.88 2,705.12 60.01
Approved Total (Overridden) [{S§) 1,400.00
Nett Amount (S§) 4 508.00 1,400.00 3,108.00 68.94
+ Loss of Use (3.0 x S$100.00/day) (S$) 300.00
+ Doc/Search Fee |S$) 7.45
Nett Liability (S$) 1,707.45
INSPECTION
Date of Assignment: 08/02/2018
Date Inspected 08/02/2018 Inspected Al Poon Siang Seow (HQ)
160 Sin Ming Drive, #05-13 Sin Ming
AutoCity
Singapore 575722
Estimated Period of Repair. 3.0 days
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Adjuster: KENNETH KONG Manager: VIC ALFEH

NOTE Thiz report represents our findings af the time and place of inspection stated herein, Such inspection haa besn camed ouf fo the beat of our
knowledge and abillty but any afher labilty under any other circumstances s hemeby exprassly esciuded
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REPAIR DETAILS

Reference |
Part Source: MRM-SG Version; 1.0 (Last Synchronised: 23 Feb 2018)

Parts: M1-SUV HONDA CR-V 2.4 (A) (Catalogue:Merimen Singapore 1.0)

Labour: Repairer's (Price-denominated Standard List) ‘
Print Cede: (Unsubmitted, no prinl-code for SGVB934J)

Validity: These estimates are valid only if they contain the print code (above) on all estimate pages, running page
numbers with the END OF ESTIMATES marker on the last estimale page

Further Info: ltems/values not in reference catalogue are prefixed with an asterisk * |

Recommended Parts

No. Qty PartNo. Particulars Condition Repairer's Amount
1 1 *REAR BUMPER Buckled 508.20F *508. 20FL
2 1 "REAR BUMPER CONNER Bucklaed 153.10F "153.10FL
3 1 “REAR BUMPER SENSOR Serviceable 350.00F *FL
4 1 *‘REAR BUMPER REFLECTOR Scralched 40.00F *40 00 FL
5 1 “REAR BUMPER MUDFLAT Serviceable B5.00F “FL
& 1 *REAR PANEL Repair 53500F *-FL
T 1 “REAR EXHAUST BOX Repair 607 90F *FL
B 1 “TAIL GATE GARISH Cracked 364.B0F *364 BOFL
B 1 “TAIL GATE RUBBER Serviceable 106.00F *FL
1m0 1 “REAR PANEL TOP GARISH Senviceable 128.00F "-FL

F=Franchise part. L=Listhemisc

Sub Total (S§) 2.858.00 1,066.10

- List Item Discount on L Items 0.00/20.00% (S§) 0.00 21322

Total Parts (S5) 2,858.00 852.88

Report was unsubmitted during this print-out.
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Recommended Miscellaneous Items

There are no new miscellansous tema selected.

Recommended Labour

No Particulars Lab.Type Repairer's Amount

Labour ltems

1 RUST PROCFING New 80.00 0.00

2 PANEL BEATING New B890.00 400,00

3 SPRAY PAINTING Mew 680.00 §50.00
Gross Labour Cost (S5) 1,650.00 950.00

Report was unsubmitied during this print-out.

< END OF ESTIMATES >

https://singapore. merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRadjuster&fuseaction=gen_p... 8/3/2018



